
PAGE  1 OF 5

BID #16-21 WASTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES FOR BRAZORIA COUNTY

DATE OF BID OPENING

FRIDAY, MARCH 4, 2016

10:00 a.m. local time

Contract Term

2 - 12 month renewal options

DESCRIPTION County ID Qty

Price per EA 

per Month

Ext Price per 

Month

Price per EA 

per Month

Ext Price per 

Month

Price per EA 

per Month

Ext Price per 

Month

Price per EA 

per Month

Ext Price per 

Month

PORT-A-CANS

Port-a Can County Beach Follets  

4/11-9/19, 2 x week  

Parks Dept, Bluewater Hwy - CR257

(btwn beach access roads 1 &2)                                                                2401 10 NO BID NO BID $156.00 $1,560.00 $142.00 $1,420.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can County Beach Quintana  

3/10-5/11, 1 x week

Parks Dept, 330 5th St (fishing pier)

Quintana                      6604 1 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can County Beach Quintana

9/12-3/9, 1 x week

Qty 1 @ Main Entrance

Qty 1 @ Fishing Pier 

Parks Dept, 330 5th St, Quintana                      2402 2 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can County Beach Quintana

5/11-9/11, 2 x week

Qty 1 @ Main Entrance

Qty 1 @ Fishing Pier

Parks Dept 330 5th St, Quintana                       2403 2 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can Surfside Barn, Year Round,1 x week

Parks Dept 2214 Fort Velasco, Surfside 2406 1 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can Boat Ramp Sportman's Span, Year 

Round, 1 x Week

Parks Dept, 3655 FM 2611 Brazoria 2407 1 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can Boat Ramp McNeil Bridge, Year 

Round, 1 x Week

Parks Dept, 3204 FM 521, Brazoria 2408 1 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can Boat Ramp End of Levee Road, Year 

Round, 1 x Week

Parks Dept, 4114 E Flood Gate Rd,Freeport 2409 1 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can Boat Ramp Sonny Travis, Year 

Round, 1 x week

Parks Dept, 2101 Hwy 36, Freeport 2410 1 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can Boat Ramp Seidlers, Year Round, 1 x 

Week

Parks Dept, 5311 1/3 Amigo Ln, Freeport 2411 1 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can Boat Ramp Swan Lake, Year Round, 

1 x week

Parks Dept, 8311 1/3 Bay St, Surfside 2412 1 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can Boat Ramp San Luis Pass, Year 

Round, 1 x week

Parks Dept, 14001 CR 257, Freeport 2413 1 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can Boat Ramp,Chocolate Bayou,Year 

Round, 1 x week

Parks Dept, 17703 1/3 FM 2004 RD,Liverpool 2430 1 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

 Monday

(OFF SEASON) 

 Monday & Friday

(PEAK SEASON) 

Friday

Day of Service

Monday & Friday

Monday

FRESH CAN, LLC 

dba TEXAS W ASTE CO.

2010 E. BROADW AY

PEARLAND, TX 77581

KEY BRADLEY

281-377-1986

281-331-3460

W ASTE CONNECTIONS OF TEXAS LLC

10310 FM 523

ANGLETON, TX 77515

EVAN SHARP

979-864-4600

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

Day of Service

Monday & Friday

Monday

 Monday

(OFF SEASON) 

 Monday & Friday

(PEAK SEASON) 

UNITED SITE SERVICES OF TEXAS INC.

421 LITTLE YORK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77076

GRACE FLAHERTY

832-309-0896

N/A

Day of Service

Monday & Friday

SPRINT W ASTE SERVICES LP

16011 W EST BELLFORT

Friday

Friday

Friday

Monday

Friday

 Monday

(OFF SEASON) 

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

 Monday & Friday

(PEAK SEASON) 

Friday

FREEPORT, TX 77498

STEVE CANNON

979-388-9998

979-373-0868

VENDOR NAME

QUOTED BY

FAX NUMBER

TELEPHONE

979-848-5122

Day of Service

Monday & Friday

Monday

 Monday

(OFF SEASON) 

 Monday & Friday

(PEAK SEASON) 

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

Friday

DATE PRINTED 3/14/2016



PAGE  2 OF 5

BID #16-21 WASTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES FOR BRAZORIA COUNTY

DATE OF BID OPENING

FRIDAY, MARCH 4, 2016

10:00 a.m. local time

Contract Term

2 - 12 month renewal options

Day of Service

FRESH CAN, LLC 

dba TEXAS W ASTE CO.

2010 E. BROADW AY

PEARLAND, TX 77581

KEY BRADLEY

281-377-1986

281-331-3460

W ASTE CONNECTIONS OF TEXAS LLC

10310 FM 523

ANGLETON, TX 77515

EVAN SHARP

979-864-4600

Day of Service

UNITED SITE SERVICES OF TEXAS INC.

421 LITTLE YORK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77076

GRACE FLAHERTY

832-309-0896

N/A

Day of Service

SPRINT W ASTE SERVICES LP

16011 W EST BELLFORT

FREEPORT, TX 77498

STEVE CANNON

979-388-9998

979-373-0868

VENDOR NAME

QUOTED BY

FAX NUMBER

TELEPHONE

979-848-5122

Day of Service
DESCRIPTION County ID Qty Price per Each

Extended 

Price Price per Each

Extended 

Price Price per Each

Extended 

Price Price per Each

Extended 

Price 

PORT-A-CANS AS NEEDED OR TEMPORARY 

RENTAL

Port-a Can Precinct 1 Clute Service Center, As 

Needed 1 x week

1432 Highland Park(any location in Pct 1) 2415 1 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can Precinct 1 Clute Service Center, As 

Needed 2 x week

1432 Highland Park(any locatin in Pct 1) 2416 1 NO BID NO BID $139.00 $139.00 $132.00 $132.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can Precinct 2 Angleton Service Center, 

As Needed 1 x week

21017 CR 171 (any location in Pct 2) 2417 1 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can Precinct 2 Angleton Service Center, 

As Needed 2 x week

21017 CR 171 (any location in Pct 2) 2418 1 NO BID NO BID $139.00 $139.00 $132.00 $132.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can Precinct 3 Alvin Service Center, As 

Needed 1 x week

2508 N Gordon (any location in Pct 3) 2419 1 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can Precinct 3 Alvin Service Center, As 

Needed 2 x week

2508 N Gordon (any location in Pct 3) 2420 1 NO BID NO BID $139.00 $139.00 $132.00 $132.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can Precinct 4 Brazoria Service Center, 

As Needed 1 x week

1001 Market St (any location in Pct 4) 2421 1 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-a Can Precinct 4 Brazoria Service Center, 

As Needed 2 x week

1001 Market St (any location in Pct 4) 2422 1 NO BID NO BID $139.00 $139.00 $132.00 $132.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-A-Can service 1 x per week 2423 1 NO BID NO BID $112.00 $112.00 $104.00 $104.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-A-Can service 2 x per week 2424 1 NO BID NO BID $139.00 $139.00 $132.00 $132.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-A-Can service 3 x per week 2425 1 NO BID NO BID $156.00 $156.00 $146.00 $146.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-A-Can service 4 x per week 2426 1 NO BID NO BID $173.00 $173.00 $162.00 $162.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-A-Can service 5 x per week 2427 1 NO BID NO BID $197.00 $197.00 $186.00 $186.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-A-Can service 6 x per week 2428 1 NO BID NO BID $219.00 $219.00 $212.00 $212.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-A-Can service Daily 2429 1 NO BID NO BID $243.00 $243.00 $228.00 $228.00 NO BID NO BID

Port-A-Can service, Handicap, Daily 7644 1 NO BID NO BID $259.00 $259.00 $252.00 $252.00 NO BID NO BID

DATE PRINTED 3/14/2016
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BID #16-21 WASTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES FOR BRAZORIA COUNTY

DATE OF BID OPENING

FRIDAY, MARCH 4, 2016

10:00 a.m. local time

Contract Term

2 - 12 month renewal options

Day of Service

FRESH CAN, LLC 

dba TEXAS W ASTE CO.

2010 E. BROADW AY

PEARLAND, TX 77581

KEY BRADLEY

281-377-1986

281-331-3460

W ASTE CONNECTIONS OF TEXAS LLC

10310 FM 523

ANGLETON, TX 77515

EVAN SHARP

979-864-4600

Day of Service

UNITED SITE SERVICES OF TEXAS INC.

421 LITTLE YORK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77076

GRACE FLAHERTY

832-309-0896

N/A

Day of Service

SPRINT W ASTE SERVICES LP

16011 W EST BELLFORT

FREEPORT, TX 77498

STEVE CANNON

979-388-9998

979-373-0868

VENDOR NAME

QUOTED BY

FAX NUMBER

TELEPHONE

979-848-5122

Day of Service
DESCRIPTION

DUMPSTERS County ID Qty

Price per EA 

per Month

Ext Price per 

Month

Price per EA 

per Month

Ext Price per 

Month

Price per EA 

per Month

Ext Price per 

Month

Price per EA 

per Month

Ext Price per 

Month

Brazoria County Airport

8 yard, Year Round, 2 x Week

Airport, 815 Airport Way, CR 220 2440 3 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $207.84 $623.52

Alvin Adult Probation

3 Yard, Year Round, 1 x Week

Facilities Mgmnt, 20020 Hwy 35, Alvin 2441 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $51.96 $51.96

Brazoria County Juvenile Justice

6 yard, Year Round, 2 x week

Juvenile Justice, 20875 CR 171, Angleton 2445 2 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $155.88 $311.76

Brazoria County Mosquito Control

6 Yard, Year Round, 1 x Week

Mosquito Control, CR 213 & 428, Angleton 2446 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $77.94 $77.94

Angleton Service Center (Pct 2) - Angleton

6 Yard, Year Round, 2 x Week

Angleton Svc Center,21017 CR 171, Angleton 2448 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $155.88 $155.88
Brazos River County Park

6 Yard,  5/1-9/30, 1 x Week

Parks Dept,3053 Cty Park Rd, Angleton 2450 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $77.94 $77.94
Brazos River County Park

4 Yard,  10/1-4/30, 1 x Week

Parks Dept, 3053 Cty Park Rd, Angleton 2451 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $69.28 $69.28

Hanson Riverside County Park

6 Yard,  5/1-9/30, 1 x Week

Parks Dept,18499 Hwy 35, West Columbia 2453 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $77.94 $77.94

Hanson Riverside County Park

4 Yard, 10/1-4/30, 1 x Week

Parks Dept,18499 Hwy 35, West Columbia 2454 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $69.28 $69.28
Quintana Beach County Park

8 Yard, Year Round, 2 x Week

Parks Dept,330 5th St, Quintana 2455 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $207.84 $207.84

Quintana Beach County Park

6 Yard, 3/1-9/30, 2 x Week

Parks Dept,330 5th St, Quintana 2456 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $155.88 $155.88

Quintana Beach County Park

6 Yard, Year Round, 2 x Week

Parks Dept,330 5th St, Quintana 6740 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $155.88 $155.88

Resoft County Park

8 Yard, Year Round, 2 x Week

Parks Dept, Hwy 35 & CR 281, Alvin 2457 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $207.84 $207.84
San Luis County Park

8 Yard, Year Round, 2 x Week

Parks Dept,14001 CR 257, Freeport 2459 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $207.84 $207.84
San Luis County Park

6 Yard, 3/1-10/30, 2 x Week

Parks Dept, 14001 CR 257, Freeport 2460 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $155.88 $155.88
San Luis County Park

6 Yard, Year Round, 2 x Week

Parks Dept, 14001 CR 257, Freeport 6741 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $155.88 $155.88
Surfside Jetty County Park

8 Yard, Year Round, 2 x Week

Parks Dept, 101 Parkview, Surfside 2461 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $207.84 $207.84
Camp Mohawk

8 Yard, Year Round, 2 x Week

Parks Dept, 110 Mohawk Dr, Alvin 2463 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $207.84 $207.84
Henry William Munson Park @ Stephen F. 

Austin Statue

3 Yard, Year Round, 1 x Week 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $51.96 $51.96

Freeport JP / AP Office

6 Yard, Year Round, 1 x Week

Facilities Management

210 First Street, Freeport, TX 2452 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $77.94 $77.94

DESCRIPTION

DUMPSTERS County ID Qty

Price per EA 

per Month

Ext Price per 

Month

Price per EA 

per Month

Ext Price per 

Month

Price per EA 

per Month

Ext Price per 

Month

Price per EA 

per Month

Ext Price per 

Month

West Columbia JP Office

3 Yard, Year Round, 1 x Week

Facilities Management

210 First Street, Freeport, TX 7772 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $51.96 $51.96

Truck Shed, West Columbia

6 Yard, Year Round, 1 x Week

Facilities Management

1211 Jefferson, West Columbia, TX 7914 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $77.94 $77.94

Facilities Management,

8 Yard, Year Round, 1 x Week

1340 E Kiber Street, Angleton 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $103.92 $103.92

Brazoria County Pct 4 Sub Office

6 Yard, Year Round, 1 x Week

3633 CR 58, Manvel, TX 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $77.94 $77.94

Monday & Friday

Monday & Friday

 Thursday 

Monday & Thursday

Thursday

 Friday 

 Thursday 

 Monday & Friday

(PEAK SEASON) 

 Monday & Friday

(PEAK SEASON) 

 Monday & Friday

(OFF SEASON) 

Monday & Thursday

Monday & Friday

 Monday & Friday

(PEAK SEASON) 

Thursday

Monday & Thursday

 Wednesday

(PEAK SEASON) 

 Wednesday

(OFF SEASON) 

 Monday

(PEAK SEASON) 

 Monday

(OFF SEASON) 

Day of Service

Monday & Thursday

Friday

Monday & Thursday

 Friday 

 Thursday 

Monday & Friday

Monday & Friday

 Thursday 

 Thursday 

Monday & Thursday

Monday & Thursday

Thursday

Monday & Thursday

 Monday & Friday

(OFF SEASON) 

Monday & Thursday

Monday & Friday

 Monday & Friday

(PEAK SEASON) 

 Monday & Friday

(OFF SEASON) 

Day of Service

Monday & Thursday

 Monday & Friday

(PEAK SEASON) 

Monday & Friday

Monday & Friday

Monday & Thursday

Monday & Thursday

 Monday

(PEAK SEASON) 

 Monday & Friday

(PEAK SEASON) 

Monday & Friday

Monday & Thursday

Thursday

Friday

Monday & Thursday

 Wednesday

(PEAK SEASON) 

 Wednesday

(OFF SEASON) 

 Monday

(OFF SEASON) 

 Monday & Friday

(PEAK SEASON) 

Day of Service

Monday & Thursday

Friday

 Monday & Friday

(PEAK SEASON) 

 Monday & Friday

(PEAK SEASON) 

 Wednesday

(PEAK SEASON) 

 Wednesday

(OFF SEASON) 

 Monday

(PEAK SEASON) 

 Monday

(OFF SEASON) 

Thursday Thursday

 Thursday  Thursday  Thursday 

 Thursday  Thursday  Thursday 

 Thursday 

 Friday 

Day of Service

Monday & Thursday

Friday

Monday & Thursday

Thursday

Monday & Thursday

 Wednesday

(PEAK SEASON) 

 Wednesday

(OFF SEASON) 

 Monday

(PEAK SEASON) 

 Monday

(OFF SEASON) 

 Monday & Friday

(PEAK SEASON) 

 Monday & Friday

(PEAK SEASON) 

 Monday & Friday

(OFF SEASON) 

Monday & Thursday

Monday & Friday

 Monday & Friday

(PEAK SEASON) 

Monday & Friday

Monday & Friday

Monday & Thursday

Thursday

 Friday 

 Thursday 

 Thursday 

 Thursday 

 Thursday 

Day of Service Day of Service Day of Service Day of Service

DATE PRINTED 3/14/2016
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BID #16-21 WASTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES FOR BRAZORIA COUNTY

DATE OF BID OPENING

FRIDAY, MARCH 4, 2016

10:00 a.m. local time

Contract Term

2 - 12 month renewal options

Day of Service

FRESH CAN, LLC 

dba TEXAS W ASTE CO.

2010 E. BROADW AY

PEARLAND, TX 77581

KEY BRADLEY

281-377-1986

281-331-3460

W ASTE CONNECTIONS OF TEXAS LLC

10310 FM 523

ANGLETON, TX 77515

EVAN SHARP

979-864-4600

Day of Service

UNITED SITE SERVICES OF TEXAS INC.

421 LITTLE YORK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77076

GRACE FLAHERTY

832-309-0896

N/A

Day of Service

SPRINT W ASTE SERVICES LP

16011 W EST BELLFORT

FREEPORT, TX 77498

STEVE CANNON

979-388-9998

979-373-0868

VENDOR NAME

QUOTED BY

FAX NUMBER

TELEPHONE

979-848-5122

Day of Service

DESCRIPTION County ID Qty

 Rent per 

Day 

 Rent per 

Month Delivery Fee Haul Rate*

Hazard

 Waste 

(chem)

Special

 Waste 

(cresote)

 Rent per 

Day 

 Rent per 

Month Delivery Fee Haul Rate*

Hazard

 Waste 

(chem)

Special

 Waste 

(cresote)

 Rent per 

Day 

 Rent per 

Month Delivery Fee Haul Rate*

Hazard

 Waste 

(chem)

Special

 Waste 

(cresote)

 Rent per 

Day 

 Rent per 

Month Delivery Fee Haul Rate*

Hazard

 Waste 

(chem)

Special

 Waste 

(cresote)

DUMPSTER, FRONT LOAD AS NEEDED

2 Yard, As Needed 2473 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $10.03 $75.00 $50.00 $0.00 $0.00

3 Yard, As Needed 2479 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $12.02 $75.00 $50.00 $0.00 $0.00

4 Yard, As Needed 2485 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $13.39 $75.00 $50.00 $0.00 $0.00

6 Yard, As Needed 2491 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $16.70 $75.00 $50.00 $0.00 $0.00

8 Yard, As Needed 2497 1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $0.00 $19.58 $75.00 $50.00 $0.00 $0.00

TOTAL (if applicable) NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ROLL-OFF DUMPSTERS AS NEEDED  County ID Qty

 Rent per 

Day Delivery Fee Haul Rate*

 Hazard

 Waste 

(chem) 

 Special

 Waste 

(cresote) 

 Rent per 

Day Delivery Fee Haul Rate*

 Hazard

 Waste 

(chem) 

 Special

 Waste 

(cresote) 

 Rent per 

Day Delivery Fee Haul Rate*

 Hazard

 Waste 

(chem) 

 Special

 Waste 

(cresote) 

 Rent per 

Day Delivery Fee Haul Rate*

 Hazard

 Waste 

(chem) 

 Special

 Waste 

(cresote) 

20 Yard, As Needed, Qty 1 7645 1 $3.50 $0.00 $0.00 $4.75 $2.50

20 Yard, As Needed,Delivery Fee 2515 1 $125.00 $0.00 $106.00 $100.00

20 Yard, As Needed,Haul Rate 2516 1 $365.00 $0.00 $130.00 $255.00

20 Yard, As Needed,Special Waste 2518 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $918.00 $0.00 $0.00 

30 Yard, As Needed, Qty 1 7646 1 $3.50 $0.00 $4.75 $2.50

30 Yard, As Needed, Delivery Fee 2521 1 $125.00 $0.00 $106.00 $100.00

30 Yard, As Needed,Haul Rate 2522 1 $465.00 $0.00 $130.00 $295.00

30 Yard, As Needed, Special Waste 2524 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,377.00 $0.00 $0.00 

40 Yard, As Needed, Qty 1 7647 1 $3.50 $0.00 $4.75 $2.50

ROLL-OFF DUMPSTERS AS NEEDED  County ID Qty

 Rent per 

Day 

 Rent per 

Month Delivery Fee Haul Rate*

 Hazard

 Waste 

(chem) 

 Special

 Waste 

(cresote) 

 Rent per 

Day 

 Rent per 

Month Delivery Fee Haul Rate*

 Hazard

 Waste 

(chem) 

 Special

 Waste 

(cresote) 

 Rent per 

Day Delivery Fee Haul Rate*

 Hazard

 Waste 

(chem) 

 Special

 Waste 

(cresote) 

 Rent per 

Day Delivery Fee Haul Rate*

 Hazard

 Waste 

(chem) 

 Special

 Waste 

(cresote) 

40 Yard, As Needed,Delivery Fee 2527 1 $125.00 $0.00 $106.00 $100.00

40 Yard, As Needed,Haul Rate 2528 1 $565.00 $0.00 $130.00 $335.00

40 Yard, As Needed, Special Waste 2530 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1,836.00 $0.00 $0.00 

TOTAL (if applicable)

EMERGENCY DISASTER AS NEEDED

 Rent per 

Day

Roll-Off 

 Rent per 

Month

Roll-Off 

 Port-A-Can 

Service 1 x 

Week 

 Port-A-Can 

Service 2 x 

Week  Haul Rate  Final Pull 

 Rent per 

Day

Roll-Off 

 Rent per 

Month

Roll-Off 

 Port-A-Can 

Service 1 x 

Week 

 Port-A-Can 

Service 2 x 

Week  Haul Rate  Final Pull 

 Rent per 

Day

Roll-Off 

 Rent per 

Month

Roll-Off 

 Port-A-Can 

Service 1 x 

Week 

 Port-A-Can 

Service 2 x 

Week  Haul Rate  Final Pull 

 Rent per 

Day

Roll-Off 

 Rent per 

Month

Roll-Off 

 Port-A-Can 

Service 1 x 

Week 

 Port-A-Can 

Service 2 x 

Week  Haul Rate  Final Pull 

40 Yard Roll-off, for emergency disaster, as 

needed (INCLUDES 5 PORT-A-CANS)* 2541 1 Lot $3.50 $0.00

$125.00

DELIVERY $0.00 $565.00 $565.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4.75 $150.00 $0.00 $0.00 $130.00 $130.00 $2.50 $75.00 $0.00 $0.00 $335.00 $335.00

*Port-A-Cans delivered on trailer for emergency 

disaster as needed 2545 1 Lot $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $265.00 $371.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $104.00 $132.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

*40 Yard Roll-Off filled with Port-A-Cans, for 

emergency disaster, as needed 2546 1 Lot $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $4.75 $150.00 $104.00 $132.00 $130.00 $130.00 $2.50 $75.00 $0.00 $0.00 $335.00 $335.00

TOTALS (If Applicable)

Vendor Contact for  Port-A -Can Service:

New service representative

Customer service representative

Billing representative

Vendor Contact for  Dum psters :

New service representative

Customer service representative

Billing representative KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

N/A

GRACE FLAHERTY - 832-309-0896

N/A

RAYANNE J. BRINTON - 209-436-9262

N/A

N/AN/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

AMBER BRODERICK - 979-864-4600

AMBER BRODERICK - 979-864-4600

AMBER BRODERICK - 979-864-4600

*TXWC does not provide haz waste disposal. TXWC does provide Class I material 

disposal at a rate of $45.90 / yard and Class II at $20.40 / yard.

Special Waste (cresote) disposal is quoted at the Class I rate of $45.90 / yard

DATE PRINTED 3/14/2016
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BID #16-21 WASTE MANAGEMENT SERVICES FOR BRAZORIA COUNTY

DATE OF BID OPENING

FRIDAY, MARCH 4, 2016

10:00 a.m. local time

Contract Term

2 - 12 month renewal options

Day of Service

FRESH CAN, LLC 

dba TEXAS W ASTE CO.

2010 E. BROADW AY

PEARLAND, TX 77581

KEY BRADLEY

281-377-1986

281-331-3460

W ASTE CONNECTIONS OF TEXAS LLC

10310 FM 523

ANGLETON, TX 77515

EVAN SHARP

979-864-4600

Day of Service

UNITED SITE SERVICES OF TEXAS INC.

421 LITTLE YORK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77076

GRACE FLAHERTY

832-309-0896

N/A

Day of Service

SPRINT W ASTE SERVICES LP

16011 W EST BELLFORT

FREEPORT, TX 77498

STEVE CANNON

979-388-9998

979-373-0868

VENDOR NAME

QUOTED BY

FAX NUMBER

TELEPHONE

979-848-5122

Day of ServiceVendor Contact for  Port-A -Cans, as  needed:

New service representative

Customer service representative

Billing representative

Vendor Contact for  Dum psters , Front Load, 

as  needed:

New service representative

Customer service representative

Billing representative

Vendor Contact for Dumpsters, Roll-

Off, as needed:

New service representative

Customer service representative

Billing representative

Vendor Contact for Dumpsters, 

Emergency Disaster, as needed:

New service representative

Customer service representative

Billing representative

Bid Documents Included

Exceptions to Terms and Conditions

Additional Comments

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

INCLUDED

NONE

NONE

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

KEY BRADLEY, V.P. - 281-377-1986

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

NONE

NONE

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

INCLUDED

GRACE FLAHERTY - 832-309-0896

N/A

N/A

NONE

NONE

INCLUDED

N/A

AMBER BOCK - 979-388-9998

N/A

N/A

AMBER BOCK - 979-388-9998

AMBER BOCK - 979-388-9998

AMBER BOCK - 979-388-9998

AMBER BOCK - 979-388-9998

AMBER BOCK - 979-388-9998

N/A

N/A

N/A N/A

N/A

INCLUDED

NONE

N/A

AMBER BRODERICK - 979-864-4600

AMBER BRODERICK - 979-864-4600

AMBER BRODERICK - 979-864-4600

AMBER BRODERICK - 979-864-4600

AMBER BRODERICK - 979-864-4600

NONE

AMBER BRODERICK - 979-864-4600

AMBER BRODERICK - 979-864-4600

AMBER BRODERICK - 979-864-4600

AMBER BRODERICK - 979-864-4600

DATE PRINTED 3/14/2016


