Open Date:

Thursday, February 25, 2016

10:00 a.m., local time

Company Name BEASLEY TIRE SERVICE - HOUSTON, INC. SOUTHERN TIRE MART, LLC ATO Z TIRE & BATTERY, INC. BRIDGESTONE AMERICAS TIRE OPERATIONS, HUNTER TIRES INC. GOOLSBEE TIRE SERVICE INC AMERICAN TIRE DISTRIBUTORS
Address P.O. BOX 11556 529 INDUSTRIAL PARK ROAD P.0. BOX 9138 1150 KATY / FT. BEND RD 5584 IMPERIAL HWY 2880 WHY 271 350 RAILHEAD ROAD
HOUSTON, TX 77293-1556 COLUMBIA, MS AMARILLO, TX KATY, TX 77493 SOUTHGATE, CA 90280 TYLER, TX 75708 FORT WORTH, TX 76106

ITB #16-24 Tires

Contact Name

ROB LILES

RICHARD CONWILL

PHILLIP MUSSBAUM

MICHAEL REILLY

MATTHEW SHENOUDA

RHEANNE GOOLSBEE

ROGER WEBSTER

Telephone

(281) 449-2365

(877) 786-4681

806) 373-2592

Fax Number

(281) 449-7239

(214) 389-7111

(281) 371-0394

(626) 600-4676

(903) 593-3561

(806) 373-6504

(281) 371-0373

(626) 722-5835

(903) 593-9646

(682) 499-7735

Contact for Orders

ROB LILES (713) 816-6797

RICHARD CONWILL (877) 786-4681

CARLOS CARDENAS (713) 956-5270

MICHAEL REILLY (346) 901-4314

MATTHEW SHENOUDA (626)600-4676

800) 722-6917

RHEANNE GOOLSBEE (903) 593-3561

ROGER WESTER (800) 722-6917

Contact for Billing ROB LILES (713) 816-6797 RICHARD CONWILL (877) 786-4681 MATT JUPE (806) 373-2592, EXT 1236 APRIL LAYTON (281) 371-0394 MATTHEW SHENOUDA (626)600-4676 SUSAN GOOLSBEE (903) 593-3561 SHERRY MCGEE (800) 722-6917
COUNTY VENDOR
ITEM D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME MFR PART # DESCRIPTION MFRNAME | MFRPART # | PART# PRICE DESCRIPTION MFR NAME | VENDOR PART # PRICE MFR NAME | MFR PART # | VENDOR PART # PRICE MFR NAME | VENDOR PART # PRICE MFR NAME | VENDOR PART # PRICE MFR NAME | VENDOR PART # PRICE MFR NAME | VENDOR PART # PRICE
P215/70R16 99T LONG TRAIL COOPER
1 7347 _|P215/70R16, DUELER H/T BRIDGESTONE 000010 T/ATOUR BF GOODRICH 15953 $97.00 _|P215/70R16, DUELER H/T #000010 $138.00 STARFIRE _| 900000-7523 51045 $84.00 $145.62 BRIDGESTONE #000010 $174.00 BRIDGESTONE 000010 $141.60 BRIDGESTONE 000010 $133.20
SAMSON
2 7348 |225/70R19.5 BS R250F 12 PLY BRIDGESTONE 153028 225/70R19.5XZE F MICHELIN 81473 $257.00 | 225/70R19.5 BS R250F 12 PLY #153028 $266.00 GL283 880152 61128015 $107.00 $266.86 BRIDGESTONE #153028 $354.00 BRIDGESTONE 153028 $250.50 BRIDGESTONE 153028 $250.99
LT265/75R16 E 123Q ALL- LT265/75R16 DESTINATION
3 7349 |LT265/75R16 DESTINATION M/T, 10 PLY, OWL FIRESTONE 223589 TERRAIN T/A KO BF GOODRICH 71887 $152.00  |M/T, 10 PLY, OWL #223589 $152.00 KANATIMT | LTG162-6575 | LTG162-6575 $129.00 $152.93 FIRESTONE #223589 $171.00 FIRESTONE 223589 $148.90 FIRESTONE 223589 $146.81
LT245/75R16 DUELER A/T
4 7351 _|LT245/75R16 DUELER A/T REVO BRIDGESTONE 212107 LT245/75R16 E 120R LTX AIT2 | MICHELIN 8115 $133.00 _|REVO #212107 $148.00 ADVANTAAT | 195233-4763 | 195233-4763 $103.00 $148.08 BRIDGESTONE #212107 $206.00 BRIDGESTONE 212107 $144.00 BRIDGESTONE 212107 $140.68
LT265/75R16/E DUELER AT
5 7353 _|LT265/75R16/E DUELER A/T REVO BRIDGESTONE 206548 LT265/75R16 E 123R LTX A/T2 | MICHELIN 6924, $147.00 _|REVO #206548 $173.00 ADVANTAAT | 195223-6763 | 195223-6763 $113.00 $173.64 BRIDGESTONE #206548 $219.00 BRIDGESTONE 206548 $169.50 BRIDGESTONE 206548 $165.05
11R22.5 FS-561, 14 PLY, SAMSON
6 7354 |11R22.5 FS-561, 14 PLY, STEEL RADIAL FIRESTONE 248307 11R22.5 ST244 TL LRG BF GOODRICH 40525 $291.00 | STEEL RADIAL #248307 $292.00 GL282 885352 885352 $194.00 $301.21 FIRESTONE #248307 $394.00 FIRESTONE 248307 $288.84 FIRESTONE 248307 $273.33
SAMSON
7 9062 _[11R22.5 FD691 PLUSRAD ST FIRESTONE 241558 11R22.5 DR444 LRG BF GOODRICH 77081 $335.00  |11R22.5 FD691 PLUSRAD ST #241558 $349.00 GL116S 86300-2 863002 $202.00 $349.75 FIRESTONE #241558 $443.00 FIRESTONE 241558 $336.95 FIRESTONE 241558 $334.17
11R22.5 16 PLY V STEEL LUG SAMSON
8 7477 _|11R22.5 16 PLY V STEEL LUG L320 BRIDGESTONE 186318 11R22.5 XDN2 H MICHELIN 64321 $455.00 |L320 #186318 $468.00 GL266D 86005N-2 61186005 $207.00 $468.19 BRIDGESTONE #186318 $649.00 BRIDGESTONE 186318 $457.99 BRIDGESTONE 186318 $452.53
LT215/85R16 E 115R
COMMERCIAL T/A ALL LT215/85R16 TRANSFORCE
9 7356 _|LT215/85R16 TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 189701 SEASON 2 BF GOODRICH 19836 $112.00 #189701 $103.00 | ADVANTACLT | 19522-01863 | 19522-01863 $80.00 $103.52 FIRESTONE #189701 $159.00 FIRESTONE 189701 $98.99 FIRESTONE 189701 $99.38
LT235/85R16 E 120 Q
COMMERCIAL T/A ALL LT235/85R16E TRANSFORCE
10 7357 _|LT235/85R16E TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 189718 SEASON BF GOODRICH 34213 $122.00 |HT #189718 $114.00 | DURO DL6000 | 866000-16235E | 866000-16235E $102.00 $114.80 FIRESTONE #180718 $165.00 FIRESTONE 189718 $110.27 FIRESTONE 189718 $109.61
LT235/75R15 C 104S ALL- LT235/75R15, TRANSFORCE
11 7359 |LT235/75R15, TRANSFORCE H/T FIRESTONE 189837 TERRAIN T/A KO2 BF GOODRICH 11341 $117.00 #189387 $103.00 | DURO DL6000 | 866000-15235D | 866000-15235D $87.00 $103.67 FIRESTONE #189387 $159.00 FIRESTONE 189837 $99.14 FIRESTONE 189837 $99.52
LT265/70R17 121/118S ALL- LT265/70R17, DESTNATION POWER TRAC
12 7360 |LT265/70R17, DESTNATION M/T WITH UNI-OWL FIRESTONE 190296 TERRAIN T/A KO2 BF GOODRICH 76397 $162.00 | M/T WITH UNI-OWL #190296 $153.00 mMT PO305-W1 PO305-W1 $117.00 $153.31 FIRESTONE #190296 $268.00 FIRESTONE 190296 $148.78 FIRESTONE 190296 $145.64
LT245/70R17 E 119R
COMMERCIAL T/A ALL LT245/70R17, TRANSFORCE COOPER
13 7361 |LT245/70R17, TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 191316 SEASON 2 BF GOODRICH 30539 $128.00 #191316 $120.00 STARFIRE 9-2358-5 9-2358-5 $115.00 $120.24 FIRESTONE #191316 $183.00 FIRESTONE 191316 $115.71 FIRESTONE 191316 $114.23
SAMSON
14 7362 _|255/70R22.5, R250, 16 PLY. BRIDGESTONE 216568 255/70R22.5 XZE* LRH MICHELIN 61737 $395.00 _ |255/70R22.5, R250, 16 PLY #216568 $397.00 GL283 88025-2 88025 $138.00 $411.19 BRIDGESTONE #216568 $596.00 BRIDGESTONE 216568 $398.98 BRIDGESTONE 216568 $381.12
LT265/70R17 E 121R
COMMERCIAL T/A ALL LT265/70R17, 10 PLY, COOPER
15 7365 _|LT265/70R17, 10 PLY, TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 200156 SEASON 2 BF GOODRICH 17795 $147.00 | TRANSFORCE HT #200156 $134.00 STARFIRE 2063865 51018 $137.00 $134.18 FIRESTONE #200156 $197.00 FIRESTONE 200156 $129.65 FIRESTONE 200156 $128.81
LT265/70R17 E 121R ALL- LT265/70R17 TRANSFORCE
16 7366 |LT265/70R17 TRANSFORCE ALL TERRAIN FIRESTONE 200190 TERRAIN T/A KO BF GOODRICH 72981 $203.00 _|ALL TERRAIN #200190 $137.00 ADVANTAAT | 195223-7763 | 195223-7763 $119.00 $137.39 FIRESTONE #200190 $208.00 FIRESTONE 200190 $132.86 FIRESTONE 200190 $130.52
LT245/75R17 E 121R
COMMERCIAL T/A ALL LT245/75R17, TRANSFORCE COOPER
17 7367 _|LT245/75R17, TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 207483 SEASON 2 BF GOODRICH 39531 $137.00  |HT #207483 $123.00 STARFIRE 9-19679 9-19679 $123.00 $123.66 FIRESTONE #207483 $198.00 FIRESTONE 207483 $119.13 FIRESTONE 207483 $118.71
TIRE, FIRESTONE
P265/60R17 108V FIREHAWK FIREHAWK
18 P265/60R17 108V FIREHAWK GT PURSUIT FIRESTONE 023189 GT PURSUIT FIRESTONE 23189 $375.00 NOBID NO BID NOBID NOBID 265/70R17 108V $117.36 FIRESTONE #023189 $447.00 FIRESTONE 023189 $113.34 FIRESTONE 023189 $110.95
BRIDGESTONE M724 F
225/70R19.5 BSA M724LP, SAMSON
19 7369 [225/70R19.5 BSA M724LP, 12PLY BRIDGESTONE 153028 - - - - - 12PLY #272876 $252.00 GL283 88015-2 61128015 $107.00 $266.86 BRIDGESTONE #153028 $364.00 BRIDGESTONE 153028 $259.50 BRIDGESTONE 153028 $250.99
SAMSON
20 7370 [11R22.5 FD663, 14 PLY, TL FIRESTONE 281042 11R22.5 DR444 LRG BF GOODRICH 77081 $335.00  |11R22.5 FD663, 14 PLY, TL #281042 $314.00 GL266D 86000N-2 61186000 $204.00 $320.55 FIRESTONE #281042 $447.00 FIRESTONE 281042 $286.95 FIRESTONE 281042 $295.16
POWERTRAC
21 7371 _|385/65R22.5 M854 BRIDGESTONE 241439 385/65R22.5 XZY3 160K (LRJ) MICHELIN 53779 $585.00 _ |385/65R22.5 M854 #241239 $586.00 CROSSTRAC P000302 P000302 $245.00 $599.15 BRIDGESTONE #241239 $837.00 BRIDGESTONE 241439 $587.95 BRIDGESTONE 241439 $570.12
POWERTRAC
22 7373 _|385/65R22.5 T839 WIDEBASE FIRESTONE 294586 385/65R22.5 ST565 LRJ BF GOODRICH 64873 $440.00 | 385/65R22.5 T839 WIDEBASE #294586 $455.00 CROSSTRAC P000302 P000302 $245.00 $455.16 FIRESTONE #294586 $609.00 FIRESTONE 294586 $448.93 FIRESTONE 294586 $439.28
SAMSON
23 7376 [11R24.5 FS561 14PLY TL FIRESTONE 248358 11R24.5 ST244 TL LRG BF GOODRICH 51477 $320.00 _ |11R24.5 FS561 14PLY TL #248358 $318.00 GL282 88540-2 885402 $205.00 $334.80 FIRESTONE #248358 $442.00 FIRESTONE 248358 $323.60 FIRESTONE 248358 $302.18
11L-16 12 PLY TUBELESS 11L-16 12 PLY TUBELESS SAMSON
24 7380 [11L-16 12 PLY TUBELESS INDUSTRIAL FIRESTONE 326089 INDUSTRIAL FIRESTONE 326089 $152.00 | INDUSTRIAL #326089 $152.00 BACKHOE 19521-2 700014 $141.00 $152.46 FIRESTONE #326089 $243.00 FIRESTONE 326089 $148.23 FIRESTONE 326089 $146.46
LT245/70R17 E 119R ALL- LT245/70R17, DESTINATION KANATI TRL
25 7383 _|LT245/70R17, DESTINATION MT FIRESTONE 000174 TERRAIN T/A KO BF GOODRICH 34162 $152.00 #000174 $155.00 HOG LTG176-4570 | LTG176-4570 $130.00 $155.02 FIRESTONE #000174 $249.00 FIRESTONE 000174 $150.79 FIRESTONE 000174 $147.27
LT245/70R17 E 119R
COMMERCIAL T/A ALL LT245/70R17, DESTINATION
26 9191 [LT245/70R17, DESTINATION AT FIRESTONE 054273 SEASON 2 BF GOODRICH 30539 $111.00  |AT #054273 $113.00 COOPER AT3 303396 51711 $140.00 $113.72 FIRESTONE #054273 $202.00 FIRESTONE 054273 $260.28 FIRESTONE 054273 $109.17
P245/70R17 108T LONG TRAIL
27 7486 | DESTINATION LE, P245/70R17 FIRESTONE 97827 T/ATOUR BF GOODRICH 31653 $100.00 | DESTINATION LE, P245/70R17 #097827 $103.00 | ADVANTASUV| 1952317745 | 1952317745 $93.00 $103.35 FIRESTONE #97827 $175.00 FIRESTONE 97827 $99.12 FIRESTONE 97827 $99.22
DURAVIS LT245/75R16 BSA COOPER
28 7680 _|DURAVIS LT245/75R16 BSA R250 BRIDGESTONE 210815 LT245/75R16 E 120Q XPS RIB MICHELIN 26848 $187.00 _ |R250 #210815 $190.00 STARFIRE 2134723 51013 $118.00 $190.27 BRIDGESTONE #210815 $266.00 BRIDGESTONE 210815 $186.04 BRIDGESTONE 210815 $182.66
V STEEL VUT
V STEEL VUT ULTRATRACTION 1400R24 14.00R24 XGLA2 TL TG G2, ULTRATRACTION 1400R24 ADVANCE
29 7681 |RADIAL BRIDGESTONE 293954 L2t MICHELIN 15024 $850.00 | RADIAL #293954 $964.00 GLR82 41401G 41401G-AV $600.00 $964.53 BRIDGESTONE #293954 $1,533.00 BRIDGESTONE 293954 $038.50 BRIDGESTONE 293954 $025.95
LT245/75R16 E 120Q
LT245/75-16 10 PLY LOAD RANGE E, COMMERCIAL T/A ALL LT245/75-16 10 PLY LOAD
30 9309 |TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 189769 SEASON BF GOODRICH 89589 $138.00 _|RANGE E, TRANSFORCE HT #189769 $110.00 | DURO DL6000 | 866000-16245E | 866000-16245E $105.00 $110.11 FIRESTONE #189769 $177.00 FIRESTONE 189769 $105.88 FIRESTONE 189769 $105.71
FIRESTONE FD663 SAMSON
31 8179 [11R22.5 16 PLY, STEEL LUG ADVANCE 86000 1R22.5 RD30 TTL LRH UNIROYAL 4433 $225.00  |11R22.5 16 PLY, STEEL LUG #2112036 $334.00 GL266D 86005N-2 61186005 $207.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID ADVANCE 86000 $329.00 ADVANCE 61107175 $235.00 ADVANCE 90302 $168.07
GOODYEAR R-3
23.1X 26, 12 PLY, TUBELESS 23.1 X 26, 12 PLY, TUBELESS
32 8182 [23.1 X 26, 12 PLY, TUBELESS R1 TRACTION BKT 12 PLY 94005079 R 1, TRACTION FIRESTONE 344052 $1,200.00 _|R1 TRACTION #4AW8EE $1,091.00 SAMSON RI 97065-2 708538 $610.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID BKT 12 PLY 94005079 $1,164.00 BKT 12 PLY 94005079 $980.00 BKT 12 PLY 344052 $1,423.00
FIRESTONE FIREHAWK GT Z
P235/55R17 98H ENERGY PURSUIT
33 7164 |EAGLE RSA, P235/55R17 GOODYEAR 732002500 MXV4 PLUS MICHELIN 13333 $107.00 _|EAGLE RSA, P235/55R17 #003874 $105.00 COOPER CS5 9-20869 9-20869 $100.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID GOODYEAR 732002500 $294.00 GOODYEAR 732002500 $108.04 GOODYEAR 732002500 $107.78
FIRESTONE FIREHAWK OV41
34 7165 |EAGLE RSA, P225/60R16 GOODYEAR 732354500 P225/60R16 97S SYMMETRY MICHELIN 98499 $87.00 _ |EAGLE RSA, P225/60R16 #067911 $92.00 COOPER CS5 9-20266 9-20266 $92.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID GOODYEAR 732354500 $199.00 GOODYEAR 732354500 $91.95 GOODYEAR 732354500 $90.22
KENDA KLEVER
35 7169 |INTEGRITY, P235/70R16 GOODYEAR 402027477 P235/70R16 101T LTX M/S2 MICHELIN 7253 $116.00 INTEGRITY, P235/70R16 #150011 $95.00 ADVANTA SUV | 195231-6735 195231-6735 $79.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 402027477 $148.00 GOODYEAR 402027477 $101.31 GOODYEAR 402027477 $99.69
FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
36 7183 |WRANGLER HT, LT245/75R16 GOODYEAR 744395900 | LT245/75R16 E 120R LTX A/T2 | MICHELIN 8115 $133.00 |WRANGLER HT, LT245/75R16 #189769 $110.00 | DURO DL6000 | 866000-16245E | 866000-16245E $105.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID GOODYEAR 744395900 $178.00 GOODYEAR 744395900 $132.60 GOODYEAR 744395900 $130.48
FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
WRANGLER HTS, 8666000-
37 7184 |WRANGLER HTS, LT235/85R16E GOODYEAR 744725502 LT235/85R16 E 120R LTX A/IT2 MICHELIN 25548 $142.00 LT235/85R16E #189718 $114.00 DURO DL6000 16235E 8666000-16235E $102.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID GOODYEAR 744725502 $197.00 GOODYEAR 744725502 $127.71 GOODYEAR 744725502 $125.99
FIRESTONE DESTINATION
P235/75R16 XL 109T LONG LE2
38 7189 |WRANGLER ST, P235/75R16 GOODYEAR 773430430 TRAIL T/A TOUR BF GOODRICH 22027 $94.00 _ |WRANGLER ST, P235/75R16 #140378 $105.00 COOPER HT 366583 50526 $99.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID GOODYEAR 773430430 $189.00 GOODYEAR 773430430 $110.20 GOODYEAR 773430430 $108.98
FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
WRANGLER SRA, COOPER
39 7327 |WRANGLER SRA, LT245/75R17 GOODYEAR 179636492 | LT245/75R17 E 121R LTX A/IT2|  MICHELIN 13022 $152.00  |LT245/75R17 #207483 $123.00 STARFIRE 919679 9-19679 $123.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID GOODYEAR 179636492 $258.00 GOODYEAR 179636492 $154.35 GOODYEAR 179636492 $152.98
FIRESTONE DESTINATION
LE2 POWERTRAC
40 7412 |WRANGLER SRA, P265/70R17 GOODYEAR 183106436 P265/70R17 113S LTX AIT2 MICHELIN 70371 $145.00 _|WRANGLER SRA, P265/70R17 #001737 $105.00 CITY ROVER PO09OH1L PO099HL $84.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID GOODYEAR 183106436 $212.00 GOODYEAR 183106436 $116.20 GOODYEAR 183106436 $114.94
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FIRESTONE DESTINATION
LE2
41 7413 |WRANGLER SRA, P235/70R17 GOODYEAR 183783418 P235/70R17 XL 108T LTX M/S2 MICHELIN 1721 $122.00 WRANGLER SRA, P235/70R17 #097776 $101.00 COOPER SRX 9-22264 9-22264 $120.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID GOODYEAR 183783418 $235.00 GOODYEAR 183783418 $132.33 GOODYEAR 183783418 $101.76
FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
42 7470 _|WRANGLER SRA LT235/85R16 GOODYEAR 179745217 | LT235/85R16 E 120R LTX M/S2|  MICHELIN 19595 $149.00  |WRANGLER SRA LT235/85R16 #189718 $114.00 DURO DL6000 | 866000-16235E | 866000-16235E $102.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 179745217 $233.00 GOODYEAR 179745217 $133.21 GOODYEAR 179745217 $130.98
FIRESTONE DESTINATION
LE2 POWERTRAC
43 7472 _|WRANGLER HP P275/60R20 GOODYEAR 403934174 P275/60R20 114T LTX M/S2 MICHELIN 75433 $171.00 __JWRANGLER HP P275/60R20 #136145 $122.00 CITY RACING P0293H1 P0293H1 $99.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 403934174 $211.00 GOODYEAR 403934174 $167.99 GOODYEAR 403934174 $165.33
FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
LT215/85R16 E 115R WRANGLER HT,
44 7484 |WRANGLER HT, LT215/85R16E GOODYEAR 744821900 DEFENDER LTX M/S MICHELIN 2903 $136.00 _ |LT215/85R16E #189701 $103.00 | ADVANTACLT | 195220-1863 195220-1863 $80.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 744821900 $203.00 GOODYEAR 744821900 $125.28 GOODYEAR 744821900 $123.37
FIRESTONE PRECISION
TOURING
INTEGRITY, P225/60R16 97S POWERTRAC
45 7628 |INTEGRITY, P225/60R16 97S S1 GOODYEAR 402314073 P225/60R16 97S SYMMETRY MICHELIN 98499 $13000  |S1 #140752 $80.00 CITYTOUR P0042H1 PO042H1 $51.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 402314073 $138.00 GOODYEAR 402314073 $86.23 GOODYEAR 402314073 $83.37
WRANGLER SRA OWL,
P265/70R17 113R, S2
FIRESTONE DESTINATION POWERTRAC
46 7630 | WRANGLER SRA OWL, P265/70R17 113R, S2 GOODYEAR 183106418 P265/70R17 LTX M/S MICHELIN 66259 $14500  |LE2 #001737 $105.00 CITYROVER PO099H1 PO099HL $84.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 183106418 $213.00 GOODYEAR 183106418 $116.20 GOODYEAR 183106418 $114.60
WRANGLER SRA OWL,
47 7631 _|WRANGLER SRA OWL, P235/70R16 104S, S2 GOODYEAR 183407418 P235/70R16 104T LTX M/S2 MICHELIN 7253 $116.00 | P235/70R16 KENDA KLEVER #150011 $95.00 ADVANTA SUV | 195231-6735 195231-6735 $79.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 183407418 $207.00 GOODYEAR 183407418 $112.10 GOODYEAR 183407418 $110.72
WRANGLER SRA OWL,
P255/65R17 108S, SL
FIRESTONE DESTINATINO POWERTRAC
48 7633 |WRANGLER SRA OWL, P255/65R17 108S, SL GOODYEAR 183579418 P255/65R17 108T LTX M/S2 MICHELIN 18907 $130.00 |LE2 #098048 $105.00 CITYROVER PO349H1 PO349H1 $78.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 183579418 $219.00 GOODYEAR 183579418 $120.43 GOODYEAR 183579418 $118.71
WRANGLER SR-A
LT265/75R16 E 123R LT265/75R16 123/120R E
49 7809 |WRANGLER SR-A LT265/75R16 123/120R E GOODYEAR 179746492 DEFENDER LTX M/S MICHELIN 56522 $151.00 _ |FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT #189786 $126.00 DURO DL6000 | 866000-16265E | 866000-16265E $117.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 179746492 $252.00 GOODYEAR 179746492 $142.12 GOODYEAR 179746492 $140.50
FIRESTONE DESTINATION
LE2
WRANGLER SR-A P255/70R16 POWERTRAC
50 7811 |WRANGLER SR-A P255/70R16 109S S2 GOODYEAR 183601418 P255/70R16 109T LTX M/S2 MICHELIN 23111 $124.00 _ |109S S2 #097844 $114.00 CITYROVER PO101H1 PO101H1 $75.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 183601418 $184.00 GOODYEAR 183601418 $107.56 GOODYEAR 183601418 $106.36
WRANGLER DURATRAC
WRANGLER DURATRAC LT285/70R17 121/118Q LT285/70R17 E 121R LT285/70R17 121/118Q D KANATI TRL
51 7812 |D GOODYEAR 312015027 DEFENDER LTX M/S MICHELIN 33533 $178.00 _|FIRESTONE DESTINATION AT #232803 $150.00 HOG LTG172-8570 | LTG172-8570 $154.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 312015027 $335.00 GOODYEAR 312015027 $201.97 GOODYEAR 312015027 $200.71
FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE HT
52 7814 |WRANGLER HT LT225/75R16E GOODYEAR 744830900 | LT225/75R16 E 115E LTX M/S2 MICHELIN 5681 $132.00  |WRANGLER HT LT225/75R16E #189753 $111.00 | ADVANTACLT | 195220-2763 195220-2763 $84.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 744830900 $179.00 GOODYEAR 744830900 $122.58 GOODYEAR 744830900 $120.78
FIRESTONE DESTINATION
LE2
P215/75R15 100T LONG TRAIL WRANGLER SR-A P215/75R15 COOPER
53 7750 |WRANGLER SR-A P215/75R15 100S S2 GOODYEAR 183025418 T/ATOUR BF GOODRICH 32459 $85.00 100s s2 #140310 $84.00 STARFIRE 340 2050716 34015 $57.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 183025418 $157.00 GOODYEAR 183025418 $87.23 GOODYEAR 183025418 $85.02
BRIDGESTONE R268 ECOPIA
11R225 144/142L G G661 HAS SAMSON
54 7641 |11R225 144/142L G G661 HAS TL GOODYEAR 138953337 11R22.5 XZE2 LRG MICHELIN 78390 $40000  |TL #248783 $363.00 GL282 88534-2 885342 $193.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 138953337 $511.00 GOODYEAR 138953337 $401.88 GOODYEAR 138953337 $400.49
FIRESTONE T839 POWERTRAC
55 7753 |385/65R225 J G296 MSA TL GOODYEAR 756315365 385/65R22.5 XZY3 160K (LRJ) MICHELIN 53779 $585.00 385/65R225 J G296 MSA TL #294586 $455.00 CROSSTRAC P000302 P000302 $245.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID GOODYEAR 756315365 $717.00 GOODYEAR 756315365 $610.41 GOODYEAR 756315365 $608.89
FIRESTONE PRECISION
TOURING
ASSURANCE COMTRD POWERTRAC
56 7806 | ASSURANCE COMTRD P225/60R16 97T S1 GOODYEAR 413314511 P225/60R16 97S SYMMETRY MICHELIN 98499 $100.00 _ |P225/60R16 97T S1 #140752 $80.00 CITYTOUR P0042H1 PO042H1 $51.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 413314511 $169.00 GOODYEAR 413314511 $113.03 GOODYEAR 413407329 $94.65
ASSURANCE FUEL MAX,
215/60R16 95V SL
215/60R16 95V PRIMACY BRIDGESTONE ECOPIA
57 8154 |ASSURANCE FUEL MAX, 215/60R16 95V SL GOODYEAR 738571571 MICHELIN 13397 $114.00 EP422 #006002 $107.00 COOPER CS5 9-20265 9-20265 $77.19 NO BID NOBID NO BID GOODYEAR 738571571 $133.00 GOODYEAR 738571571 $77.02 GOODYEAR 738571571 $74.97
P265/60R17 108V SL EAG RS-
A VSBRPTL (Tahoe)
P265/60R17 108V SL EAG RS-A VSBRPTL P265/60R17 108V FIREHAWK FIRESTONE FIREHAWK GT V
58 9065 _|(Tahoe) GOODYEAR 732301500 GT PURSUIT FIRESTONE 23189 $375.00 |PURSUIT #023189 $117.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 732301500 $294.00 GOODYEAR 732301500 $124.43 GOODYEAR 732301500 $124.11
FIRESTONE FIREHAWK GT Z
PURSUIT
EAGLE RSA VSB TL 245/55R18 EAGLE RSA VSB TL
59 9174 |EAGLE RSA VSB TL 245/55R18 103V GOODYEAR 732026500 103v GOODYEAR 732026500 $235.00 245/55R18 103V, #000177 $123.00 NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID GOODYEAR 732026500 $268.00 GOODYEAR 732026500 $126.38 GOODYEAR 732026500 $125.19
WRANGLER AT LT245/75R17
WRANGLER AT LT245/75R17 121S E 121S E ADVENTURE OWL
60 9192 |ADVENTURE OWL GOODYEAR 748104571 | LT245/75R17 E 121R LTX MIS2|  MICHELIN 31733 $162.00 _|FIRESTONE TRANSFORCE AT #205222 $124.00 ADVANTAAT | 195223-4773 195223-4773 $114.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 748104571 $288.00 GOODYEAR 748104571 $167.76 GOODYEAR 748104571 $166.83
MARATHON ST235/80R16E GLADIATOR
61 9193 |MARATHON ST235/80R16E TRLR BSLRPTL ITC GOODYEAR 762394406 ST235/80R16 E RAD TRLT RH CARLISLE 5151501 $80.00 TRLR BSLRPTL ITC #762-394-406 $138.00 QR25 114200-2863 114200-2863 $77.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 762394406 $162.00 GOODYEAR 762394406 $126.49 GOODYEAR 762394406 $125.49
TIRE, GOODYEAR
FIRESTONE DESTINATION MT
TIRE, GOODYEAR o
[m] LT245/75R16 120Q E WRL LT245/75R16 120Q E WRL KANATI MUD
62 LT245/75R16 120Q E WRL MT/R KEVLAR BSL GOODYEAR 750151326 MT/R KEVLAR GOODYEAR 750151326 $225.00 MT/R KEVLAR BSL #155543 $134.00 HOG 11622475 11622475 $128.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID GOODYEAR 750151326 $288.00 GOODYEAR 750151326 $166.22 GOODYEAR 750151326 $165.55
[BRIDGESTONE DUELER AT
REVO 2
TIRE, GOODYEAR 245/75/17 KANATI TRL
63 245/75/17 MT/R X4 GOODYEAR 750707326 245/75R17 EXO GRAPPLER NITTO 206-940 $185.00  |MT/R X4 #212192 $129.00 HOG LTG172-4575 LTG172-4575 $133.00 NO BID NOBID NO BID GOODYEAR 750707326 $292.00 GOODYEAR 750707326 $169.56 GOODYEAR 750707326 $168.76
ADDENDUM INCLUDED?! YES NO YES 1 INCLUDED YES YES YES
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS?| N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A
COMMENTS N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A




Open Date:

Company Name

SOILEAU'S PARTS & SERVICE INC.

STROUHAL TIRE RECAPPING PLANT LTD

Thursday, February 25, 2016

Address

1006 E. MULBERRY

25503 SOUTH FRWY 288

10:00 a.m., local time

ANGLETON, TX 77515

ROSHARON, TX 77583

ITB #16-24 Tires

Contact Name

MARK SOILEAU

PERRY BELINOWSKI

Telephone

(979) 849-6282

(713) 436-4000

Fax Number

(979) 849-1882

(713) 436-1196

Contact for Orders

MARK SOILEAU (979) 849-6282

PERRY BELINOWSKI (832) 731-3754

Contact for Billing ERIC STEVEN (979) 849-6282 ELAINE PHELPS (979) 532-1579
COUNTY
ITEM D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME MFR PART # MFR NAME VENDOR PART # PRICE MFR NAME VENDOR PART # PRICE
1 7347 |P215/70R16, DUELER H/IT BRIDGESTONE 000010 NO BID NO BID NO BID BRIDGESTONE 000010 $145.62
2 7348 [225/70R19.5 BS R250F 12 PLY BRIDGESTONE 153028 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
3 7349 [LT265/75R16 DESTINATION M/T, 10 PLY, OWL FIRESTONE 223589 NOBID NO BID NO BID FIRESTONE 223589 $152.93
4 7351 |LT245/75R16 DUELER A/T REVO BRIDGESTONE 212107 NO BID NO BID NO BID BRIDGESTONE 212107 $148.08
5 7353 [LT265/75R16/E DUELER A/T REVO BRIDGESTONE 206548 $209.63 BRIDGESTONE 206548 $173.64
6 7354 |11R22.5 FS-561, 14 PLY, STEEL RADIAL FIRESTONE 248307 $385.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID
7 9062 |11R22.5 FD691 PLUSRAD ST FIRESTONE 241558 $416.04 NOBID NO BID NOBID
8 7477 |11R22.5 16 PLY V STEEL LUG L320 BRIDGESTONE 186318 $616.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID
9 7356 |LT215/85R16 TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 189701 $139.37 FIRESTONE 189701 $103.52
10 7357 | LT235/85R16E TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 189718 $145.39 FIRESTONE 189718 $114.80
11 7359 [LT235/75R15, TRANSFORCE H/T FIRESTONE 189837 $139.52 FIRESTONE 189837 $103.67
12 7360 [LT265/70R17, DESTNATION M/T WITH UNI-OWL FIRESTONE 190296 $252.90 FIRESTONE 190296 $153.31
13 7361 [LT245/70R17, TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 191316 $166.39 FIRESTONE 191316 $120.24
14 7362 [255/70R22.5, R250, 16 PLY BRIDGESTONE 216568 $540.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
15 7365 |LT265/70R17, 10 PLY, TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 200156 $187.21 FIRESTONE 200156 $134.18
16 7366 | LT265/70R17 TRANSFORCE ALL TERRAIN FIRESTONE 200190 $194.64 FIRESTONE 200190 $137.39
17 7367 _|LT245/75R17, TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 207483 $188.42 FIRESTONE 207483 $123.66
18 P265/60R17 108V FIREHAWK GT PURSUIT FIRESTONE 023189 NO BID NOBID NO BID FIRESTONE 023189 $116.36
19 7369 |225/70R19.5 BSA M724LP, 12PLY BRIDGESTONE 153028 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
20 7370 |11R22.5 FD663, 14 PLY, TL FIRESTONE 281042 $432.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID
21 7371 |385/65R22.5 M854 BRIDGESTONE 241439 NO BID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID
22 7373 |385/65R22.5 T839 WIDEBASE FIRESTONE 294586 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
23 7376 _|11R24.5 FS561 14PLY TL FIRESTONE 248358 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
24 7380 |11L-16 12 PLY TUBELESS INDUSTRIAL FIRESTONE 326089 $201.77 NO BID NO BID NO BID
25 7383 |LT245/70R17, DESTINATION MT FIRESTONE 000174 NO BID NO BID NO BID FIRESTONE 000174 $155.02
26 9191 |LT245/70R17, DESTINATION AT FIRESTONE 054273 NO BID NO BID NO BID FIRESTONE 054273 $113.72
27 7486 | DESTINATION LE, P245/70R17 FIRESTONE 97827 $147.26 FIRESTONE 97827 $103.35
28 7680 | DURAVIS LT245/75R16 BSA R250 BRIDGESTONE 210815 NO BID NO BID NO BID BRIDGESTONE 210815 $190.27
V STEEL VUT ULTRATRACTION 1400R24
29 7681 |RADIAL BRIDGESTONE 293954 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
LT245/75-16 10 PLY LOAD RANGE E,
30 9309 | TRANSFORCE HT FIRESTONE 189769 $147.78 FIRESTONE 189769 $110.11
31 8179 |11R22.516 PLY, STEEL LUG ADVANCE 86000 NO BID NOBID NO BID GT RADIAL 100EV832G $300.02
32 8182 |23.1 X 26,12 PLY, TUBELESS R1 TRACTION BKT 12 PLY 94005079 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
33 7164 |EAGLE RSA, P235/55R17 GOODYEAR 732002500 $282.41 NO BID NO BID NO BID
34 7165 |EAGLE RSA, P225/60R16 GOODYEAR 732354500 $181.52 NO BID NO BID NO BID
35 7169 |INTEGRITY, P235/70R16 GOODYEAR 402027477 $100.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID
36 7183 |WRANGLER HT, LT245/75R16 GOODYEAR 744395900 $142.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID
37 7184 |WRANGLER HTS, LT235/85R16E GOODYEAR 744725502 $172.58 NO BID NO BID NOBID
38 7189 |WRANGLER ST, P235/75R16 GOODYEAR 773430430 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
39 7327 |WRANGLER SRA, LT245/75R17 GOODYEAR 179636492 $235.40 NOBID NO BID NOBID
40 7412 |WRANGLER SRA, P265/70R17 GOODYEAR 183106436 $172.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID




Open Date:

Company Name

SOILEAU'S PARTS & SERVICE INC.

STROUHAL TIRE RECAPPING PLANT LTD

Thursday, February 25, 2016

Address

1006 E. MULBERRY

25503 SOUTH FRWY 288

10:00 a.m., local time

ANGLETON, TX 77515

ROSHARON, TX 77583

ITB #16-24 Tires

Contact Name

MARK SOILEAU

PERRY BELINOWSKI

Telephone

(979) 849-6282

(713) 436-4000

Fax Number

(979) 849-1882

(713) 436-1196

Contact for Orders

MARK SOILEAU (979) 849-6282

PERRY BELINOWSKI (832) 731-3754

Contact for Billing ERIC STEVEN (979) 849-6282 ELAINE PHELPS (979) 532-1579
COUNTY
ITEM D DESCRIPTION MFR NAME MFR PART # MFR NAME VENDOR PART # PRICE MFR NAME VENDOR PART # PRICE
41 7413 |WRANGLER SRA, P235/70R17 GOODYEAR 183783418 $200.64 NOBID NO BID NOBID
42 7470 |WRANGLER SRA LT235/85R16 GOODYEAR 179745217 $197.45 NO BID NO BID NO BID
43 7472 _|WRANGLER HP P275/60R20 GOODYEAR 403934174 $187.62 NOBID NO BID NO BID
44 7484 |WRANGLER HT, LT215/85R16E GOODYEAR 744821900 $166.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
45 7628 |INTEGRITY, P225/60R16 97S S1 GOODYEAR 402314073 $112.63 NOBID NO BID NO BID
46 7630 |WRANGLER SRA OWL, P265/70R17 113R, S2 GOODYEAR 183106418 $112.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID
47 7631 |WRANGLER SRA OWL, P235/70R16 104S, S2 GOODYEAR 183407418 $170.37 NO BID NO BID NO BID
48 7633 |WRANGLER SRA OWL, P255/65R17 108S, SL GOODYEAR 183579418 $183.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID
49 7809 |WRANGLER SR-A LT265/75R16 123/120R E GOODYEAR 179746492 $216.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID
50 7811 |WRANGLER SR-A P255/70R16 109S S2 GOODYEAR 183601418 $159.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID
WRANGLER DURATRAC LT285/70R17 121/118Q
51 7812 |D GOODYEAR 312015027 $308.87 NOBID NO BID NOBID
52 7814 |WRANGLER HT LT225/75R16E GOODYEAR 744830900 $164.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID
53 7750 |WRANGLER SR-A P215/75R15 100S S2 GOODYEAR 183025418 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
54 7641 |11R225 144/142L G G661 HAS TL GOODYEAR 138953337 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
55 7753 |385/65R225 J G296 MSA TL GOODYEAR 756315365 $712.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID
56 7806 | ASSURANCE COMTRD P225/60R16 97T S1 GOODYEAR 413314511 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
57 8154 |ASSURANCE FUEL MAX, 215/60R16 95V SL GOODYEAR 738571571 $99.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID
P265/60R17 108V SL EAG RS-A VSBRPTL
58 9065 _|(Tahoe) GOODYEAR 732301500 NO BID NOBID NO BID NO BID NOBID NO BID
59 9174 |EAGLE RSA VSB TL 245/55R18 103V GOODYEAR 732026500 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WRANGLER AT LT245/75R17 121S E
60 9192 |ADVENTURE OWL GOODYEAR 748104571 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
61 9193 |MARATHON ST235/80R16E TRLR BSLRPTL ITC GOODYEAR 762394406 $146.32 NO BID NO BID NOBID
a
62 LT245/75R16 120Q E WRL MT/R KEVLAR BSL GOODYEAR 750151326 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
63 245/75/17 MT/R X4 GOODYEAR 750707326 $260.18 NO BID NO BID NOBID
ADDENDUM INCLUDED? 1 INCLUDED YES
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS? N/A N/A
COMMENTS N/A N/A




