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ALCOHOL, ISOPROPYL, 70%, 16 OZ 7291

CUMBERLAND 

SWAN CUMS08484V EA 1127067 16 OZ BT ABCO  $               5.09 1028806 16 OZ BT CUMBERLAND  $                     0.95 49176 EA MCKESSON  $                     1.27 A459500 EA THERMOSCI  $                   23.37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ALCOHOL WIPES, INDIVIDUALLY WRAPPED 7292 TRIAD TRI10-3101 200/BX 1126131 200/BX CARPVL  $               1.90 1126131 200/BX COVIDIEN  $                     1.05 191089 200/BX MCKESSON  $                     1.34 17986498 PK HONEYWELL SAFETY  $                     2.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

APPLICATORS, SCOPETTES, JR, STERILE 

COTTON TIPS, JUMBO 8"  7293 BIRCHWOOD BIR34-7021-12 100/PK 1209765 100/BX BIRLAB  $             13.80 1209765 100/BX BIRCHWOOD  $                     6.25 35628 100/PK BIRCHWOOD  $                   11.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100/PK  $                 178.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

APPLICATORS, WOOD,  COTTON TIP, 6" 

STERILE,  7294 PURITAN

HAR25-806-

2WC 100PK/BX 1205460 100/BX HARDWO  $               8.36 2670051 100/BX DYNAREX  $                     2.20 508713 100/BX MCKESSON  $                     3.23 23400110 CS THERMOSCI  $                   74.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BANDAGE JR, SHEER, 3/8 X 1 1/2 7295 KENDALL 1029409 100/BOX 8900130 100/BX KENDALL  $               3.39 6780359 100/BX MEDLINE  $                     0.83 854454 100/BOX MCKESSON  $                     1.60 1989825 PK MOORE MEDICAL  $                     3.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BANDAGE, PLASTIC, 3/4 X 3 7296

JOHNSON & 

JOHNSON JJS5634 100/BOX 5550563 60/BX J&J  $               2.23 6780359 100/BX MEDLINE  $                     1.66 464083 100/BOX MCKESSON  $                     1.65 1774423A PK DERMA SCIENCS  $                     5.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BANDAGE, SHEER, 7/8 SPOT 7297 DERMA 1307 100/BOX 1126143 100/BX ASOCPL  $               5.30 1555713 100/BX DERMA  $                     1.64 466877 100/BOX MCKESSON  $                     1.60 50256043 PK BUTLER SCHEIN  $                     3.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BANDAGE, FLEXIBLE FABRIC, 7/8 SPOT 7298 ASO AGPCBD4022 100/BOX 1668856 100/BX ASO  $               2.71 1553985 100/BX DERMA  $                     1.87 911638 100/BOX MCKESSON  $                     1.85 19027198 PK DERMA SCIENCS  $                     3.03 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

CONTAINER, SHARP, 4 QT, RED, MEDIUM, 

STACKABLE (BRAND OR EQUIVALNET) 7299

MEDICAL 

ACTION IND 8703 EA 1532682 EA ABCO  $               5.03 1532682 EA MEDICAL ACTION  $                     2.88 586905 EA MCKESSON  $                     2.80 14827198 EA COVIDEN  $                     3.77 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID EA  $                   12.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

CONTAINER SHARP 8.2 QT RED LARGE 7300

BECTON 

DICKINSON 305490 EA 9876359 EA BD  $               8.29 9876359 EA BECTOR-DICKINSON  $                     6.17 169748 EA BECTON-DICKINSON  $                     6.05 14826128 CS BD VACUTAINER  $88.53 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID EA  $                   13.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

CONTAINER SHARP 6.9 QT RED 7692

BECTON 

DICKINSON 9875824 EA 9875824 EA BD  $             10.19 9875824 EA BECTOR-DICKINSON  $                     5.83 140599 EA BECTON-DICKINSON  $                     5.70 14826127 CS BD VACUTAINER  $83.23 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID EA  $                   15.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

COTTON BALLS MEDIUM NON-STERILE 7664 RICHMOND 1000468 4000/CS 1000468 4000/CA RICHMD  $             13.93 1000468 4000/CA RICHMOND DENTAL  $                     8.82 980221 4000/CS MCKESSON  $                   11.56 22456885 CS RICHMOND  $                 174.26 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

CUP, PLASTIC, 1 OZ, GRADUATED IN CC'S 

AND OZ, 100/PKG, 7420 DYNAREX 4252 100/PK 1000580 100/PK DYNAM  $               1.90 1000580 100/PK DYNAREX  $                     0.75 188670 100/SLEEVE MCKESSON  $                     0.73 22666470 CS MEDLINE MEDICAL  $                   66.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

DRAPE SHEET 2 PLY 40 X 48 BLUE 7302

GRAHAM 

MEDICAL GRA48615 100/CS 1099605 100/CA GREBAY  $             25.59 1099605 100/CA GRAHAM  $                   18.79 201058 100/CS MCKESSON  $                   17.47 GM313 CS GRAHAM MEDICAL  $                   35.08 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

FILM DRESSING, TEGADERM, 3M, FRAME 

STYLE 1622W, 1 3/4" X 1 3/4" (BRAND ONLY) 7303 3M 3586 100/CS 7772234 25/BX 3MMED  $             35.83 7778721 100/CA 3M MEDICAL  $                 107.87 318721 100/CS 3M  $                 103.46 NC9887918 CS MED PLUS SERVICES  $                 193.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 25/BX  $                   35.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

GLOVE, EXAM, LATEX, TEXTURED, POWDER 

FREE, NOVAPLUS, SIZE MEDIUM (BRAND 

ONLY) 7305

CARDINAL 

HEALTH V8841 100/BOX 1530515 100/BX ALLEG  $               8.83 1530141 150/BX CARDINAL  $                   12.41 921593 1000/CS MCKESSON  $                   59.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID 

MED 

PRIDE/FOO

D HANDLER

MED PRIDE-

MED-LPFG-E 

AS PER 

SAMPLE #1 100/BX  $                     4.20 

GLOVE EXAM VINYL SMALL POWDER-FREE 7307 SEMPERMED 1026721 100/BOX 1026721 100/BX CARPVL  $               4.67 1026721 100/BX PINNACLE  $                     2.21 832681 150/BOX MCKESSON  $                     4.54 19121834A PK SELECT MEDICAL  $                     4.81 

SAFETY 

ZONE GVEP-1C 100/BX  $                     2.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID 

MED 

PRIDE/FOO

D HANDLER

MED PRIDE-

SM-VPFG-E 

AS PER 

SAMPLE #2 100/BX  $                     2.60 

GLOVES, VINYL, POWDER-FREE, LATEX-

FREE, CRITERION, MEDIUM, 100/BOX  7696 CRITERION 1025338 100/BOX 1025338 100/BX CARPVL  $               4.67 1025338 100/BX SEMPERMED  $                     2.19 832682 150/BOX MCKESSON  $                     4.54 19121834B PK MICROFLEX MEDICAL  $                     4.81 

SAFETY 

ZONE GVP9-1 100/BX  $                     2.56 

SMS 

ANBASSADORS SHPFVINM 100/BX  $                     2.45 

MED 

PRIDE/FOO

D HANDLER

MED PRIDE-

MED-VPFG-

E AS PER 

SAMPLE #3 100/BX  $                     2.90 

GLOVE, NITRILE, LATEX-FREE, POWDER-

FREE, TEXTURED, SUPRENO EC, SIZE 

LARGE (BRAND ONLY)

THICKNESS: 5.9 mils palm, cuf 4.7mils, 7.9 

mils finger 7768 MICROFLEX SEC-375-L 50/BOX 5657125 50/BX MICROF  $             10.63 5657125 50/BX MICROFLEX  $                     6.94 445999 50/BOX MICROFLEX  $                     6.61 19048723C CS MICROFLEX MEDICAL  $                 158.49 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  $                   62.50 AURELIA

AURELIA-

LRG-NPFG-E 

AS PER 

SAMPLE #4 50/BX  $                     2.10 

GLOVE, NITRILE, LATEX-FREE, POWDER-

FREE, TEXTURED, SUPRENO EC, SIZE 

MEDIUM (BRAND ONLY)

THICKNESS: 5.9 mils palm, cuf 4.7mils, 7.9 

mils finger 7769 MICROFLEX SEC-375-M 50/BOX 5652069 50/BX MICROF  $             10.63 5652065 50/BX MICROFLEX  $                     6.94 446000 50/BOX MICROFLEX  $                     6.61 19048723B PK MICROFLEX MEDICAL  $                   15.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  $                   62.50 AURELIA

AURELIA-

MED-NPFG-

E AS PER 

SAMPLE #5 50/BX  $                     2.10 

GLOVE, NITRILE, LATEX-FREE, POWDER-

FREE, TEXTURED, SUPRENO EC, SIZE SMALL 

(BRAND ONLY)

THICKNESS: 5.9 mils palm, cuf 4.7mils, 7.9 

mils finger 7770 MICROFLEX SEC-375-S 50/BOX 5654791 50/BX MICROF  $             10.63 5654791 50/BX MICROFLEX  $                     6.94 446001 50/BOX MICROFLEX  $                     6.61 19048123A PK MICROFLEX MEDICAL  $                   15.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 50/BX  $                   62.50 

MED 

HANDLER

MED 

HANDLER-

SM-NPFG-E 

AS PER 

SAMPLE #6 50/BX  $                     1.85 

GLOVE, DIAMOND GRIP, POWDER-FREE, 

LATEX, SMALL (BRAND ONLY)

THICKNESS: 7.2mils palm, cuff 63.0 mils, 

finger 10.3 mils 8126 MICROFLEX MF-300-S 100/BOX 5655860 100/BX MICROF  $             12.91 5655860 100/BX MICROFLEX  $                     9.38 307873 100/BOX MICROFLEX  $                     8.93 19050080A PK MICROFLEX MEDICAL  $                   15.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100/BX  $                 105.25 

MED 

PRIDE/FOO

D HANDLER

MED 

PRIDE/ELAR

A-SM-LPFG-

E AS PER 

SAMPLE #7 100/BX  $                     4.20 

GLOVE, DIAMOND GRIP, POWDER-FREE, 

LATEX, MEDIUM (BRAND ONLY)

THICKNESS: 7.2mils palm, cuff 63.0 mils, 

finger 10.3 mils 7888 MICROFLEX MF-300-M 100/BOX 5650694 100/BX MICROF  $             12.91 5650694 100/BX MICROFLEX  $                     9.38 307872 100/BOX MICROFLEX  $                     8.93 19050080C PK MICROFLEX MEDICAL  $                   15.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100/BX  $                 105.25 

MED 

PRIDE/FOO

D HANDLER

MED 

PRIDE/ELAR

A-MED-LPFG-

3 AS PER 

SAMPLE #8 100/BX  $                     4.20 

GLOVE, DIAMOND GRIP, POWDER-FREE, 

LATEX, EXTRA-LARGE (BRAND ONLY)

THICKNESS: 7.2mils palm, cuff 63.0 mils, 

finger 10.3 mils 7889 MICROFLEX MF-300-XL 100/BOX 5651329 100/BX MICROF  $             12.91 5651327 100/BX MICROFLEX  $                     9.38 307874 100/BOX MICROFLEX  $                   12.24 19050080E PK MICROFLEX MEDICAL  $                   15.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100/BX  $                 105.25 

MED 

PRIDE/FOO

D HANDLER

MED 

PRIDE/ELAR

A-XL-LPFG-3 

AS PER 

SAMPLE #9 100/BX  $                     4.20 

GLOVE, DIAMOND GRIP, POWDER-FREE, 

LATEX, LARGE (BRAND ONLY)

THICKNESS: 7.2mils palm, cuff 63.0 mils, 

finger 10.3 mils 7918 MICROFLEX MF-300-L 100/BOX 5651061 100/BX MICROF  $             12.91 5651061 100/BX MICROFLEX  $                     9.38 307871 100/BOX MICROFLEX  $                     8.93 19050080D PK MICROFLEX MEDICAL  $                   15.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100/BX  $                 105.25 

MED 

PRIDE/FOO

D HANDLER

MED 

PRIDE/ELAR

A-LRG-LPFG-

3 AS PER 

SAMPLE #10 100/BX  $                     4.20 

LUER HOLDER, MULTI-SAMPLE, 5ML, 

DISPOSABLE, NON-STERILE (BRAND ONLY) 9013

EXELENT INT'L 

CO 26530 100/BOX 3377113 100/BX EXEL  $             10.79 3377113 100/BX EXEL INTER  $                     7.39 642406 100/BAG EXEL INTERNATIONAL  $                     9.00 1484010 PK EXEL INTNL  $                   17.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SPECULA VAGINAL, DISPOSABLE, MEDIUM 7308 SANI-SPEC COO82330 10/BG 1196009 48/BX COOPSR  $               7.34 9330142 10/BG DUKAL  $                     2.55 911775 10/BOX MCKESSON  $                     3.18 NC9769194 CS SKLAR INSTRUMENTS  $                 109.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NEEDLE BLOOD 22 X 1 1/4 ECLIPSE (BRAND 

ONLY) 7309

BECTON 

DICKINSON 368608 48/BOX 9872645 100/BX BD  $             24.39 9872645 48/BX BECTOR-DICKINSON  $                   12.90 373903 48/BOX BECTON-DICKINSON  $                   20.17 2683102 PK BD VACUTAINER  $                   28.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NEEDLE ECLIPSE 23 X 1 (BRAND ONLY) 7310

BECTON 

DICKINSON 305762 100/BOX 9874963 100/BX BD  $             25.83 9874963 100/BX BECTOR-DICKINSON  $                   18.93 442026 100/BOX BECTON-DICKINSON  $                   18.92 1482121 PK BD VACUTAINER  $                   27.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100/BX  $                   85.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3ML 23 X 1 RETRACTING 

(BRAND ONLY) 7311

BECTON 

DICKINSON 305271 100/BOX 9876244 100/BX BD  $             59.83 9876244 100/BX BECTOR-DICKINSON  $                   48.20 449102 100/BOX BECTON-DICKINSON  $                   48.20 1482352 PK BD VACUTAINER  $                   72.87 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100/BX  $                 135.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 25 X 5/8 

RETRACTING (BRAND ONLY) 7312

BECTON 

DICKINSON 305269 100/BOX 9875659 100/BX BD  $             59.83 9875659 100/BX BECTOR-DICKINSON  $                   48.20 449100 100/BOX BECTON-DICKINSON  $                   48.20 1482350 PK BD VACUTAINER  $                   73.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100/BX  $                 135.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 22 X 1 1/2 

RETRACTING (BRAND ONLY) 7313

BECTON 

DICKINSON 305272 100/BOX 9875497 100/BX BD  $             59.83 9875497 100/BX BECTOR-DICKINSON  $                   48.20 449103 100/BOX BECTON-DICKINSON  $                   48.20 1482353 PK BD VACUTAINER  $                   72.78 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100/BX  $                 135.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NEEDLE, PRECISION GLIDE, 25G X 1 1/2 

(BRAND ONLY) 8127

BECTON 

DICKINSON 305127 100/BOX 9870092 100/BX BD  $             10.23 9870092 100/BX BECTOR-DICKINSON  $                     7.39 399 100/BOX BECTON-DICKINSON  $                     7.68 1482649 PK BD VACUTAINER  $                   10.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100/BX  $                   49.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BIDVACUTAINER SAFETY-LOK BLOOD 

COLLECTION SET, 23 X .75 NEEDLE WITH 12" 

TUBING (BRAND ONLY) 7315

BECTON 

DICKINSON 368653 25/BOX 9878940 25/BX BD  $             39.99 9878940 25/BX BECTOR-DICKINSON  $                   30.89 510039 25/BOX BECTON-DICKINSON  $                   30.85 268321 PK BD VACUTAINER  $                   47.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 25/BX  $                 460.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

STETHOSCOPE, DUAL-HEAD, RED 7320

PHYSICIAN 

SALES 44625 EA 9004812 EA AMDIAG  $               4.96 4996136 EA MEDSOURCE  $                     2.53 363739 EA MCKESSON  $                     2.52 18999438A EA GRAHAM MEDICAL  $                     6.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOWEL, 3 PLY, 13.5" X 18",  WHITE 7321 KAY-PEES 911898 50/BOX 8955218 50/BX TIDI  $               5.03 8955218 50/BX TIDI  $                     3.29 43890 50/BOX TIDI  $                     3.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOWEL, 4 PLY, 13.5" X 18",  WHITE 8125 KAY-PEES 50/BOX 8955218 50/BX TIDI  $               5.03 8955218 50/BX TIDI  $                     3.29 43890 50/BOX TIDI  $                     3.25 19168385 CS TIDI PRODUCTS  $                   56.81 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOURNIQUET, LATEX-FREE, 1" X 18" 7322 TECH-MED 4407 100/BOX 9330168 100/BX DUKAL  $             10.79 4673571 100/BX PDI  $                     7.50 553847 100/BOX MCKESSON  $                   12.16 2203570 PK HIGH FIVE PRODUCTS  $                   15.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOWELETTE, OBSTETRICAL (BRAND ONLY) 7323

PROFESSIONAL 

DISPOSABLES 

INTL D74800 100/BOX 1135633 100/BX NICEPK  $               7.68 1135633 100/BX PDI  $                     3.35 544410 100/BOX

PROFESSIONAL 

DISPOSABLES  $                     3.34 NC0797339 CS MCKEESON  $                   60.41 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SYRINGE WITH NEEDLE, LL, DISP, 3CC, 25G X 

5/8, 100/BOX, (BRAND ONLY) 7663

BECTON 

DICKINSON 309570 100/BOX 9872220 100/BX BD  $             17.19 9872220 100/BX BECTON  $                   11.76 455 100/BOX BECTON-DICKINSON  $                   11.75 1482682 PK BD VACUTAINER  $                   13.73 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100/BX  $                   59.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ICS JAIL SUPPLIES, INC

P.O. BOX 21056

WACO, TX 76702

MAEGAN EISENMAN

800-524-5427

254-751-0299

FISHER SCIENTIFIC COMPANY, LLC

4500 TURNBERRY DR.

HANOVER PARK, IL 60133

MARY BROOKS

800-766-7000

800-686-3857

P.O. BOX 3227

800-851-0400

631-390-8171

JESSE GARRINGER

800-845-3550

800-533-4793

HENRY SCHEIN, INC.

135 DURYEA ROAD

MELVILLE, NY 11747

CANTRELL ALVARADO

HENRY SCHEIN, INC.ITB#16-31 MEDICAL SUPPLIES

DATE OF BID OPENING:

THURSDAY, MARCH 10, 2016 AT 10:00 A.M. IRMO, SC 29063

MCKESSON MEDICAL-SURGICAL INC.

9954 MAYLAND DR., SUITE 4000

RICHMOND, VA 23233

AMANDA JOHNSON

800-328-8111

800-237-9766

SMS AMBASSADORS CORP

3601 W. ALEXIS RD SUITE 105

TOLEDO, OH 43623

AARON SHETTERLY

419-473-3103

419-473-3104

INTERBORO PACKAGING CORP

114 BRACKEN ROAD

MONTGOMERY, NY 12549

MALKY WEISS

845-782-6800

845-781-2450
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NEEDLE SYRINGE, PRECISION GLIDE, 3CC, 

23 x 1LL, 100/BOX (BRAND ONLY) 7388

BECTON 

DICKINSON 309571 100/BOX 9877076 100/BX BD  $             17.19 9877076 100/BX BECTON  $                   11.74 456 100/BOX BECTON-DICKINSON  $                   11.74 1482337 PK BD VACUTAINER  $                   13.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100/BX  $                   59.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NEEDLE, 23 X 1, PRECISION GLIDE, 100/BOX 

(BRAND ONLY) 7389

BECTON 

DICKINSON 305193 100/BOX 9875590 100/BX BD  $             10.19 9875590 100/BX BECTON  $                     7.39 95824 100/BOX BECTON-DICKINSON  $                     7.40 148266B PK BD VACUTAINER  $                     9.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100/BX  $                   38.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NEEDLE, HYPODERMIC, 23 X 1, 100/BOX 

(BRAND ONLY) 7390

BECTON 

DICKINSON 305145 100/BOX 9870934 100/BX BD  $             10.23 9870934 100/BX BECTON  $                     7.39 402 100/BOX BECTON-DICKINSON  $                     7.40 148261A PK BD VACUTAINER  $                     9.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 100/BX  $                   24.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BIDGAUZE SPONGES, COTTON WOVEN, 

STERILE, 2" X 2", 12 PLY, 2 PER PACKL, 50 

PKS/BX, 7416 DUKAL 1212 100/BOX 9336780 100/BX DUKAL  $               4.28 9336780 100/BX DUKAL  $                     2.31 501657 100/BOX MCKESSON  $                     2.55 22415504 CS DUKAL  $                   70.57 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

GAUZE, 2X2, 8 PLY, N/C WHITE, 5000/CS 7695 DUKAL 1562063 5000/CS 8520089 200/BG DUKAL  $               1.56 1562063 5000/CS DUKAL  $                   22.10 373772 5000/CS MCKESSON  $                   18.22 22415490 CS DUKAL  $                   32.17 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

GAUZE BANDAGE ROLLS, 4.5" X 3.1 YDS, 8 

PLY, STERILE, EA, 7417 KENDALL 6716 EA 8908610 EA KENDALL  $               1.56 8908610 EA COVIDIEN  $                     0.93 684279 EA COVIDIEN  $                     0.91 19898266 PK MOORE MEDICAL  $                   26.54 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID EA  $                     2.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BANDAGE, GAUZE, 2" X 3.5 YDS, STERILE, 

12/BX, 7418 KENDALL 8072 12/BOX N/A N/A N/A  N/A 8900060 96/CA COVIDIEN  $                   37.74 558737 12/SLEEVE MCKESSON  $                     4.85 19898234 PK MOORE MEDICAL  $                   14.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BIDTAPE, SURGICAL, TRANSPARENT, WATER 

RESISTANT, PERFORATED PLASTIC, 1" X 10 

YDS, 12/BOX (BRAND ONLY) 7419 3M 1527-1 12/BOX 7777305 12/BX 3M  $             22.23 7777305 12/BX 3M MEDICAL  $                   10.78 5762 12/BOX 3M  $                   10.50 18999381 PK 3M  $                   23.14 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12/BX  $                   36.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

HYDROGEN PEROXIDE, 8 OZ, EA, 7421 SWAN S1137 EA 1127012 EA ABCO  $               1.35 4718454 EA CUMBERLAND  $                     0.43 557335 EA MCKESSON  $                     0.55 H312500 EA THERMOSCI  $                   30.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SPECIMEN CUPS, WITH SCREW-ON LID AND 

LABEL, STERILE, 4 OZ, 100/BOX 7661 AMSINO AMSAS340 100/CS 7857890 100/CA AMSINO  $             19.19 6066028 100/CA GLOBE  $                   11.58 870203 100/CS MCKESSON  $                   11.92 1371156 CS THERMOSCI  $                   85.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

LANCETS, FINGERSTIX, BAYER, 200/BOX 7693 BAYER 1478204 200/BOX 1478204 200/BX ASCCIA  $             43.59 1478204 200/BX BAYER  $                   28.38 195787 200/BOX ASCENSIA  $                   35.09 AM5965 PK ASCENSIA DIABETES  $                   59.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SCALE LINERS, INFANT, 131/2X18, 2 PLY, 

500/CS 7694

GRAHAM 

MEDICAL 3959937 500/CS 1010090 500/CA TIDI  $             18.79 1106952 250/CA TIDI  $                   14.17 141718 500/CS GRAHAM MEDICAL  $                   14.65 NC0660271 EA HOPKINS MEDICAL  $                   61.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SYRINGES, VANISH PT, 1CC 

W/NEEDLE,27x1/2" 9029 RETRACTABLE 7011396 100/BOX 7011396 100/BX RETTEC  $           102.63 7011396 100/BX RETRACTABLE  $                   46.33 416664 100/BOX

RETRACTABLE 

TECHNOLOGIES  $                   46.00 50646565 PK BUTLER SCHEIN  $                 110.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

GLOVES,NITRILE, PURPLE,SIZE SMALL

THICKNESS: 6ML 9030

KIMBERLY 

CLARK 1070501 10 BOX/CS 1070501 100/BX HALYAR  $             11.99 1070501 100/BX KIMBERLY  $                     8.72 365060 100/BOX HALYARD  $                     8.72 19063128 CS KIMBERLY CLARKE  $                 171.07 AMMEX AINPF 100/BX 10/BX/CS  $                   54.63 

SMS 

ANBASSADORS

SHPFBLUN4.

5S 10 BOX/CS  $                   49.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

GLOVES,EXAM,LATEX,POWDER FREE, SIZE 

LARGE,(DASH MEDICAL GLOVES)

THICKNESS: 3.4 ml palm, 4 ml finger 9031 VITALGARD 1522450 100/BOX 1522450 100/BX DASH  $               7.47 1522450 100/BX DASH  $                     4.15 921594 100/BOX MCKESSON  $                     4.58 19130597D CS HIGH FIVE PRODUCTS  $                 144.71 

SAFETY 

ZONE M064PWF 100/BX  $                     3.90 

SMS 

ANBASSADORS

SHPFWHLT

XL 100/BX  $                     4.50 

MED 

PRIDE/FOO

D HANDLER

MED 

PRIDE/ELAR

A-LRG-LPFG-

E AS PER 

SAMPLE #11 100/BX  $                     4.20 

JELLY,LUBRICATING,STERILE,WATER 

SOLUBLE,FLIP TOP TUBE 4oz 9032 12/BOX 1125680 4 OZ/TB ULTSEH  $               1.69 1181350 12/BX HR PHARMACEUTICAL  $                   15.80 788484 12/BOX MCKESSON  $                   13.89 NC9032737 EA ANDWIN SCI  $                   14.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID HR 207 6/BX  $                     9.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BIDPROBE COVER,DISPOSABLE,SURE TEMP 

PLUS MODEL 690 & 692,ELECTRONIC 

THERMOMETER 9033 SURE TEMP 1152618 250/BOX 5660460 250/SL WEICH  $             10.79 1152618 250/PK WELCH ALLYN  $                     9.72 953916 250/BOX WELCH ALLYN  $                     9.70 50256110 PK BUTLER SCHEIN  $                   17.11 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

MASK, SURGICAL, WITH EAR LOOPS, BLUE 9034 HENRY SCHEIN 1043809 50/BOX 1043809 50/BX ARMEDC  $               5.29 1043809 50/BX AR MEDICON  $                     1.63 689981 50/BOX MCKESSON  $                     2.70 17100896 PK MOORE MEDICAL  $                     9.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BIDTUBES,CULTURE,BOROSILICATE 

GLASS,W/MARKING LABELS 

60A10BLZ,,CHASE SCIENTIFIC RIM TOP MARK- 9035

CHASE 

SCIENTIFIC 1188759 1000/CS 1188759 1000/CA CHASE  $             83.19 1188759 1000/CA KIMBLE CHASE  $                   60.30 682734 1000/CS

CHASE SCIENTIFIC 

GLASS  $                   65.63 22378897 CS KIMBLE CHASE  $                   85.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

WIPE,LARGE SURFACE,GERMICIDAL 

DISPOSABLE,SANI-CLOTH AF3, 6x6.75 9036 SANI-CLOTH AF3 2670039

160/PK

12 PK/CS 2670039 160/PK NICEPK  $               8.75 2670039 160/PK PDI  $                     5.56 804411 12/CS

PROFESSIONAL 

DISPOSABLES  $                   67.85 23100148 PK

PROFESSIONAL 

DISPOSABLE  $                   26.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  $                 148.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAPER, EXAM TABLE, WHITE, SMOOTH, 21" x 

225' ROLL

GRAHAM 

MEDICAL 42532 12/CS 39532525 12/CA GREBAY  $             36.63 3953252 12/CA GRAHAM  $                   29.63 180612 12/CS MCKESSON  $                   28.15 GM018 CS GRAHAM MEDICAL  $                   63.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID CROSSTEX ETPS21 12/CS  $                   65.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

WIPE, DISPOSABLE, SANI-CLOTH BLEACH 

GERMICIDAL, LARGE CANISTER PDI P54072 12/CS 6020021 75/PK NICEPK  $               9.59 6020021 75/PK PDI  $                     7.50 786308 12/CS

PROFESSIONAL 

DISPOSABLES  $                   92.59 23100145 PK

PROFESSIONAL 

DISPOSABLE  $                     7.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 12/CS  $                 148.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

HAND SANITIZER, INSTANT, ALOE, 8 OZ 

PUMP PURELL 9674-12 12/CS 5900011 12/BT/CA GOJO  $             51.83 5900011 12/BT/CA GOJO  $                   38.01 953791 EA MCKESSON  $                     2.10 19898479 EA MOORE MEDICAL  $                     3.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID DAVION 8 OZ. 12/CS  $                   19.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

WRAP, TAN, SELF-ADHERENT, LATEX FREE, 

ECONOMY, 1" x 5 YD ROLL

WILLIAM V. 

MACGILL

VENDOR 

PART

#53111 EA N/A N/A N/A  N/A 6819862 30/CA ANDOVER  $                   18.20 464151 EA MCKESSON  $                     0.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

APPLICATOR STICKS, PLAIN, 6"

WILLIAM V. 

MACGILL

VENDOR 

PART

#5616 1000/BX 1009175 1000/BX DALGOO  $               7.90 1009485 1000/BX GOODCARD  $                     1.30 40100 1000/BX MCKESSON  $                     4.75 23400112 PK THERMOSCI  $                     6.43 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BANDAGE, SHUR-BAND, ELASTIC, LATEX 

FREE, SURE-BAND, 2" x 5 YD ROLL HARTMAN 59520000 EA 8299953 10/BX CONCO  $             14.95 8299953 10/BX HARTMAN  $                   10.29 454618 EA MCKESSON  $                     0.43 19898299 PK MOORE MEDICAL  $                   26.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10/PK 6/CS  $                   88.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BANDAGE, SHUR-BAND, ELASTIC, LATEX 

FREE, SURE-BAND, 3" x 5 YD ROLL HARTMAN 59530000 EA 8295759 10/BX CONCO  $             19.83 8295759 10/BX HARTMAN  $                   12.13 454619 EA MCKESSON  $                     0.56 19898361 PK MOORE MEDICAL  $                   25.02 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10/PK 6/CS  $                 120.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BANDAGE, SHUR-BAND, ELASTIC, LATEX 

FREE, SURE-BAND, 4" x 5 YD ROLL HARTMAN 59540000 EA 8292743 10/BX CONCO  $             21.07 8292743 10/BX HARTMAN  $                   15.13 454620 EA MCKESSON  $                     0.77 19898301 PK MOORE MEDICAL  $                   39.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 10/PK 6/CS  $                 122.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TOWEL, C-FOLD, WHITE, 10-1/8" X 12-3/4"

GEORGIA 

PACIFIC 25190 2400/CS 1204781 2400/CA GEOPAC  $             67.99 1204781 2400/CA GEORGIA PACIFIC  $                   20.85 358643 2400/CS GEORGIA PACIFIC  $                   26.16 191202484 CS KIMBERLY CLARKE  $                   65.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TAPE, PAPER, SURGICAL, WHITE, 1" X 10 YD 

ROLL DUKAL HP6111 12/BX 7438092 12/BX DUKAL  $               9.04 1019673 12/BX DUKAL  $                     4.19 455531 12/BX MCKESSON  $                     4.80 19027761 PK 3M  $                   11.42 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

CUP, PAPER, POLY COAT, 5 OZ HENRY SCHEIN 9491498 1000/CS 9491498 1000/CA MEDICM  $             35.19 9491478 1000/CA MEDICOM  $                   23.71 972514 100/SLEEVE SOLO  $                     2.94 19899052 CS MOORE MEDICAL  $                   85.73 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PAPER, CREPE, EXAM TABLE, WHITE, 18" x 

125' ROLL

AVALON 

PAPERS 613 12/CS 1161643 12/21/CA AVA P  $             19.83 1161643 12R1/CA ANALON  $                   14.31 919570 12/CS MCKESSON  $                   17.21 GM016 CS GRAHAM MEDICAL  $                   58.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID CROSSTEX ETPC18 12/CS  $                   59.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

GLOVE, STRECH, VINYL, LATEX FREE, 

POWDER FREE, MEDIUM (BRAND ONLY) MEDLINE CUR9255

151/BX

10/CS 9870355 150/BX MEDL  $             10.53 9870355 150/BX MEDLINE  $                     6.13 949331 1500/CS MEDLINE  $                   76.00 23667210B CS MEDLINE IND  $                   60.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

GLOVE, STRECH, VINYL, LATEX FREE, 

POWDER FREE, LARGE (BRAND ONLY) MEDLINE CUR9226

150/BX

10/CS 9870356 150/BX MEDL  $             10.53 9870356 150/BX MEDLINE  $                     6.13 949332 1500/CS MEDLINE  $                   76.00 23667210B CS MEDLINE IND  $                   90.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BIDGLOVE, STRECH, VINYL, LATEX FREE, 

POWDER FREE, EXTRA-LARGE (BRAND 

ONLY) MEDLINE CUR9227

130/BX

10/CS 9870357 130/BX MEDL  $             10.53 9870357 130/BX MEDLINE  $                     6.13 949333 1300/CS MEDLINE  $                   76.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SOAP, VIONEX ANTIMICROBIAL, PUMP 

BOTTLE, 18 OZ (BRAND ONLY) METREX 10-1518 12/CS 1763829 18 OZ/BT METREX  $             11.99 1763829 18 OZ/BT VIRO  $                     7.75 262764 12/CS METREX RESEARCH  $                 101.25 5004345B EA ASPETIC CONTROL  $                   13.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1 INCLUDED

N/A

N/A

YES

YES; SEE PACKAGE

N/A

1 INLCUDED

NO  

SEE PRICE SHEET FOR COMMENTS - 19048723C, 19048723B, & 

19048723A ARE AVAILABLE IN BOTH CASE QTY AND PK QTY. CASE: 

$158.49, PK: $15.84

YES

N/A

N/A

YES

N/A

N/A

ADDENDUM INCLUDED?

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS?

COMMENTS

NO  

N/A

N/A

YES

NO  

SEE PACKAGE - THEIR STANDARD PACKS ARE 100/BOX, 10 

BOXES/CASE. (1,000) ADJUSTED PRICES ARE LISTED IN LETTER
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1000033127 EA CUMBERLAN  $                     1.25 34001M EA  $                     1.52 MCKESSON  $                     1.61 98003 EA SWAN  $                     1.66 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 26811 BTL MEDIQUE  $                     2.50 

9022-10 100/BX GOJO  $                     4.07 243925 200/BX DYNAREX  $                     1.40 MCKESSON  $                   84.40 33903 200/BX DYNAREX  $                     1.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 22133 100 CT BOX MEDIQUE  $                     3.10 

77600 50/PK PRO ADVANTAGE  $                     3.18 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                   19.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

76701 100/BX PRO ADVANTAGE  $                     3.20 32160 100PK/BX  $                     2.46 MCKESSON  $                     3.98 4305 100PK/BX DYNAREX  $                     2.65 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

44117

100/BX 

36BX/CS KENDALL  $                   29.86 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                     1.65 CBD2027 100/BOX CAREBAND  $                     0.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NON25500 110/BOX MEDLINE  $                     2.36 2618844 100/BOX MEDCO  $                     1.56 MCKESSON  $                     6.50 CBD1018 100/BOX CAREBAND  $                     1.26 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 102133 EA MEDIQUE  $                     4.25 

1307033-24 100/BOX DERMA  $                     1.93 261848 100/BOX MEDCO  $                     1.20 MCKESSON  $                     1.60 CBD2022 100/BOX CAREBAND  $                     1.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

44107

50/BX 

24/BX/CS COVIDIEN  $                   16.92 317271 100/BOX MEDCO  $                     1.99 MCKESSON  $                     7.41 CBD4022 100/BOX CAREBAND  $                     1.62 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

8703 EA MEDEGAN  $                     3.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                     3.14 4801 EA KENDALL  $                     2.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

305490 EA BECTOR DICKINSON  $                     6.78 900988 EA BD  $                     6.34 MCKESSON  $                   11.55 305490 EA BECTON DICKINSON  $                     6.74 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

305489 EA BECTOR DICKINSON  $                     6.36 20459 EA BD  $                     7.59 MCKESSON  $                   10.91 305489 EA BECTON DICKINSON  $                     6.37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3170 4000/CS DYNAREX  $                   13.72 10626 4000/CS KENDALL  $                   13.41 MCKESSON  $                   16.38 2600 4000/CS KENDALL  $                   12.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

4252

100/BG 

50/BG/CS DYNAREX  $                   40.80 39002M 100/SL  $                     0.76 MCKESSON  $                     1.22 4258 100/PK DYNAREX  $                     0.74 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

48615 100/CS GRAHAM MEDICAL  $                   20.42 830200 100/CS AVALON PAPERS  $                   12.95 MCKESSON  $                   18.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3586 100/CS 3M  $                 117.76 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                   42.09 16622W 400/CS 3M  $                 180.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                     8.29 D2337 100/BOX DYNAREX  $                     5.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

P359402 100/BOX PRO ADVANTAGE  $                     2.63 268838 100/BOX OMNI INTL  $                     2.72 MCKESSON  $                     3.48 SPF100S 100/BOX DYNAREX  $                     2.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID M9 5010S EA  $                     6.75 

P359403 100/BOX PRO ADVANTAGE  $                     2.63 268839 100/BOX OMNI INTL  $                     2.72 MCKESSON  $                     3.48 SPF100M 100/BOX DYNAREX  $                     2.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID M9 5010M EA  $                     6.75 

NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                   12.60 SEC375L 50/BOX MICROFLEX  $                     7.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                   12.60 SEC375M 50/BOX MICROFLEX  $                     7.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                   12.70 SEC3758 50/BOX MICROFLEX  $                     7.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID 144408 100/BOX  $                   10.59 MCKESSON  $                     8.29 MF300S 100/BOX MICROFLEX  $                   10.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID 144409 100/BOX  $                   10.59 MCKESSON  $                     8.29 MF300M 100/BOX MICROFLEX  $                   10.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID 144411 100/BOX  $                   10.59 MCKESSON  $                     8.29 MF300XL 100/BOX MICROFLEX  $                   10.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID 144410 100/BOX  $                   10.59 MCKESSON  $                     8.29 MF300L 100/BOX MICROFLEX  $                   10.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID 100/BOX  NO BID MCKESSON  $                   42.15 26530 100/BOX EXEL  $                     8.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

6660 10/BG DUKAL  $                     2.81 56750 10/BG DYNAREX  $                     4.39 MCKESSON  $                 151.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

368608 48/BOX BD  $                   20.23 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                 234.44 368608 48/BOX BECTON DICKINSON  $                   20.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

305762 100/BOX BD  $                   19.57 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                   35.62 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

305271 100/BOX BD  $                   52.62 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                   31.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

305269 100/BOX BD  $                   52.62 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                   31.68 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

305272 100/BOX BD  $                   52.62 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                   10.79 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

305127 100/BOX BD  $                     8.40 30514 100/BOX  $                   58.41 MCKESSON  $                     5.71 305127 100/BOX BECTON DICKINSON  $                     6.26 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

368653 25/BOX BD  $                   33.72 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                   58.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID 48047M EA OMRON  $                     5.73 MCKESSON  $                     3.94 670R EA ADC  $                     3.74 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

911898 50/BOX TIDI  $                     3.39 52055M 500/CS CROSSTEX ****13"X19"  $                   18.85 MCKESSON  $                     7.57 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

911898 50/BOX TIDI  $                     3.39 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                     8.25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NLT4100

100/BOX 

10/BX/CS DUKAL  NO PRICE LISTED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                   22.12 01-127 100/BOX MEDSOURCE  $                   10.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

D74800 100/BOX PDI  $                     3.93 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                     3.39 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

309570 100/BOX BD  $                   13.04 99857 100/BOX BD  $                   13.81 MCKESSON  $                   22.20 309570 100/BOX BECTON DICKINSON  $                   11.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

STERLING FIRST AID & SAFETY, INC.

P.O. BOX 266208

PEARLAND, TX 77207

STERLING KIRK

888-242-1700

281-997-8847

BOUND TREE MEDICAL, LLC

5000 TUTTLE CROSSING BLVD

DUBLIN, OH 43016

CHRISTOPHER FYFFE

800-533-0523

877-311-2437

4MD MEDICAL SOLUTIONS LLC

315 B FOURTH ST

LAKEWOOD, NJ 08701

KATE LURIA

732-905-5400

866-611-6999

PATTERSON MEDICAL DBA MEDCO

500 FILLMORE AVE

TONAWANDA, NY 14150

JENNIFER WHEELER

800-556-3326

800-222-1934 800-558-1551

APACHE MEDICAL SUPPLY, LLC

4720 CRAWFORD ST.

HOUSTON, TX 77004

RUTHIE HEBERT

713-528-2410

713-795-4660

EMERGENCY MEDICAL PRODUCTS, INC.

5235 INTERNATIONAL DR., SUITE B

CUDAHY, WI 53110

BRAD SMITH

800-558-6270
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309571 100/BOX BD  $                   13.04 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                   21.40 309571 100/BOX BECTON DICKINSON  $                   11.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

305193 100/BOX BD  $                     8.19 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                   22.10 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

305145 100/BOX BD  $                     8.19 20454 100/BOX BD  $                     5.81 MCKESSON  $                     5.63 305145 100/BOX BECTON DICKINSON  $                     5.66 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1212 100/BOX DUKAL  $                     3.25 267664 50/BX DUKAL  $                     1.46 MCKESSON  $                 128.40 D1212 100/BOX DUKAL  $                     2.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

2280 5000/CS DUKAL  $                   31.15 19106 5000/CS DUKAL  $                   23.75 MCKESSON  $                 466.98 3222 5000/CS DYNAREX  $                   20.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

6716 100/CS KENDALL  $                 101.04 25039M EA FLUFF E  $                     0.73 MCKESSON  $                     1.28 6716 EA KENDALL  $                     1.01 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1801 96/CS KENDALL  $                   47.76 72262 12/BOX KENDALL  $                     7.92 MCKESSON  $                     1.78 3112 12/BOX DYNAREX  $                     2.38 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1527-1 12/BOX 3M  $                   14.93 98918 12/BOX 3M  $                   12.57 MCKESSON  $                     9.75 15271 12/BOX 3M  $                   14.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

P903008 12/CS PRO ADVANTAGE  $                     5.91 34002M EA  $                     0.68 MCKESSON  $                     0.97 87134 EA LEADER  $                     0.60 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

AS340 100/CS AMSINO  $                   20.20 31109M 100/BX   $                   27.02 MCKESSON  $                   16.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

5965 200/BOX ASCENSIA  $                   34.89 48126M 200/BOX MC KESSON  $                   17.86 MCKESSON  $                   47.52 5965 200/BOX BAYER  $                   31.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

981222 250/CS TIDI  $                   16.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                   63.34 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                   13.94 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1070501 10 BOX/CS KIMBERLY CLARKE  $                   95.17 110011

100/BX 

10/BX/CS KIMBERLY CLARK  $                   98.90 MCKESSON  $                   16.64 52001 10 BOX/CS HALYARD  $                   91.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID M9 6012S BOX EACH MCR NITRO-MED  $                   15.95 

NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID 267009 100/BOX AURELLA LATEX  $                     4.70 MCKESSON  NO PRICE LISTED D2338 100/BOX DYNAREX  $                     5.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID M9 5056L BOX EACH SENSA GUARO  $                   11.50 

201 12/BOX HR LUBRICATIONS  $                   18.03 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MCKESSON  $                   19.49 D1254 12/BOX DYNAREX  $                   14.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

05031-750 250/BOX WELCH ALLYN  $                     9.91 47300 250/BOX SURE TEMP  $                     9.39 MCKESSON  $                   72.49 05031-750 250/BOX SURE TEMP  $                     9.27 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

1541 50/BOX DUKAL  $                     3.57 596171 50/BOX DUKAL  $                     3.84 MCKESSON  $                     3.98 3T3101 50/BOX SECURE GARD  $                     5.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID MCKESSON  NO PRICE LISTED NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

P13872

160/PK

12 PK/CS PDI  $                   73.47 51017M 12/CS  $                   67.92 MCKESSON  $                 126.16 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

42532 12/CS GRAHAM MEDICAL  $                   34.85 14443 12/CS AVALON PAPERS  $                   34.55 MCKESSON  $                   34.86 5282 12/CS TIDI  $                   30.96 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

P54072 12/CS PDI  $                   99.02 264486

150/TUB 

12/CS CLOROX  $                 158.28 MCKESSON  $                   26.25 P54072 12/CS PDI  $                   98.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

9674-12 12/CS PURELL  $                   42.30 54046M 12/CS PURELL  $                   42.00 MCKESSON  $                   65.24 9652-12 12/CS PURELL  $                   31.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

P154010 30/BX PRO ADVANTAGE  $                   10.23 27515M 5 PK 3M  $                     4.88 MCKESSON  $                     1.64 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

75900 1000/BX PRO ADVANTAGE  $                     4.56 65960 1000/BX DUKAL  $                     1.82 MCKESSON  $                     5.53 D9000 1000/BX DUKAL  $                     1.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

59520000 10/PK HARTMAN  $                   12.38 27534M EA HARTMAN  $                     1.09 MCKESSON  $                     0.57 D3658 EA DYNAREX  $                     0.35 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 63601 EA COBAN  $                     2.60 

59530000 10/PK HARTMAN  $                   15.25 27535M EA HARTMAN  $                     1.32 MCKESSON  $                     2.29 D3659 EA DYNAREX  $                     0.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 64701 EA COBAN  $                     3.50 

59540000 10/PK HARTMAN  $                   18.45 27536M EA HARTMAN  $                     1.64 MCKESSON  $                     0.57 D3660 EA DYNAREX  $                     0.63 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 65901 EA COBAN  $                     3.90 

20241 2400/CS GEORGIA  $                   29.92 51520 2400/CS BUNZL  $                   23.13 MCKESSON  $                   47.73 30150 2400/CS CONSOLIDATED  $                   17.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

HP6111 12/BX DUKAL  $                     5.20 260785 12/BX AMD RETMED  $                     4.13 MCKESSON  $                     5.53 3552 12/BX DYNAREX  $                     3.51 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

116-CH 1000/CS MEDICOM  $                   34.33 34160 1000/CS BUNZL  $                   37.60 MCKESSON  $                   77.82 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

P751018 12/CS PRO ADVANTAGE  $                   17.53 77095 12/CS AVALION PAPER  $                   17.63 MCKESSON  $                   27.82 23324 12/CS TIDI  $                   17.40 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

CUR9225

150/BX

10/CS MEDLINE  $                   60.39 NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID MCKESSON  $                     7.76 CUR9225 1500/CS MEDLINE  $                   58.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

CUR9226

150/BX

10/CS MEDLINE  $                   58.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID MCKESSON  $                     5.22 CUR9226 1500/CS MEDLINE  $                   58.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

CUR9227

130/BX

10/CS MEDLINE  $                   59.89 NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID MCKESSON  $                     3.48 CUR9227 1300/CS MEDLINE  $                   58.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

10-1518 12/CS METREX  $                 104.59 54042M 12/CS VIONEX  $                 102.84 MCKESSON  $                     3.50 25017 12/CS METREX  $                 108.24 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NON-COMPLIANT; SUBMITTED BID OFFER SHEET & COMPANY INFO 

ONLY
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ONLY
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ONLY1 INCLUDED

N/A

N/A

1 INCLUDED

N/A

N/A

INCLUDED

N/A

N/A

YES

N/A

N/A

Page 4 of  4


