
DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, MARCH 31, 2016

11:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

DESCRIPTION COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

Flexible Base

2.1 CRUSHED LIMESTONE (per 

TxDOT Item 247, Type A, Grade 1 Price per Ton Price per Ton Price per Ton Price per Ton

2.1.1 Price per ton-bidder's plant / 

siding loaded onto County trucks 750-52 6745 $31.00 $0.00 $26.00 $0.00

2.1.3 Price per ton as deliverd to County 

Facility at: 750-52 County Facility County Facility County Facility County Facility

Airport Airport Airport Airport

Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr Angleton Svc Ctr Angleton Svc Ctr Angleton Svc Ctr

Camp Mohawk Camp Mohawk Camp Mohawk Camp Mohawk

Clute Svc Ctr Clute Svc Ctr Clute Svc Ctr Clute Svc Ctr

Hanson Park Hanson Park Hanson Park Hanson Park

Manvel Svc Ctr Manvel Svc Ctr Manvel Svc Ctr Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control Mosquito Control Mosquito Control Mosquito Control

Quintana Cty Park Quintana Cty Park Quintana Cty Park Quintana Cty Park

Resoft Park Resoft Park Resoft Park Resoft Park

San Luis Cty Park San Luis Cty Park San Luis Cty Park San Luis Cty Park

W. Columbia Svc W. Columbia Svc W. Columbia Svc W. Columbia Svc

2.1.4 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-52 6745 Material cost

Hauling first 

mile

Hauling ea 

add'l mile Material cost

Hauling 

first mile

Hauling ea 

add'l mile Material cost

Hauling 

first mile

Hauling ea 

add'l mile Material cost

Hauling 

first mile

Hauling ea 

add'l mile

$31.00 $2.75 $0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $26.00 $1.80 $0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

1.4   State Minimum if required

2.2 Reclaimed Base Blend Price per Ton Price per Ton Price per Ton Price per Ton

2.2.1 Price per ton bidder's plant / siding 

loaded onto County trucks 750-72 6746 $20.00 $17.48 $18.00 $0.00

NO BID 12 TONS NO BID

Plant Location

NO BID

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

Price/ton Delivered

$0.00 

Plant Location

NO BID

AMERICAN MATERIALS, INC.

10126 CASH ROAD

STAFFORD, TX 77477

JERRY L. BERRY

281-499-1551

281-499-1525

JERRY L BERRY - 281-499-1551

JERRY L BERRY - 281-499-1551

 

$39.80 

$32.90 

$37.10 

Plant Location

2101 OYSTER CREEK 

BEND, FREEPORT

$37.40 

$28.40 

$37.70 

$39.80 

$30.80 

$29.90 

Price/ton Delivered

$32.00 

$39.50 

$31.40 

ANTHONY REYNOLDS - 979-233-6655

SUNNY DYE - 979-233-6655

 

Plant Location

2101 OYSTER CREEK 

BEND, FREEPORT

SORRELL CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT

& MATERIALS LLC

2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

FREEPORT, TX 77541

JAMES DYE

979-233-6655

979-233-7313

14 TONS

$37.95

$45.45

$37.65

Price/ton Delivered

$40.95 

$39.45

$44.25

$36.75

$37.65

$44.85

$40.95

$33.75

$41.85

ITB#16-34 ROAD MATERIALS-FLEXIBLE BASE

CHERRY CRUSHED CONCRETE

Plant Location

979-233-6167

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES

SHARON FOREMAN

979-233-3366

BELINDA MCMANNERS-

979-233-6330

 

7108 VERNOR RD

FREEPORT, TX 77541

Plant Location

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

CINDY JOHNSON-713-987-0000

Plant Location

NO BID

$0.00 

7108 VERNOR RD

FREEPORT, TX 77541

606 FM 521 

FRESNO, TX 

Price/ton Delivered

$0.00 

Plant Location

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER

$0.00 

$0.00 

713-436-0990

 

713-436-0071

$0.00 

BIDDERS  NAME

ADDRESS

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO. INC

$0.00 

$0.00 

FAX NUMBER

C.J. WALLER, JR.-713-436-0990

MIKE DAMIAN

FREEPORT, TX 77541

435 COMMERCE

FRESNO, TX 77545

606 ALMEDA ROAD

C.J. WALLER, JR.

979-233-3366
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DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, MARCH 31, 2016

11:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

DESCRIPTION COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

AMERICAN MATERIALS, INC.

10126 CASH ROAD

STAFFORD, TX 77477

JERRY L. BERRY

281-499-1551

281-499-1525

JERRY L BERRY - 281-499-1551

JERRY L BERRY - 281-499-1551

 

ANTHONY REYNOLDS - 979-233-6655

SUNNY DYE - 979-233-6655

 

SORRELL CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT

& MATERIALS LLC

2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

FREEPORT, TX 77541

JAMES DYE

979-233-6655

979-233-7313

ITB#16-34 ROAD MATERIALS-FLEXIBLE BASE

CHERRY CRUSHED CONCRETE

979-233-6167

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES

SHARON FOREMAN

979-233-3366

BELINDA MCMANNERS-

979-233-6330

 

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

CINDY JOHNSON-713-987-0000

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER 713-436-0990

 

713-436-0071

BIDDERS  NAME

ADDRESS

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO. INC

FAX NUMBER

C.J. WALLER, JR.-713-436-0990

MIKE DAMIAN

FREEPORT, TX 77541

435 COMMERCE

FRESNO, TX 77545

606 ALMEDA ROAD

C.J. WALLER, JR.

979-233-3366

2.2.3 Price per ton as delivered to 

County Facility at: 750-72 County Facility County Facility County Facility County Facility

Airport Airport Airport Airport

Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr Angleton Svc Ctr Angleton Svc Ctr Angleton Svc Ctr

Camp Mohawk Camp Mohawk Camp Mohawk Camp Mohawk

Clute Svc Ctr Clute Svc Ctr Clute Svc Ctr Clute Svc Ctr

Hanson Park Hanson Park Hanson Park Hanson Park

Manvel Svc Ctr Manvel Svc Ctr Manvel Svc Ctr Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control Mosquito Control Mosquito Control Mosquito Control

Quintana Cty Park Quintana Cty Park Quintana Cty Park Quintana Cty Park

Resoft Park Resoft Park Resoft Park Resoft Park

San Luis Cty Park San Luis Cty Park San Luis Cty Park San Luis Cty Park

W. Columbia Svc W. Columbia Svc W. Columbia Svc W. Columbia Svc

2.2.4 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-72 6746 Material cost

Hauling first 

mile

Hauling ea 

add'l mile Material cost

Hauling 

first mile

Hauling ea 

add'l mile Material cost

Hauling 

first mile

Hauling ea 

add'l mile Material cost

Hauling 

first mile

Hauling ea 

add'l mile

$20.00 $2.75 $0.30 $17.48 $3.24 $0.11 $18.00 $1.80 $0.30 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

2.4   State Minimum if required

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

NO BID

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

Price/ton Delivered

$0.00 

$0.00 

$29.10 

12 TONS

$29.70 

$31.80 

$22.80 

$21.90 

$31.80 

$24.90 

Price/ton Delivered

$24.00 

$31.50 

$23.40 

$29.40 

$20.40 

14 TONS

Price/ton Delivered

$26.65 

$22.75 

$29.95 

$34.45 

$26.95 

$30.85 

$33.85 

$26.65 

$25.75 

$33.25 

$28.45 

$29.95 

$22.43 

$24.28 

$24.08 

$20,378.00 

$23.78 

$27.23 

$24.83 

24 TONS

$23.78 

$28.73 

$21.93 

$21.68 

$24.28 

Price/ton Delivered
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AMERICAN MATERIALS, INC.

10126 CASH ROAD

STAFFORD, TX 77477

JERRY L. BERRY

281-499-1551

281-499-1525

JERRY L BERRY - 281-499-1551

JERRY L BERRY - 281-499-1551

 

ANTHONY REYNOLDS - 979-233-6655

SUNNY DYE - 979-233-6655

 

SORRELL CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT

& MATERIALS LLC

2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

FREEPORT, TX 77541

JAMES DYE

979-233-6655

979-233-7313

ITB#16-34 ROAD MATERIALS-FLEXIBLE BASE

CHERRY CRUSHED CONCRETE

979-233-6167

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES

SHARON FOREMAN

979-233-3366

BELINDA MCMANNERS-

979-233-6330

 

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

CINDY JOHNSON-713-987-0000

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER 713-436-0990

 

713-436-0071

BIDDERS  NAME

ADDRESS

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO. INC

FAX NUMBER

C.J. WALLER, JR.-713-436-0990

MIKE DAMIAN

FREEPORT, TX 77541

435 COMMERCE

FRESNO, TX 77545

606 ALMEDA ROAD

C.J. WALLER, JR.

979-233-3366

2.3 Crushed Concrete Price per Ton Price per Ton Price per Ton Price per Ton

2.3.1 Price per ton bidder's plant / siding 

loaded onto County trucks 750-52 6747 $20.00 $17.50 $18.00 $20.00

2.3.3 Price per ton as delivered to 

County Facility at: 750-52 County Facility County Facility County Facility County Facility

Airport Airport Airport Airport

Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr Angleton Svc Ctr Angleton Svc Ctr Angleton Svc Ctr

Camp Mohawk Camp Mohawk Camp Mohawk Camp Mohawk

Clute Svc Ctr Clute Svc Ctr Clute Svc Ctr Clute Svc Ctr

Hanson Park Hanson Park Hanson Park Hanson Park

Manvel Svc Ctr Manvel Svc Ctr Manvel Svc Ctr Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control Mosquito Control Mosquito Control Mosquito Control

Quintana Cty Park Quintana Cty Park Quintana Cty Park Quintana Cty Park

Resoft Park Resoft Park Resoft Park Resoft Park

San Luis Cty Park San Luis Cty Park San Luis Cty Park San Luis Cty Park

W. Columbia Svc W. Columbia Svc W. Columbia Svc W. Columbia Svc

2.3.4 Price per ton as delivered to 

jobsite 750-52 6747 Material cost

Hauling first 

mile

Hauling ea 

add'l mile Material cost

Hauling 

first mile

Hauling ea 

add'l mile Material cost

Hauling 

first mile

Hauling ea 

add'l mile Material cost

Hauling 

first mile

Hauling ea 

add'l mile

$20.00 $2.75 $0.30 $17.50 $3.24 $0.11 $18.00 $1.80 $0.30 $0.00 $3.00 $0.20
2.3.5   State Minimum truckload if 

required

2.4 Crushed Asphalt - RAP Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton Price per ton

2.4.1 Price per ton bidder's plant / 

siding loaded onto County trucks 745-68 6748 $0.00 $35.00 $0.00 $0.00

2.4.3 Price per ton as delivered to 

County Facilities at: 745-68 County Facility County Facility County Facility County Facility

Airport Airport Airport Airport

Price/ton Delivered

$0.00 

$28.60 

$33.40 

$32.80 

15 TONS

Plant Location

NO BID

$28.60 

$32.20 

$32.80 

$26.80 

$30.40 

$34.20 

Price/ton Delivered

$30.80 

$28.60 

$30.40 

2122 HWY 90A

MISSOURI CITY, TX 

Plant Location

Price/ton Delivered

$0.00 

12 TONS

Plant Location

NO BID

$31.80 

$22.80 

$21.90 

$31.80 

$24.90 

$29.10 

$24.00 

$31.50 

$23.40 

$29.40 

$20.40 

$29.70 

Price/ton Delivered

Plant Location

2101 OYSTER CREEK 

BEND, FREEPORT

14 TONS 24 TONS

606 FM 521 

FRESNO, TX 

Plant Location

606 FM 521 

FRESNO, TX 

$22.20 

$24.80 

Plant Location

$42.30 

Price/ton Delivered

7108 VERNOR RD

FREEPORT, TX 77541

$30.85 

$26.95 

$34.45 

$26.65 

Price/ton Delivered

$26.65 

$33.85 

$29.95 

$22.75 

$29.95 

$28.45 

$33.25 

$25.75 

Plant Location

Plant Location

NO BID

Price/ton Delivered

$0.00 

$21.30 

$22.95 

$24.80 

$24.30 

$29.25 

$22.45 

$27.75 

$24.30 

$25.35 

$24.60 

Price/ton Delivered
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DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, MARCH 31, 2016

11:00 A.M., Local Time

CONTRACT TERM

DESCRIPTION COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

AMERICAN MATERIALS, INC.

10126 CASH ROAD

STAFFORD, TX 77477

JERRY L. BERRY

281-499-1551

281-499-1525

JERRY L BERRY - 281-499-1551

JERRY L BERRY - 281-499-1551

 

ANTHONY REYNOLDS - 979-233-6655

SUNNY DYE - 979-233-6655

 

SORRELL CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT

& MATERIALS LLC

2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

FREEPORT, TX 77541

JAMES DYE

979-233-6655

979-233-7313

ITB#16-34 ROAD MATERIALS-FLEXIBLE BASE

CHERRY CRUSHED CONCRETE

979-233-6167

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES

SHARON FOREMAN

979-233-3366

BELINDA MCMANNERS-

979-233-6330

 

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

CINDY JOHNSON-713-987-0000

CONTACT

TELEPHONE NUMBER 713-436-0990

 

713-436-0071

BIDDERS  NAME

ADDRESS

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT CO. INC

FAX NUMBER

C.J. WALLER, JR.-713-436-0990

MIKE DAMIAN

FREEPORT, TX 77541

435 COMMERCE

FRESNO, TX 77545

606 ALMEDA ROAD

C.J. WALLER, JR.

979-233-3366

Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr Angleton Svc Ctr Angleton Svc Ctr Angleton Svc Ctr

Camp Mohawk Camp Mohawk Camp Mohawk Camp Mohawk

Clute Svc Ctr Clute Svc Ctr Clute Svc Ctr Clute Svc Ctr

Hanson Park Hanson Park Hanson Park Hanson Park

Manvel Svc Ctr Manvel Svc Ctr Manvel Svc Ctr Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control Mosquito Control Mosquito Control Mosquito Control

Quintana Cty Park Quintana Cty Park Quintana Cty Park Quintana Cty Park

Resoft Park Resoft Park Resoft Park Resoft Park

San Luis Cty Park San Luis Cty Park San Luis Cty Park San Luis Cty Park

W. Columbia Svc W. Columbia Svc W. Columbia Svc W. Columbia Svc

2.4.4 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 745-68 6748 Material cost

Hauling first 

mile

Hauling ea 

add'l mile Material cost

Hauling 

first mile

Hauling ea 

add'l mile Material cost

Hauling 

first mile

Hauling ea 

add'l mile Material cost

Hauling 

first mile

Hauling ea 

add'l mile

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $35.00 $3.24 $0.11 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

4.4 State Minimum truckload if required

County Facility County Facility County Facility County Facility

Airport Airport Airport Airport

Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr Alvin Svc Ctr

Angleton Svc Ctr Angleton Svc Ctr Angleton Svc Ctr Angleton Svc Ctr

Camp Mohawk Camp Mohawk Camp Mohawk Camp Mohawk

Clute Svc Ctr Clute Svc Ctr Clute Svc Ctr Clute Svc Ctr

Hanson Park Hanson Park Hanson Park Hanson Park

Manvel Svc Ctr Manvel Svc Ctr Manvel Svc Ctr Manvel Svc Ctr

Mosquito Control Mosquito Control Mosquito Control Mosquito Control

Quintana Cty Park Quintana Cty Park Quintana Cty Park Quintana Cty Park

Resoft Park Resoft Park Resoft Park Resoft Park

San Luis Cty Park San Luis Cty Park San Luis Cty Park San Luis Cty Park

W. Columbia Svc W. Columbia Svc W. Columbia Svc W. Columbia Svc

20 66 18 53

25 43 32 50

11 56 8 57

36 20 42 29

38 11 41 20

14 34 11 38

1 45 3 47

25 45 34 50

15 35 13 38

28 29 33 29

14 36 15 40

40 20 40 29

$0.00 

$0.00 

NO BID

NONE

mileage mileage mileage mileage

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

NONE

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

NO BID

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

NO BID

NONE

$42.30 

$39.95 

$38.80 

$43.75 

$43.75 

$41.35 

$46.75 

$39.95 

$45.25 

$42.10 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$43.45 

NONE

24 TONS

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

$0.00 

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS
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