#16-35 ROAD MATERIALS - STABILIZING MATERIALS

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDERS NAME|

THURSDAY, MARCH 31, 2016 ADDRESS

11:00 A.M., Local Time
CONTRACT TERM: CONTACT|
TELEPHONE #
FAX #

AMERICAN MATERIALS INC.

SORRELL CONSTRUCTION
EQUIPMENT & MATERIALS LLC

CHERRY CRUSHED CONCRETE

CENTURY ASPHALT LTD

AUSTIN WHITE LIME CO.

VERNOR MATERIAL &
EQUIPMENT

10126 CASH ROAD

2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

6131 SELINSKY

5303 NAVIGATION BLVD

4900 HOWARD LANE

435 COMMERCE

STAFFORD, TX 77477

FREEPORT, TX 77541

HOUSTON, TX 77048

HOUSTON, TX 77011

AUSTIN, TX 78728

FREEPORT, TX 77541

JERRY L. BERRY

JAMES DYE

JOHN CONYER

PHILLIP KING

LILA R. WEIRICH

MIKE DAMIAN

281-499-1551

979-233-6655

281-692-1900

713-292-2868

800-553-5463

979-233-3366

281-499-1525

979-233-7313

832-435-2533

713-292-2885

512-388-1220

979-233-6167

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

JERRY L. BERRY -
281-499-1551

ANTHONY REYNOLDS
979-233-6655

EDDIE BARAJAS
281-692-1900 ext.6005

DARRYL VANEK
713-923-1988

AMBER FRANKS OR CHRISTINA
THOMSON 800-553-5463

BELINDA McMANNERS
979-233-6330

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES

JERRY L. BERRY -
281-499-1551

SUNNY DYE
979-233-6655

ROSIE PLEMONS
281-692-1900 ext. 6003

KIM BYFORD
713-292-2868

ANNE STUTZ
800-553-5463

SHARON FOREMAN
979-233-3366

STABILIZING MATERIALS COMM CODE | COUNTY ID #

PLANT LOCATION

PLANT LOCATION

PLANT LOCATION

PLANT LOCATION

PLANT LOCATION

PLANT LOCATION

2.1 LIME

500 WARD STREET
ANGLETON, TX

2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND
FREEPORT, TX

4635 CR 418
ROSHARON, TX
PLANT 5

5303 NAVIGATION BLVD
HOUSTON, TX 77011
AND
9519 GALVESTON RD
HOUSTON, TX 77034

McNEIL, TRAVIS CO., TX

7108 VERNOR ROAD
FREEPORT, TX 77541

2.1.1 Hydrated Lime Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON
2.1.1.1. Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-95 9204 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $154.27 $0.00
2.1.1.2. Hauling First Mile 750-95 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 N/A $0.00
2.1.1.3. Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-95 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 N/A $0.00

22 TON MINIMUM FREIGHT
2.1.1.4. State Minimum truckload if required 750-95 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID LOAD NO BID
2.1.1.5. Price per ton for Spreader Bar $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2.00 $0.00

CARRIER ALLOWS 2 HOURS TO

UNLOAD PRODUCT, AFTER THE

INITIAL 2 HOURS IF THE TRUCK IS
NOT UNLOADED DEMURRAGE
CHARGES WILL BEGIN AT A RATE
OF $75.00/HOUR.

2.1.2 Lime Slurry 6750 Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON
2.1.2.1. Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-95 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2.1.2.2. Hauling First Mile 750-95 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2.1.2.3. Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-95 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2.1.2.4. State Minimum truckload if required NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2.1.2.5. Price per ton for Spreader Bar 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2.1.3 CEMENT STABILIZED SAND
*Shall consist of sand, free of foreign matter and having a plasticity index not exceeding
10, stabilized with cement in proportions bid as follows:
2.1.3.1 6% cement by weight Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON
2.1.3.1.1. Price per ton bidder's plant / siding
loaded onto County trucks 750-77 6752 $0.00 $17.10 $15.00 $0.00 $0.00 $19.00
2.1.3.1.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-77 6752 $0.00 $17.10 $15.00 $0.00 $0.00 $19.00
2.1.3.1.4. Hauling First Mile 750-77 7104 $0.00 $1.80 $1.74 $0.00 $0.00 $2.75
2.1.3.1.5. Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7105 $0.00 $0.30 $0.12 $0.00 $0.00 $0.30
2.1.3.1.6 State minimum truckload if required 750-77 NO BID 12 TONS 15 TONS NO BID NO BID 14 TONS




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, MARCH 31, 2016

BIDDERS NAME
ADDRESS

11:00 A.M., Local Time
CONTRACT TERM:

CONTACT
TELEPHONE #|

FAX #

AMERICAN MATERIALS INC.

SORRELL CONSTRUCTION
EQUIPMENT & MATERIALS LLC

CHERRY CRUSHED CONCRETE

CENTURY ASPHALT LTD

AUSTIN WHITE LIME CO.

VERNOR MATERIAL &
EQUIPMENT

10126 CASH ROAD

2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

6131 SELINSKY

5303 NAVIGATION BLVD

4900 HOWARD LANE

435 COMMERCE

STAFFORD, TX 77477

FREEPORT, TX 77541

HOUSTON, TX 77048

HOUSTON, TX 77011

AUSTIN, TX 78728

FREEPORT, TX 77541

JERRY L. BERRY

JAMES DYE

JOHN CONYER

PHILLIP KING

LILA R. WEIRICH

MIKE DAMIAN

281-499-1551

979-233-6655

281-692-1900

713-292-2868

800-553-5463

979-233-3366

281-499-1525

979-233-7313

832-435-2533

713-292-2885

512-388-1220

979-233-6167

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

JERRY L. BERRY -
281-499-1551

ANTHONY REYNOLDS
979-233-6655

EDDIE BARAJAS
281-692-1900 ext.6005

DARRYL VANEK
713-923-1988

AMBER FRANKS OR CHRISTINA
THOMSON 800-553-5463

BELINDA McMANNERS
979-233-6330

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES

JERRY L. BERRY -
281-499-1551

SUNNY DYE
979-233-6655

ROSIE PLEMONS
281-692-1900 ext. 6003

KIM BYFORD
713-292-2868

ANNE STUTZ
800-553-5463

SHARON FOREMAN
979-233-3366

STABILIZING MATERIALS COMM CODE | COUNTY ID # PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION
2.1.3.2 8% cement by weight Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON
2.1.3.2.1 Price per ton bidder's plant / siding

loaded onto County trucks 750-77 6753 $0.00 $20.09 $17.00 $0.00 $0.00 $22.00
2.1.3.2.3 Price per ton as deliverd to jobsite 750-77 6753 $0.00 $20.09 $17.00 $0.00 $0.00 $22.00
2.1.3.2.4. Hauling First Mile 750-77 7106 $0.00 $1.80 $1.74 $0.00 $0.00 $2.75
2.1.3.2.5. Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7107 $0.00 $0.30 $0.12 $0.00 $0.00 $0.30
2.1.3.2.6. State minimum truckload if required NO BID 12 TONS 15 TONS NO BID NO BID 14 TONS
2.1.3.3 12% cement by weight Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON
2.1.3.3.1. Price per ton bidder's plant / siding

loaded onto County trucks 750-77 6754 $0.00 $23.90 $19.00 $0.00 $0.00 $26.00
2.1.3.3.3 Price per ton as deliverd to jobsite 750-77 6754 $0.00 $23.90 $19.00 $0.00 $0.00 $26.00
2.1.3.3.4. Hauling First Mile 750-77 7108 $0.00 $1.80 $1.74 $0.00 $0.00 $2.75
2.1.3.3.5. Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7109 $0.00 $0.30 $0.12 $0.00 $0.00 $0.30
2.1.3.3.6. State minimum truckload if required NO BID 12 TONS 15 TONS NO BID NO BID 14 TONS

2.1.4 CEMENT STABILIZED BASE-LIMESTONE

*Shall consist of a Portland cement treated base material

limestone, cement, and water, mixed at a central mixing

|, composed of new crushed
plant.

2.1.4.1 3-1/2% cement by weight Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON
2.1.4.1.1. Price per ton bidder's plant / siding

loaded onto County trucks 750-91 6757 $0.00 $36.15 $31.50 $0.00 $0.00 $40.00
2.1.4.1.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-91 6757 $0.00 $36.15 $31.50 $0.00 $0.00 $40.00
2.1.4.1.4. Hauling First Mile 750-77 7114 $0.00 $1.80 $1.74 $0.00 $0.00 $2.75
2.1.4.15. Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7115 $0.00 $0.30 $0.12 $0.00 $0.00 $0.30
2.1.4.1.6. State minimum truckload if required NO BID 12 TONS 15 TONS NO BID NO BID 14 TONS
2.1.4.2. 6% cement by weight Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON
fo-;;;f,-1:;:35;;;;;5;‘;;’“'5 plent fsiding 750-91 6758 $0.00 $39.14 $33.00 $0.00 $0.00 $43.00
2.1.4.2.3. Price per ton as deliverd to jobsite 750-91 6758 $0.00 $39.14 $33.00 $0.00 $0.00 $43.00
2.1.4.2.4.. Hauling First Mile 750-77 7116 $0.00 $1.80 $1.74 $0.00 $0.00 $2.75
2.1.4.2.5. Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7117 $0.00 $0.30 $0.12 $0.00 $0.00 $0.30
2.1.4.2.6 State minimum truckload if required NO BID 12 TONS 15 TONS NO BID NO BID 14 TONS




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, MARCH 31, 2016

BI

11:00 A.M., Local Time
CONTRACT TERM:

DDERS NAME
ADDRESS

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #|

FAX #

AMERICAN MATERIALS INC.

SORRELL CONSTRUCTION
EQUIPMENT & MATERIALS LLC

CHERRY CRUSHED CONCRETE

CENTURY ASPHALT LTD

AUSTIN WHITE LIME CO.

VERNOR MATERIAL &
EQUIPMENT

10126 CASH ROAD

2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

6131 SELINSKY

5303 NAVIGATION BLVD

4900 HOWARD LANE

435 COMMERCE

STAFFORD, TX 77477

FREEPORT, TX 77541

HOUSTON, TX 77048

HOUSTON, TX 77011

AUSTIN, TX 78728

FREEPORT, TX 77541

JERRY L. BERRY

JAMES DYE

JOHN CONYER

PHILLIP KING

LILA R. WEIRICH

MIKE DAMIAN

281-499-1551

979-233-6655

281-692-1900

713-292-2868

800-553-5463

979-233-3366

281-499-1525

979-233-7313

832-435-2533

713-292-2885

512-388-1220

979-233-6167

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

JERRY L. BERRY -
281-499-1551

ANTHONY REYNOLDS
979-233-6655

EDDIE BARAJAS
281-692-1900 ext.6005

DARRYL VANEK
713-923-1988

AMBER FRANKS OR CHRISTINA
THOMSON 800-553-5463

BELINDA McMANNERS
979-233-6330

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES

JERRY L. BERRY -
281-499-1551

SUNNY DYE
979-233-6655

ROSIE PLEMONS
281-692-1900 ext. 6003

KIM BYFORD
713-292-2868

ANNE STUTZ
800-553-5463

SHARON FOREMAN
979-233-3366

STABILIZING MATERIALS COMM CODE | COUNTY ID # PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION
2.1.5 CEMENT STABILIZED RECLAIMED BASE-CRUSHED
CONCRETE
*Shall consist of a Portland cement treated reclaimed base material, cement, and
water, mixed at a central mixing plant.
2.1.5.1 6% cement by weight Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON
2.1.5.1.1. Price per ton bidder's plant / siding
loaded onto County trucks 750-91 6750 $0.00 $25.85 $29.00 $0.00 $0.00 $28.00
2.1.5.1.3 Price per ton as deliverd to jobsite 750-91 6760 $0.00 $25.85 $29.00 $0.00 $0.00 $28.00
2.15.1.4. Hauling First Mile 750-77 7120 $0.00 $1.80 $1.74 $0.00 $0.00 $2.75
2.1.5.1.5. Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7121 $0.00 $0.30 $0.12 $0.00 $0.00 $0.30
2.1.5.1.6. State minimum truckload if required NO BID 12 TONS 15 TONS NO BID NO BID 14 TONS
2.1.5.2 12% cement by weight Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON
2.1.5.2.1. Price per ton bidder's plant / siding
loaded onto County trucks 750-91 9205 $0.00 $32.60 $35.00 $0.00 $0.00 $36.00
2.1.5.2.3. Price per ton as deliverd to jobsite 750-91 9205 $0.00 $32.60 $35.00 $0.00 $0.00 $36.00
2.1.5.2.4. Hauling First Mile 750-77 9206 $0.00 $1.80 $1.74 $0.00 $0.00 $2.75
2.15.2.5. Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 9207 $0.00 $0.30 $0.12 $0.00 $0.00 $0.30
2.1.5.2.6. State minimum truckload if required NO BID 12 TONS 15 TONS NO BID NO BID 14 TONS
2.1.6 FLY ASH
*Shall consist of Class "C" fly ash meeting ASTM Specification C-593, Section 3.2, when
sampled and tested in accordance with Sections 4, 6 and 8.

Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON
2.1.6.1. Price per ton bidder's plant / siding
loaded onto County trucks 750-04 6761 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2.1.6.3. Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-04 6761 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2.1.6.4. Hauling First Mile 750-77 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2.1.6.5. Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2.1.6.7 Price per ton for Spreader Bar 750-04 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 NO BID




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, MARCH 31, 2016

11:00 A.M., Local Time
CONTRACT TERM:

BIDDERS NAME
ADDRESS

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #|
FAX #

AMERICAN MATERIALS INC.

SORRELL CONSTRUCTION
EQUIPMENT & MATERIALS LLC

CHERRY CRUSHED CONCRETE

CENTURY ASPHALT LTD

AUSTIN WHITE LIME CO.

VERNOR MATERIAL &
EQUIPMENT

10126 CASH ROAD

2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

6131 SELINSKY

5303 NAVIGATION BLVD

4900 HOWARD LANE

435 COMMERCE

STAFFORD, TX 77477

FREEPORT, TX 77541

HOUSTON, TX 77048

HOUSTON, TX 77011

AUSTIN, TX 78728

FREEPORT, TX 77541

JERRY L. BERRY

JAMES DYE

JOHN CONYER

PHILLIP KING

LILA R. WEIRICH

MIKE DAMIAN

281-499-1551

979-233-6655

281-692-1900

713-292-2868

800-553-5463

979-233-3366

281-499-1525

979-233-7313

832-435-2533

713-292-2885

512-388-1220

979-233-6167

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

JERRY L. BERRY -
281-499-1551

ANTHONY REYNOLDS
979-233-6655

EDDIE BARAJAS
281-692-1900 ext.6005

DARRYL VANEK
713-923-1988

AMBER FRANKS OR CHRISTINA
THOMSON 800-553-5463

BELINDA McMANNERS
979-233-6330

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES

JERRY L. BERRY -
281-499-1551

SUNNY DYE
979-233-6655

ROSIE PLEMONS
281-692-1900 ext. 6003

KIM BYFORD
713-292-2868

ANNE STUTZ
800-553-5463

SHARON FOREMAN
979-233-3366

STABILIZING MATERIALS

COMM CODE

COUNTY ID #

PLANT LOCATION

PLANT LOCATION

PLANT LOCATION

PLANT LOCATION

PLANT LOCATION

PLANT LOCATION

2.1.7 LIME-FLY ASH PLANT MIX

*Shall consist of a homogeneous blend of not less than 30 percent lime by weight which
meets the specification for Hydrated Lime in Item II.1.A of these specifications. The
balance of the mix shall consist of fly ash meeting the specification for Fly Ash in ltem

2.1.6. of these specifications or in TXDOT Item 265.

Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON

2.1.7.1. Price per ton bidder's plant / siding

loaded onto County trucks 750-04 6762 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2.1.7.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-04 6762 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2.1.7.4. Hauling First Mile 750-77 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2.1.7.5. Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
2.1.7.6.State minimum truckload if required NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
2.1.7.7 Price per ton for Spreader Bar 750-04 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00

2.1.8 CEMENT FOR STABILIZATION OF MATERIALS (ROAD MIXED)
*Shall consist of portland cement, Type |, IP, or Il in accordance with TXDOT Item 524.2.,
delivered in tanker-type trucks to jobsite anywhere in Brazoria County. Price bid shall

include distributor

Price per TON

Price per TON

Price per TON

Price per TON

Price per TON

Price per TON

2.1.8.1 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-21 6765 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 $190.00
2.1.8.2. Hauling First Mile 750-77 8199 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2.75
2.1.8.3. Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 8200 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.30
2.1.8.4 State minimum truckload if required NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 24 TONS
2.1.8.5. Price per ton for Spreader Bar 750-21 6766 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 $8.00

2.1.9 ASPHALT STABILIZED BASE -BLACK BASE

Per TxDOT Item 292.4(A), Grade 1

*PRODUCT FROM BOTH PLANTS

Price per TON

Price per TON

Price per TON

Price per TON

Price per TON

Price per TON

2.1.9.1. Price per ton bidder's plant loaded onto

County Trucks 750-21 6779 $55.00 $0.00 $55.00 $52.00 $0.00 $0.00
2.1.9.3. Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-21 6779 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $52.00 $0.00 $0.00
2.1.9.4. Hauling First Mile 750-77 7084 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2.75 $0.00 $0.00
2.1.9.5. Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7085 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.25 $0.00 $0.00
2.1.9.6. Price per ton_in place 750-21 7086 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
2.1.9.9. State minimum truckload if required 15 TONS 15 TONS 15 TONS 17 TONS NO BID NO BID




DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, MARCH 31, 2016

11:00 A.M., Local Time
CONTRACT TERM:

BIDDERS NAME
ADDRESS

CONTACT

TELEPHONE #|
FAX #

AMERICAN MATERIALS INC.

SORRELL CONSTRUCTION
EQUIPMENT & MATERIALS LLC

CHERRY CRUSHED CONCRETE

CENTURY ASPHALT LTD

AUSTIN WHITE LIME CO.

VERNOR MATERIAL &
EQUIPMENT

10126 CASH ROAD

2101 OYSTER CREEK BEND

6131 SELINSKY

5303 NAVIGATION BLVD

4900 HOWARD LANE

435 COMMERCE

STAFFORD, TX 77477

FREEPORT, TX 77541

HOUSTON, TX 77048

HOUSTON, TX 77011

AUSTIN, TX 78728

FREEPORT, TX 77541

JERRY L. BERRY

JAMES DYE

JOHN CONYER

PHILLIP KING

LILA R. WEIRICH

MIKE DAMIAN

281-499-1551

979-233-6655

281-692-1900

713-292-2868

800-553-5463

979-233-3366

281-499-1525

979-233-7313

832-435-2533

713-292-2885

512-388-1220

979-233-6167

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS

JERRY L. BERRY -
281-499-1551

ANTHONY REYNOLDS
979-233-6655

EDDIE BARAJAS
281-692-1900 ext.6005

DARRYL VANEK
713-923-1988

AMBER FRANKS OR CHRISTINA

THOMSON 800-553-5463

BELINDA McMANNERS
979-233-6330

PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES

JERRY L. BERRY -
281-499-1551

SUNNY DYE
979-233-6655

ROSIE PLEMONS
281-692-1900 ext. 6003

KIM BYFORD
713-292-2868

ANNE STUTZ
800-553-5463

SHARON FOREMAN
979-233-3366

STABILIZING MATERIALS COMM CODE | COUNTY ID # PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION
2.1.10 RECLAIMED CEMENT FOR STABILIZATION OF MATERIALS
(ROAD MIXED)
*Shall consist of reclaimed portland cement, Class A or Class H, containing no toxic or
hazardous components other than crystalline silica, delivered in tanker-type trucks to
jobsite anywher
Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON
2.1.10.1. Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-21 6767 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 $100.00
2.1.10.2. Hauling First Mile 750-77 8201 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2.75
2.1.10.3. Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 8202 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.30
2.1.10.4. Price per ton for Spreader Bar 750-21 6768 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 $8.00
BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED INCLUDED
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE NONE
5303 NAVIGATION
9519 GALVESTON RD BLVD 7108 VERNOR ROAD
County Facility MILEAGE MILEAGE MILEAGE HOUSTON, TX HOUSTON, TX 77011 McNEIL, TRAVIS CO., TX FREEPORT, TX 77541
Airport 6 15 27 46 50 214 14
Alvin Svc Ctr 23 40 14.4 20 28 205 40
Angleton Svc Ctr 3 13 25.7 38 56 212 15
Camp Mohawk 23 33 24.8 25 33 192 28
Clute Svc Ctr 10 3 36.3 43 44 226 1
Hanson Park 14 34 36.2 57 59 183 25
Manvel Svc Ctr 24 41 5.5 28 25 189 38
Mosquito Control 3 11 26.9 40 49 212 14
Quintana Cty Park 22 8 47.3 61 70 212 11
Resoft Park 23 42 17.7 13 26 194 36
San Luis Cty Park 30 18 56.9 60 71 244 20
W. Columbia Svc 14 32 34.5 53 57 184 25




