
Page 1 of 12

 

DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

THURSDAY, MAY 12, 2016

2:00 P.M. C.S.T.
CONTACT

TELEPHONE NO.

 FAX NUMBER

 

Heavy Equipment - 
Description UOM MAKE / MODEL UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

Bucket Truck
Up to 50' Reach Hour NO BID $100.00 N/A $145.94 $100.00
Bucket Truck
50' - 75' Hour NO BID $100.00 N/A $160.94 $120.00
Self Loading Knuckle Boom 
Truck
25-35 CY body

Hour
NO BID $125.00 $140.94 $100.00

Self Loading Knuckle Boom 
Truck
35-45 CY body

Hour
NO BID $125.00 $150.94 $120.00

Haul Vehicles - Description UOM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
Dump Truck
10-15 CY Hour MACK / 2007 $80.00 $75.00 ASSORTMENT $100.00 $68.94 $40.00
Dump Truck
16-20 CY Hour MACK / 06 & 2015 $105.00 $75.00 ASSORTMENT $115.00 $78.64 $60.00
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
30-40 CY Hour NO BID $75.00 ASSORTMENT $140.00 $84.74 $70.00
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
41-50 CY Hour NO BID $75.00 ASSORTMENT $140.00 $92.94 $80.00
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
51-60 CY Hour NO BID $100.00 ASSORTMENT $140.00 $97.82 $90.00
Trailer Dump w/Tractor
61-70 CY Hour NO BID $100.00 ASSORTMENT $140.00 $99.94 $100.00
Walking Floor Trailer w/Tractor
100 CY Hour NO BID $100.00 N/A N/A $149.94 $110.00

Personnel - Description UOM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
Hour LABORER $37.10 OPERATIONS MANAGER $60.00
Hour FLAGGER $37.10 SUPERINTENDENT WITH TRUCK, PHONE AND RADIO $54.00

Hour SKILLED SAWMAN $42.66 FOREMAN WITH TRUCK, PHONE AND RADIO $48.00

Hour EQUIPMENT OPERATOR $43.71
SAFETY/QUALITY CONTROL INSPECTOR WITH VEHICLE, 

PHONE AND RADIO $50.00

Hour CREW FOREMAN WITH TRUCK AND COMMUNICATIONS $61.40 INSPECTOR WITH VEHICLE, PHONE AND RADIO $32.00
Hour OPERATIONS MANAGER WITH TRUCK AND COMMUNICATIONS $94.88 CLIMBER WITH GEAR $90.00
Hour SUPERINTENDENT WITH TRUCK AND COMMUNICATIONS $79.57 SAW HAND WITH CHAINSAW $32.00
Hour LABORERS AND FLAGMEN $28.00
Hour TIMEKEEPER $35.00
Hour HAZMAT PROFESSIONAL $180.00
Hour HOUSEHOLD HAZMAT INSPECTION AND REMOVAL CREW $110.00
Hour PUBLIC ASSISTANCE MANAGER $130.00
Hour DOCUMINATION CLERK $50.00
Hour COMMUNITY ASSISTANCE/HOT LINE OPERATORS $35.00

Additional Heavy Equipment 
or Haul Vehicles UOM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION

UNIT PRICE
HR / OT DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

Hour SKID STEER; T 300; BOBCAT $50.00 RUBBER TIRE BACKHOE; 580; CASE $104.00 JD544 WHEEL LOADER W/DEBRIS GRAPPLE $139.38 JD544 WHEEL LOADER WITH DEBRIS GRAPPLE $100.00

Hour VERSA HANDLER; V518; BOBCAT $50.00 EXCAVATOR; 200 CLASS; CAT $139.00 JD644 WHEEL LOADER W/DEBRIS GRAPPLE $151.12 JD544 WHEEL LOADER WITH DEBRIS GRAPPLE $110.00

Hour GRAPPLE; 200 CLASS; CAT $142.00 EXTENDABOOM FORKLIFT W/DEBRS GRAPPLE $79.26 EXTENDABOOM FORKLIFT WITH DEBRIS GRAPPLE $65.00

Hour SHEAR; 200 CLASS; CAT $156.00 SKID STEER, 1,000-LB CAPACITY $72.05
753 BOBCAT SKID STEER LOADER WITH DEBRIS 

GRAPPLE $60.00

Hour GRAPPLE; 240 CLASS; CAT $163.00 SKID STEER, 2,000-LB CAPACITY $75.65 753 BOBCAT SKID STEER LOADER WITH BUCKET $50.00

Hour SHEAR; 240 CLASS; CAT $186.00 DIAMOND Z TUBGRINDER $525.00
753 BOBCAT SKID STEER LOADER WITH STREET 

SWEEPER $60.00

CROWDERGULF, LLC.

5435 BUSINESS PARKWAY

THEODORE, AL 36582

JOHN RAMSEY

800-992-6207

251-459-7433

CERES ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES, INC

9945 WINDFERN ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77064

GAIL HANSCOM

800-218-4424

866-228-5636

VERNOR MATERIAL AND EQUIPMENT

435 COMMERCE ST.

FREEPORT, TX 77541

MIKE DAMIAN

979-233-3366

979-233-6167

$10.55

AFTERMATH DISASTER RECOVERY, INC.

1826 HONEYSUCKLE LN

PROSPER, TX 75078

OBIE CORLEY

972-567-1491

$7.79

ITB#16-19 DEBRIS HAULING

979-233-7313

SORRELL CONSTRUCTION 
EQUIPMENT & MATERIALS, LLC

P.O. BOX 2049

FREEPORT, TX 77542

ANTHONY REYNOLDS

979-233-6655

$0.17
PRICE PER EACH CUBIC YARD HAULED $11.55

$0.43PRICE PER MILE PER CUBIC YARD $0.30$0.20
$7.65 $7.50

$0.10
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DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

THURSDAY, MAY 12, 2016

2:00 P.M. C.S.T.
CONTACT

TELEPHONE NO.

 FAX NUMBER

 

Heavy Equipment - 
Description UOM MAKE / MODEL UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
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AFTERMATH DISASTER RECOVERY, INC.
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ANTHONY REYNOLDS

979-233-6655

$0.17
PRICE PER EACH CUBIC YARD HAULED $11.55

$0.43PRICE PER MILE PER CUBIC YARD $0.30$0.20
$7.65 $7.50

$0.10

Hour MAINTAINER; 140 CLASS; CAT $144.00 HYDRAULIC EXCAVATOR, 1.5CY BUCKET $194.00 30-50 HP FARM TRACOTR WITH BOX BLADE OR RAKE $45.00

Hour FRONT LOADER; 1221 CLASS; CASE $194.00 LOWBOY TRAILER W/TRACTOR $122.50 2 - 2 1/2 CU. YD. ARTICULATED LOADER WITH BUCKET $90.00

Hour SKID STEER; 279; CAT $97.00 3 - 4 CU. YD. ARTICULATED LOADER WITH BUCKET $100.00

Hour
JD 648E LOG SKIDDER, OR EQUIVALENT $75.00

Hour
CAT D4 DOZER $60.00

Hour
CAT D6 DOZER $90.00

Hour CAT D8 DOZER $125.00

Hour
CAT125 - 140 HP MOTOR GRADER $90.00

Hour
JD 690 TRACKHOE WITH DEBRIS GRAPPLE $100.00

Hour JD 690 TRACKHOE WITH BUCKET AND THUMB $100.00

Hour
RUBBER TIRED TRACKHOE WITH DEBRIS GRAPPLE $105.00

Hour JD 310 RUBBER TIRE BACKHOE WITH BUCKET AND HOE $60.00
Hour RUBBER TIRED EXCAVATOR WITH DEBRIS GRAPPLE $105.00
Hour 210 PRENTICE KNUCCKLEBOOM WITH DEBRIS GRAPPLE $90.00
Hour SELF-LOADER SCRAPER CAT 623 OR EQUIVALENT $150.00

Hour
HAND FED DEBRIS CHIPPER $35.00

Hour 300 - 400 TUB GRINDER $350.00

Hour
800 - 1,000 HP DIAMOND Z GRINDER $500.00

Hour
30 TON CRANE $150.00

Hour 50 TON CRANE $170.00

Hour
100 TON CRANE (8 HOUR MINIMUM) $250.00

Hour 40 - 60' BUCKET TRUCK $100.00
Hour SERVICE TRUCK $50.00

Hour
WATER TRUCK $60.00

Hour PORTABLE LIGHT PLANT $14.00

Hour
EQUIPMENT TRANSPORTS $90.00

Hour PICKUP TRUCK, UNMANNED $14.00

Hour SELF-LOADING DUMP TRUCK WITH KNUCKLEBOOM AND 
DEBRIS GRAPPLE $125.00

Hour
SINGLE AXLE DUMPE TRUCK, 5 - 12 CU. YD $45.00

Hour TANDEM DUMP TRUCK, 16 - 20 CU. YD. $60.00

Hour
TRAILER DUMP TRUCK, 24-40 CU. YD. $70.00

Hour TRAILER DUMP TRUCK, 41-60 CU. YD. $85.00

Hour
TRAILER DUMP TRUCK, 61-80 CU. YD. $100.00

Hour
POWER DCREEN $160.00

Hour STACKING CONVEYOR $35.00
Hour OFF ROAD TRUCKS $150.00
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DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

THURSDAY, MAY 12, 2016

2:00 P.M. C.S.T.
CONTACT

TELEPHONE NO.

 FAX NUMBER

 

Heavy Equipment - 
Description UOM MAKE / MODEL UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
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PRICE PER EACH CUBIC YARD HAULED $11.55

$0.43PRICE PER MILE PER CUBIC YARD $0.30$0.20
$7.65 $7.50

$0.10

Hour 8000 GALLON FUEL TANKER $60.00

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour

Note: All above prices include operator, fuel and maintenance



Page 4 of 12

 

DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

THURSDAY, MAY 12, 2016

2:00 P.M. C.S.T.
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 FAX NUMBER
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Hour

Hour

Hour
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Hour
Hour
Hour
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Hour

Hour
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2:00 P.M. C.S.T.
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Description UOM MAKE / MODEL UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

CROWDERGULF, LLC.

5435 BUSINESS PARKWAY

THEODORE, AL 36582

JOHN RAMSEY

800-992-6207

251-459-7433

CERES ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES, INC

9945 WINDFERN ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77064

GAIL HANSCOM

800-218-4424

866-228-5636

VERNOR MATERIAL AND EQUIPMENT

435 COMMERCE ST.

FREEPORT, TX 77541

MIKE DAMIAN

979-233-3366

979-233-6167

$10.55

AFTERMATH DISASTER RECOVERY, INC.

1826 HONEYSUCKLE LN

PROSPER, TX 75078

OBIE CORLEY

972-567-1491

$7.79

ITB#16-19 DEBRIS HAULING

979-233-7313

SORRELL CONSTRUCTION 
EQUIPMENT & MATERIALS, LLC

P.O. BOX 2049

FREEPORT, TX 77542

ANTHONY REYNOLDS

979-233-6655

$0.17
PRICE PER EACH CUBIC YARD HAULED $11.55

$0.43PRICE PER MILE PER CUBIC YARD $0.30$0.20
$7.65 $7.50

$0.10

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour



Page 6 of 12

 

DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

THURSDAY, MAY 12, 2016

2:00 P.M. C.S.T.
CONTACT

TELEPHONE NO.

 FAX NUMBER
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Description UOM MAKE / MODEL UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
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Hour

Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour

Hour

YES

FILL DIRT FOR STUMP HOLES - PURCHASED, PLACE AND 
SHAPED - $20.00/CY

N/A

YES
YES

N/A
N/A

YES
YESYES

N/A
NO

NO
YES
NO

WE HAVE ACCESS TO: 75 SELF-LOADING 
TRUCKS (120-160 CUBIC YARD CAPACITY); 40 

END DUMPS UP TO 80 CUBIC YARD; 20 
WALKING FLOOR 100 CUBIC YARD; 25 SKID 

STEERS; 12 BUCKET TRUCKS; 2 BULLDOZERS; 
15 EXCAVATORS; 6 BARGES WITH KNUCKLE 

BOOMS
N/A

YES

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS

ADDENDUMS INCLUDED
INSURANCE INCLUDED

N/A
N/A
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DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

THURSDAY, MAY 12, 2016

2:00 P.M. C.S.T.
CONTACT

TELEPHONE NO.

 FAX NUMBER

 

Heavy Equipment - 
Description UOM

Bucket Truck
Up to 50' Reach Hour

Bucket Truck
50' - 75' Hour

Self Loading Knuckle Boom 
Truck
25-35 CY body

Hour

Self Loading Knuckle Boom 
Truck
35-45 CY body

Hour

Haul Vehicles - Description UOM
Dump Truck
10-15 CY Hour

Dump Truck
16-20 CY Hour

Trailer Dump w/Tractor
30-40 CY Hour

Trailer Dump w/Tractor
41-50 CY Hour

Trailer Dump w/Tractor
51-60 CY Hour

Trailer Dump w/Tractor
61-70 CY Hour

Walking Floor Trailer w/Tractor
100 CY Hour

Personnel - Description UOM
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour

Additional Heavy Equipment 
or Haul Vehicles UOM

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

ITB#16-19 DEBRIS HAULING

PRICE PER EACH CUBIC YARD HAULED
PRICE PER MILE PER CUBIC YARD 

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

INTERNATIONAL $235.00 INTERNATIONAL 4300 $120.00 FORD $290.00

INTERNATIONAL $265.00 INTERNATIONAL 4300 $145.00 FORD $390.00

STERLING $315.00 STERLING LT9500 $120.00 MACK $170.00

STERLING $335.00 STERLING LT9513 $150.00 MACK $190.00
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

CAT $125.00 $70.00 MACK $100.00

CAT $145.00 $70.00 MACK $110.00

PETERBUILT $165.00 $80.00 MACK $120.00

PETERBUILT $175.00 $80.00 MACK $130.00

PETERBUILT $195.00 $95.00 MACK $150.00

WESTERN STAR $200.00 $95.00 MACK $170.00

MAC $180.00 $130.00 MACK $190.00
DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

SUPERINTENDENT $75.00 LABORER/FLAGMAN CHAINSAW MAN $45.00 PROJECT MANAGER $90.00
FORMAN $60.00 CHAINSAW OPERATOR LABOR/FLAGGER $35.00 CLIMBER WITH SAW $90.00

TREE CLIMBER $90.00 SUPERINTENDENT PROJECT MANAGER W/PHONE $70.00 SAWMAN $50.00

LABORER $45.00 TRAFFIC CONTROL/LABORER $50.00

FLAGGER $40.00

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
EQUIPMENT TYPE WITH 

OPERATOR HOURLY RATE DAY RATE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE
15-24 Cubic Yard Dump 

Truck $80.00 $960.00 WHEEL LOADER; 3 CU YD+ $135.00 SKIDSTEER; 753 OR EQUIV.; CAT $120.00

17 Cubic Yard Clam Truck $125.00 $1,500.00 SKID STEER LOADER 65HP+ $75.00
EXTEND-A-BOOM; FORKLIFT 

WITH GRAPPLE; CAT $120.00

20 Cubic Yard Clam Truck $145.00 $1,740.00 EXCAVATOR 125HP+ $165.00 WHEEL LOADER; 2.5-3.0 CY; CAT $180.00
25-34 Cubic Yard Dump 

Truck $90.00 $1,080.00 LIGHT TOWER $15.00 WHEEL LOADER; 3.0-4.5 CY; CAT $200.00

30 Ton or Larger Crane $245.00 $2,940.00 GENERATOR; 5000W $15.00 WHEEL LOADER; 4.5-6.0 CY; CAT $220.00
35-44 Cubic Yard Dump 

Truck $95.00 $1,140.00
COMMAND TRAILER; 34 FOOT W/ 

GENERATOR (10,000W) $25.00 DOZER TRACKED; D4; CAT $120.00

TFR ENTERPRISES, INC.

601 LEANDER DR.

LEANDER, TX 78641

TIFFANY WILKES

512-260-3322

512-528-1942

$175.00

$175.00

$6.75
$0.25

CUSTOM TREE CARE, INC.

3722 SW SPRING CREEK LN

TOPEKA, KS 66610

GREG GATHERS

785-478-9805

785-478-4195

$8.96
$0.35

$7.00
$0.10

DRC EMERGENCY SERVICES, LLC

P.O. BOX 17017 

GALVESTON, TX 77552

KRISTY FUENTES

888-721-4372

504-482-2852

$125.00

$145.00

$65.00

$75.00

$90.00

$90.00

UNIT PRICE

UNIT PRICE

$90.00

$90.00

$110.00

$30.00
$35.00

$70.00

UNIT PRICE

BERGERON EMERGENCY SERVICES, INC

866-757-7656

954-680-6100 EXT 223

BRIAN THOMASON

FT. LAUDERDALE, FL 33332

19612 S.W. 69TH PLACE

$7.91
$0.23
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DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

THURSDAY, MAY 12, 2016

2:00 P.M. C.S.T.
CONTACT

TELEPHONE NO.

 FAX NUMBER

 

Heavy Equipment - 
Description UOM

 
   

ITB#16-19 DEBRIS HAULING

PRICE PER EACH CUBIC YARD HAULED
PRICE PER MILE PER CUBIC YARD 

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

TFR ENTERPRISES, INC.

601 LEANDER DR.

LEANDER, TX 78641

TIFFANY WILKES

512-260-3322

512-528-1942

$6.75
$0.25

CUSTOM TREE CARE, INC.

3722 SW SPRING CREEK LN

TOPEKA, KS 66610

GREG GATHERS

785-478-9805

785-478-4195

$8.96
$0.35

$7.00
$0.10

DRC EMERGENCY SERVICES, LLC

P.O. BOX 17017 

GALVESTON, TX 77552

KRISTY FUENTES

888-721-4372

504-482-2852

UNIT PRICE

BERGERON EMERGENCY SERVICES, INC

866-757-7656

954-680-6100 EXT 223

BRIAN THOMASON

FT. LAUDERDALE, FL 33332

19612 S.W. 69TH PLACE

$7.91
$0.23

45-54 Cubic Yard Dump 
Truck $100.00 $1,200.00 PICKUP $15.00 DOZER TRACKED; D6; CAT $150.00

50' Bucket Truck $150.00 $1,800.00 TRACTOR/LOW BOY $125.00
5-14 Cubic Yard Dump 

Truck $75.00 $900.00
55-64 Cubic Yard Dump 

Truck $115.00 $1,380.00
65-74 Cubic Yard Dump 

Truck $120.00 $1,440.00
75+ Cubic Yard Dump 

Truck $125.00 $1,500.00
Bobcat Loader $80.00 $960.00

D-6 DOZERS OR 
EQUIVALENT $150.00 $1,800.00

Diamond Z or Equivalent 
Tub Grinder $525.00 $6,300.00

Equipment Transports $95.00 $1,140.00
John Deere 544 Loader or 

Equivalent $120.00 $1,440.00

Motor Grader $130.00 $1,560.00
Rubber Tire Backhoe $115.00 $1,380.00

Service Trucks $85.00 $1,020.00
Stump Grinder $129.00 $1,548.00

Track-Hoes-John Deere 
690 or Equivalent $145.00 $1,740.00

Tractor with Box Blade $65.00 $780.00

Water Truck (2,000 Gallon) $91.00 $1,092.00
Wheel-Loader 644 or 

Equivalent $140.00 $1,680.00
1" DIAPHRAGM PUMP $12.50 $100.00
1" Suction or Discharge 

Hose $4.00 $35.00
12 Ton Lowboy $59.00 $590.00

12' Work Boat with Motor $112.00 $1,120.00
12' Work Boat without 

Motor $84.00 $840.00
185 CFM Compressor $20.00 $151.50
2" Chemical Suction or 

Discharge Hose $22.00 $140.00
2" Diaphragme Pump $25.00 $160.00

2" Diaphragme Pump S.S. $43.00 $275.00
2" Suction or Discharge 

Hose $11.00 $70.00
20' Response Trailer $29.50 $295.00

3"Chemical Suction or 
Discharge Hose $28.00 $180.00

3" Diaphragm Pump $39.00 $250.00
3" Suction or Discharge 

Hose $15.00 $90.00
3"X12' Absorbent Boom- 

Universal $70.00 BALE OF 4
30 Gallon Ovcer-pack $115.00 EACH
36' Response Trailer $45.00 $395.00
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DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

THURSDAY, MAY 12, 2016

2:00 P.M. C.S.T.
CONTACT

TELEPHONE NO.

 FAX NUMBER

 

Heavy Equipment - 
Description UOM

 
   

ITB#16-19 DEBRIS HAULING

PRICE PER EACH CUBIC YARD HAULED
PRICE PER MILE PER CUBIC YARD 

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

TFR ENTERPRISES, INC.

601 LEANDER DR.

LEANDER, TX 78641

TIFFANY WILKES

512-260-3322

512-528-1942

$6.75
$0.25

CUSTOM TREE CARE, INC.

3722 SW SPRING CREEK LN

TOPEKA, KS 66610

GREG GATHERS

785-478-9805

785-478-4195

$8.96
$0.35

$7.00
$0.10

DRC EMERGENCY SERVICES, LLC

P.O. BOX 17017 

GALVESTON, TX 77552

KRISTY FUENTES

888-721-4372

504-482-2852

UNIT PRICE

BERGERON EMERGENCY SERVICES, INC

866-757-7656

954-680-6100 EXT 223

BRIAN THOMASON

FT. LAUDERDALE, FL 33332

19612 S.W. 69TH PLACE

$7.91
$0.23

4 mii20X100 Polyethylene $70.25 EACH

4000-5000 Watt Generator TBD TBD
5"X1 0' Absorbent Boom- 

Petroleum $26.25 EACH
50 Ton Lowboy $130.00 $1,300.00

55- Gallon Drum Liners, 10 
mil $11.25 EACH

55 - Gallon Drums $110.00 EACH

6 mil 20X100 Polyethylene $425.00 ROLL
6 mil Bags $4.75 EACH

8"X 1 0' Absorbent Boom - 
Petroleum $177.50 EACH

95 Gallon Poly Over-pack $350.75 EACH
Absorbent Pads Bundle- 

Petroleum $143.00 BOX
Absorbent Pads Bundle- 

Universal $191.25 B
Acid Suit $95.00 EACH

Administrative Assistant $65.00 $600.00
Air Blower $8.00 $55.00

Air Filtration Panel $12.00 $95.00
Air-hose Section $3.25 $20.75

Airless Spray $35.00 $275.00
Airline Respirator (includes 

150' of Airline) $45.00 $265.00
Asbestos Abatement 

Supervisor $70.00 $700.00
Asbestos Abatement 

Worker $60.00 $600.00
Asbestos Inspector $50.00 $500.00

Backhoe $115.00 $1,150.00
Backhoe Extend-a-hoe $115.00 $1,150.00

Barrel Cart $5.25 $27.50
Boot Covers $8.00 PAIR
Box Truck $35.00 $210.00

Bulldozer D4or Equivalent $105.00 $1,050.00
Cascade Air System Per 

Employee $140.00 DAY/EACH
Caution/Hazard Tape $9.25 EACH

Chemist $80.00 $800.00
Circular Saw $750.00 $30.00

Clerical $35.00 $350.00
Climber with Gear $85.00 $850.00

Combustible Gas Indicator $16.00 $64.75
Cotton or Latex Gloves $0.70 PAIR

Cutting Torch $40.00 $201.75
Detector Tubes $180.00 TEN PACK

DOT Hazardous Waste 
Labels $1.40 EACH

Drill with Bits $4.25 $17.25
Duct Tape $5.00 ROLL

Dump Truck $90.00 $900.00

Electrical Cord Section (50') $12.50 $52.00
Equipment Operator $55.00 $550.00
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DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

THURSDAY, MAY 12, 2016

2:00 P.M. C.S.T.
CONTACT

TELEPHONE NO.

 FAX NUMBER

 

Heavy Equipment - 
Description UOM

 
   

ITB#16-19 DEBRIS HAULING

PRICE PER EACH CUBIC YARD HAULED
PRICE PER MILE PER CUBIC YARD 

Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

TFR ENTERPRISES, INC.

601 LEANDER DR.

LEANDER, TX 78641

TIFFANY WILKES

512-260-3322

512-528-1942

$6.75
$0.25

CUSTOM TREE CARE, INC.

3722 SW SPRING CREEK LN

TOPEKA, KS 66610

GREG GATHERS

785-478-9805

785-478-4195

$8.96
$0.35

$7.00
$0.10

DRC EMERGENCY SERVICES, LLC

P.O. BOX 17017 

GALVESTON, TX 77552

KRISTY FUENTES

888-721-4372

504-482-2852

UNIT PRICE

BERGERON EMERGENCY SERVICES, INC

866-757-7656

954-680-6100 EXT 223

BRIAN THOMASON

FT. LAUDERDALE, FL 33332

19612 S.W. 69TH PLACE

$7.91
$0.23

Extension Ladders $9.50 $42.75
Fiber Drums $75.75 EACH

Field Hazardous Material 
Manager $135.00 $1,350.00

Field Hazardous Material 
Technician $110.00 $1,100.00

Field Project Foreman $95.00 $950.00
Field Project Supervisor $85.00 $850.00

Fire Extinguisher $25.00 $125.00
First Aid Station N/A $125.00
Flatbed Trailer $25.00 $115.00

Foreman with Truck $65.00 $650.00
Grounding Cable and Rod $4.00 $15.00

Hand Auger, Stainless Steel $55.00 $285.00
Hand Operated Transfer 

Pump $11.25 $45.00
Hand Tools Per Employee 

(Shovels, brooms, etc.) $7.50 $30.00
Handheld Radios $18.75 $75.00

Hazardous Material 
Containment Area Foreman $70.00 $700.00

Hazardous Material 
Containment Area Manager $85.00 $850.00

Hazardous Material 
Containment Area 

Supervisor $70.00 $700.00
Hazardous Material 
Containment Area 

Technician $50.00 $500.00
Hazmat Kit N/A $8,500.00

Health and Safety Specialist $85.00 $850.00
Hearinq Protection $0.35 PAIR

HEPA Vac $92.00 $552.00
High Hazard Personnel 

Decontamination $400.00 KIT
Inspector with Vehicle $42.50 $425.00

Kappler Tape $15.00 ROLL
Laborer $32.50 $325.00

Leather Work Gloves $12.50 PAIR
Level A Suit - Kappler 
Responder or Egual $800.00 EACH

Level B Suit - Kappler 
Responder or Egual $350.00 EACH

Low Hazard Personnel 
Decontamination $225.00 EACH

Mechanized Broom $81.00 $810.00
Nitrile Gloves $8.00 PAIR

Neoprene Gloves $12.00 PAIR
Office Trailer $29.50 $339.25

Oil Dry $25.00 PER BUCKET
Oil Dry Spreader $6.00 $24.75

Operator with Chainsaw $45.00 $450.00
Passenger Car $18.75 $75.00

Peat Moss $45.00 EACH BAG
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THURSDAY, MAY 12, 2016

2:00 P.M. C.S.T.
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Description UOM

 
   

ITB#16-19 DEBRIS HAULING

PRICE PER EACH CUBIC YARD HAULED
PRICE PER MILE PER CUBIC YARD 

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour
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Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

TFR ENTERPRISES, INC.

601 LEANDER DR.

LEANDER, TX 78641

TIFFANY WILKES

512-260-3322

512-528-1942

$6.75
$0.25

CUSTOM TREE CARE, INC.

3722 SW SPRING CREEK LN

TOPEKA, KS 66610

GREG GATHERS

785-478-9805

785-478-4195

$8.96
$0.35

$7.00
$0.10

DRC EMERGENCY SERVICES, LLC

P.O. BOX 17017 

GALVESTON, TX 77552

KRISTY FUENTES

888-721-4372

504-482-2852

UNIT PRICE

BERGERON EMERGENCY SERVICES, INC

866-757-7656

954-680-6100 EXT 223

BRIAN THOMASON

FT. LAUDERDALE, FL 33332

19612 S.W. 69TH PLACE

$7.91
$0.23

Personal Protective 
Equipment/Level A 

Employee N/A $240.00
Personal Protective 
Equipment/Level B 

Employee N/A $46.00
Personal Protective 
Equipment/Level C 

Employee N/A $30.00
Personnel Retrieval 

Harness N/A $24.00

Personnel Retrieval System N/A $140.00
Photo Paper $36.00 PACK

Photographic Equipment $37.50 $150.00
Photoionization Detector N/A $110.00

Pickup Truck $16.25 $95.00
Pickup Truck, 1 Ton $21.00 $125.00
Pickup Truck, 4X4 $21.00 $125.00

Pickup Truck, Extended 
Cab $16.25 $95.00

Port a John $15.00 $85.00
Portable Eyewash Station N/A $38.00

Portable Light Stand $40.00 $240.00
Pressure Washer $18.50 $112.75

Project Coordinator $100.00 $1,000.00
Project Engineer $95.00 $950.00
Project Geologist $85.00 $850.00

Proshield $5.00 EACH
PVC Boots (Hazmat) $32.50 PAIR

PVC Gloves $2.70 PAIR
Rain Suit $35.00 EACH

Regulatory Manager $75.00 $750.00
Respirator Airline, 50' 

Section N/A $175.00
Respirator Cartridges N/A $35.00

Respirator Wipes $0.40 EACH
Safety Superintendent $55.00 $550.00

Saranex $25.00 EACH
SCBA Bottle Refill $17.00 EACH
Silvershield Gloves $12.00 PAIR

Skid Steer $80.00 $800.00
Small Compressor $9.00 $72.50

Soda Ash Bag $30.00 EACH
Spike Bar $4.25 $20.75

Spill Classifier $18.00 STRIP
Step Ladders N/A $12.00

Superintendent with Truck $75.00 $750.00
Survey Personnel with 

Vehicle $38.00 $380.00
Tool Kit (Hammers, Pliers, 

Screwdrivers, etc.) N/A $45.00
Toxic Gas Detector $31.25 $125.00
Track-hoe 490 or 

Equivalent $145.00 $1,450.00
Traffic Control Personnel $30.00 $300.00
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DATE OF BID OPENING RESPONDENTS NAME

THURSDAY, MAY 12, 2016

2:00 P.M. C.S.T.
CONTACT

TELEPHONE NO.

 FAX NUMBER

 

Heavy Equipment - 
Description UOM

 
   

ITB#16-19 DEBRIS HAULING

PRICE PER EACH CUBIC YARD HAULED
PRICE PER MILE PER CUBIC YARD 

Hour

Hour
Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour

Hour
Hour

Hour

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS

ADDENDUMS INCLUDED
INSURANCE INCLUDED

DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE

TFR ENTERPRISES, INC.

601 LEANDER DR.

LEANDER, TX 78641

TIFFANY WILKES

512-260-3322

512-528-1942

$6.75
$0.25

CUSTOM TREE CARE, INC.

3722 SW SPRING CREEK LN

TOPEKA, KS 66610

GREG GATHERS

785-478-9805

785-478-4195

$8.96
$0.35

$7.00
$0.10

DRC EMERGENCY SERVICES, LLC

P.O. BOX 17017 

GALVESTON, TX 77552

KRISTY FUENTES

888-721-4372

504-482-2852

UNIT PRICE

BERGERON EMERGENCY SERVICES, INC

866-757-7656

954-680-6100 EXT 223

BRIAN THOMASON

FT. LAUDERDALE, FL 33332

19612 S.W. 69TH PLACE

$7.91
$0.23

Traffic Control Vest, Cones, 
_Flags, Barrels, etc. $51.25 $310.00

Truck Driver $45.00 $450.00
Tyvek $8.00 EACH

Vacuum Truck, 3,500 
Gallon $295.00 $2,950.00

Vermiculite $30.00 EACH
Water hose Section 

(Garden) $35.00 EACH
Wheelbarrow N/A $15.00
Wire Welder $43.25 $258.75

Wrench Kit (Bung wrench, 
speed wrench, etc.) N/A $25.00

YES
NO

NO

YES
YES

N/A
N/A

YES
NO

NO
N/A N/A
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