ITB#16-55 MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS

Printed 7/14/2016

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 30, 2016
11:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME

BIDDERS NAME

ADAPCO, INC.

UNIVAR ENVIRONMENTAL
SCIENCES

TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

550 AERO LANE

1919 JACINTO PORT

1225 N POST OAK ROAD

SANFORD, FL 32771

HOUSTON TX 77015

HOUSTON, TX 77055

QUOTED BY

JASON TRUMBETTA

CHRIS WALTHALL

MIKE NICHOLS

TELEPHONE NUMBER

800-367-0659

832-386-3200

713-682-4411

FAX NUMBER 866-330-9888 281-864-9908 713-682-4374
UNIT PRICE
Comm | County PER UNIT PRICE PER EXTENDED UNIT PRICE PER
DESCRIPTION Code ID Qty UOM GALLON EXTENDED PRICE GALLON PRICE GALLON EXTENDED PRICE
1.0 PERMETHRIN 30-30 CONCENTRATE
$57.42 - 30 GAL $1,722.60 - 30 GAL
$55.78 - 55 GAL $3,067.90 - 55 GAL
30 Gallon Container|] 675-45 | 2637 30 DRUM $54.13 $1,623.90 $53.84 $1,615.20 $55.78 - 275 GAL | $15,339.50 - 275 GAL
Provide Mix Ration quote 30-30 30-30 30-30
Vendor Products Name if Different from Above PERMANONE 30-30 KONTROL 30-30 EVOLUER 30-30 ULV
Days to deliver ARO 1-4 DAYS 2 DAYS 1-7 DAYS
UNIT PRICE
Comm | County PER UNIT PRICE PER EXTENDED UNIT PRICE PER
2.0 PERMETHRIN 31-67 CONCENTRATE Code ID Qty UOM GALLON EXTENDED PRICE GALLON PRICE GALLON EXTENDED PRICE
$92.10 - 30 GAL $2,763.00 - 30 GAL
$90.16 - 55 GAL $4,958.80 - 55 GAL
30 Gallon Container] 675-45 30 DRUM $80.97 $2,429.10 $79.84 $2,395.20 $90.16 - 275 GAL [ $24,794.00 - 275 GAL
Provide Mix Ration quote 31-66 31-67 31-66
Vendor Products Name if Different from Above PERMANONE 31-66 KONTROL 31-67 EVOLUER 31-66 ULV
Days to deliver ARO 1-4 DAYS 2 DAYS 1-7 DAYS
UNIT PRICE
Comm | County PER UNIT PRICE PER EXTENDED UNIT PRICE PER
3.0 MALATHION Code ID Qty UOM GALLON EXTENDED PRICE GALLON PRICE GALLON EXTENDED PRICE
BULK PRICE| 675-45 | 1805 0 BULK $46.15 $46.15/gl $46.15 $46.15 $0.00 $0.00

VENDOR TO PROVIDE A BULK PRICE STRUCTURE BASED ON VARIOUS QUANTITY

RANGES OF GALLONS ORDERED

FYFANON ULVMosquito = 1,000 gallon
minimum; frieght included
Fyfanon ULV Mosquito - 260 gl tote $48.50/gl

260 GL TOTE $48.50 GAL.

NO BID

Vendor Products Name if Different from Above

FYFANON ULV /
FMC CHEMI-NOVE

Days to deliver ARO

2-5 DAYS

2 DAYS
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ITB#16-55 MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS

Printed 7/14/2016

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 30, 2016
11:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME

BIDDERS NAME

ADAPCO, INC.

UNIVAR ENVIRONMENTAL
SCIENCES

TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

550 AERO LANE

1919 JACINTO PORT

1225 N POST OAK ROAD

SANFORD, FL 32771

HOUSTON TX 77015

HOUSTON, TX 77055

QUOTED BY

JASON TRUMBETTA

CHRIS WALTHALL

MIKE NICHOLS

TELEPHONE NUMBER

800-367-0659

832-386-3200

713-682-4411

FAX NUMBER 866-330-9888 281-864-9908 713-682-4374
UNIT PRICE
Comm | County PER UNIT PRICE PER EXTENDED UNIT PRICE PER
DESCRIPTION Code 1D Qty UOM GALLON EXTENDED PRICE GALLON PRICE GALLON EXTENDED PRICE
UNIT PRICE
Comm | County PER EXTENDED PRICE UNIT PRICE PER EXTENDED UNIT PRICE PER
4.0 NALED Code ID Qty UOM GALLON Prices valid until 12/31/16 GALLON PRICE GALLON EXTENDED PRICE
$5,951.70
30 Gallon Drum| 675-45 | 1804 30 DRUM $198.39 1-3 drums $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
$196.20 $5,886.00 > 4 drums
Price not to exceed below prices after 12/31/16
$208.31 / GL = $6,249.30 1-3 drums
ADDITIONAL COMMENTS $206.01 / GL = $6,180.30 = > 4 drums NO BID NO BID
DIBROM CONCENTRATE - SAME ACTIVE AS
Vendor Products Name if Different from Above ABOVE
Days to deliver ARO 1-3 DAYS
Does the company retrieve containers after use? Yes or No YES
Retrieval Policy included?] SEE RFP RESPONSE FOR INFORMATION
UNIT PRICE
Comm | County PER UNIT PRICE PER EXTENDED UNIT PRICE PER
5.0 B.T.l. Bacillus thuringiensis, Serotype H-14 | Code ID Qty UOM GALLON EXTENDED PRICE GALLON PRICE GALLON EXTENDED PRICE
2.5 Gallon Container| 675-45 | 2568 25 CAN $30.74 $76.85 $39.49 $91.23 $31.96 $79.90
5 Gallon Container| 675-45 | 2564 5 CAN $30.74 $153.70 NO BID NO BID $31.96 $159.80
ADDITIONAL COMMENTS 5 GAL CONTAINER = 2/2.5 GL / CASE N/A N/A
Vendor Products Name if Different from Above] AQUABAC XT - SAME ACTIVE AS ABOVE TEKNAR SC VECTO BAC 12 AS
Days to deliver ARO 1-4 DAYS 2 DAYS 1-7 DAYS
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ITB#16-55 MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS

Printed 7/14/2016

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JUNE 30, 2016
11:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME

BIDDERS NAME

ADAPCO, INC.

UNIVAR ENVIRONMENTAL
SCIENCES

TARGET SPECIALTY PRODUCTS

550 AERO LANE

1919 JACINTO PORT

1225 N POST OAK ROAD

SANFORD, FL 32771

HOUSTON TX 77015

HOUSTON, TX 77055

QUOTED BY

JASON TRUMBETTA

CHRIS WALTHALL

MIKE NICHOLS

TELEPHONE NUMBER

800-367-0659

832-386-3200

713-682-4411

FAX NUMBER 866-330-9888 281-864-9908 713-682-4374
UNIT PRICE
Comm | County PER UNIT PRICE PER EXTENDED UNIT PRICE PER
DESCRIPTION Code ID Qty UOM GALLON EXTENDED PRICE GALLON PRICE GALLON EXTENDED PRICE
UNIT PRICE
Comm | County PER UNIT PRICE PER EXTENDED UNIT PRICE PER
6.0 BONIDE Code 1D Qty UOM GALLON EXTENDED PRICE GALLON PRICE GALLON EXTENDED PRICE
2.5 Gallon Container 25 $0.00 NO OFFER $11.25 $28.13 NO BID NO BID
5 Gal Container 5 $8.80 $44.00 NO BID NO BID $9.40 $47.00
55 Gallon Container| 675-45 | 2618 55 DRUM $8.23 $452.65 $8.49 $466.95 $8.10 $445.50
ADDITIONAL COMMENTS NONE N/A N/A
Vendor Products Name if Different from Above BVA 2 LARVICIDE MASERLINE LARVACIDE OIL BVA 2 MOSQUITO LARVICIDE OIL
Days to deliver ARO 1-4 DAYS 2 DAYS 1-7 DAYS
7.0 METHOPRENE EXTENDED RESIDUAL BRIQUET-
"INGOT DESIGN" ALTOSID XR EXTENDED VENDOR'S
RESIDUAL BRIQUET "INGOT DESIGN" Comm | County QTY/CS VENDOR'S QTY /| UNIT PRICE/ | VENDOR'S QTY /
Code ID Qty UOM UOM UNIT PRICE / CASE CS UOM CASE CS UOM UNIT PRICE / CASE
$682.00 / CASE ($682.00 Texas State contract
CASE| 675-45 | 9145 CASE pricing) 220 $710.60 220 $710.60
ADDITIONAL COMMENTS NONE N/A N/A

Brand to be furnished

ALTOSID XR INGOT

ALTOSID XR BRIQUET / INGOT

ALTOSID XR EXTENDED RESIDUAL
BRIQUETS INGOT DESIGN

Days to deliver ARO N/A N/A N/A
MSDS SHEETS INCLUDED INCLUDED NOT INCLUDED INCLUDED
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS? NONE NONE NONE
ADDITIONAL COMMENTS NONE NONE NONE
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