BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
BID TABULATION SHEET - ITB #16-73 TREATED BRIDGE TIMBERS
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS NAME

INTERNATIONAL FOREST PRODUCTS, LLC

CONROE WOOD PRODUCTS

FRIDAY, JULY 29, 2016

12229 ALMEDA ROAD

804 W DALLAS #1

10:00 A.M., C.S.T.

HOUSTON, TX 77045

CONROE, TX 77301

QUOTED BY SEAN PEARCY CHARLINE MULLER
CONTRACT TERM TELEPHONE NUMBER 713-413-4700 936-760-2974
FAX NUMBER 713-413-4705 936-760-2975
1. GRADE 1, C.C.A. TREATED TIMBER
COMM
1.1 PILING - 12 inch min dia. CODE COUNTY ID PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED
20 FT. 540-10 2052 NO BID NO BID $7.32 -
25 FT. 540-10 2053 NO BID NO BID $6.79 -
30 FT. 540-10 2054 NO BID NO BID $6.58 -
35 FT. 540-10 2055 NO BID NO BID $6.24 -
1.2.1. S4S (Surfaced four sides - both faces and both edges (planer-finished)
COMM
2" X 6" CODE COUNTY ID PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED
8'-16'| 540-10 2058 NO BID NO BID - -
18'| 540-10 5545 NO BID NO BID - -
20| 540-10 5546 NO BID NO BID - -
22| 540-10 5547 NO BID NO BID - -
24'| 540-10 5548 NO BID NO BID - -
26'| 540-10 5549 NO BID NO BID - -
28| 540-10 5550 NO BID NO BID - -
30| 540-10 5551 NO BID NO BID - -
2" X 10"
8'-16'| 540-10 2059 NO BID NO BID - -
18'| 540-10 5552 NO BID NO BID - -
20| 540-10 5553 NO BID NO BID - -
22| 540-10 5554 NO BID NO BID - -
24'| 540-10 5555 NO BID NO BID - -
26'| 540-10 5556 NO BID NO BID - -
28| 540-10 5557 NO BID NO BID - -
30| 540-10 5558 NO BID NO BID - -
3" X 8"
8'-16'| 540-10 2063 NO BID NO BID - -
18'| 540-10 5559 NO BID NO BID - -
20| 540-10 5560 NO BID NO BID - -
22| 540-10 5561 NO BID NO BID - -
24'| 540-10 5562 NO BID NO BID - -
26'| 540-10 5563 NO BID NO BID - -
28| 540-10 5564 NO BID NO BID - -
30| 540-10 5565 NO BID NO BID - -
4" X 4"
8'-16' 540-10 2060 NO BID NO BID - -
18 540-10 5566 NO BID NO BID - -
20’ 540-10 5567 NO BID NO BID - -
22' 540-10 5568 NO BID NO BID - -
24' 540-10 5569 NO BID NO BID - -
26' 540-10 5570 NO BID NO BID - -
28' 540-10 5571 NO BID NO BID - -
30 540-10 5572 NO BID NO BID - -
4" X 6"
8'-16'| 540-10 2061 NO BID NO BID - -
18'| 540-10 5573 NO BID NO BID - -
20| 540-10 5574 NO BID NO BID - -
22| 540-10 5575 NO BID NO BID - -
24'| 540-10 5576 NO BID NO BID - -
26'| 540-10 5577 NO BID NO BID - -
28| 540-10 5578 NO BID NO BID - -
30| 540-10 5579 NO BID NO BID - -
4" X 10"
8'-16'| 540-10 2062 NO BID NO BID - -
18'| 540-10 5580 NO BID NO BID - -
20| 540-10 5581 NO BID NO BID - -
22| 540-10 5582 NO BID NO BID - -
24'| 540-10 5583 NO BID NO BID - -
26'| 540-10 5584 NO BID NO BID - -
28| 540-10 5585 NO BID NO BID - -
30| 540-10 5586 NO BID NO BID - -
6" X 6"
8'-16'| 540-10 2064 NO BID NO BID - -
18'| 540-10 5587 NO BID NO BID - -
20| 540-10 5588 NO BID NO BID - -
22| 540-10 5589 NO BID NO BID - -
24'| 540-10 5590 NO BID NO BID - -
26'| 540-10 5591 NO BID NO BID - -
28| 540-10 5592 NO BID NO BID - -
30| 540-10 5593 NO BID NO BID - -
6" X 8"
8'-16'| 540-10 2065 NO BID NO BID - -
18'| 540-10 5594 NO BID NO BID - -
20| 540-10 5595 NO BID NO BID - -
22| 540-10 5596 NO BID NO BID - -




BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
BID TABULATION SHEET - ITB #16-73 TREATED BRIDGE TIMBERS
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DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS NAME

INTERNATIONAL FOREST PRODUCTS, LLC

CONROE WOOD PRODUCTS

FRIDAY, JULY 29, 2016

12229 ALMEDA ROAD

804 W DALLAS #1

10:00 A.M., C.S.T.

HOUSTON, TX 77045

CONROE, TX 77301

QUOTED BY SEAN PEARCY CHARLINE MULLER
CONTRACT TERM TELEPHONE NUMBER 713-413-4700 936-760-2974
FAX NUMBER 713-413-4705 936-760-2975
24 540-10 5597 NO BID NO BID - -
26' 540-10 5598 NO BID NO BID - -
28' 540-10 5599 NO BID NO BID - -
30 540-10 5600 NO BID NO BID - -
1.2.2. SI1S1E (Surface one-sided & one-
edge (planer - finished) PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED
3" X 8"
8 -16' 540-10 5609 NO BID NO BID - -
18' 540-10 5610 NO BID NO BID - -
20' 540-10 5611 NO BID NO BID - -
1.2.4 Rough (Has not been surfaced
(dressed) but which has been sawed,
edged & trimmed) PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED
3" X 8"
8'-16' NO BID NO BID - -
18' NO BID NO BID - -
20’ NO BID NO BID - -
28' NO BID NO BID - -
30 NO BID NO BID - -
4" X 4"
8'-16' NO BID NO BID - -
18' NO BID NO BID - -
20’ NO BID NO BID - -
28' NO BID NO BID - -
30 NO BID NO BID - -
4" X 6"
8 -16' NO BID NO BID - -
18' NO BID NO BID - -
20' NO BID NO BID - -
28' NO BID NO BID - -
30 NO BID NO BID - -
1.3 POSTS (Round, Fence)
5" - 6" Dia Tops
6 1/2' NO BID NO BID - -
8' NO BID NO BID - -
10' NO BID NO BID - -
12' NO BID NO BID - -
14' NO BID NO BID - -
16' NO BID NO BID - -
18' NO BID NO BID - -
6" - 7" Dia Tops
6 1/2' NO BID NO BID - -
8' NO BID NO BID - -
10' NO BID NO BID - -
12' NO BID NO BID - -
14' NO BID NO BID - -
16' NO BID NO BID - -
18' NO BID NO BID - -
7" - 8" Dia Tops
6 1/2' NO BID NO BID - -
8' NO BID NO BID - -
10' NO BID NO BID - -
12' NO BID NO BID - -
14' NO BID NO BID - -
16' NO BID NO BID - -
18' 540-10 5790 NO BID NO BID - -
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BIDDERS NAME
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QUOTED BY SEAN PEARCY CHARLINE MULLER
CONTRACT TERM TELEPHONE NUMBER 713-413-4700 936-760-2974
FAX NUMBER 713-413-4705 936-760-2975
2.0 GRADE 2, C.C.A. TREATED TIMBER PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED
2.1 PILING - 12 inch min dia.
20 FT. 540-10 2052 $7.24 $7.64 - -
25 FT. 540-10 2053 $6.76 $7.13 - -
30 FT. 540-10 2054 $6.99 $7.35 - -
35 FT. 540-10 2055 $6.67 $7.02 - -
40 FT. 540-10 2056 $6.56 $6.89 - -
45 FT. 540-10 2057 $6.43 $6.74 - -
2.2 Grade 2 - Dimensional Lumber &
Timbers
2.2.1 S4S (Surfaced four sides-both faces
and both edges(planer-finished) PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED
2" X 6"
8 -16' 540-10 2081 NO BID NO BID $0.67 -
18' 540-10 5871 NO BID NO BID $0.67 -
20' 540-10 5872 NO BID NO BID $0.68 -
22' 540-10 5873 NO BID NO BID $0.92 -
24 540-10 5874 NO BID NO BID $0.93 -
26' 540-10 5875 NO BID NO BID $1.21 -
28' 540-10 5876 NO BID NO BID - -
30 540-10 5877 NO BID NO BID - -
2" X 10"
8 -16' 540-10 2082 NO BID NO BID $1.02 -
18' 540-10 5878 NO BID NO BID $1.03 -
20' 540-10 5879 NO BID NO BID $1.03 -
22' 540-10 5880 NO BID NO BID $1.52 -
24 540-10 5881 NO BID NO BID $1.56 -
26' 540-10 5882 NO BID NO BID $2.02 -
28' 540-10 5883 NO BID NO BID - -
30 540-10 5884 NO BID NO BID - -
2.2.2. S1S1E (Surfaced one-sided & one-
edge (planer-finished) PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED
3" X 8"
8 -16' 540-10 5935 $1.98 $2.08 $1.87 -
18' 540-10 5936 $2.06 $2.16 $1.92 -
20' 540-10 5937 $2.14 $2.24 $1.95 -
22 540-10 5938 $2.21 $2.31 - -
24 540-10 5939 $2.40 $2.50 - -
26' 540-10 2090 $2.57 $2.67 - -
28' 540-10 2089 NO BID NO BID - -
30 540-10 5940 NO BID NO BID - -
2.2.3 S2E (Surfaced, two edges (planer-
finished) PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED
6" X 14"
8 -16' 540-10 2093 NO BID NO BID - -
18' 540-10 2092 NO BID NO BID - -
20' 540-10 2091 NO BID NO BID - -
22' 540-10 5949 NO BID NO BID - -
24 540-10 5950 NO BID NO BID - -
26' 540-10 5951 NO BID NO BID - -
28' 540-10 5952 NO BID NO BID - -
30 540-10 5953 NO BID NO BID - -
2.24  Rough (Not surfaced but sawed,
edged & trimmed) PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED
3" X 8"
8 -16' 540-10 6042 $1.91 $2.01 $1.87 -
18' 540-10 6043 $1.94 $2.04 $1.92 -
20' 540-10 6044 $2.06 $2.16 $1.95 -
22' 540-10 6045 $2.17 $2.27 $2.35 -
24 540-10 6046 $2.39 $2.49 $2.41 -
26' 540-10 6047 $2.56 $2.66 $2.60 -
28' 540-10 2094 NO BID NO BID - -
30 540-10 2095 NO BID NO BID - -
4" X 4"
8 -16' 540-10 2096 $1.36 $1.43 $1.24 -
18' 540-10 6048 $1.44 $1.50 $1.31 -
20' 540-10 6049 $1.44 $1.50 $1.32 -
22'| 540-10 6050 NO BID NO BID - -
24'|  540-10 6051 NO BID NO BID - -
26'| 540-10 6052 NO BID NO BID - -
28'| 540-10 6053 NO BID NO BID - -
30| 540-10 6054 NO BID NO BID - -
4" X 6"
8 -16' 540-10 2097 $2.04 $2.14 $1.87 -
18' 540-10 6055 $2.16 $2.26 $1.97 -
20' 540-10 6056 $2.16 $2.26 $1.99 -
22'| 540-10 6057 NO BID NO BID - -
24'|  540-10 6058 NO BID NO BID - -
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INTERNATIONAL FOREST PRODUCTS, LLC
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QUOTED BY SEAN PEARCY CHARLINE MULLER
CONTRACT TERM TELEPHONE NUMBER 713-413-4700 936-760-2974
FAX NUMBER 713-413-4705 936-760-2975
26'| 540-10 6059 NO BID NO BID - -
28'| 540-10 6060 NO BID NO BID - -
30| 540-10 6061 NO BID NO BID - -
4" X 8"

8'-16'| 540-10 2098 $2.55 $2.68 $2.81 -
18'| 540-10 6062 $2.59 $2.73 $2.97 -
20'| 540-10 6063 $2.74 $2.87 $3.07 -
22'| 540-10 6064 $2.89 $3.02 $3.22 -
24'|  540-10 6065 $3.19 $3.32 $3.29 -
26'| 540-10 6066 $3.41 $3.54 $3.46 -
28'| 540-10 6067 $3.63 $3.76 $3.66 -
30| 540-10 6068 $3.85 $3.99 $4.07 -

4" X'12"

8'-16'| 540-10 2099 $4.22 $4.42 $4.20 -
18'| 540-10 6069 $4.33 $4.53 $4.45 -
20'| 540-10 6070 $4.44 $4.64 $4.60 -
22'| 540-10 6071 $4.67 $4.87 $4.82 -
24'|  540-10 6072 $4.78 $4.98 $4.94 -
26'| 540-10 6073 $5.11 $5.31 $5.18 -
28'| 540-10 6074 $5.33 $5.53 $5.50 -
30| 540-10 6075 $5.56 $5.76 $6.12 -

6" X 6"

8'-16'| 540-10 2100 $2.62 $2.77 $2.84 -
18'| 540-10 6076 $2.72 $2.87 $2.94 -
20'| 540-10 6077 $2.87 $3.02 $3.11 -
22'| 540-10 6078 $3.42 $3.57 $3.71 -
24'|  540-10 6079 $3.50 $3.65 $3.80 -
26'| 540-10 6080 $3.58 $3.73 $3.88 -
28'| 540-10 6081 $3.67 $3.82 $3.99 -
30| 540-10 6082 $3.75 $3.90 $4.07 -

6" X 14"

8'-16' 540-10 2101 $8.48 $8.83 $9.33 -
18'| 540-10 6083 $8.87 $9.22 $9.54 -
20'| 540-10 6084 $9.26 $9.61 $9.76 -
22'| 540-10 6085 $9.64 $9.99 $9.97 -
24'|  540-10 6086 $10.03 $10.38 $10.40 -
26'| 540-10 6087 $10.42 $10.77 $10.61 -
28'| 540-10 6088 $10.81 $11.16 $10.82 -
30| 540-10 6089 $11.20 $11.55 $11.03 -

6" X 16"

8'-16'| 540-10 2177 $10.13 $10.53 $10.66 -
18'| 540-10 6090 $10.58 $10.98 $10.91 -
20'| 540-10 6091 $11.02 $11.42 $11.14 -
22'| 540-10 6092 $12.36 $12.76 $11.40 -
24'|  540-10 6093 $13.24 $13.64 $11.88 -
26'| 540-10 6094 $14.13 $14.53 $12.12 -
28'| 540-10 6095 $15.02 $15.42 $12.36 -
30| 540-10 6096 $15.47 $15.87 $12.62 -

8" X 8"

8'-16'| 540-10 6097 $5.04 $5.30 $5.28 -
18'| 540-10 6098 $5.19 $5.45 $5.61 -
20'| 540-10 6099 $5.48 $5.75 $5.93 -
22'| 540-10 6100 $5.78 $6.04 $6.26 -
24'|  540-10 6101 $6.07 $6.34 $6.49 -
26'| 540-10 6102 $6.37 $6.64 $6.84 -
28'| 540-10 6103 $6.52 $6.79 $6.98 -
30| 540-10 6104 $6.67 $6.93 $7.18 -

10" X 12"

8'-16'| 540-10 2102 $11.67 $12.17 $11.12 -
18'| 540-10 6105 $11.94 $12.44 $11.43 -
20'| 540-10 6106 $12.22 $12.72 $12.03 -
22'| 540-10 6107 $13.33 $13.83 $13.02 -
24'|  540-10 6108 $13.89 $14.39 $13.82 -
26'| 540-10 6109 $14.17 $14.67 $14.18 -
28'| 540-10 6110 $14.72 $15.22 $14.67 -
30| 540-10 6111 $15.28 $15.78 $15.34 -

12" X 12"

8'-16'| 540-10 2103 $12.67 $13.27 $13.34 -
18'| 540-10 6112 $13.00 $13.60 $13.72 -
20'| 540-10 6113 $13.33 $13.93 $14.44 -
22'| 540-10 6114 $14.67 $15.27 $15.62 -
24'|  540-10 6115 $15.23 $15.93 $16.58 -
26'| 540-10 2104 $15.67 $16.27 $17.02 -
28'| 540-10 6116 $16.33 $16.93 $17.60 -
30| 540-10 6117 $17.00 $17.60 $18.40 -




BRAZORIA COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT

BID TABULATION SHEET - ITB #16-73 TREATED BRIDGE TIMBERS

Page 5 of 5

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDERS NAME| INTERNATIONAL FOREST PRODUCTS, LLC CONROE WOOD PRODUCTS
FRIDAY, JULY 29, 2016 12229 ALMEDA ROAD 804 W DALLAS #1
10:00 AM., C.S.T. HOUSTON, TX 77045 CONROE, TX 77301
QUOTED BY SEAN PEARCY CHARLINE MULLER
CONTRACT TERM TELEPHONE NUMBER 713-413-4700 936-760-2974
FAX NUMBER 713-413-4705 936-760-2975
2.3 POSTS (Round, Fence) PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED PRICE/FT.@ PLANT PRICE/FT. DELIVERED
3" - 4" Dia. Tops SOLD IN BUNDLES ONLY
6 1/2'| 540-10 6160 $0.61 $0.65 $0.65 -
8'| 540-10 6161 NO BID NO BID - -
10'| 540-10 6162 NO BID NO BID - -
12'| 540-10 6163 NO BID NO BID - -
14'|  540-10 6164 NO BID NO BID - -
16'| 540-10 6465 NO BID NO BID - -
18'| 540-10 6166 NO BID NO BID - -
4" - 5" Dia Tops
6 1/2'| 540-10 6167 $0.87 $0.94 $0.95 -
8'| 540-10 6168 $0.91 $0.98 $0.99 -
10'| 540-10 6169 $0.92 $0.99 $0.99 -
12'| 540-10 6170 $1.00 $1.07 $1.08 -
14'|  540-10 6171 NO BID NO BID $1.12 -
16'| 540-10 6172 NO BID NO BID - -
18'| 540-10 6173 NO BID NO BID - -
5" - 6" Dia Tops
6 1/2'| 540-10 6174 $1.58 $1.69 $1.32 -
8'| 540-10 6175 $1.37 $1.47 $1.77 -
10'| 540-10 6176 $1.41 $1.52 $1.86 -
12'| 540-10 6177 $1.54 $1.65 $1.61 -
14'|  540-10 6178 $1.60 $1.71 $1.64 -
16'| 540-10 6179 $1.65 $1.77 $1.71 -
18'| 540-10 6180 $1.76 $1.88 $1.83 -
6" - 7" Dia Tops
6 1/2'( 510-10 6181 NO BID NO BID $2.10 -
8'| 510-10 6182 $1.97 $2.12 $1.88 -
10'| 510-10 6183 $2.03 $2.18 $1.93 -
12'| 510-10 6184 $2.21 $2.36 $2.61 -
14'| 510-10 6185 $2.27 $2.44 $2.24 -
16'| 510-10 6186 $2.34 $2.51 $2.28 -
18'| 510-10 6187 $2.48 $2.65 $2.42 -
7" - 8" Dia Tops
6 1/2'| 540-10 6188 NO BID NO BID - -
8'| 540-10 6189 $2.60 $2.80 $2.41 -
10'| 540-10 6190 $2.66 $2.86 $2.54 -
12'| 540-10 6191 $2.92 $3.12 $3.43 -
14'|  540-10 6192 $2.98 $3.19 $2.91 -
16'| 540-10 6193 $3.07 $3.29 - -
18'| 540-10 6194 $3.24 $3.47 - -
8" - 9" Dia Tops
6 1/2' 540-10 6195 NO BID NO BID - -
8'| 540-10 6196 $3.59 $3.84 - -
10'| 540-10 6197 $3.73 $3.99 - -
12'| 540-10 6198 $3.98 $4.24 - -
14'|  540-10 6199 $4.07 $4.34 - -
16'| 540-10 6200 $4.16 $4.44 - ,
18'| 540-10 6201 $4.25 $4.54 - -

DELIVERY CAN BE MADE IN 10 DAYS AFTER
RECEIPT OF ORDER.
FOR ALL ITEMS ON THIS BID ADD 400.00 FREIGHT
PER TL WOULD NEED QUANTITIES TO QUOTE

DELIVERY 14 DAYS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER DELIVERED
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS NONE NONE
BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED YES YES
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