BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
ITB# 16-72 ROAD SAFETY, FLASHERS, STROBES & WARNING LIGHTS

DATE OF BID OPENING

VENDOR NAME

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.

TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC.

DALLAS LITE AND BARRICADE, INC.

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016 ADDRESS 8341 EPICENTER BLVD. 3310-D FRICK RD. 1607 FORT WORTH AVE
2:00 P.M., Local Time LAKELAND, FL 33809 HOUSTON, TX 77086 DALLAS, TX 75208
CONTACT DAVID VESPA RENEE CAMPBELL SHANE HOWELL
CONTRACT TERM TELEPHONE 863-984-1385 281-448-7711 214-748-5791
FAX NUMBER 863-984-0058 281-591-6827 214-748-3586

COMM [ COUNTY PRICE PER | PRICE PER| QTY PER PRICE PER | PRICE PER| QTY PER PRICE PER | PRICE PER| QTY PER
1.0 FLASHER LIGHT BARRICADE CODE ID# MFG NAME MFG # EACH CTN CTN MFG NAME MFG # EACH CTN CTN MFG NAME MFG # EACH CTN CTN
FLASHER LIGHT TO INCLUDE ALL
HARDWARE, BOLT, WRENCH,
TAMPER RESISTANT HARDWARE 550-96 3691 EMPCO ECONO $13.99 $139.90 10 Trantex LED $17.50 $167.50 10
BATTERY 12 VOLT 550-96 7205 NO BID No Bid No Bid
BATTERY 6 VOLT, TYPE HEAVY
DUTY, SPRINGTOP, RAILROAD
LANTERNS 550-96 7206 RAYOVAC 6VHD $3.50 $42.00 12 No Bid No Bid
BATTERY, 6 VOLT, TYPE GENERAL
PURPOSE, SPRING TOP 550-96 7207 RAYOVAC 6VHD $3.50 $42.00 12 $2.75 $26.50 10
REPLACEMENT BULB 550-96 3692 EMPCO 1850 $1.98 $198.00 100 N/A N/A
DELIVERY 10 DAYS 7 to 10 Days

COMM [ COUNTY
1.1 QUAD FLASH STROBE- LED CODE ID# COLOR MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG # PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION 12-24 VOLT 12-24 VOLT 12-24 VOLT
QUAD FLASH STROBE, MAGNET 212652-
MOUNT 055-57 3716 AMBER STAR 256TCLM-A $81.20 Federal Signal 02SB $88.50 NASIG LED625A $104.80
QUAD FLASH STROBE, PERMANENT 212650-
MOUNT 055-57 3717 AMBER STAR 256TCL-A $72.95 Federal Signal 02SB $76.50 NASIG LED625MXA $114.77
BULB REPLACEMENT 055-57 3718 N/A NO BID N/A
QUAD FLASH STROBE, MAGNET 256TCLM-A 252650-
MOUNT WITH WIRE GUARD 055-57 3719 AMBER STAR (274-55-TC) $114.95 Federal Signal 02SC $225.00 NASIG LED625A $131.06
QUAD FLASH STROBE, PERMANENT 256TCL-A 252651-
MOUNT WITH WIRE GUARD 055-57 3720 AMBER STAR (274-55-TC) $104.95 Federal Signal 02SC $215.00 NASIG LED625MXA $141.03
BULB REPLACEMENT 055-57 3721 N/A NO BID N/A
DELIVERY 21 Days
1.2 TRAFFIC ADVISOR DIRECTIONAL | COMM [ COUNTY
LIGHT BAR - LED CODE ID# COLOR MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION 12-24 VOLT 12-24 VOLT 12-24 VOLT

SL6S-A

DIRECTIONAL LIGHT BAR 055-57 AMBER ECCO 3315A $448.25 Federal Signal 6Head $345.00 RAISSC-Al NASIG $469.50
REPLACEMENT BULB 055-57 N/A NO BID N/A
DELIVERY 21 Days

COMM [ COUNTY
1.3 MINI LIGHT BAR CODE ID# COLOR MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION
MINI LIGHT BAR, PERMANENT
MOUNT 055-57 3722 AMBER ECCO 5580A $189.00 NASIG MMBS625A $187.93
MINI LIGHT BAR, MAGNETIC MOUNT MMBS625-
WITH CIGARETTE LIGHTER PLUG 055-57 3723 AMBER ECCO 5580A-MG $221.40 NASIG CAB $204.54
MINI LIGHT BAR, PERMANENT BLUE/AMB
MOUNT 055-57 | PENDING ER STAR 9016LED-BA $300.75 NASIG MMBC625-A $187.93
MINI LIGHT BAR, MAGNETIC MOUNT BLUE/AMB 9016LEDM- MMBS625-
WITH CIGARETTE LIGHTER PLUG 055-57 | PENDING ER STAR BA $326.75 NASIG CAB $204.54
REPLACEMENT BULBS 055-57 3724 N/A NO BID
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
ITB# 16-72 ROAD SAFETY, FLASHERS, STROBES & WARNING LIGHTS

DATE OF BID OPENING VENDOR NAME SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC. TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC. DALLAS LITE AND BARRICADE, INC.
THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016 ADDRESS 8341 EPICENTER BLVD. 3310-D FRICK RD. 1607 FORT WORTH AVE
2:00 P.M., Local Time LAKELAND, FL 33809 HOUSTON, TX 77086 DALLAS, TX 75208
CONTACT DAVID VESPA RENEE CAMPBELL SHANE HOWELL
CONTRACT TERM TELEPHONE 863-984-1385 281-448-7711 214-748-5791
FAX NUMBER 863-984-0058 281-591-6827 214-748-3586
COMM [ COUNTY
1.4 LOW PROFILE MINI LIGHT BAR CODE ID# COLOR MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH MFG NAME MFG # PRICE PER EACH
DESCRIPTION
LOW PROFILE MINI LIGHT BAR, MMBSCHO017-
PERMANENT MOUNT 055-57 3725 AMBER ECCO 5135A $119.90 NASIG CA $203.50
MAGNETIC MOUNT WITH
CIGARETTE LIGHTER PLUG 055-57 3726 AMBER ECCO 5135A-VM $144.95 NASIG MMBSHD-CA $221.00
LOW PROFILE MINI LIGHT BAR, BLUE/AMB MMBSLEDFL
PERMANENT MOUNT 055-57 9184 ER STAR 9100LED-BA $210.60 NASIG CH $203.50
LOW PROFILE MINTLTIGHT BAR,
MAGNETIC MOUNT WITH BLUE/AMB 9100LEDM- MMBSCCDF
CIGARETTE LIGHTER PLUG 055-57 9184 ER STAR BA $241.95 NASIG L-CH $221.00
REPLACEMENT BULBS 055-57 3727 N/A ECCO R5812BH $11.75
DELIVERY 10 DAYS
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS NONE NONE NONE

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

CATALOGS NOT INCLUDED

CATALOGS INCLUDED

CATALOGS NOT INCLUDED; MRG NAME & NUMBER HARD TO READ;
DID NOT SUBMIT EXCEL FILE ON FLASH DRIVE
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