BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET
BID #16-70 ROAD SAFETY REFLECTIVE SHEETING

DATE OF BID OPENING BIDDERS NAME TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS, INC. NIPPON CARBIDE INDUSTRIES USA INC.
THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016 ADDRESS 3310-D FRICK RD 13856 BETTENCOURT STREET
2:00 P.M. HOUSTON, TX 77086 CERRITOS, CA 90703
CONTRACT TERM: CONTACT RENEE CAMPBELL ANDREW KATO
TELEPHONE # 281-448-7711 800-821-4264
FAX # 281-591-6827 562-777-1811
1.0 REFLECTIVE SHEETING, CLASS
1, WITH PRESSURE SENSITIVE 3M PRODUCT ALTERNATE 3M PRODUCT ALTERNATE
ADHESIVE BACKING DIAMOND GRADE DIAMOND GRADE DIAMOND GRADE DIAMOND GRADE
PRODUCT MFG. /
1.1 Pressure sensitive rolls, 36 inch CODE / LENGTH LENGTH OF PRODUCT LENGTH OF
wide, Diamond Grade COMM CODE ITEMID |PRICE PER ROLL OF ROLL MFG. PRICE PER ROLL ROLL PRICE PER ROLL| LENGTH OF ROLL CODE PRICE PER ROLL ROLL
GREEN 801-49 7228 $1,567.50 3997/36x50 Nikkalite 92808 $1,575.00 50yards
YELLOW 801-49 7229 $1,540.00 4081/36x50 Nikkalite 92804 $1,575.00 50yards
RED 801-49 7230 $1,567.50 3992/36x50 Nikkalite 92805 $1,575.00 50yards
WHITE 801-49 7231 $1,567.50 3990/36x50 Nikkalite 92802 $1,575.00 50yards
BLUE 801-49 $1,567.50 3995/36x50 Nikkalite 92806 $1,575.00 50yards
FLUORESCENT YELLOW/GREEN 801-49 $1,540.00 4054/36x50 Nikkalite 92844 $1,800.00 50yards
FLUORESCENT ORANGE 801-49 $1,540.00 4084/36x50 Nikkalite 92847 $1,057.50 50 yards
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 3to5 15-30 days ARO
1.1 Pressure sensitive rolls, 36 inch PRICE PER LENGTH OF LENGTH OF
wide, Engineer Grade COMM CODE ITEM ID MFG. ROLL ROLL MFG. PRICE PER ROLL ROLL
Nikkalite 48012
WHITE 801-49 3M $387.50 50 Ft. Premium $387.00 50yds
Nikkalite 48003
BLACK 801-49 3M $387.50 50 Ft. premium $387.00 50yds
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 3to5 15-30 days ARO
1.2 Pressure Sensitive Rolls, 24-inch COMM COUNTY PRICE PER LENGTH OF LENGTH OF
Width Vinyl CODE ID# MFG. ROLL ROLL MFG. PRICE PER ROLL ROLL
WHITE 801-49 Oracal $111.00 50 Ft. No bid
BLACK 801-49 Oracal $111.00 50 Ft. Nikkalite $165.00 50yds
GREEN 801-49 Oracal $121.00 50 Ft. No bid
RED 801-49 Oracal $121.00 50 Ft. No bid
BLUE 801-49 Oracal $121.00 50 Ft. No bid
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 3t05 15-30 Day ARO  "BLACK ONLY"
2.0 Electro Cut (EC) Film, Non-
Reflective with pressure sensitive COMM COUNTY PRICE PER LENGTH OF LENGTH OF
adhesive. 24" WIDTH CODE ID# MFG. ROLL ROLL MFG. PRICE PER ROLL ROLL
RED 801-49 3M $478.00 50 Ft. Nikkalite 105 $285.00 50YDS
GREEN 801-49 3M $478.00 50 Ft. Nikkalite 108 $285.00 50YDS
BROWN 801-49 3M $478.00 50 Ft. Nikkalite 109 $285.00 50YDS
BLUE 801-49 3M $478.00 50 Ft. Nikkalite 106 $285.00 50YDS
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 3t05 15-30 Day ARO
2.1 APPLICATION TAPE (PRE-MASK) 3M PRODUCT | EQUIVALENT [3M PRODUCT | EQUIVALENT 3M PRODUCT EQUIVALENT | 3M PRODUCT | EQUIVALENT
MFG. NAME 3M No bid
PRODUCT NUMBER TPM No bid
TAC LEVEL High No bid
TYPE No bid
UOM| 100 YD Roll No bid
COMM COUNTY
CODE ID#
4 INCH 832-69 3401 $49.35 No bid
6 INCH 832-69 3403 $74.06 No bid
8 INCH 832-69 3405 $105.00 No bid
12 INCH 832-69 3407 $149.00 No bid
18 INCH 832-69 3409 $181.00 No bid
24 INCH 832-69 3412 $242.00 No bid
DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: 3to5
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS NONE NONE
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