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DESCRIPTION Comm COLOR

Code 1 - 9 10+ 1 - 9 10+

Windsock 035-92 3' x 8' x 11"
Red / 

Orange NO BID No Bid No Bid

Windsock 035-92 3' x 12' x 9"
Red / 

Orange NO BID No Bid No Bid

Windsock 035-92

36" (throat 
diameter) x 

12"
Bright 

Orange
SAFETY 

FLAG WS36 $83.45 $79.95 No Bid No Bid

Windsock 035-92
18" (throat 

diameter)x 8'
Bright 

Orange
SAFETY 

FLAG WS18 $45.30 $42.70 No Bid No Bid

Windsock Hardware Kit 035-92 N/A N/A
SAFETY 

FLAG HDKIT $262.00 $256.10 No Bid No Bid

Windsock 035-92
18" (throat 

diameter) x 5'
Red / 
Orange

SAFETY 
FLAG WS18/60 $45.00 $42.45 No Bid No Bid

Windsock 035-92
36" (throat 

diameter)x 8'
Red / 
Orange NO BID No Bid No Bid

Comm 
Code County ID MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

330-55 1124 MUTUAL 14993

Comm 
Code County ID MFG. NAME MFG. # MFG. NAME MFG. #

Barrier Tape, Caution Yellow 832-10 3285 3" X 1000' TRINITY 3100C

832-10 3286 3" x 1000' TRINITY 3100CCA

832-10 3287 3" x 1000' TRINITY 3100CDNE

832-10 3287 3" x 1000'

832-10 3289 N/A

1 - 9 10+ 1 - 9 10+

201-65 S 2W INT. 650C-3 $35.00 $34.60 No Bid No Bid

201-65 3381 M 2W INT. 650C-3 $35.00 $34.60 No Bid No Bid

201-65 3382 L 2W INT. 650C-3 $35.00 $34.60 No Bid No Bid

201-65 3383 XL 2W INT. 650C-3 $35.00 $34.60 No Bid No Bid

201-65 3384 2XL 2W INT. 650C-3 $35.00 $34.60 No Bid No Bid

201-65 3385 3XL 2W INT. 650C-3 $35.00 $34.60 No Bid No Bid

201-65 3385 4XL 2W INT. 650C-3 $35.00 $34.60 No Bid No Bid

201-65 3386 5XL 2W INT. 650C-3 $35.00 $34.60 No Bid No Bid

1 - 24 25+ 1 - 24 25+

550-43 3819 NO BID Trantex $49.50 $45.50

1 - 9 10+ 1 - 9 10+

350-60 554 18" x 18" 24"
SAFETY 

FLAG SF1824 $2.50 $2.50 No Bid No Bid

345-92 S MESH

345-92 3592 M MESH

345-92 3592 L MESH

345-92 3593 XL MESH

$6.95

10

$11.00

$11.00

 PRICE PER EACH

$28.40

10

$6.95

NO BID

NO BID

$6.95

NO BID

$11.00

$11.00

$11.00

$11.00

Rain suit notes: 300 denier fabric, polyester; 49" long; 2 inner leg 
snaps with form pants - N/A; corduroy color with snaps - Black; 
Badge holder - N/A; Cape-vented back - N/A; outside pocket

Days to Delivery ARO:

Comm 
Code SIZE VEST

Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure

Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure

Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure

 DOWEL
WIDTH 

County ID

Days to Delivery ARO:

FLAG SIZE

Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, sleeveless

4.1 RAIN SUIT, "RIDER" STYLE COAT

DESCRIPTION Comm 
Code

7.1 DESCRIPTION
CLASS II

Days to Delivery ARO:

Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure

1 - 9

MFG. NAME

MFG. NAME MFG. #
PRICE PER EACH

7.0  SAFETY VESTS 

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, sleeveless

Comm 
Code

10-20

MFG. #

PRICE PER EACH
County ID

Safety Flag

 *NOT 3M; SINGLE STRIPE; 4 POCKETS; 
302 MVGZ4P 

DESCRIPTION

DESCRIPTION

Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure

Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure

SIZE

Rain Suit, 60" long with snap enclosure

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, sleeveless

DESCRIPTION

Comm 
Code

County ID

3366

5.0  SAFETY DRUMS WITH BASES

6.0  SAFETY FLAGS 

DATE OF BID OPENING

2:00 P.M. C.S.T. CONTACT

Days to Delivery ARO:

County ID

7397

3368

ITB# 16-69 ROAD SAFETY, 
MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS

3365

BIDDER'S NAME

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016

3367

2.0 SAFETY / CONSTRUCTION BARRIER FENCE

CONTRACT TERM

FAX NUMBER

SIZE

863-984-1385

863-984-0058

MFG. NAME

TELEPHONE

1.0 AIRPORT WINDSOCKS 
Comm code: 035-92

MFG. #

PRICE PER EACH

Barrier Tape Dispenser

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, sleeveless

Safety Drums with bases 36" X 18" diameter

Days to Delivery ARO:

PRICE PER ROLL

PRICE PER ROLL

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33809

DAVID VESPA

MFG. #

PRICE PER EACH

10

*4 X 15 IN / 8 LBS

Barrier Tape Yellow, No Writing

Barrier Tape, Caution Do Not Enter, Yellow

Fence, Safety

Barrier Tape, Caution Construction Area, Yellow

DESCRIPTION

3.0 BARRIER TAPE (Estimated expenditure unknown)

Days to Delivery ARO:

County ID

MFG. NAME

PRICE PER ROLL

TRANTEX TRANSPORATION PRODUCTS
OF TEXAS INC.

3310-D FRICK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77086

RENEE CAMPBELL

281-448-7711

281-591-6827

MFG. NAME MFG. #

PRICE PER EACH

PRICE PER ROLL

MFG. NAME MFG. #

PRICE PER EACH

MFG. NAME MFG. #
PRICE PER EACH

MFG. NAME MFG. #

PRICE PER EACH

2 Days

 PRICE PER EACH

1 - 9 10-20

$22.50

$22.50 $21.50

$22.50

No Bid

$21.50

$21.50

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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DATE OF BID OPENING

2:00 P.M. C.S.T. CONTACT

ITB# 16-69 ROAD SAFETY, 
MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS BIDDER'S NAME

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016

CONTRACT TERM

FAX NUMBER

863-984-1385

863-984-0058

TELEPHONE

   
  

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33809

DAVID VESPA

TRANTEX TRANSPORATION PRODUCTS
OF TEXAS INC.

3310-D FRICK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77086

RENEE CAMPBELL

281-448-7711

281-591-6827

345-92 3594 2X MESH

345-92 3595 3X MESH

345-92 3596 4X MESH

345-92 5X MESH

345-92 6X MESH

345-92
S

2"

345-92 3602
M

2"

345-92
L

2"

345-92 3603
XL

2"

345-92 3604
2X 

2"

345-92 3605
3X 

2"

345-92 3606
4X 

2"

345-92
5X 

2"

345-92
6X

2"

1 - 9 10+ 1 - 9 10+

350-60 3301 12" Wood 18" EGP SZ18SSEGW $29.10 $27.95 No Bid No Bid

350-60 3302 81" PVC 18" EGP SZ18SSEGP $39.50 $37.95 No Bid No Bid

550-29 3369 2-1/2" X 3-1/2" Red TRINITY 2321R $10.75 100 No Bid

550-29 3373 2-1/2" X 3-1/2" White TRINITY 2321W $10.75 100 No Bid

1 - 99 100+ 1 - 99 100+

550-78 567 NO BID JBC 28-6/4/7 $16.50 $15.50

550-78 NO BID Dicke $38.50 $37.50

Comm 
Code County ID MFG NAME MFG# UOM PRICE / EA MFG NAME MFG# UOM PRICE / EA

NO BID No Bid

NO BID No Bid

NO BID No Bid

PIP 68-163 PAIR $7.43 No Bid

PIP 68-163 PAIR $7.95 No Bid

PIP 68-163 PAIR $8.35 No Bid

NO BID No Bid

$11.00

$11.00

$11.00

$11.00

$13.95

$13.95 $13.95

$13.95

NO BID

$11.00

$11.00

NO BID

$13.95

$13.95

$11.00

$11.00

$13.95

10-20

NO BID

$13.95 $13.95

$13.95

NO BID

 QTY PER 
BUNDLE 

REFLECTIVE 
SHEETING

MFG. NAME
MFG #

 PRICE
PER

BUNDLE 

$13.95

$13.95 $13.95

11.0 GLOVES

$13.95

10

 *NOT 3M; SINGLE STRIPE; 4 POCKETS; 
303-MVGZ4P 

1 - 9

10

10

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, short sleeve

10

MFG NAME MFG #

10.0  TRAFFIC CONES 

 RELFECTIVE 
STRIPE

SIZE 

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, short sleeve

DESCRIPTION Comm 
Code County ID

7.2 DESCRIPTION
CLASS III

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, short sleeve

DESCRIPTION

Comm 
Code

Survey Marker Flag

Days to Delivery ARO:

DESCRIPTION
REFLECTIVE SHEETING

8.0  STOP / SLOW PADDLE  (Estimated annual expenditure 
unknown) 

Days to Delivery ARO:

Stop / Slow Paddle, Octagon

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, short sleeve

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, short sleeve

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, sleeveless

County ID

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, short sleeve

Comm 
Code

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, short sleeve

COLOR

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, sleeveless

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, short sleeve

SIZE

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, sleeveless

 FLAG
SIZE 

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, sleeveless

County ID

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, sleeveless

 PADDLE 
SIZ 

9.0  SURVEY MARKER FLAGS (Estimated annual expenditure 
unknown) 

DESCRIPTION
WIRE STAFF SIZE - 21"

Stop / Slow Paddle, Octagon

County ID

Traffic Cones 28"

Survey Marker Flag

Traffic cones, 28", "pack and pop", collapsible

Unlined, Cow Grain, Leather Drivers, Keystone 
Thumb Shirred Elastic Back

XS

Unlined, Cow Grain, Leather Drivers, Keystone 
Thumb Shirred Elastic Back L

Unlined, Cow Grain, Leather Drivers, Keystone 
Thumb Shirred Elastic Back

Days to Delivery ARO:

3X

2X

 STAFF SIZE 

Vest, Orange or Lime Green, Silver reflective 
stripe, short sleeve

Unlined, Cow Grain, Leather Drivers, Keystone 
Thumb Shirred Elastic Back

PRICE PER EACH

Days to Delivery ARO:

Unlined, Cow Grain, Leather Drivers, Keystone 
Thumb Shirred Elastic Back

 SIZE 

Days to Delivery ARO:

Comm 
Code

MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE PER EACH

XL

Unlined, Cow Grain, Leather Drivers, Keystone 
Thumb Shirred Elastic Back

Unlined, Cow Grain, Leather Drivers, Keystone 
Thumb Shirred Elastic Back S

M

1 - 9 10-20

MFG #

 PRICE
PER

BUNDLE 

No Bid

$22.50 $21.50

$24.50

$22.50

$23.50

$25.50

2 Days

No Bid No Bid

 QTY PER 
BUNDLE 

No Bid

MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE PER EACH

REFLECTIVE 
SHEETING

MFG. NAME
MFG #

PRICE PER EACH

MFG NAME

$21.50

$24.50

$23.50 $22.50

$21.50

$22.50 $21.50

$22.50

$24.50

$22.50

$23.50

30 Days

$24.50

$21.50

$25.50

$22.50

$23.50

No Bid No Bid
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DATE OF BID OPENING

2:00 P.M. C.S.T. CONTACT

ITB# 16-69 ROAD SAFETY, 
MISCELLANEOUS PRODUCTS BIDDER'S NAME

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016

CONTRACT TERM

FAX NUMBER

863-984-1385

863-984-0058

TELEPHONE

   
  

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS, INC.

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33809

DAVID VESPA

TRANTEX TRANSPORATION PRODUCTS
OF TEXAS INC.

3310-D FRICK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77086

RENEE CAMPBELL

281-448-7711

281-591-6827

Comm 
Code County ID MFG NAME MFG# UOM PRICE / EA MFG NAME MFG# UOM PRICE / EA

NO BID No Bid

NO BID No Bid

TYVEK TY120 $25.00 $122.60 No Bid

TYVEK TY120 $25.00 $122.60 No Bid

TYVEK TY120 $25.00 $122.60 No Bid

TYVEK TY120 $25.00 $128.90 No Bid

TYVEK TY120 $25.00 $136.65 No Bid

TYVEK TY120 $25.00 $147.55 No Bid

TYVEK TY120 $25.00 $155.20 No Bid

Comm 
Code County ID MFG NAME MFG# UOM PRICE MFG NAME MFG# UOM PRICE

PIP 250-01-0000 PAIR $1.95 3M SF201AF
Case of 

20 $54.50

PIP 250-01-0001 PAIR $1.95 3M SF202AF
Case of 

20 $58.50

Tyvek brand, collard, disposable, white, zippered 3X

10

Tyvek brand, collard, disposable, white, zippered M

Tyvek brand, collard, disposable, white, zippered

INCLUDED

Days to Delivery ARO:

Gray, Scratch resistant

13.0 SAFETY GLASSES

DESCRIPTION

10

Clear, Scratch resistant

NONEEXCEPTIONS TO BID DOCUMENTS

BID DOCUMENTS INCLUDED

Tyvek brand, collard, disposable, white, zippered XL

Tyvek brand, collard, disposable, white, zippered 5X

Tyvek brand, collard, disposable, white, zippered

Days to Delivery ARO:

Tyvek brand, collard, disposable, white, zippered

2X

Tyvek brand, collard, disposable, white, zippered L

4X

Tyvek brand, collard, disposable, white, zippered S

XS

DESCRIPTION  SIZE 

12.0 COVERALLS

30 Days

INCLUDED

NONE
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