BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

BID #16-68 ROAD SAFETY
BARRICADES AND SHEETING

BIDDERS NAME:

DALLAS LITE AND BARRICADE INC.

NIPPON CARBIDE INDUSTRIES (USA) INC.

TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS INC

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016

BIDDERS ADDRESS

1607 FORT WORTH AVE

13856 BETTENCOURT STREET

3310-D FRICK ROAD

DALLAS, TX 75208

CERRITOS, CA 90703

HOUSTON, TX 77086

PLACING ORDERS

SHANE HOWELL

562-777-1811

2:00P.M.C.S.T. CONTACT PERSON SHANE HOWELL ANDREW KATO RENEE CAMPBELL
CONTRACT TERM TELEPHONE NUMBER 214-748-5791 ANDREW KATO 281-448-7711
FAX NUMBER 214-748-3586 800-821-4264 281-591-6827
PERSON TO CONTACTFOR

RENEE CAMPBELL

1.0 BARRICADES
Comm Code: 550-78

DESCRIPTION

COUNTY
SIZE ID#

MFG NAME

ORDER #
MFG #

PRICE PER

EACH

ORDER #
MFG #

PRICE PER

MFG NAME EACH

ORDER #
MFG #

PRICE PER

MFG NAME EACH

TYPE I

Verticle Panel (Verticade),
stackable, with carry handle, low
density polyethylene, orange &
white reflective sheeting, 20 Ib
rubber base

3959

8 X 36

TRAFFIC DEVICES

40236-FHIP20

$51.33

no bid

Lakeside Plastics VPOWHI20 $42.50

Verticle Panel (Verticade),
stackable, with carry handle, low
density polyethylene, orange &
white reflective sheeting, 30 Ib
rubber base

3959

8 X 36

TRAFFIC DEVICES

40236-FHIP30

$60.66

no bid

Lakeside Plastics VPOWHI30 $43.50

A Frame Barricade Set (Board &
Frame-one board) - Engineer
Grade with solid mold legs

TRAFFIC DEVICES RE92

44040AM151210-

$72.53

no bid

Plasticcade

203-310 EG $64.50

A Frame Barricade Set (Board &
Frame-two boards) - Engineer
Grade with solid mold legs

TRAFFIC DEVICES RE92

44040AM151210-

$109.41

no bid

Plasticcade 2003-310 EG $92.50

A Frame Barricade Set (Board &
Frame-one board) - Engineer
Grade with fillable legs

TRAFFIC DEVICES

44000 144010-ES-2

$112.00

no bid

200-A10 EG $87.50

Plasticcade

A Frame Barricade Set (Board &
Frame-two boards) - Engineer
Grade with fillable legs

TRAFFIC DEVICES

44000 144010-ES-2

$191.20

no bid

2002-A10 EG $109.50

Plasticcade

TYPE Il

Type 11 - 24” Width, Right or
Left, plastic, orange & white or
red & white reflective sheeting

3878/3879
24" [2FT

TYPE I/
PLASTIC

TRAFFIC DEVICES

37128-FHIP

$62.66

no bid

Plasticcade Fibercade Type Il HI $74.50
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DESCRIPTION SIZE ID# MFG NAME MFG # EACH MFG NAME MFG # EACH MFG NAME MFG # EACH
TYPE |11
Type Il - 72” Width, Right, Left 3890/3891/
or End of Road, plastic, orange & ) 3892
white or red & white reflective ;f(P/Eﬂ'I:IT/
sheeting PLASTIC TRAFFIC DEVICES 53006-FHIP2 $276.80 no bid Plasticade BAR TY Il 72 HI $205.00
Type Il - 96” Width, Right, Left 3896 /3897 /
or End of Road, plastic rails 8” x 3898
96”, orange & white or red & )
white reflective sheeting, 14 if( P/E8I'I:IT/
Gauge tubing, 5’ plastic supports | p AcTic TRAFFIC DEVICES 53008-FHIP2 $307.06 no bid Plasticade BAR TY Ill 96 HI $235.00
Type 11l Board,Plastic, high
intensity retroreflective sheeting,
polyethylene, "I" beam Txgr
compatible 6FT TRAFFIC DEVICES 44006-FHIP $941.53 no bid Plasticade BB6H $45.00
Type Il Board,Plastic, high
intensity retroreflective sheeting,
polyethylene, "I" beam
compatible 1"x 8"
8FT TRAFFIC DEVICES 44008-FHIP2 $122.66 no bid Plasticade BB8HI $52.00
Type Il Board,Plastic, high
intensity retroreflective sheeting,
polyethylene, "I" beam
compatible 1"x 8"
10 FT TRAFFIC DEVICES 44010-FHIP2 $133.86 no bid Plasticade BB10HI $58.50
2.0 BARRICADE TAPE PRICE PER EA PRICE PER EA PRICE PER EA
COUNTY
DESCRIPTION ITEM ID # MFG NAME MFG# MFG NAME MFG# MFG NAME MFG#
AMBER / WHITE, LEFT, 6"
STRIPE N51766 $189.33 Nikkalite N517L6 8"x50y $155.00ea NCI AWL6"-8x150 $236.00
AMBER / WHITE, RIGHT, 6"
STRIPE N517R6 $189.33 Nikkalite N517R6 8"x50y $155.00ea NCI AWR6"-8x150 $236.00
RED / WHITE, LEFT, 6"
STRIPE N515R6 $199.33 Nikkalite N515L6 8"x50y $155.00ea NCI RWL6"-8x150 $236.00
RED / WHITE, RIGHT, 6"
STRIPE N515L6 $199.33 Nikkalite N515R6 8"x50yd $155.00ea NCI RWR 6"-8x150 $236.00
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS NONE NONE NONE
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