
BID TABULATION SHEET

BID #16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & 
POSTS

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016 AT 2:00 P.M.

CONTRACT TERM

COMM 
CODE

COUNTY 
ID # 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 + 1 to 25  26 to 100 100 +

6" x 12" 801-09 1054 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.86 $1.86 $1.86 $2.09 $2.07 $2.01 NO BID $1.95 $1.90 $1.86

6" X 18" 801-09 7208 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.57 $1.57 $1.57 $2.09 $2.07 $2.03 NO BID $2.30 $2.23 $2.19

6" X 24" 801-09 7209 NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.99 $1.99 $1.99 $2.68 $2.59 $2.55 NO BID $2.80 $2.74 $2.69
6" X 24" Green (both sides) 

no white border 801-09 PENDING NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.72 $9.60 $9.50 $6.00 $5.50 $5.50 NO BID $12.50 $12.25 $12.00

6" X 24" Brown (both sides) 801-09 PENDING NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.72 $9.60 $9.50 $6.00 $5.84 $5.50 NO BID $12.50 $12.25 $12.00

6" X 30" 801-09 7210 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.58 $2.58 $2.58 $3.40 $3.34 $3.25 NO BID $3.10 $3.04 $2.98
6" X 30" Green (both sides)

no white border 801-09 PENDING NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.10 $11.92 $11.80 $7.50 $6.90 $6.90 NO BID $15.50 $15.19 $14.89

6" X 30" Brown (both sides) 801-09 PENDING NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.10 $11.92 $11.80 $7.50 $7.00 $6.90 NO BID $15.50 $15.19 $14.89

6" X 36" 801-09 7211 NO BID NO BID NO BID $3.16 $3.16 $3.16 $3.74 $3.72 $3.59 NO BID $4.00 $3.92 $3.84
6" X 36" Green (both sides)

no white border 801-09 PENDING NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.47 $14.33 $14.19 $8.58 $8.06 $8.06 NO BID $16.80 $16.46 $16.13

6" X 36" Brown (both sides) 801-09 PENDING NO BID NO BID NO BID $14.47 $14.33 $14.19 $8.58 $8.22 $8.06 NO BID $16.80 $16.46 $16.13

9" X 12" 801-09 PENDING NO BID NO BID NO BID $1.64 $1.64 $1.64 $2.14 $2.07 $2.01 NO BID $1.92 $1.88 $1.84

12" x 18" 801-09 837 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.88 $2.88 $2.88 $3.91 $3.90 $3.76 NO BID $3.38 $3.31 $3.24

12" x 36" 801-09 2261 NO BID NO BID NO BID $6.11 $6.11 $6.11 $7.11 $7.07 $7.06 NO BID $7.19 $7.05 $6.91

18" x 18" 801-09 838 NO BID NO BID NO BID $4.32 $4.32 $4.32 $5.48 $5.41 $5.35 NO BID $5.08 $4.98 $4.88

18" x 24" 801-09 839 NO BID NO BID NO BID $5.77 $5.77 $5.77 $7.08 $6.99 $6.90 NO BID $6.70 $6.57 $6.44

24" x 8" 801-09 840 NO BID NO BID NO BID $2.62 $2.62 $2.62 $3.29 $3.24 $3.12 NO BID $3.90 $3.82 $3.74

24" x 24" 801-09 841 NO BID NO BID NO BID $7.65 $7.65 $7.65 $9.50 $9.38 $9.27 NO BID $9.30 $9.11 $8.93

24" x 30" 801-09 1654 NO BID NO BID NO BID $9.56 $9.56 $9.56 $11.80 $11.65 $11.51 NO BID $11.20 $10.98 $10.76

24" x 36" 801-09 2191 NO BID NO BID NO BID $11.40 $11.40 $11.40 $14.16 $13.99 $13.81 NO BID $14.10 $13.82 $13.54

24" x 48" 801-09 3277 NO BID NO BID NO BID $15.76 $15.76 $15.76 $18.71 $18.65 $18.61 NO BID $19.00 $18.62 $18.25
30" x 30"

(Diamond Shape) 801-09 843 NO BID NO BID NO BID $12.06 $12.06 $12.06 $14.75 $14.57 $14.53 NO BID $14.90 $14.60 $14.31

30" Octagon 801-09 844 NO BID NO BID NO BID $10.72 $10.72 $10.72 $13.55 $13.40 $13.35 NO BID $13.60 $13.33 $13.06
36" x 36"

(Diamond Shape) 801-09 847 NO BID NO BID NO BID $18.01 $18.01 $18.01 $20.98 $20.55 $20.29 NO BID $21.30 $20.87 $20.45

36 " Octagon 801-09 878 NO BID NO BID NO BID $16.05 $16.05 $16.05 $19.55 $19.34 $18.66 NO BID $18.00 $17.64 $17.29

36" Yield (measures 30" wide) 801-09 849 NO BID NO BID NO BID $8.31 $8.31 $8.31 $11.37 $11.30 $11.10 NO BID $10.85 $10.63 $10.42

36" Round 801-09 850 NO BID NO BID NO BID $17.75 $17.75 $17.75 $19.55 $19.34 $18.66 NO BID $21.85 $21.41 $20.98

EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS AND CONDITIONS

Days to deliver 30 DAYS ARO

NONE

NO BID

NONE

BIDDERS  NAME

FRANKFORT, OH 45628
22 E. SPRINGFIELD ST.

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO, LLC

QUOTED BY

CONTACT PERSON DAVID LIGHTLE

DAVID LIGHTLE

      
QUANTITIES SHOWN

TELEPHONE NO.
FAX NUMBER

DESCRIPTION: 1.0 ALUMINUM SIGN BLANKS
740-998-5364
740-998-5363

      
QUANTITIES SHOWN

5-21 (Stock ships 24-48 hrs/average 
production ships 5-7 days depending on qty)

      
QUANTITIES SHOWN

NONE

NO BID 30 Days

251-943-1544
800-633-6845

      
QUANTITIES SHOWN

DAVID B VEVIACQUA

      
QUANTITIES SHOWN

866-656-0495
888-905-5665
ALEX HOEGG

ALEX HOEGG
JACKSON, MS 39232

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORATON

DAVID B VEVIACQUA
FOLEY, AL 36535
408 E BERRY AVE

VULCAN INC SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS
8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33804-0764
DAVID VESPA

TRANTEX TRANSPORTATON PRODUCTS 
OF TEXAS INC

3310- D FRICK RD
HOUSTON, TX 77086
H STEVEN NELSON

DAVID VESPA
863-984-1385
863-984-0058

DOUG HOTTEL
281-448-7711
281-591-6827



ITEM NO.
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#

DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+

1 12 X 36 Bridge Marker R OM-3R 7213 $19.04 $18.75 NO BID NO BID $16.38 $16.10 $17.49 $17.49 NO BID NO BID

2 12 X 36 Bridge Marker L OM-3L 7215 $19.04 $18.75 NO BID NO BID $16.38 $16.10 $17.49 $17.49 NO BID NO BID

3
18 X 18  Advisory Speed Plate (Blank) 
MPH W13-1P 4479 $15.22 $15.00 NO BID NO BID $12.94 $12.79 $13.15 $13.15 NO BID NO BID

4
18 X 18    Brazoria County Road Number 
Green / White 4481 $19.86 $19.56 NO BID NO BID $16.89 $16.52 $14.00 $14.00 NO BID NO BID

5 24 X 18   County Maintenance Begins 4487 $20.37 $20.06 NO BID NO BID $17.32 $17.32 $17.49 $17.49 NO BID NO BID

6 24 X 18   County Maintenance Ends 4488 $20.37 $20.06 NO BID NO BID $17.32 $17.32 $17.49 $17.49 NO BID NO BID

7 24 X 18   End Detour M4-8a 4491 $18.59 $18.31 NO BID NO BID $15.81 $15.81 $17.49 $17.49 NO BID NO BID

8 24 X 18 Cell Phone Use Prohibited S7-1T $20.37 $20.06 NO BID NO BID $17.31 $17.31 $17.49 $17.49 NO BID NO BID

9 24 X 30   Speed Limit (Blank) MPH R2-1 4498 $32.82 $32.33 NO BID NO BID $27.90 $27.90 $29.07 $29.07 NO BID NO BID

10
24 X 30   Speed Limit (with Numbers) 
MPH R2-1-XX 4499 $32.82 $32.33 NO BID NO BID $27.90 $27.90 $29.07 $29.07 NO BID NO BID

11 24 X 30   Reduced Speed Ahead W3-5a 4500 $31.54 $31.07 NO BID NO BID $26.82 $26.82 $29.07 $29.07 NO BID NO BID

12 24 X 30   No Parking R8-3a 4502 $31.54 $31.07 NO BID NO BID $26.82 $26.82 $29.07 $29.07 NO BID NO BID

13 24 X 30   Weight Limit (Blank) Tons R12-1 4503 $31.54 $31.07 NO BID NO BID $26.82 $26.82 $29.07 $29.07 NO BID NO BID

14
24 X 30   Weight Limit ( with Numbers) 
Tons W12-1 4504 $32.80 $32.31 NO BID NO BID $27.82 $27.82 $29.07 $29.07 NO BID NO BID

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF 
OHIO LLC

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

800-633-6845 888-905-5665

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

740-998-5363

DAVID R LIGHTLE

CUSTOM PRODUCTS 
CORPORATON

740-998-5364866-656-0495

FOLEY, AL 36535

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

863-984-0058

BID TABULATION SHEET

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016 AT 2:00 P.M.

DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS  NAME SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTSBID #16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & POSTS VULCAN INC

H STEVEN NELSON DAVID B VEVIACQUA

HOUSTON, TX 77086

TRANTEX TRANSPORTATON 
PRODUCTS OF TEXAS INC

408 E BERRY AVE8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33804-0764

281-448-7711

281-591-6827

TELEPHONE NO.

22 E SPRINGFIELD ST

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

DAVID R LIGHTLE

JACKSON, MS 39232

ALEX HOEGG

ALEX HOEGG

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

DAVID B VEVIACQUA

251-943-1544

863-984-1385

3310- D FRICK RD

2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE 
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

FAX NUMBER

QUOTED BY

DOUG HOTTEL

DAVID VESPA

CONTRACT TERM CONTACT PERSON DAVID VESPA

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 



ITEM NO.
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#

DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF 
OHIO LLC

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

800-633-6845 888-905-5665

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

740-998-5363

DAVID R LIGHTLE

CUSTOM PRODUCTS 
CORPORATON

740-998-5364866-656-0495

FOLEY, AL 36535

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

863-984-0058

BID TABULATION SHEET

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016 AT 2:00 P.M.

DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS  NAME SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTSBID #16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & POSTS VULCAN INC

H STEVEN NELSON DAVID B VEVIACQUA

HOUSTON, TX 77086

TRANTEX TRANSPORTATON 
PRODUCTS OF TEXAS INC

408 E BERRY AVE8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33804-0764

281-448-7711

281-591-6827

TELEPHONE NO.

22 E SPRINGFIELD ST

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

DAVID R LIGHTLE

JACKSON, MS 39232

ALEX HOEGG

ALEX HOEGG

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

DAVID B VEVIACQUA

251-943-1544

863-984-1385

3310- D FRICK RD

2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE 
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

FAX NUMBER

QUOTED BY

DOUG HOTTEL

DAVID VESPA

CONTRACT TERM CONTACT PERSON DAVID VESPA

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

15 24 X 30   No Dumping Allowed R19-5T 4505 $31.54 $31.07 NO BID NO BID $26.82 $26.82 $29.07 $29.07 NO BID NO BID

16 24 X 30   Do Not Pass R4-1 4506 $31.54 $31.07 NO BID NO BID $26.82 $26.82 $29.07 $29.07 NO BID NO BID

17 24 X 30 Chevron Alignment (Right) W1-8R $32.82 $32.33 NO BID NO BID $27.90 $27.90 $29.07 $29.07 NO BID NO BID

18 24 X 30 Chevron Alighnment (Left) W1-8L $32.82 $32.33 NO BID NO BID $27.90 $27.90 $29.07 $29.07 NO BID NO BID

19 24 X 30 No Thru Trucks R10-9A $31.54 $31.07 NO BID NO BID $26.82 $26.82 $29.07 $29.07 NO BID NO BID

20
24 X 36   Weight Limit - Axle or Tandem 
(Blank) LBS

R12-4 or
R12-5 4507 $37.86 $37.48 NO BID NO BID $32.19 $32.19 $34.15 $34.15 NO BID NO BID

21
24 X 36   Weight Limit - Tandem Axle 
(Blank) LBS

R12-4 or
R12-5 4508 $37.86 $37.48 NO BID NO BID $32.19 $32.19 $34.15 $34.15 NO BID NO BID

22 30 STOP R1-1 4509 $41.62 $41.20 NO BID NO BID $35.39 $35.39 $35.38 $35.38 NO BID NO BID

23

 g  g     
Message - Water Over Road / Drive 
Friendly 7219 $82.36 $81.57 NO BID NO BID $71.30 $71.30 $57.08 $57.08 NO BID NO BID

24 30 X 24   Detour (Florescent Orange)
M4-9R or

M4-9L 4510 $31.54 $31.07 NO BID NO BID $26.82 $26.82 $27.71 $27.71 NO BID NO BID

25 30 X 30   Right - Left Turn W-1-1R(L) 4511 $40.50 $40.10 NO BID NO BID $34.87 $34.87 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

26 30 X 30   Right - Left Curve (Yellow) W1-2R(L) 4512 $40.50 $40.10 NO BID NO BID $34.87 $34.87 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

27
30 X 30   Right - Left Reverse Turn 
(Yellow) W1-3R(L) 4513 $40.50 $40.10 NO BID NO BID $34.87 $34.87 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

28
30 X 30   Right - Left Reverse Curve 
(Yellow) W1-4R(L) 4514 $40.50 $40.10 NO BID NO BID $34.87 $34.87 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID



ITEM NO.
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#

DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF 
OHIO LLC

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

800-633-6845 888-905-5665

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

740-998-5363

DAVID R LIGHTLE

CUSTOM PRODUCTS 
CORPORATON

740-998-5364866-656-0495

FOLEY, AL 36535

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

863-984-0058

BID TABULATION SHEET

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016 AT 2:00 P.M.

DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS  NAME SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTSBID #16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & POSTS VULCAN INC

H STEVEN NELSON DAVID B VEVIACQUA

HOUSTON, TX 77086

TRANTEX TRANSPORTATON 
PRODUCTS OF TEXAS INC

408 E BERRY AVE8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33804-0764

281-448-7711

281-591-6827

TELEPHONE NO.

22 E SPRINGFIELD ST

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

DAVID R LIGHTLE

JACKSON, MS 39232

ALEX HOEGG

ALEX HOEGG

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

DAVID B VEVIACQUA

251-943-1544

863-984-1385

3310- D FRICK RD

2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE 
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

FAX NUMBER

QUOTED BY

DOUG HOTTEL

DAVID VESPA

CONTRACT TERM CONTACT PERSON DAVID VESPA

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

29
30 X 30   Right - Left Winding Road 
(Yellow) W1-5R(L) 4515 $40.50 $40.10 NO BID NO BID $34.87 $34.87 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

30 30 X 30   Cross Road W2-1 4516 $40.50 $40.10 NO BID NO BID $34.87 $34.87 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

31 30 X 30   Side Road W2-2R(L) 4517 $40.50 $40.10 NO BID NO BID $34.87 $34.87 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

32 30 X 30   T Symbol W2-4 4518 $40.50 $40.10 NO BID NO BID $34.87 $34.87 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

33 30 X 30   Y Symbol W2-5 4519 $39.30 $38.90 NO BID NO BID $33.53 $33.53 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

34 30 X 30   Bump W8-1 4520 $39.30 $38.90 NO BID NO BID $33.53 $33.53 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

35 30 X 30   Dip W8-2 4521 $39.30 $38.90 NO BID NO BID $33.53 $33.53 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

36 30 X 30   Soft Shoulder W8-4 4522 $39.30 $38.90 NO BID NO BID $33.53 $33.53 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

37 30 X 30 No Shoulder W8-23 $39.30 $38.90 NO BID NO BID $33.53 $33.53 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

38 30 X 30   Narrow Bridge W5-2 4523 $39.30 $38.90 NO BID NO BID $33.53 $33.53 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

39 30 X 30   Pavement Ends W8-3 4524 $39.30 $38.90 NO BID NO BID $33.53 $33.53 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

40 30 X 30   Dead End W14-1 4526 $39.30 $38.90 NO BID NO BID $33.53 $33.53 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

41 30 X 30   Cattle Guard W17-4T 4528 $39.30 $38.90 NO BID NO BID $33.53 $33.53 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

42 30 X 30   Slow Down on Wet Road W8-5aT 4529 $39.30 $38.90 NO BID NO BID $33.53 $33.53 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID



ITEM NO.
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#

DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF 
OHIO LLC

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

800-633-6845 888-905-5665

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

740-998-5363

DAVID R LIGHTLE

CUSTOM PRODUCTS 
CORPORATON

740-998-5364866-656-0495

FOLEY, AL 36535

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

863-984-0058

BID TABULATION SHEET

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016 AT 2:00 P.M.

DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS  NAME SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTSBID #16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & POSTS VULCAN INC

H STEVEN NELSON DAVID B VEVIACQUA

HOUSTON, TX 77086

TRANTEX TRANSPORTATON 
PRODUCTS OF TEXAS INC

408 E BERRY AVE8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33804-0764

281-448-7711

281-591-6827

TELEPHONE NO.

22 E SPRINGFIELD ST

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

DAVID R LIGHTLE

JACKSON, MS 39232

ALEX HOEGG

ALEX HOEGG

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

DAVID B VEVIACQUA

251-943-1544

863-984-1385

3310- D FRICK RD

2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE 
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

FAX NUMBER

QUOTED BY

DOUG HOTTEL

DAVID VESPA

CONTRACT TERM CONTACT PERSON DAVID VESPA

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

43
30 X 30   Fresh Oil 5 MPH (Florescent 
Orange) CW21-2 4530 $39.30 $38.90 NO BID NO BID $33.53 $33.53 $33.43 $33.43 NO BID NO BID

44 30 X 30   High Water 4531 $39.30 $38.90 NO BID NO BID $33.53 $33.53 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

45
30 X 30   Railroad Advance Warning (for 
parallel roads) W10-3R(L) 4537 $39.30 $38.90 NO BID NO BID $33.53 $33.53 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

46
30 X 30   Stop Ahead (SYMBOL
ONLY) W3-1 4538 $42.00 $41.60 NO BID NO BID $35.70 $35.70 $44.90 $44.90 NO BID NO BID

47 30 X 30   Yield Ahead (Symbol Only) W3-2 4539 $42.00 $41.60 NO BID NO BID $35.70 $35.70 $44.90 $44.90 NO BID NO BID

48 30 X 30 No Outlet W14-2 $40.50 $40.10 NO BID NO BID $34.87 $34.87 $35.63 $35.63 NO BID NO BID

49 36 STOP R1-1 4540 $59.67 $59.25 NO BID NO BID $51.20 $51.20 $49.86 $49.86 NO BID NO BID

50 36 YIELD (measures 30" wide) R1-2 4541 $28.85 $28.60 NO BID NO BID $24.52 $24.52 $24.06 $24.06 NO BID NO BID

51 36 Railroad Advance Warning W10-1 4543 $56.60 $56.05 NO BID NO BID $48.12 $48.12 $50.95 $50.95 NO BID NO BID

52 36 School Crossing Sign S4-3P 4545 $19.90 $19.70 NO BID NO BID $16.89 $16.89 $51.25 $51.25 NO BID NO BID

53 36 x 36    Stop Ahead W3-1 4546 $62.45 $61.90 NO BID NO BID $53.10 $53.10 $63.56 $63.56 NO BID NO BID

54 36 x 36    Yield Ahead W3-2 4547 $62.45 $61.90 NO BID NO BID $53.10 $53.10 $63.56 $63.56 NO BID NO BID

55 36 x 36    One Lane Bridge W5-3 4548 $56.75 $56.20 NO BID NO BID $48.28 $48.28 $50.95 $50.95 NO BID NO BID

56 36 x 36    Load Zoned Bridge W12-5T 4549 $56.75 $56.20 NO BID NO BID $48.28 $48.28 $50.95 $50.95 NO BID NO BID



ITEM NO.
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#

DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF 
OHIO LLC

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

800-633-6845 888-905-5665

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

740-998-5363

DAVID R LIGHTLE

CUSTOM PRODUCTS 
CORPORATON

740-998-5364866-656-0495

FOLEY, AL 36535

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

863-984-0058

BID TABULATION SHEET

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016 AT 2:00 P.M.

DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS  NAME SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTSBID #16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & POSTS VULCAN INC

H STEVEN NELSON DAVID B VEVIACQUA

HOUSTON, TX 77086

TRANTEX TRANSPORTATON 
PRODUCTS OF TEXAS INC

408 E BERRY AVE8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33804-0764

281-448-7711

281-591-6827

TELEPHONE NO.

22 E SPRINGFIELD ST

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

DAVID R LIGHTLE

JACKSON, MS 39232

ALEX HOEGG

ALEX HOEGG

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

DAVID B VEVIACQUA

251-943-1544

863-984-1385

3310- D FRICK RD

2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE 
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

FAX NUMBER

QUOTED BY

DOUG HOTTEL

DAVID VESPA

CONTRACT TERM CONTACT PERSON DAVID VESPA

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

57 36 x 36    Road Narrows W5-1 4550 $56.75 $56.20 NO BID NO BID $48.28 $48.28 $50.95 $50.95 NO BID NO BID

58 36 x 36    Truck Advance Crossing W11-10L(R) 4551 $56.75 $56.20 NO BID NO BID $48.28 $48.28 $50.95 $50.95 NO BID NO BID

59 36 x 36    Fire Truck Advance Crossing W11-8R(L) 4552 $56.75 $56.20 NO BID NO BID $48.28 $48.28 $50.95 $50.95 NO BID NO BID

60 36 x 36    Playground Sign W15-1 4553 $56.75 $56.20 NO BID NO BID $48.28 $48.28 $50.95 $50.95 NO BID NO BID

61
36 x 36    Road Work Ahead (Florescent 
Orange) CW20-10 4554 $56.75 $56.20 NO BID NO BID $48.28 $48.28 $48.53 $48.53 NO BID NO BID

62
36 x 36    Workers Ahead (Florescent 
Orange) SYMBOL ONLY CW21-1aT 4555 $56.75 $56.20 NO BID NO BID $48.28 $48.28 $48.53 $48.53 NO BID NO BID

63
36 x 36    Workers Ahead (Florescent 
Orange)WORDS CW21-1bT 4555 $56.75 $56.20 NO BID NO BID $48.28 $48.28 $48.53 $48.53 NO BID NO BID

64 48 x 24   Large Arrow W1-6R(L) 4556 $52.50 $52.00 NO BID NO BID $44.64 $44.64 $45.61 $45.61 NO BID NO BID

65 48 X 24 Double Headed Arrow W1-7 7414 $65.60 $65.00 NO BID NO BID $44.64 $44.64 $45.61 $45.61 NO BID NO BID

66
48 X 24 School Zone (Speed and Time 
Blank) SS-1 $63.10 $62.60 NO BID NO BID $48.05 $48.05 $53.13 $53.17 NO BID NO BID

67 48 x 30   Road Closed R11-2 4557 $65.75 $65.15 NO BID NO BID $55.80 $55.80 $56.61 $56.61 NO BID NO BID

68
48 X 30 Road Work Ahead (Florescent 
Orange) CW20-1D $63.50 $62.95 NO BID NO BID $53.65 $53.65 $56.61 $56.61 NO BID NO BID

69
48 x 48    Detour (Blank) Feet (Florescent 
Orange) CW20-2 4559 $57.80 $57.30 NO BID NO BID $49.14 $49.14 $87.49 $87.49 NO BID NO BID

70
48 x 48    Road Closed Ahead (Florescent 
Orange) CW20-3D 4560 $57.80 $57.30 NO BID NO BID $49.14 $49.14 $87.49 $87.49 NO BID NO BID



ITEM NO.
Size / Description TX DOT # COUNTY ID#

DG 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+ 1-50 51+

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF 
OHIO LLC

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

800-633-6845 888-905-5665

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

740-998-5363

DAVID R LIGHTLE

CUSTOM PRODUCTS 
CORPORATON

740-998-5364866-656-0495

FOLEY, AL 36535

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

863-984-0058

BID TABULATION SHEET

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016 AT 2:00 P.M.

DATE OF BID OPENING

BIDDERS  NAME SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTSBID #16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & POSTS VULCAN INC

H STEVEN NELSON DAVID B VEVIACQUA

HOUSTON, TX 77086

TRANTEX TRANSPORTATON 
PRODUCTS OF TEXAS INC

408 E BERRY AVE8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33804-0764

281-448-7711

281-591-6827

TELEPHONE NO.

22 E SPRINGFIELD ST

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

DAVID R LIGHTLE

JACKSON, MS 39232

ALEX HOEGG

ALEX HOEGG

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

DAVID B VEVIACQUA

251-943-1544

863-984-1385

3310- D FRICK RD

2.0 FABRICATED SIGNS - DIAMOND GRADE 
PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

FAX NUMBER

QUOTED BY

DOUG HOTTEL

DAVID VESPA

CONTRACT TERM CONTACT PERSON DAVID VESPA

PRICE EA. WHEN ORDERED 
IN QUANTITIES AS SHOWN 

71
48 x 48    Flagger Ahead (Florescent 
Orange) WORDS CW20-7aD 4561 $57.80 $57.30 NO BID NO BID $49.14 $49.14 $87.49 $87.49 NO BID NO BID

72
48 x 48    Flagger Ahead (Florescent 
Orange) SYMBOL CW20-7  4561 $57.80 $57.30 NO BID NO BID $49.14 $49.14 $87.49 $87.49 NO BID NO BID

73 48 STOP R1-1 4562 $104.40 $103.50 NO BID NO BID $88.78 $88.78 $88.81 $88.81 NO BID NO BID

N/A30

15-21 (stock ships 24-48 hrs 
average production order ships 
3-5 working days depending on 

qty) Days to deliver ARO 30 days N/A



PAGE  1 OF 8
O  COU   U O  

SHEET

BID # 16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & 
POSTS

BIDDERS  
NAME

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016

2:00 C.S.T. QUOTED BY

CONTRACT TERM: TELEPHONEFAX 
NUMBER

3.0 CUSTOM FABRICATED SIGN
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY ID
#

DUNES ARE PROTECTED 
KEEP OUT

NO GLASS CONTAINERS
ALLOWED ON BEACH

UP TO $500 FINE 801-83 3325

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

4.0 ROLL UP CONSTRUCTION SIGNS & 
STANDS

4.1 ROLL UP CONSTRUCTION SIGNS
ITEM ID#801-60

COUNTY ID
# TXMUTCD#

MFG 
NAME MFG # 1-9  10 + 

MFG 
NAME MFG # 1-9  10 + MFG # MFG # MFG # MFG #

36" X 36" ROADWORK AHEAD 3617 CW20-1D Trantex $34.50 $32.00
SAFETY 
ZONE 1MS36RWA $28.50 $28.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

36"X36" WORKERS AHEAD CS21-1bT Trantex $34.50 $32.00
SAFETY 
ZONE 1MS36WA $28.50 $28.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

36" X 36" ROADWORK 5 MPH 3621 Trantex $34.50 $32.00
SAFETY 
ZONE 1MS36RW5 $28.50 $28.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

36" X 36" FLAGGER AHEAD 3623 Trantex $34.50 $32.00
SAFETY 
ZONE 1MS36FA $28.50 $28.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

36" X 36" LOOSE GRAVEL 3625 Trantex $34.50 $32.00
SAFETY 
ZONE 1MS36LG $28.50 $28.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

36" X 36" YIELD 3627 Trantex $34.50 $32.00
SAFETY 
ZONE 1MS36YLD $28.50 $28.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

36" X 36" SLIPPERY WHEN WET 3629 Trantex $34.50 $32.00
SAFETY 
ZONE 1MS36SWW $28.50 $28.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

36"X36" ONE LANE AHEAD Trantex $34.50 $32.00
SAFETY 
ZONE 1MS36OLA $28.50 $28.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

36" X 36" CUSTOM SIGN 3631 Trantex $49.50 $47.00
SAFETY 
ZONE

1MS36CUS
TOM $40.00 $39.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

48" X 48" ROADWORK AHEAD 3618 W20-1D Trantex $42.50 $39.50
SAFETY 
ZONE 1MS48RWA $35.00 $33.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

48"X48" WORKERS AHEAD 3620
CW21-1aT
CW21-1bT Trantex $42.50 $39.50

SAFETY 
ZONE 1MS48WA $35.00 $33.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

48" X 48" ROADWORK 5 MPH 3622 Trantex $42.50 $39.50
SAFETY 
ZONE 1MS48RW5 $35.00 $33.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

48" X 48" FLAGGER AHEAD 3624
CW20-7

CW20-7aD Trantex $42.50 $39.50
SAFETY 
ZONE 1MS48FA $35.00 $33.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

48" X 48" LOOSE GRAVEL 3626 CW8-7 Trantex $42.50 $39.50
SAFETY 
ZONE 1MS48LG $35.00 $33.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

48" X 48" YIELD 3628 R1-2 Trantex $44.50 $41.50
SAFETY 
ZONE 1MS48YLD $35.00 $33.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

20.23

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33804-0764

DAVID VESPA

863-984-1385

DAVID B BEVIACQUA

281-591-6827 863-984-0058 251-943-1544

TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS INC.

3310-D FRICK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77086

H STEVEN NELSON

`VULCAN INC.

PRICE PER QTY

NO BID

408 E BERRY AVE

FOLEY, AL 36536-1850

DAVID B BEVIACQUA

800-633-6845

PRICE PER QTY

PRICE PER EA

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS INC.

CONTACT RENEE CAMPBELL DAVID VESPA

N/A 30

PRICE EA BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES SHOWN

PRICE PER EA

$32.00

281-448-7711

PRICE EA BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES SHOWN

10-14 DAYS

PRICE EA BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES SHOWN

PRICE PER QTY

PRICE PER EA



PAGE  2 OF 8
O  COU   U O  

SHEET

BID # 16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & 
POSTS

BIDDERS  
NAME

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016

2:00 C.S.T. QUOTED BY

CONTRACT TERM: TELEPHONEFAX 
NUMBER

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33804-0764

DAVID VESPA

863-984-1385

DAVID B BEVIACQUA

281-591-6827 863-984-0058 251-943-1544

TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS INC.

3310-D FRICK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77086

H STEVEN NELSON

`VULCAN INC.

408 E BERRY AVE

FOLEY, AL 36536-1850

DAVID B BEVIACQUA

800-633-6845

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS INC.

CONTACT RENEE CAMPBELL DAVID VESPA

       

281-448-7711

              
48" X 48" SLIPPERY WHEN WET 3630 CW8-SaT Trantex $42.50 $39.50

SAFETY 
ZONE 1MS48SWW $35.00 $33.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

48"X48" MERGE (WITH VELCRO-
INTERCHANGABLE LEFT OR RIGHT) CW8-2TL(R) Trantex $54.50 $51.50

SAFETY 
ZONE

1MS48MLS 
W/OL $39.50 $37.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

48"X48" ONE LANE AHEAD Trantex $42.50 $39.50
SAFETY 
ZONE 1MS48OLA $35.00 $33.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

48" X 48" CUSTOM SIGN 3632 Trantex $59.50 $57.50
SAFETY 
ZONE

1MS48CUS
TOM $44.00 $43.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

4.2 ROLL UP SIGN STAND
COMM CODE: 801-60

COUNTY ID
# TXMUTCD#

MFG 
NAME MFG # 1-9  10 + 

MFG 
NAME MFG # 1-9  10 + 

MFG 
NAME MFG # 1-9  10 + 

36" X 36" RIBS FOR SIGN 3654 Trantex N/A $12.75 $11.50 FASTEC RIBS36 $8.35 $8.15 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

48" x 48" STAND 3655 Trantex N/A $97.50 $92.50

DICKE 
TOOL 
COMPANY DL1003W $76.80 $74.50

48" x 48" RIBS FOR SIGN 3656 Trantex N/A $16.75 $15.00 FASTEC RIBS48 $10.50 $10.40

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

5.0 DELINEATORS
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY ID
#

MFG 
NAME MFG #  1-50  51 + 

MFG 
NAME MFG #  1-50  51 + MFG NAME MFG #  1-50  51 + 

2 PART EXPOXY FOR SURFACE 
MOUNT SHALL INCLUDE ONE (1) 
GALLON EPOXY AND ONE (1) GALLON 
CATALLIST 3871

Industrial 
Coatings B-22 $77.80 $75.50 NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

CARSONITE POST, FLAT, DRIVABLE, 2 
SIDED DIAMOND GRADE REFLECTIVE 
SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP, AMBER 
COLOR; LENGTH 62" 550-41 3854 Carsonite

DGS3012-
02B/S $19.75 $18.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

CARSONITE POST, CONCAVE, 
DRIVABLE, 2 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE 
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH 
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 62" 550-41 3856 Carsonite

DG3012-
02 $19.75 $18.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

STUB, ANCHOR FOR CONCAVE POST 550-41 3858 Carsonite 66AATT $5.75 $5.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

CARSONITE POST DRIVER 550-41 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NO BID 

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

N/A

N/A10 DAYS
PRICE EACH POST WHEN 

ORDERED IN QTY'S AS 
SHOWN

N/A N/A

6MD400                    $170.00

21 Days

PRICE EACH POST WHEN 
ORDERED IN QTY'S AS 

SHOWN

10

PRICE EACH POST WHEN 
ORDERED IN QTY'S AS 

SHOWN

10-14 DAYS

10-14 DAYS



PAGE  3 OF 8
O  COU   U O  

SHEET

BID # 16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & 
POSTS

BIDDERS  
NAME

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016

2:00 C.S.T. QUOTED BY

CONTRACT TERM: TELEPHONEFAX 
NUMBER

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33804-0764

DAVID VESPA

863-984-1385

DAVID B BEVIACQUA

281-591-6827 863-984-0058 251-943-1544

TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS INC.

3310-D FRICK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77086

H STEVEN NELSON

`VULCAN INC.

408 E BERRY AVE

FOLEY, AL 36536-1850

DAVID B BEVIACQUA

800-633-6845

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS INC.

CONTACT RENEE CAMPBELL DAVID VESPA

       

281-448-7711

              6.0 PAVEMENT MARKERS

6.1 RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY ID
#

MFG 
NAME MFG # UOM PKG

MFG 
NAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 +

MFG 
NAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 +

TYPE 1-C (SINGLE RELFECTIVE FACE, 
WHITE) 550-30 917 Ray-O-Lite 1-C 1 Box 50/Box NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TYPE II-A-A (TWO REFLECTIVE 
FACES, BOTH AMBER) 550-30 918 Ray-O-Lite IIAA 1 Box 50/Box NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TYPE II-C-R (TWO REFLECTIVE 
FACES; WHITE APPROACHING, RED 
TRAILING) 550-30 919 Ray-O-Lite IICR 1 Box 50/Box NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TYPE II-C-C (TWO REFLECTIVE 
FACES; BOTH WHITE) 550-30 3310 Ray-O-Lite IICC 1 Box 50/Box NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TYPE II -BLUE 550-30 Ray-O-Lite IIBB 1 Box 50/Box NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EPOXY FOR RAISED PAVEMENT 
MARKER 550-30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

EPOXY GUN 550-30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SELF ADHESIVE-TYPE 1-C (SINGLE 
REFLECTIVE FACE, WHITE) 550-30 3M 1CSA 1 Box 100/Box NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SELF ADHESIVE-TYPE II-A-A(TWO 
REFLECTIVE FACES, BOTH AMBER) 550-30 3M IIAASA 1 Box 100/Box NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SELF ADHESIVE-TYPE II-C-R (TWO 
RELFECTIVE FACES;WHITE 
APPROACHING, RED TRAILING) 550-30 3M IICRSA 1 Box 100/Box NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SELF ADHESIVE-TYPE II-C-C (TWO 
REFLECTIVE FACES; BOTH WHITE) 550-30 3M IICCSA 1 Box 100/Box NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SELF ADHESIVE-TYPE II-BLUE 550-30 3M IIBBSA 1 Box 100/Box NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO: N/A

PRICE PER UOM PRICE PER UOM

N/A

Aecel                600CC Epoxy             Cartridge             
Each

Aecel                600CC Epoxy Gun             Cartridge             
Each   

$148.00

3-5 DAYS

$49.00

$49.00

$49.00

$57.50

$21.75

$49.00

$242.00

$242.00

$242.00

$242.00

$228.00

PRICE PER UOM



PAGE  4 OF 8
O  COU   U O  

SHEET

BID # 16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & 
POSTS

BIDDERS  
NAME

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016

2:00 C.S.T. QUOTED BY

CONTRACT TERM: TELEPHONEFAX 
NUMBER

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33804-0764

DAVID VESPA

863-984-1385

DAVID B BEVIACQUA

281-591-6827 863-984-0058 251-943-1544

TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS INC.

3310-D FRICK ROAD

HOUSTON, TX 77086

H STEVEN NELSON

`VULCAN INC.

408 E BERRY AVE

FOLEY, AL 36536-1850

DAVID B BEVIACQUA

800-633-6845

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS INC.

CONTACT RENEE CAMPBELL DAVID VESPA

       

281-448-7711

              6.2 TEMPORARY MARKERS
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY ID
#

MFG 
NAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 +

MFG 
NAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 +

MFG 
NAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 +

TEMPORARY MARKER, 
POLYURETHANE, TWO-WAY CHIP 
SEAL MARKER WITH COVERS AND 
ADHESIVE BASE; COLOR: YELLOW 
#932-2Y 550-34 6329 Pexco

TRPM 4" 
Y2WZ Box 500/ Box $220.00 $200.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

TEMPORARY MARKER, 
POLYURETHANE, TWO-WAY CHIP 
SEAL MARKER WITH COVERS AND 
ADHESIVE BASE; COLOR: WHITE #932-
2W 550-34 7036 Pexco

TRPM 4" 
W2WZ Box 500/ Box $230.00 $210.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

6.3 END OF ROAD MARKER
COMM CODE: 801-83

COUNTY ID
# TXMUTCD#

MFG 
NAME MFG # 1-25 25+

MFG 
NAME MFG # 1-25 25+

MFG 
NAME MFG # 1-25 25+

RED ON RED 9, BUTTON, 18 X 18 3299 OM4-1 CPC
S1818OM41

HBA 37.5 $34.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID VULCAN EOR-18RR 17.95 $16.95

YELLOW ON YELLOW, 9 BUTTON, 18 X 
18 OM1-1 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

N/A N/A

30 DAYS10-14 Days NA/

5-7 Days



PAGE  5 OF 8
O  COU   U O  

SHEET

BID # 16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & 
POSTS

BIDDERS  
NAME

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016

2:00 C.S.T. QUOTED BY

CONTRACT TERM: TELEPHONEFAX 
NUMBER

3.0 CUSTOM FABRICATED SIGN
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY ID
#

DUNES ARE PROTECTED 
KEEP OUT

NO GLASS CONTAINERS
ALLOWED ON BEACH

UP TO $500 FINE 801-83 3325

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

4.0 ROLL UP CONSTRUCTION SIGNS & 
STANDS

4.1 ROLL UP CONSTRUCTION SIGNS
ITEM ID#801-60

COUNTY ID
# TXMUTCD#

36" X 36" ROADWORK AHEAD 3617 CW20-1D

36"X36" WORKERS AHEAD CS21-1bT

36" X 36" ROADWORK 5 MPH 3621

36" X 36" FLAGGER AHEAD 3623

36" X 36" LOOSE GRAVEL 3625

36" X 36" YIELD 3627

36" X 36" SLIPPERY WHEN WET 3629

36"X36" ONE LANE AHEAD

36" X 36" CUSTOM SIGN 3631

48" X 48" ROADWORK AHEAD 3618 W20-1D

48"X48" WORKERS AHEAD 3620
CW21-1aT
CW21-1bT

48" X 48" ROADWORK 5 MPH 3622

48" X 48" FLAGGER AHEAD 3624
CW20-7

CW20-7aD

48" X 48" LOOSE GRAVEL 3626 CW8-7

48" X 48" YIELD 3628 R1-2

CONTACT

MFG # MFG # MFG # MFG # MFG # MFG # 1-9  10 + 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

JACKSON, MS 39232

ALEX HOEGG

888-905-5665

ALEX HOEGG

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO, LLC

22 E SPRINGFIELD ST

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

DAVID R LIGHTLE

740-998-5363

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORATON

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

PRICE EA BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES SHOWN

30

PRICE PER QTY

PRICE PER EA

15-21

PRICE PER QTY

PRICE EA BLANK WHEN ORDERED IN QUANTITIES SHOWN

866-656-0495 740-998-5364

PRICE PER EA

18.26 Each with DG3 4090 12 year material

DAVID R LIGHTLE

$18.50



PAGE  6 OF 8
O  COU   U O  

SHEET

BID # 16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & 
POSTS

BIDDERS  
NAME

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016

2:00 C.S.T. QUOTED BY

CONTRACT TERM: TELEPHONEFAX 
NUMBER

CONTACT

48" X 48" SLIPPERY WHEN WET 3630 CW8-SaT

48"X48" MERGE (WITH VELCRO-
INTERCHANGABLE LEFT OR RIGHT) CW8-2TL(R)

48"X48" ONE LANE AHEAD

48" X 48" CUSTOM SIGN 3632

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

4.2 ROLL UP SIGN STAND
COMM CODE: 801-60

COUNTY ID
# TXMUTCD#

36" X 36" RIBS FOR SIGN 3654

48" x 48" STAND 3655

48" x 48" RIBS FOR SIGN 3656

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

5.0 DELINEATORS
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY ID
#

2 PART EXPOXY FOR SURFACE 
MOUNT SHALL INCLUDE ONE (1) 
GALLON EPOXY AND ONE (1) GALLON 
CATALLIST 3871

CARSONITE POST, FLAT, DRIVABLE, 2 
SIDED DIAMOND GRADE REFLECTIVE 
SHEETING 12 INCH STRIP, AMBER 
COLOR; LENGTH 62" 550-41 3854

CARSONITE POST, CONCAVE, 
DRIVABLE, 2 SIDED DIAMOND GRADE 
REFLECTIVE SHEETING 12 INCH 
STRIP, AMBER COLOR; LENGTH 62" 550-41 3856

STUB, ANCHOR FOR CONCAVE POST 550-41 3858

CARSONITE POST DRIVER 550-41

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

JACKSON, MS 39232

ALEX HOEGG

888-905-5665

ALEX HOEGG

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO, LLC

22 E SPRINGFIELD ST

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

DAVID R LIGHTLE

740-998-5363

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORATON

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

              

866-656-0495 740-998-5364

DAVID R LIGHTLE

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

MFG 
NAME MFG # 1-9  10 + 

MFG 
NAME MFG # 1-9  10 + 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID MDI 36" RIBS $19.50 $19.25

MDI 5018K-1 $125.00 $121.00

MDI 48" RIBS $23.25 $22.95

MFG NAME MFG #  1-50  51 + MFG NAME MFG #  1-50  51 + 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID CARSONITE

SDA KIT
22 OZ 

TUBES  $    42.81  $    39.95 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID CARSONITE
CRM-
306201 $15.20 $14.88

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID CARSONITE
CFTM30620
1 $15.40 $14.98

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID CARSONITE
ANCHOR 
INSTALLED $2.25 $1.95

N/A

N/A

*18" STEEL U CHANNEL
ANCHOR

*SEE PAGE INSERTS

15-28

PRICE EACH POST WHEN 
ORDERED IN QTY'S AS 

SHOWN

NO BID

15-28

RMTLPDRL $165.00

PRICE EACH POST WHEN 
ORDERED IN QTY'S AS 

SHOWN



PAGE  7 OF 8
O  COU   U O  

SHEET

BID # 16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & 
POSTS

BIDDERS  
NAME

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016

2:00 C.S.T. QUOTED BY

CONTRACT TERM: TELEPHONEFAX 
NUMBER

CONTACT

6.0 PAVEMENT MARKERS

6.1 RAISED PAVEMENT MARKERS
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY ID
#

TYPE 1-C (SINGLE RELFECTIVE FACE, 
WHITE) 550-30 917

TYPE II-A-A (TWO REFLECTIVE 
FACES, BOTH AMBER) 550-30 918

TYPE II-C-R (TWO REFLECTIVE 
FACES; WHITE APPROACHING, RED 
TRAILING) 550-30 919

TYPE II-C-C (TWO REFLECTIVE 
FACES; BOTH WHITE) 550-30 3310

TYPE II -BLUE 550-30

EPOXY FOR RAISED PAVEMENT 
MARKER 550-30

EPOXY GUN 550-30

SELF ADHESIVE-TYPE 1-C (SINGLE 
REFLECTIVE FACE, WHITE) 550-30

SELF ADHESIVE-TYPE II-A-A(TWO 
REFLECTIVE FACES, BOTH AMBER) 550-30

SELF ADHESIVE-TYPE II-C-R (TWO 
RELFECTIVE FACES;WHITE 
APPROACHING, RED TRAILING) 550-30

SELF ADHESIVE-TYPE II-C-C (TWO 
REFLECTIVE FACES; BOTH WHITE) 550-30

SELF ADHESIVE-TYPE II-BLUE 550-30

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

JACKSON, MS 39232

ALEX HOEGG

888-905-5665

ALEX HOEGG

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO, LLC

22 E SPRINGFIELD ST

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

DAVID R LIGHTLE

740-998-5363

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORATON

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

              

866-656-0495 740-998-5364

DAVID R LIGHTLE

MFG 
NAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 +

MFG 
NAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 +

3M RPMM290W $1.13 EA 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3M 
RPMM291Y

Y $1.18 EA 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3M RPMM290WR $1.19 EA 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3M 
RPMM290W

W $1.18 EA 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3M 
RPMM295B

B $1.19 EA 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3M
RPMMPSA2

90W $2.23 EA 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3M
RPMMPSA2

91YY $2.35 EA 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3M
RPMPSA29

0WR $2.35 EA 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3M
RPMPSA29

0WW $2.35 EA 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

3M
RPMPSA29

5BB $2.50 EA 100 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

PRICE PER UOM

10-15 WORKING DAYS N/A

PRICE PER UOM



PAGE  8 OF 8
O  COU   U O  

SHEET

BID # 16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS & 
POSTS

BIDDERS  
NAME

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016

2:00 C.S.T. QUOTED BY

CONTRACT TERM: TELEPHONEFAX 
NUMBER

CONTACT

6.2 TEMPORARY MARKERS
COMM 
CODE

COUNTY ID
#

TEMPORARY MARKER, 
POLYURETHANE, TWO-WAY CHIP 
SEAL MARKER WITH COVERS AND 
ADHESIVE BASE; COLOR: YELLOW 
#932-2Y 550-34 6329

TEMPORARY MARKER, 
POLYURETHANE, TWO-WAY CHIP 
SEAL MARKER WITH COVERS AND 
ADHESIVE BASE; COLOR: WHITE #932-
2W 550-34 7036

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

6.3 END OF ROAD MARKER
COMM CODE: 801-83

COUNTY ID
# TXMUTCD#

RED ON RED 9, BUTTON, 18 X 18 3299 OM4-1

YELLOW ON YELLOW, 9 BUTTON, 18 X 
18 OM1-1

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

JACKSON, MS 39232

ALEX HOEGG

888-905-5665

ALEX HOEGG

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO, LLC

22 E SPRINGFIELD ST

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

DAVID R LIGHTLE

740-998-5363

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORATON

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

              

866-656-0495 740-998-5364

DAVID R LIGHTLE

MFG 
NAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 +

MFG 
NAME MFG # UOM PKG 1-9 10 +

Traffic 
Supply RPMMCYY EA 500 $0.53 N/A APEX

CHIP SEAL 
2W Y BOX 500/BOX $257.50 $244.50

Traffic 
Supply RPMMCWW EA 500 $0.53 N/A APEX

CHIP SEAL 
2W W BOX 500/BOX $257.50 $244.50

MFG 
NAME MFG # 1-25 25+

MFG 
NAME MFG # 1-25 25+

CPC 
S1818OM41

3BA  $31.30 $31.30 STELLO OM4-1 $23.50 $19.50

15-21 working days 30

7
*Must order in full boxes only of qty 500/box **lead time is 5-7 working days for 

delivery average



1 of 4

BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

BID #16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS 
& POSTS

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016

2:00 P.M. C.S.T.

CONTRACT TERM:

8.0 SIGN POSTS

8.1 GALVANIZED
COMM
CODE

COUNTY ID
# LENGTH MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE PER 
POST

PRICE PER
BUNDLE

 SIZE OF 
BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE PER 
POST

PRICE PER
BUNDLE

 SIZE OF 
BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE PER 
POST

PRICE PER
BUNDLE

 SIZE OF 
BUNDLE 

GALVANIZED, ROUND, 16 GA 801-30 894 12' TRINITY
2.3/8" X 
16GA $22.50 $832.50 37 Trinity $21.84 $808.08 37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

8.2 U-CHANNEL
COMM
CODE

COUNTY ID
# LENGTH MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE PER 
POST

PRICE PER
BUNDLE

 SIZE OF 
BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE PER 
POST

PRICE PER
BUNDLE

 SIZE OF 
BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE PER 
POST

PRICE PER
BUNDLE

 SIZE OF 
BUNDLE 

U-CHANNEL, 2 LB., GALVANIZED 801-30 901 10' FRANKLIN 2# GALV $18.00 $825.00 50
Chicago 
Heights $19.10 $955.00 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

U-CHANNEL,2 LB., GALVANIZED 801-30 902 12' FRANKLIN 2#GALV $21.60 $960.00 50
Chicago 
Heights $22.95 $1,147.50 50 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

8.3 SOCKETS & WEDGES
COMM
CODE

COUNTY ID
# LENGTH MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE PER 
POST

PRICE PER
BUNDLE

 SIZE OF 
BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE PER 
POST

PRICE PER
BUNDLE

 SIZE OF 
BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE PER 
POST

PRICE PER
BUNDLE

 SIZE OF 
BUNDLE 

POZ-LOC SOCKETS 801-30 1045 TRINITY 720745G-27" $18.86 $360.50 25 Trinity $14.75 $545.75 37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

WEDGES FOR POZ-LOC 
SOCKETS 801-30 3850 TRINITY 720750G $3.97 $82.00 25 Trinity $3.45 $127.65 37 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

9.0 SLOW MOVING VEHICLE

COMM
CODE COUT COLOR MFG NAME MFG # 1 - 9 10 + MFG NAME MFG # 1 - 9 10 + MFG NAME MFG # 1 - 9 10 +

SIGN WITH MOUNTING BRACKET, 16" X 
14" 801-83 2567 RED / ORANGE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Trantex N/A $30.50 $29.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SIGN ONLY, 16" X 14" 8010-83 3306 RED / ORANGE NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID Trantex N/A $13.50 $13.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

DAVID R LIGHTLE

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS INC

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33804-0764

DAVID VESPA

TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS 
INC

H STEVEN NELSON

HOUSTON, TX 77086

3310-D FRICK ROAD

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

N/A10-14 DAYS

281-591-6827
281-448-7711

CONTACT RENEE CAMPBELL

FAX NUMBER

TELEPHONE

DAVID VESPA

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO,LLC

22 E SPRINGFIELD ST

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

N/A

PRICE PER UOM

14 TO 21 DAYS NO BID

PRICE PER UOM

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

DAVID R LIGHTLE

PRICE PER UOM

740-998-5363
740-998-5364

30-45

863-984-1385
863-984-0058



2 of 4

BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

BID #16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS 
& POSTS

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016

2:00 P.M. C.S.T.

CONTRACT TERM:

DAVID R LIGHTLE

SAFETY ZONE SPECIALISTS INC

8341 EPICENTER BLVD

LAKELAND, FL 33804-0764

DAVID VESPA

TRANTEX TRANSPORTATION PRODUCTS OF TEXAS 
INC

H STEVEN NELSON

HOUSTON, TX 77086

3310-D FRICK ROAD

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

281-591-6827
281-448-7711

CONTACT RENEE CAMPBELL

FAX NUMBER

TELEPHONE

DAVID VESPA

LIGHTLE ENTERPRISES OF OHIO,LLC

22 E SPRINGFIELD ST

FRANKFORT, OH 45628

DAVID R LIGHTLE

740-998-5363
740-998-5364

863-984-1385
863-984-0058

10.0 SIGN CAPS AND CROSS BLADES
COMM
CODE

COUNTY ID
# MFG #

PRICE 
1-9

PRICE 
10 +

PRICE PER
BOX

 QTY IN 
BOX MFG #

PRICE 
1-9

PRICE 
10 +

PRICE PER
BOX

 QTY IN 
BOX MFG #

PRICE 
1-9

PRICE 
10 +

PRICE PER
BOX

 QTY IN 
BOX 

SIGN, CAP, 2-3/8" ROUND, FLAT 801-12 2041 DYNA 5.5" $3.40 $3.30 $147.50 50 $3.95 $3.75 $93.75 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SIGN, MOUNTING BRACKET SET,
2-3/8", Z238 801-12 2045 DYNA Z238 $1.85 $1.80 $145.00 100 $3.25 $3.10 $77.50 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 90 DEGREE 
FLAT 801-12 2046 DYNA 5.5" $3.30 $3.25 $144.00 50 $3.80 $3.60 $90.00 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 180 DEGREE, 
FLAT 801-12 2048 DYNA 5.5" $3.30 $3.25 $144.00 50 $5.75 $5.50 $137.50 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

SIGN, BLADE, CROSSPIECE, FLAT 801-12 2050 DYNA 5.5" $3.90 $3.80 $166.00 50 $5.75 $5.50 $137.50 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

BRACKET, Z238 ALUMINUM INTER 
LOCK 8010-12 6658

DYNA Z238 B-
B $2.70 $2.64 $240.00 100 $3.95 $3.75 $93.75 25 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

10.0 SIGN CAPS AND CROSS BLADES
COMM
CODE

COUNTY ID
# MFG #

PRICE 
1-9

PRICE 
10 +

PRICE PER
BOX

 QTY IN 
BOX 

SIGN, CAP, 2-3/8" ROUND, FLAT 801-12 2041 DYNA 12" $9.85 $9.70 $184.00 20

SIGN, MOUNTING BRACKET SET,
2-3/8", Z238 801-12 2045 DYNA Z238 $1.85 $1.80 $145.00 100

SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 90 DEGREE 
FLAT 801-12 2046 DYNA 12" $8.95 $8.80 $166.00 20

SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 180 DEGREE, 
FLAT 801-12 2048 DYNA 12" $8.95 $8.80 $166.00 20

SIGN, BLADE, CROSSPIECE, FLAT 801-12 2050 DYNA 12" $10.98 $10.76 $208.00 20

BRACKET, Z238 ALUMINUM INTER 
LOCK 8010-12 6658

DYNA Z238 B-
B $2.70 $2.64 $240.00 100

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

14 10-14 DAYS N/A

14



3 of 4

BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

BID #16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS 
& POSTS

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016

2:00 P.M. C.S.T.

CONTRACT TERM:

8.0 SIGN POSTS

8.1 GALVANIZED
COMM
CODE

COUNTY ID
# LENGTH

GALVANIZED, ROUND, 16 GA 801-30 894 12'

8.2 U-CHANNEL
COMM
CODE

COUNTY ID
# LENGTH

U-CHANNEL, 2 LB., GALVANIZED 801-30 901 10'

U-CHANNEL,2 LB., GALVANIZED 801-30 902 12'

8.3 SOCKETS & WEDGES
COMM
CODE

COUNTY ID
# LENGTH

POZ-LOC SOCKETS 801-30 1045

WEDGES FOR POZ-LOC 
SOCKETS 801-30 3850

9.0 SLOW MOVING VEHICLE

COMM
CODE COUT COLOR

SIGN WITH MOUNTING BRACKET, 16" X 
14" 801-83 2567 RED / ORANGE

SIGN ONLY, 16" X 14" 8010-83 3306 RED / ORANGE

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

CONTACT

FAX NUMBER

TELEPHONE

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

MFG NAME MFG #
PRICE PER 

POST
PRICE PER
BUNDLE

 SIZE OF 
BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE PER 
POST

PRICE PER
BUNDLE

 SIZE OF 
BUNDLE 

TRINITY $23.82 $881.34 37 Trinity RPORG12 $21.48 $794.76 37

MFG NAME MFG #
PRICE PER 

POST
PRICE PER

BUNDLE
 SIZE OF 
BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE PER 
POST

PRICE PER
BUNDLE

 SIZE OF 
BUNDLE 

NUCOR $17.32 $866.00 50
Chicago 
Heights RPOCG102 $18.19 $909.50 50

NUCOR $20.78 $1,039.00 50
Chicago 
Heights RPOCG122 $21.80 $1,090.00 50

MFG NAME MFG #
PRICE PER 

POST
PRICE PER

BUNDLE
 SIZE OF 
BUNDLE MFG NAME MFG #

PRICE PER 
POST

PRICE PER
BUNDLE

 SIZE OF 
BUNDLE 

TRINITY $13.55 $677.50 50 Trinity 

RPORZPOZ
LOCSOCKE

T $13.48 $498.76 37

TRINITY $3.02 $151.00 50 Trinity 
RPORZR208
SOCWEDGE $3.55 $131.35 37

MFG NAME MFG # 1 - 9 10 + MFG NAME MFG # 1 - 9 10 +

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

VULCAN INC.

408 E BERRY AVENUE

FOLEY, AL 36536-1850

DAVID B BEVIACQUA

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORATON

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

JACKSON, MS 39232

ALEX HOEGG

ALEX HOEGG

N/A

PRICE PER UOMPRICE PER UOM

N/A

DAVID B BEVIACQUA

Stock ships 24-48 hrs (non stock posts may take 60-90 days for 
delivery county would be notified of availability at time of order) 

888-905-5665

866-656-0495

800-633-6845
251-943-1544

30
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BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION SHEET

BID #16-67 ROAD SAFETY SIGNS 
& POSTS

DATE OF BID OPENING

THURSDAY, JULY 28, 2016

2:00 P.M. C.S.T.

CONTRACT TERM:

  

BIDDERS  NAME

QUOTED BY

CONTACT

FAX NUMBER

TELEPHONE

10.0 SIGN CAPS AND CROSS BLADES
COMM
CODE

COUNTY ID
#

SIGN, CAP, 2-3/8" ROUND, FLAT 801-12 2041

SIGN, MOUNTING BRACKET SET,
2-3/8", Z238 801-12 2045

SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 90 DEGREE 
FLAT 801-12 2046

SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 180 DEGREE, 
FLAT 801-12 2048

SIGN, BLADE, CROSSPIECE, FLAT 801-12 2050

BRACKET, Z238 ALUMINUM INTER 
LOCK 8010-12 6658

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

10.0 SIGN CAPS AND CROSS BLADES
COMM
CODE

COUNTY ID
#

SIGN, CAP, 2-3/8" ROUND, FLAT 801-12 2041

SIGN, MOUNTING BRACKET SET,
2-3/8", Z238 801-12 2045

SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 90 DEGREE 
FLAT 801-12 2046

SIGN, CAP, U-CHANNEL, 180 DEGREE, 
FLAT 801-12 2048

SIGN, BLADE, CROSSPIECE, FLAT 801-12 2050

BRACKET, Z238 ALUMINUM INTER 
LOCK 8010-12 6658

DAYS TO DELIVER ARO:

VULCAN INC.

408 E BERRY AVENUE

FOLEY, AL 36536-1850

DAVID B BEVIACQUA

CUSTOM PRODUCTS CORPORATON

1120 FLOWOOD DRIVE

JACKSON, MS 39232

ALEX HOEGG

ALEX HOEGGDAVID B BEVIACQUA

888-905-5665

866-656-0495

800-633-6845
251-943-1544

MFG #
PRICE 

1-9
PRICE 
10 +

PRICE PER
BOX

 QTY IN 
BOX MFG #

PRICE 
1-9

PRICE 
10 +

PRICE PER
BOX

 QTY IN 
BOX 

MD 
SOLUTIONS $4.32 $4.32 $216.00 50 RPB922F $3.75 $3.10 $155.00 50

MD 
SOLUTIONS $2.95 $2.95 $73.75 25 RPBZ238 $3.50 $3.26 $163.00 50

MD 
SOLUTIONS $3.89 $3.89 $194.50 50

RPB91UFOL9
0 $3.75 $3.10 $155.00 50

MD 
SOLUTIONS $3.89 $3.89 $194.50 50

RPB91UFNU
180 $3.75 $3.10 $155.00 50

MD 
SOLUTIONS $4.40 $4.40 $220.00 50 RPB990F $3.75 $3.10 $155.00 50

VULCAN $2.50 $2.50 $125.00 50
RPBZ238 

EACH $1.75 $1.63 $163.00 100

5  TO 14 Calendar days (Stock itesm ship 24-48 hrs)30

PRICE FOR 12" BLADE HOLDER IS $9.25 EACH

ADDITIONAL INFO
FABRICATED SIGNS - ITEM# 52 - PRICE BASED ON 36" X 
12" 

END OF ROAD MARKERS - PRICE BASED ON 9 
REFLECTIVE RED BUTTONS ON RED BAKED ENAMEL .063 
GAUGE ALUMINUM

SIGN CAPS AND CROSS BLADES - PRICE BASED ON 5 1/2" 
BLADE HOLDER.
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