ITB #16-64 GASOLINE AND DIESEL FOR
BRAZORIA COUNTY

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 8, 2016

MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY OF GAINESVILLE,
INC.

TRUMAN ARNOLD COMPANIES DBA TAC
ENERGY

MIDTEX OIL, LP

SC FUELS

PETROLEUM TRADERS

PETROPANGEA, INC.

INDIGO ENERGY PARTNERS, LLC

1025 AIRPORT PWY, SW

100 CRESCENT COURT, SUITE 1600

1519 IH45 SOUTH

1800 W. KATELLA AVENUE, #400

7120 POINTE INVERNESS WAY

2206 GLENEAGLES DR.

222 MAIN STREET

2:00P.M., CS.T. GAINESVILLE, GA 30501 DALLAS, TX 75201 CONROE, TX 77301 ORANGE, CA 92867 FORT WAVYNE, IN 46804 LEAGUE CITY, TX 77573 GAINESVILLE, GA 30501
CONTRACT TERM DAVID ZARFOSS CASEY BOSTAIN JANE TUMLINSON KAREN KOEP GAYLE NEWTON MARDI PHILLIPS CHRIS KEENER
800-255-6699 800-808-6500 936-756-4469 805-389-3550 800-348-3705 OPTION 4 281-334-9110 678-514-7339
678-450-2242 469-547-6724 936-756-1038 805-389-3554 260-203-3820 678-928-4925
mocbids@mansfieldoil.com chostain@tacenergy.com jane@midtexoil.com koepk@scfuels.com gnewton@petroleumtraders.com petropangea24@gmail.com ckeene
DESCRIPTION

UNLEADED GASOLINE

8500 7000 MAY BE COMBINATION OF GAS AND
Transport Load 8500 8000 8600 7500 **PLEASE SEE ATTACHED TX FEE LETTER 8600 DIESEL
Differential added to OPIS avg daily rate for
Houston region/gallon -0.00570 0.00940 0.00980 -0.01110 -0.01010 0.09000 0.05100
State tax/gallon 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000 0.25000 0.20000
Federal Oil Spill recovery tax/gallon 0.00170 0.001715 0.00190 0.001714 0.00171 0.00190 0.00171
LUST Tax/gallon 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100
Total price per gallon 0.19700 0.19340 0.21270 0.191614 + TX load fee of $11.00 0.19260 1.83970 0.25370
<8500
Tank Wagon Load 500 4000 4000 NO BID **PLEASE SEE ATTACHED TX FEE LETTER 4500 NO BID
Differential added to OPIS avg daily rate for
Houston region/gallon 0.15690 0.14010 0.13610 NO BID 0.07930 0.25000
State tax/gallon 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000 NO BID 0.20000 0.25000
Federal Oil Spill recovery tax/gallon 0.00170 0.001715 0.00190 NO BID 0.00171 0.00190
LUST Tax/gallon 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100 NO BID 0.00100
Total price per gallon 0.35960 0.34280 0.33900 NO BID 0.28200 1.99970
SUPER UNLEADED GASOLINE
8500 7000 MAY BE COMBINATION OF GAS AND
Transport Load 8500 8000 8600 7500 **PLEASE SEE ATTACHED TX FEE LETTER 8600 DIESEL
Differential added to OPIS avg daily rate for
Houston region/gallon -0.04620 -0.19770 0.00980 -0.15100 -0.01760 0.10000 -0.07530
State tax/gallon 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000 0.25000 0.20000
Federal Oil Spill recovery tax/gallon 0.00170 0.00175 0.00190 0.001714 0.00171 0.00190 0.00171
LUST Tax/gallon 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100
Total price per gallon 0.15650 0.00510 0.21270 .051714 +TX LOAD FEE OF $11.00 0.1851 2.2804 0.12740
<7500
Tank Wagon Load 500 4000 4000 NO BID **PLEASE SEE ATTACHED TX FEE LETTER 4500.00 NO BID
Differential added to OPIS avg daily rate for
Houston region/gallon 0.15690 -0.08520 0.13610 NO BID 0.07930 0.25000
State tax/gallon 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000 NO BID 0.20000 0.25000
Federal Oil Spill recovery tax/gallon 0.00170 0.00175 0.00190 NO BID 0.00171 0.00190
LUST Tax/gallon 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100 NO BID 0.00100
Total price per gallon 0.35960 0.11750 0.33900 NO BID 0.2820 2.4304

NO. 2 DIESEL LOW SULPHUR
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DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 8, 2016

MANSFIELD OIL COMPANY OF GAINESVILLE,
INC.

TRUMAN ARNOLD COMPANIES DBA TAC
ENERGY

MIDTEX OIL, LP

SC FUELS

PETROLEUM TRADERS

PETROPANGEA, INC.

INDIGO ENERGY PARTNERS, LLC

1025 AIRPORT PWY, SW

100 CRESCENT COURT, SUITE 1600

1519 IH45 SOUTH

1800 W. KATELLA AVENUE, #400

7120 POINTE INVERNESS WAY

2206 GLENEAGLES DR.

222 MAIN STREET

2:00P.M., CS.T. GAINESVILLE, GA 30501 DALLAS, TX 75201 CONROE, TX 77301 ORANGE, CA 92867 FORT WAVYNE, IN 46804 LEAGUE CITY, TX 77573 GAINESVILLE, GA 30501
CONTRACT TERM DAVID ZARFOSS CASEY BOSTAIN JANE TUMLINSON KAREN KOEP GAYLE NEWTON MARDI PHILLIPS CHRIS KEENER
800-255-6699 800-808-6500 936-756-4469 805-389-3550 800-348-3705 OPTION 4 281-334-9110 678-514-7339
678-450-2242 469-547-6724 936-756-1038 805-389-3554 260-203-3820 678-928-4925
mocbids@mansfieldoil.com chostain@tacenergy.com jane@midtexoil.com koepk@scfuels.com gnewton@petroleumtraders.com petropangea24@gmail.com ckeener@indigoener
DESCRIPTION

7500 7000 MAY BE COMBINATION OF GAS AND
Transport Load 7500 7000 7400 **PLEASE SEE ATTACHED TX FEE LETTER 7500 DIESEL
Differential added to OPIS avg daily rate for
Houston region/gallon 0.01660 0.03630 0.01880 0.01010 0.01210 0.11000 0.05650
State tax/gallon 0.20000 0.19000 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000 0.25000 0.20000
Federal Oil Spill recovery tax/gallon 0.00190 0.00181 0.00190 0.001905 0.00190 0.00190 0.00190
LUST Tax/gallon 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100
Total price per gallon 0.21950 0.22910 0.22170 .213005 + TX LOAD FEE OF $8.65 0.2150 1.8955 0.25940

<7500

Tank Wagon Load 500.00 4000.00 4000.0000 NO BID **PLEASE SEE ATTACHED TX FEE LETTER 4500.00 NO BID
Differential added to OPIS avg daily rate for
Houston region/gallon 0.15570 0.18190 0.13610 NO BID 0.07930 0.25000
State tax/gallon 0.20000 0.19000 0.20000 NO BID 0.20000 0.25000
Federal Oil Spill recovery tax/gallon 0.00190 0.00181 0.00190 NO BID 0.00190 0.00190
LUST Tax/gallon 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100 NO BID 0.00100
Total price per gallon 0.35860 0.37470 0.33900 NO BID 0.2822 2.0355

DELIVERY

24 HOURS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER

24 HOURS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER

36 HOURS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER

24-48 HRS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER

24 HOURS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER

6 HOURS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER

24 HOURS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER

ADDITIONAL INFO

N/A

WE WILL NOT FURNISH TANKS, BUT WILL BE
HAPPY TO DISCUSS TANK RENTAL AND
MAINTENANCE.

LIQUIDATED DAMAGES: DUE TO TERMINAL
OUTAGES & ACTS OF GOD, WE CANNOT
AGREE TO BULLET "A".

TANKS CAN BE SUPPLIED AT NO CHARGE.
HOWEVER, A ONE-TIME DELIVERY FEE OF

$750.00 PER TANK WILL BE ASSESSED.

CAN NOT DELIVER TO AIRPORT OR
MOSQUITO CONTROL; SUPPLIED DOES NOT
FURNISH TANKS. PUMP CHARGE IS INCLUDED
IN OUR PRICE.

TANKS CANNOT BE FURNISHED

TANKS CAN BE LOANED FOR EXLUSIVE ON
FUEL. TANKS CAN BE RENTED DURING
HURRICAN SEASON OR DURING
EMERGENCIES. PRICE BASED UPON TANK

SIZE.

TANKS NOT AVAILABLE;
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ITB #16-64 GASOLINE AND DIESEL FOR
BRAZORIA COUNTY

DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 8, 2016

HOUSTON-PASADENA APACHE OIL COMPANY
LP

BAY OIL COMPANY

SUN COAST RESOURCES, INC.

PINNACLE PETROLEUM, INC.

5136 SPENCER HIGHWAY

2201 FM 517 E.

6405 CAVALCADE, BUILDING 1

16651 GEMINI LANE

2:.00P.M., CS.T. PASADENA, TX 77505 DICKINSON, TX 77539 HOUSTON, TX 77026 HUNTINGTON BEACH, CA 92647
CONTRACT TERM JEREMY YEPES JAKE MARSICO TERRI BATEMAN OR LISA MOORE LIZ MCKINLEY
281-487-5400 281-337-4673 713-429-6702 714-841-8877
281-487-7606 281-614-5949 713-429-8409 714-841-8855
lyepes@apacheoilcompany.com jakeboc@gmail.com national@suncoastresources.com Imckinley@pinnaclepetrolaum.com
DESCRIPTION
UNLEADED GASOLINE
8000 GAL MINIMUM DELIVERY
** DEMURRAGE WILL OCCUR AT THE RATE OF
$1.25 PER MINUTE SHOULD UNLOADING TIME
EXCEED 1 HOUR THROUGH NO FAULT OF SUN
Transport Load 6500 + 7500 COAST 4501 - 8600
Differential added to OPIS avg daily rate for
Houston region/gallon 0.01460 0.07000 0.01990 -0.00190
State tax/gallon 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000
Federal Oil Spill recovery tax/gallon 0.00170 0.001715 0.00171 0.00171
LUST Tax/gallon 0.00000 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100
Total price per gallon 0.21630 0.272715 0.22261 0.20081
1500 GAL MINIMUM DELIVERY
(LOADS UNDER 1500 GAL MINIMUM WILL HAVE
Tank Wagon Load UP TO 4500 4000 A SEPARATE DELIVERY FEE OF $125.00 500 - 4500
Differential added to OPIS avg daily rate for
Houston region/gallon 0.09500 0.12000 0.14660 0.10160
State tax/gallon 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000
Federal Oil Spill recovery tax/gallon 0.00170 0.001715 0.00171 0.00171
LUST Tax/gallon 0.00000 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100
Total price per gallon 0.29670 0.322715 0.34931 0.30431
SUPER UNLEADED GASOLINE
8000 GAL MINIMUM DELIVERY
** DEMURRAGE WILL OCCUR AT THE RATE OF
$1.25 PER MINUTE SHOULD UNLOADING TIME
EXCEED 1 HOUR THROUGH NO FAULT OF SUN
Transport Load NO BID 7500 COAST 4501 - 8600
Differential added to OPIS avg daily rate for
Houston region/gallon -0.04000 0.01990 -0.00190
State tax/gallon 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000
Federal Oil Spill recovery tax/gallon 0.001715 0.00171 0.00171
LUST Tax/gallon 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100
Total price per gallon 0.162715 0.22261 0.20081
1500 GAL MINIMUM DELIVERY
(LOADS UNDER 1500 GAL MINIMUM WILL HAVE
Tank Wagon Load NO BID 4000 A SEPARATE DELIVERY FEE OF $125.00 500 - 4500
Differential added to OPIS avg daily rate for
Houston region/gallon -0.01000 0.14660 0.10160
State tax/gallon 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000
Federal Oil Spill recovery tax/gallon 0.001715 0.00171 0.00171
LUST Tax/gallon 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100
Total price per gallon 0.192715 0.34931 0.30431

NO. 2 DIESEL LOW SULPHUR
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DATE OF BID OPENING
THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 8, 2016

HOUSTON-PASADENA APACHE OIL COMPANY
LP

BAY OIL COMPANY

SUN COAST RESOURCES, INC.

PINNACLE PETROLEUM, INC.

5136 SPENCER HIGHWAY

2201 FM 517 E.

6405 CAVALCADE, BUILDING 1

16651 GEMINI LANE

2:00P.M.,, CS.T. PASADENA, TX 77505 DICKINSON, TX 77539 HOUSTON, TX 77026 HUNTINGTON BEACH, CA 92647
CONTRACT TERM JEREMY YEPES JAKE MARSICO TERRI BATEMAN OR LISA MOORE LIZ MCKINLEY
281-487-5400 281-337-4673 713-429-6702 714-841-8877
281-487-7606 281-614-5949 713-429-8409 714-841-8855
lyepes@apacheoilcompany.com jakeboc@gmail national@suncoastresources.com Imckinley@pinnaclepetrolaum.com
DESCRIPTION
7000 GAL MINIMUM DELIVERY
** DEMURRAGE WILL OCCUR AT THE RATE OF
$1.25 PER MINUTE SHOULD UNLOADING TIME
EXCEED 1 HOUR THROUGH NO FAULT OF SUN
Transport Load 6500+ 7400 COAST 4501 - 7600
Differential added to OPIS avg daily rate for
Houston region/gallon 0.02250 0.07000 0.02990 0.03870
State tax/gallon 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000
Federal Oil Spill recovery tax/gallon 0.00190 0.001905 0.001905 0.00190
LUST Tax/gallon 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100
Total price per gallon 0.22540 0.272905 0.232805 0.24160
2000 GAL MINIMUM DELIVERY
(LOADS UNDER 2000 GAL MINIMUM WILL HAVE
Tank Wagon Load UP TO 4500 3800.00 A SEPARATE DELIVERY FEE OF $125.00 500 - 4500
Differential added to OPIS avg daily rate for
Houston region/gallon 0.09500 0.11000 0.12660 0.09150
State tax/gallon 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000 0.20000
Federal Oil Spill recovery tax/gallon 0.00190 0.001905 0.001905 0.00190
LUST Tax/gallon 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100 0.00100
Total price per gallon 0.29790 0.312905 0.329505 0.29440

DELIVERY

24 HOURS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER

24 HOURS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER

24 HOURS AFTER RECEIPT OF ORDER

24 BUSINESS HOURS

ADDITIONAL INFO

MOST TANKS CAN BE FURNISHED AT NO
COST TO BRAZORIA COUNTY. IF NEEDED FOR
EMERGENCY IT CAN BE HANDLED IN
ADVANCE AS EMERGENCY FUELING
PAPERWORK MUST BE TAKEN CARE OF ON A
SEPARATE BASIS.

BAY OIL CAN PROVIDE TANKS IN THE EVENT
OF EMERGENCY OR OTHER PURPOSES. BAY
OIL WILL ONLY CHARGE A (1) ONE TIME FEE
OF $360.00 PER TANK. THIS ONLY IS TO
COVER THE DELIVERY OF THE TANK.
AMENDMENTS:

#1 - IF THERE IS AN "ACT OF GOD" AND THE
LOADING RACKS ARE CLOSED OR OUT OF
FUEL, BAY OIL CO. WILL DELIVER FUEL AS
SOONS AS IT'S AVAILABLE AND WE ARE NOT
RESPONSIBLE IF DELIVERY IS NOT MADE IN 24
HOURS.

#2 - THERE WILL BE A OVER ORDER FEE
CHARGED IF THE LOCATION DOES NOT HOLD
THE FUEL THAT WAS ORDERED.

#3 - IN EMERGENCY SITUATIONS (HURRICANE,
TROPICAL STORM) THERE MAY BE A
DELIVERY CHARGE UP TO $175.00

SEE EXCEPTIONS PAGE

IN ORDER TO LOAN OR RENT SUN COAST
RESOURCES, INC.'S TANKS, BIDDER
REQUIRES AN AGREEMENT REGARDING RISK
ALLOCATION IN THE FORM OF THE ATTACHED
TANK LOAN AGREEMENT. PRICING FOR THE
LOAN OR RENTAL OF TANK (DELIVERY FEES,
PUMPS, ETC.) WILL BE QUOTED ON REQUEST
(EMERGENCY AND NON-EMERGENCY) BASED
ON SPECIFIC TANK SIZE, PUMP
REQUIREMENT AND OTHER SPECIFICATIONS
NOT INCLUDED IN THIS BID SOLICITATION.

PINNACLE PETROLEUM, INC. CAN SUPPLY
TANKS TO THE COUNTY IF NEEDED FOR
EMERGENCY PURPOSES WITH A RENTAL FEE
TBD.
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