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9014
BAG, BARREL SACK, 76#,12" X 7" X 17", KRAFT 
BROWN, BBL, 500 CT DURO 1075 500/PKG NO BID B & H 80080 *1675 400/BALE  $        36.22 No Bid DURO SK1675 SK165 500  $        60.99 

7598
BAGS, TRASH, 23" X 33", 12-16 GAL, .30 MIL, 
BLACK, STAR BOTTOM 

STEEL-FLEX-
COVALENCE 32BL 1000/CS PITT PLASTIC 166434 P166434 1000/CA  $             31.65 Central Poly CP2333K.3 CP2333K.3 1000/cs  $        16.20 PINNICAL P32BL P32BL 1000/CASE  $        23.18 

Gateway 
Liners

GL77124320300
3 GL771243203003 1000/Case $18.94/case CONCORD 2336M 2336M 1000  $        20.00 

7597
BAGS, TRASH, 24" X 33", 8 MC, HIGH DENSITY, 
12-16 GAL, STAR BOTTOM, NATURAL COLOR 

RHINO-
COVALENCE 24338 20 X 50/CS PITT PLASTIC 112156 P112156 1000/CA  $             25.69 Central Poly CP2433N8 CP2433N8 1000/cs  $        14.80 RHINO 24338N *24338 20/50/CASE  $        19.97 

Gateway 
Liners

GL77224320800
1 GL771243208001 1000/Case $20.92/case CONCORD 2436M 2436M 1000  $        20.00 

7906
BAGS, TRASH, 33" X 40", 1.5 MIL, 33 GAL, DARK 
COLOR, STAR BOTTOM  

TITANIUM-PITT 
PLASTICS 40STL 100/CS PITT PLASTIC P112376 P112376 150/CA  $             18.04 Central Poly CP3340K1.5 CP3340K1.5 100/cs  $        14.00 PINNICAL P40STL P40STL 100/CASE  $        16.38 

Gateway 
Liners

GL77133401500
3 GL771334015003 100/Case $16.52/case CONCORD 3340 1.5 3340 1.5 100  $        19.00 

7596
BAGS, TRASH, 40" X 48", 16 MC, 40-45 GAL, STAR 
BOTTOM, NATURAL

RHINO-
COVALENCE HR404816N 10X25/CS PITT PLASTIC 112136 P112136 250/CA  $             28.22 Central Poly CP4048N16 CP4048N16 250/cs  $        17.80 RHINO 404816N *404816 10/25/CASE  $        22.14 

Gateway 
Liners

GL77240481600
1 GL771404816001 250/Case $24.98/case CONCORD 4048 1.0 4048 1.0 250  $        39.00 

7601 BAGS, TRASH, ECONOMY, WHITE, PLAS-T-SACK 1/6HID 1000/CS NO BID
PLAS-T-

SACK 1/6HD 1/6HD 1000/CASE  $        15.99 
Gateway 

Liners
GL77219201500

2 GL772192015002 2000/Case $37.35/case CONCORD T BAGS T BAGS 1000  $        18.95 

7595
BAGS, TRASH, SILVER, 39" X 57", 1.7 MIL, 55/60 
GAL, STAR BOTTOM, DARK COLOR 

TITANIUM 
INDUSTRIAL - 

PITT PLASTICS 56STL 50/CS PITT PLASTIC 112083 P112083 50/CA  $             19.74 Central Poly CP3957S1.7 CP3957S1.7 50/cs  $        14.05 PINNICAL P56STL P56STL 50/CASE  $        15.17 
Gateway 

Liners
GL77138581700

3 GL771385817003 100/Case $31,27/case CONCORD 55 2.0 55 2.0 50  $        23.00 

6366 BLEACH, (1 GAL) KIK 10BLCH 4x1 GAL KIK KIKBLEACH3 KIKBLEACH3 3/CA  $               8.00 KIK 10BLCH3 10BLCH3 3/1GAL/CASE  $          9.00 Clorox L.CLO30966 L.CLO30966 3/121oz/case $13.36/case N/A

6368 BLEACH, 6%, 1 GAL KIK 6BLCH 6X96 OZ NO BID KIK 6BLCH 6BLCH 6/96oz/CASE  $        10.50 Clorox L.CLO30966 L.CLO30966 3/121oz/case $13.36/case N/A

6372
BLOCK, URINAL DEODORIZING SENTRY 
W/SCREEN, PLIABLE VINYL, 3 OZ FRESH 12-USPB DZ HOSPECO 1901 H01901 12/CA  $             13.64 FRESH 12-USPB

URINAL 
SEN 6/12/CASE  $        19.68 Continental 165-1 CO165-1 12/cs $10.47/case FRESH USPB/12 12/USPB DOZEN  $        17.50 

6373
BLOCK, URINAL DEODORIZING, 3 OZ., LAST 30 
DAYS FRESH URINAL BLOCK DZ HOSPECO 4901 H04901 12/CA  $             12.27 FRESH *12-3

URINAL 
BLOCK DOZEN  $          6.07 Hospeco 4901 HOS04901-12 12/cs $12.70/case FRESH KRY U03 KRY U03 DOZEN  $          7.00 

6547
BOTTLE, SPRAY, PLASTIC, FULL QUART 
CAPASITY, TRANSLUCENT CPC BOTTLEQT EA DIVERSEY BS32 DIVBS32 EACH  $               2.02 TOLCO BOTTLEQT BOTTLEQT EACH  $          0.59 Continental 932CG-100 CO932CG-100 Each $.43/each UNS 32 UNS 32 EACH  $          0.50 

6377
BROOM, 24" GARAGE BRUSH, PALMYRA FIBER, 4" 
TRIM, HEAD ONLY CARLISLE 10824 EA CARLISLE 4522200 C4522200 EACH  $               9.08 CARLISLE 10824 *10824 EACH  $        10.97 Nexstep 27100-6 NC27100-6 Each $5.82/each BOARDWALK BWK20124 BWK20124 EACH  $        11.00 

6378
BROOM, 36" GARAGE BRUSH, PALMYRA FIBER, 4" 
TRIM, HEAD ONLY CARLISLE 10836 EA CARLISLE 3621913600 C3621913600 EACH  $             11.67 CARLISLE 10836 *10836 EACH  $        18.04 Continental F102036 COF102036-12 Each $13.92/each BOARDWALK BWK20136 BWK20136 EACH  $        18.00 

6379
BROOM, ANGLER 13" LARGE PLASTIC FLAGGED, 
42" LONG WOOD HANDLE UNISAN 932A EA CARLISLE 3686500 C3686500 EACH  $               8.48 CCP 932A CANGLE EACH  $          5.20 Continental E507012 COE507012-12 Each $4.64/each UNISAN UNS932A UNS932A DOZEN  $        69.00 

6381
BROOM, WAREHOUSE, YUCCA & CORN FIBERS, 
HEAVY DUTY , 42" LONG UNISAN 932Y EA CARLISLE 4135467 C4135467 EACH  $               7.67 CCP 932Y MAIDBR EACH  $          7.71 Continental E502028 COE502028-12 Each $6.08/each UNISAN UNS932Y UNS932Y DOZEN  $        95.40 

6382 BROOM, WHISK, CORN, 10" UNISAN 951WC EA NO BID CCP 951WC WHBR EACH  $          4.26 Continental E504000 COE504000-12 Each $2.41/each UNISAN UNS951WC UNS951WC DOZEN  $        54.00 

6375
BROOM,24" GARAGE BRUSH, PLASTIC, 60"X148" 
ANCHOR STYLE HANDLE MALISH 24424 EA NO BID MALISH 24424 *24424 EACH  $        11.50 Nexstep 27112-6 NC27112-6 Each $6.97/each BOARDWALK BWK20424 BWK20424 EACH  $        10.95 

6518
BUCKET, MOP, 26 QT, WRINGER, 780 COMBO 
PACK RUBBERMAID 7580 EA RUBBERMAID FG758088YEL 

RFG758088YE
L EACH  $             58.10 RCP 7580 *7580 EACH  $        53.93 Continental 226-312YW CO226-312YW Each $40.29/each RCP 7580 7,580.00 EACH  $        69.00 

6386
BUS BOX, DUR-X UNDIVIDED, 7-5/8 GAL, 
GRAY,ROUND CORNERS RUBBERMAID 3351 EA RUBBERMAID 33351

RFG335100GR
AY EACH  $             15.89 RCP 3351 RCP3351 EACH  $        16.48 No Bid RCP RCP3351 RCP3351 EACH  $        16.00 

6396
CHEMICAL, POOL, SMALL TABS,24 HOUR 
CHLORINE, 7 OZ 3" DIA PUCKS, 25 LB BAG HARCROSS 25LB 25LB NO BID SCP DIST. 5071 3T 25# PAIL  $        72.57 No Bid SCP 3T 3T 25  $        68.00 

6409
CLEANER, BOWL, DISINFECTANT, DEORDORIZES, 
NON-ACID, 32 OZ SPARTAN NABC 12 QT DIVERSEY 4996 D04996 32OZ/ EACH  $               1.64 SPARTAN 7116 NABC 12/32oz/CASE  $        16.25 Buckeye B.SANDRCQT B.SANDRCQT

12x32 RTU 
Quarts $32.52/case CONCORD NAPC 12QT DOZEN  $        19.95 

7578
CLEANER, BOWL, DISINFECTANT, PRETTY POTTY, 
12 X 1 QT/CS CARROLL

PRETTY 
POTTY 12 X 1 QT/CS DIVERSEY 4578 D04578 32OZ/ EACH  $               1.99 CARROLL Buckeye B.SANDRCQT B.SANDRCQT

12x32 RTU 
Quarts $32.52/case CONCORD BOWL BRITE

BOWL 
BRITE DOZEN  $        26.00 

7579
CLEANER, BOWL, DISINFECTANT, PRETTY POTTY, 
GAL CARROLL PP1 4X1 GAL NO BID CARROLL 76328 PP1 4/1GAL/CASE  $        29.17 Buckeye B.SANDRCGL B.SANDRCGL 4x1 Gallon $32.76/case CONCORD BOWL BRITE

BOWL 
BRITE 4X1  $        34.00 

8151
CLEANER, BOWL, GERMICIDAL, 23% HCI ACID, 
(12X32 OZ) SPARTAN GERMICIDAL 12X32 OZ DIVERSEY 4560 D04560 32OZ/EACH  $               3.43 SPARTAN 7120

GERMICIDA
L 12/32oz/CASE  $        15.45 Buckeye B.DYPHAQT B.DYPHAQT

12x32 RTU 
Quarts $42.84/case CONCORD GLITTER GLITTER DOZEN  $        32.00 

6431
CLEANER, DEGREASER, RTU, INDUSTRIAL 
STRENGTH, 32 OZ, ALL PURPOSE SPARTAN

TOUGHRTU 
2040 12X32 OZ DIVERSEY 95891789 D95891789 32OZ/EACH  $               3.02 SPARTAN 2040 TOUGHRTU 12/32oz/CASE  $        21.14 Buckeye B.SHOPQT B.SHOPQT

12x32 RTU 
Quarts $60.96/case CONCORD BLUE POWER

BLUE 
POWER DOZEN  $        20.00 

6450
CLEANER, DISINFECTANT, AROMA LIQUID, 
ADVANCE CHEMICAL, PH NEUTRAL, 55 GAL, CONCORD AROMA

55 GAL 
DRUM DIVERSEY 3062768 D3062768 5L/EACH  $             49.03 SPARTAN 3297-55 ECO55 55GAL DRUM  $      524.59 Buckeye B.LEMQUA55 B.LEMQUA55 55 Gal Drum $534.87/drum CONCORD AROMA/55 AROMA/55 55 GAL  $      399.99 

7581
CLEANER, DISINFECTANT, CONSUME ECO-LYZER 
NEUTRAL, 4X 1 GAL/CS SPARTAN

CONSUME 
ECOLYZER 4X1 GAL/CS DIVERSEY 4332 D04332 1GAL/EACH  $             19.72 SPARTAN 3297-4 ECO1 4/1GAL/CASE  $        39.05 Buckeye B.LEMQUAGL B.LEMQUAGL 4x1 Gallon $43.08/case SPARTAN EC01 EC01 4X1 GAL  $        50.00 

6420
CLEANER, FLOOR STRIDE, FLORAL, LIQUID, ALL 
PURPOSE, 1 GAL, ODOR COUNTERACTANT JOHNSON JW-4689 4X1 GAL DIVERSEY 903904 D903904 1GAL/EACH  $               5.62 JWAX 903904 STRIDE14 4/1GAL/CASE  $        18.28 Buckeye B.STRUPGL B.STRUPGL 4x1 Gallon $32.36/case JOHNSON 903904 903904 4X1 GAL  $        29.90 

6413
CLEANER, FLOOR, DAMP MOP, NO RINSE 
CONCENTRATE, LEMON, 1 GAL CONCORD LEMON 101 4X1 GAL DIVERSEY 903904 D903904 1GAL/EACH  $               5.62 

TIDAL 
WAVE LEMON1 LEMON1 4/1GAL/CASE  $        32.64 Buckeye B.STRUPGL B.STRUPGL 4x1 Gallon $32.36/case CONCORD LEMON 101 LEMON 101 4X1  $        49.80 

6417
CLEANER, FLOOR, FINISHED, NO RINSE, OPEN 
LOOP, 1 GAL, MR CLEAN P&G PG02621 3X1 GAL DIVERSEY 903904 D903904 1GAL/EACH  $               5.62 P & G 2621

PGC03621C
T 3/1GAL/CASE  $        41.35 Buckeye B.STRUPGL B.STRUPGL 4x1 Gallon $32.36/case P&G PG02621 PG02621 3X1  $        48.00 

6419
CLEANER, FLOOR, SPRAY BUFF & MAINTAINER, 
MULTIPURPOSE, 1 GAL P&G PG41774 4X1 GAL DIVERSEY 904116 D904116 1GAL/EACH  $             16.67 JWAX 904116 SNAPBACK 4/1GAL/CASE  $        60.05 Buckeye B.EQUIGL B.EQUIGL 4x1 Gallon $65.88/case P&G PG41774 PG41774 4X1  $        69.80 

6406
CLEANER, FOAMY TUB & TILE DISINFECTANT, 
AEROSAL,18OZ, FOR WASHROOMS SPARTAN TNT 12X18 OZ DIVERSEY 4531 D04531 32OZ/EACH  $               4.00 SPARTAN 6343 TNT 12/18oz/CASE  $        25.56 No Bid CONCORD TUB & TILE

TUBE & 
TILE DOZEN  $        44.00 

6422
CLEANER, GLASS RTU, LIQUID AMMONIA-BASED, 
32 OZ SPARTAN GLASS RTU 12 QT DIVERSEY 4705 D04705 32OZ/EACH  $               1.88 SPARTAN 3261 GLASSRTU 12/32oz/CASE  $        18.58 Buckeye B.STASPRQT B.STASPRQT

12x32 RTU 
Quarts $36.48/case CONCORD SPARKLE SPARKLE DOZEN  $        26.80 

7233
CLEANER, GLASS, AEROSOL, SPARTAN, 12 X 18 
OZ / CASE SPARTAN

GLASSCLN 
AERO 12X18 OZ CLAIRE CP050 CCP050 20OZ/EACH  $               1.70 SPARTAN 6217

GLASSCLN         
AERO 12/18oz/CASE  $        23.44 Buckeye B.STASPRA B.STASPRA

12x19 Aerosol 
Cans $39.00/case CONCORD GLASS SHINE

GLASS 
SHINE DOZEN  $        21.90 

6423
CLEANER, GLASS, LIQUID AMMONIA-BASED, NON 
STREAKING, 1GAL SPARTAN GLASSCLN1 4X1 GAL DIVERSEY 4705 D04705 32OZ/EACH  $               1.88 SPARTAN 3030

CLASSCLN
RTU 12/32oz/CASE  $        18.78 Buckeye B.STASPRGL B.STASPRGL 4x1 Gallon $24.56/case CONCORD SPARKLE SPARKLE 4X1 GAL  $        24.00 

6425 CLEANER, GRILL, BRICK, 8 X 4 X 3-1/2 3M MCOP1142 12/CS NO BID ROYAL RG549 GBRICK 12/CASE  $        21.28 No Bid ROYAL G BRICK G BRICK CASE  $        24.99 

7193
CLEANER, METAQUAT GERMICIDE, SPARTAN, 4 X 
1 GAL / CS SPARTAN SP-1013-4 4X1 GAL DIVERSEY 3143429 D3143429 5L/EACH  $             25.63 SPARTAN 1013-4

METAQUAT
1 4/1GAL/CASE  $        35.13 Buckeye B.TERMGL B.TERMGL 4x1 Gallon $64.68/case SPARTAN SP1013-4 SP1013-4 4X1 GAL  $        40.99 

7588
CLEANER, METAQUAT GERMICIDE, SPARTAN, 55 
GAL SPARTAN SP-1013-55

55 GAL 
DRUM DIVERSEY 3143429 D3143429 5L/EACH  $             25.63 SPARTAN 1013-55

METAQUAT
55 55GAL DRUM  $      363.36 Buckeye B.TERM55 B.TERM55 55 Gallon Drum $834.26/drum SPARTAN SP1013-55 SP1013-55 55 GAL  $      399.99 

6427
CLEANER, OVEN, RTU, QUICK PENETRATING, 
LEMON SCENTED, 32 OZ SPARTAN

OVENRTU 
3194 12X32 OZ CLAIRE CP824 CCP824 20OZ/EACH  $               2.19 SPARTAN 3194 OVENRTU 12/32oz/CASE  $        23.52 No Bid SPARTAN OVEN RTU OVEN RTU DOZEN  $        29.90 

6401
CLEANER, RESTROOM, ACID DISINFECTANT, 
MINT, SPARCLING, 32 OZ SPARTAN SPARCLING 12 QT DIVERSEY 4578 D04578 32OZ/EACH  $               1.99 SPARTAN 7118 SPARCLING 12/32oz/CASE  $        17.91 Buckeye B.GELSCRQT B.GELSCRQT

12x32 RTU 
Quarts $49.68/case CONCORD BOWL CLEANER

BOWL 
CLEANER DOZEN  $        19.99 

FERGUSON FACILITIES SUPPLY

ITB #16-60 Janitorial Products and Related Supplies

OPEN DATE

WEDNESDAY, SEPTEMBER 28, 2016 

AT 11:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME

Vendor name

Address

Contact

Phone

Fax 888-334-8112

GULF COAST PAPER CO. INC.

437 COMMERCE AVE.

CLUTE, TX 77531

GLENN WILLIAMS

979-265-6149

908-862-9019 979-265-6149

SPRINGFIELD, TN 37172

NARI SADARANGANI

1842 AIRPORT BLVD.

HOUSTON, TX 77051

RYAN BARTRAM

832-728-9703

615-384-0574

CENTRAL POLY BAG CORP.

2400 BROLLE PLACE

LINDEN, NJ 07036

ANDREW HOFFER

908-862-7570

281-873-4242

NASHVILLE MEDICAL & EMS PRODUCTS, INC.

701 CENTRAL AVE. W

615-384-0573

503 BAINS ST.

BROOKSHIRE, TX 77423

MICHAEL BRAHM

800-288-2744

BUCKEYE CLEANING CENTER - HOUSTON

16420 W. HARDY RD. SUITE 150

HOUSTON, TX 77060

REAGAN LA POINT

281-873-4200

K & L SUPPLY INC.
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6404
CLEANER,DISINFECTING ALL PURPOSE SPRAY & 
GLASS CLEANER, 1 GAL, SPIC N SPAN P&G PG31241 3X1 GAL P&G 58773 PGC58773CT 3 X 1GAL  $             36.94 P & G 58773

PGC58773C
T 3/1GAL/CASE  $        34.94 Buckeye B.STASPRGL B.STASPRGL 4x1 Gallon $24.56/case P&G PGC58773 PGC58773 DOZEN  $        39.80 

6405
CLEANER,WASHROOM, FOAMY, FLORAL, DUAL 
ACID, FOR SHOWERS & LOCKER ROOMS, 32 OZ SPARTAN FOAMY RTU 12 QT DIVERSEY 95325322 D95325322 32OZ/EACH  $               2.59 SPARTAN 3200 FOAMYRTU 12/32oz/CASE  $        25.51 Buckeye B.GELSCRQT B.GELSCRQT

12x32 RTU 
Quarts $49.68/case CONCORD

FOAMY 
DISINFECTANT

FOAMY 
DISINFECTA

NT DOZEN  $        29.70 

6432

DEGREASER, NATURAL ORANGE SOLVENT, 
RTU,REMOVES MARKS, TAR,GUM, OIL,GREASE 
AND OTHER DIFFICULT SOILS SPARTAN OT15QT 12X32 OZ DIVERSEY 95891164 D95891164 1QT/EACH  $               3.27 SPARTAN 2218 OT15QT 12/32oz/CASE  $        30.11 Buckeye B.WORKQT B.WORKQT

12x32 RTU 
Quarts $49.68/case CONCORD LEMON 101 LEMON 101 DOZEN QTS  $        39.95 

6438
DEODORIZIER,DRIP, RESTROOM, FRESH SCENT, 
32 OZ SPARTAN FENABC 12X32 OZ NO BID SPARTAN 5801 FENABC 12/32oz/CASE  $        54.37 No Bid K & L SUPPLY TROPICAL MIST

TROPICAL 
MIST DOZEN  $        56.00 

6449 DETERGENT, LAUNDRY, 100 LB DRUM, OPTI-BRITE OPTI-BRITE
100 LB 
DRUM ECOLAB 6100106 E6100106 5GAL/EACH  $           236.34 No Bid CONCORD OPTI BRITE OPTI BRITE 100#  $      109.99 

7583
DISINFECTANT, DEODORANT, LYSOL SPRAY, 12 X 
19 OZ/CS LYSOL 12X19 OZ/CS DIVERSEY 4832 D04832 15OZ/EACH  $               4.47 LYSOL 4675

RAC04675C
T 12/19oz/CASE  $        75.73 LYSOL Same

12 
X19OZ/CS $65.88 Buckeye B.SANIA3 B.SANIA3 12x15 OZ/CS $48.36/case LYSOL LYSOL LYSOL DOZEN  $        59.90 

6454

DISINFECTANT, DEODORANT, STERI-PHENE, 
CLEAN / FRESH, 15 OZ, KILLS MOST DISEASE AND 
GERMS SPARTAN STERIPHENE 12X15 OZ/CS DIVERSEY 4832 D04832 15OZ/EACH  $               4.47 SPARTAN 6075 SSB 12/15oz/CASE  $        30.81 Buckeye B.SANIA3 B.SANIA3 12x15 OZ/CS $48.36/case CONCORD HOSP/DIS HOSP/DIS DOZEN QTS  $        39.95 

6456

DISINFECTANT, QUATERNARY WITH 
SURFACTANT CLEANING SYSTEM, LEMON FRESH, 
1 GAL CARROL 77628 4X1 GAL DIVERSEY 3143429 D3143429 5L/EACH  $             25.63 

TIDAL 
WAVE 77628 LEMON1 4/1GAL/CASE  $        32.64 Buckeye B.LEMQUAGL B.LEMQUAGL 4x1 Gallon $10.77/gallon CONCORD LEMON 101 LEMON 101 4X1  $        49.80 

6555
DOLLY, FOR 20 32, 44 AND 55 GAL CONTAINERS, 
BLACK, BRUTE RUBBERMAID RCP 2654G EA RUBBERMAID FG264000BLA 

RFG264000BL
A EACH  $             36.64 RCP 2640G 2640 EACH  $        23.11 Impact 7708 02DORO18BK Each $18.82/each RCP RCP265 RCP265 EACH  $        34.80 

6460 DUSTMOP, FRAME, 36 X 5 ABCO AB36 EA RUBBERMAID
FGM25500000

0 
RFGM2550000

00  $               3.88 CCP C702036 536DMF EACH  $          3.15 Continental C702036 COC702036-12 Each $2.77/each UNSLINE UNS1436 UNS1436 EACH  $          4.80 

6472
FRESHENER, AIR-METERED, AEROSOL, MANGO 
SCENT, 6.6 OZ, TIMEMIST TIME MIST TMS2960

12X6.6 
OZ/CS TIME MIST 2960

TMS332960TM
CT

6.6OZX12 / 
CASE  $             44.82 VECTAIRE MANGO MA 12/7oz/CASE  $        32.96 Time Mist 2960 L.TMS2960 12/Case $45.03/case BOLT BLT860 BLT860 DOZEN  $        46.40 

6479

GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, LATEX, LG, 5MIL, WHITE, 
POWDERED, ROLLED CUFF (BRAND OR 
EQUIVLANET) ANSELL 69210L 10/100/CS LIBERTY T2800W LT2800W BX/100  $               2.96 Sterex LGPPG-L LGPPG-L

1000/cs
4 mil  $        36.20 HOSPECO GL-L105PL L105PL 10/100 CASE  $        31.93 Hospeco GL-L105PL HOSGL-L105PL 10/100/CS $33.05/case ANSELL 6901L 6901L 1000/CASE  $        49.00 

6480
GLOVES, DISPOSABLE, LATEX, XLG, 5MIL, WHITE, 
POWDERED, ROLLED CUFF ANSELL 69210XL 10/100/CS LIBERTY T2810W LT2810W BX/100  $               3.49 Sterex LGPPG-XL LGPPG-XL

1000/cs
4 mil  $        36.20 HOSPECO GL-105PXL L105PXL 10/100 CASE  $        31.93 Hospeco GL-L105PX HOSGL-L105PX 10/100/CS $33.05/case ANSELL 69210XL 69210XL 1000/CASE  $        49.00 

6489
GLOVES, LATEX, FLOCKLINED, SIZE 9, GREEN 
COLOR ANSELL 188L 10/100/CS MCR 5320 M5320 EACH  $               1.33 HOSPECO GL-116 L116L 10/1DZ/CASE  $        50.00 Impact 8217L 1 DZ/CS $17.29/dozen N/A

7584
GLOVES, NITRILE, DISPOSABLE, POWDER-FREE, 
TEXTURED, SIZE LARGE ANSELL 62675L 100/BOX MCR 6001L M6001L

10 BX OF 
100/CASE  $             56.00 Sterex NGPPFG-L NGPPFG-L

1000/cs
4 mil  $        42.00 HOSPECO GL-N106L N106L 10/100/CASE  $        43.52 Hospeco GL-N106FL HOSGL-N106FL 10/100/CS $45.05/case ANSELL 92-675 L 92-675 L 100 BOX  $          6.50 

7585
GLOVES, NITRILE, DISPOSABLE, POWDER-FREE, 
TEXTURED, SIZE X-LARGE ANSELL 62675XL 100/BOX MCR 6001XL M6001XL

10 BX OF 
100/CASE  $             56.00 Sterex NGPPFG-XL NGPPFG-XL 1000/cs  $        42.00 HOSPECO GL-N106XL N106XL 10/100/CASE  $        43.52 Hospeco GL-N106FX HOSGL-N106FX 10/100/CS $45.05/case ANSELL 92-675 XL 92-675 XL 100 BOX  $          6.50 

7235
GLOVES, POWDER-FREE, DISPOSABLE, LATEX 
EXAM, GCP69318L, SIZE L GCP GCP69318L 10X100/CS MCR 5045L M5045L

10 BX OF 
100/CASE  $             65.41 HOSPECO GL-L105FL L105FL 10/100/CASE  $        34.77 Hospeco GL-L106FL HOSGL-L106FL 10/100/CS $40.00/case BOARDWALK BWK345 L BWK345 L 10/100 BOX  $        59.00 

7586
GLOVES, VERSATOUCH, ANSELL, VINYL, 5 MIL, 
LARGE, 100/BOX ANSELL ANS34700 100/BOX LIBERTY 2910 L107121 BX/100  $               2.75 Sterex VGPCPG-L VGPCPG-L

1000/cs
4 mil  $        27.99 HOSPECO GL-V103FL V103FL 10/100/CASE  $        20.91 Hospeco GL-L105FL HOSGL-L105FL 10/100/CS $36.00/case ANSELL ANS347 L ANS347 L 100 BOX  $          5.95 

6383
HANDLE, BROOM, WOOD, 60" WITH METAL 
THREADED TIP UNISAN BRU136 EA CARLISLE 4526700 C4526700 EACH  $               3.48 BRU136 136 EACH  $          4.30 Continental M104060 COM104060-12 Each $2.64/each UNISAN 136 136 EACH  $          4.00 

6519
HANDLE, MOP, 60", FIBERGLASS, JANITOR, 
CAMLOCK WILEN A70212 EA RUBBERMAID

FGH13600000
0 

RFGH1360000
00 EACH  $             12.92 CCP A07212 60CL EACH  $          8.50 Continental A70312 COA70312-12 Each $7.85/each UNISAN 5620 UNS5620 EACH  $          7.00 

6520
HANDLE, MOP, 60", SPEED CHG HEAD, SAFETY 
ORNG FIBERGLASS SHAFT UNISAN 620 EA RUBBERMAID

FGH13600000
1

RFGH1360000
0 EACH  $             12.92 IMPACT 94 IMPACT94 EACH  $        12.63 Nexstep 6542 NC6542-12 Each $6.57/each UNISAN 626 626 EACH  $          8.99 

6523
HANDLE, MOP, 60", WOOD JAWS LOOP FOR 5" 
HEADBAND MOP WILEN 60J EA RUBBERMAID

FGH21600000
0

RFGH2160000
00 EACH  $               8.88 CCP A70602 60J EACH  $          8.19 

Nexstep 
Metal handle 6508 NC6508-12 Each $4.58/each WILEN 60J 60J EACH  $          8.99 

6461 HANDLE,DUSTMOP, CLIPON 15/16 X 60" WILEN DMH EA RUBBERMAID
FGH21600000

0
RFGH2160000

00 EACH  $               8.88 CCP C801060 DMH EACH  $          5.61 Nexstep 96161 NC96161-12 Each $4.98/each UNISAN UNS1490 UNS1490 EACH  $          8.00 

6602
INSECTICIDE WITH DURSBAN BUCKETS WITH 
SPRAYERS AERO AEL485 4X1 GAL NO BID No Bid CONCORD VIPER VIPER 4X1 GAL  $        99.99 

6603 INSECTICIDE, WASP AND HORNET , 17 OZ SPARTAN WASP 12/17/CS CLAIRE CL005 CCL005 EACH  $               3.07 SPARTAN 6820 SBWASP 12/17oz/CASE  $        37.36 No Bid CONCORD WASP KILLR WASP KILL 12X19oz  $        46.99 

8159 LAUNDRY DERTEGENT PREMIER 4377 50 LB BOX SUNBURST 744550 S744550
50LB 

BOX/EACH  $             35.65 
MONTGOM

ERY 47562500 PREMIER50 50# BOX  $        18.62 Premier 4756 BZ47562500 50 LB BOX $16.74/each
MOUNTAIN 

FRESH
MOUNTAIN 

FRESH
MOUNTAIN 

FRESH 50# BKTS  $        24.99 

6531

MOP, BLUE FINISH HEAD, MEDIUM, FASTTRACK, 
1-1/4"HEADBAND, LOOPED END, USE WITH CLAMP 
OR GRIPPER STYLE HANDLES UNISAN UNS 542 EA RUBBERMAID

FGC15206BL0
0 

RFGC15206BL
00 EACH  $               7.38 CCP A03512 MFM EACH  $          6.50 Nexstep 97312 NC97312-12 Each $4.63/each UNISAN UNS542 UNS542 DOZEN QTS  $        77.99 

6517 MOP, DECK, WOOD HANDLE, COTTON, 24 OZ UNISAN 124C EA NO BID UNISAN 124C 24MOP EACH  $        10.00 Nexstep 6506-6 NC6506-6 Each $5.38/each UNISAN 124C 124C DOZEN  $        84.00 

6459 MOP, DUST, DISPOSABLE, 36" X 5 WILEN WI-401036 EA RUBBERMAID
FGL25500WH0

0 
RFGL25500W

H00 EACH  $               6.08 CCP C057036 536DMH EACH  $          8.00 Nexstep 96036 NC96036-12 Each $5.42/each UNISAN UNS5X36 UNS1636 EACH  $          7.60 

6526 MOP, HEAD ONLY, 16 OZ, RAYON, LIE FLAT UNISAN UNS 716R EA RUBBERMAID
FGF16600WH0

0
RFGF16600W

H00 EACH  $               4.30 CCP A504316 16RLF EACH  $          3.60 Nexstep 97829 NC97829-12 Each $3.65/each UNISAN UNS716R UNS716R DOZEN  $        69.99 

6527
MOP, HEAD, COTTON, FULL OUNCE, 32 OZ, 1" 
MESH HEADBAND, GENERAL PURPOSE WILEN 32CCL DZ RUBBERMAID

FGC21306BL0
0 

RFGC21306BL
00 EACH  $               9.51 CCP A401132 32CCL DOZEN  $        58.20 Nexstep 97732V NC97322V-12 12/Case $4.18/each UNISAN UNS4032C UNS4032C DOZEN  $        89.00 

6608 PADS, FEMININE, SANITARY, MAXITHINS HOSPECO 147GUARD 250/CS HOSEPCO 147 H147A 250/CA  $             27.67 HOSPECO MT4 147GUARD 250/CASE  $        28.99 KENTRON 999240B 999240B 250/CS $26.49 Hospeco 147A HOS147A 250/Case $28.00/case HOSPECO HOS147A HOS147A 250/CASE  $        34.00 

6532
PADS, SCOURING, MICROTRON PAD, 6" X 9" X 1/4", 
GREEN,MEDIUM DUTY AMER 69GP 3X20/CS 3M 96

3M0480110829
3 20/PK  $             10.52 AMERICO 510165 69GP 3/20/CASE  $        14.88 ETC 96-60 E.96-60 3x20/Case $12.70/case PREMIERE PAD196 PAD196 3X20 CASE  $        13.40 

6467 PADS,FLOOR, STRIP, 17" AMER 17MSTRP 5/CS NIAGARA 7200N
3M0480113502

0 5/CA  $             11.86 AMERICO 400117 17MSTRP 5/CASE  $        10.71 ETC BLK17 E.BLK17 5/cs $10.23/case PREMIERE PAD4014 PAD4013 5/CASE  $          9.60 

6462
PAN,DUST,HEAVY DUTY, 8-1/8" X 12-1/4" X 12-1/4", 
CHARCOL COLOR RUBBERMAID 2005 EA RUBBERMAID 2005

RFG200500CH
AR EACH  $               2.72 RCP 2005 2005 EACH  $          2.61 Nexstep 96420 NC96420-12 Each $1.68/each RCP 2005 2005 EACH  $          4.00 

6407
PROTECTANT, MULTI-SURFACE, SILICONE BLEND, 
32OZ CONCORD PROTECT 12X32 OZ NO BID SPARTAN 3025 SHINEPLUS 12/32oz/CASE  $        80.37 Buckeye B.GLINA B.GLINA

12x17 oz 
Aerosol Cans $49.32/case CONCORD PROTECT PROTECT 12X32 OZ  $        59.99 

6539 RAGS, #1 NO LINT,  WHITE, 25# JOSCO 25WR 25# BOX NO BID JOSCO
#1 WHITE 
COTTON 25WR 25# BOX  $        14.89 Hospeco 340-25 HOS340-25 25 lb box $32.47/case JOSCO 25WR 25WR 25# BOX  $        49.00 

6540 RAGS, CHENILLE JOSCO CHENILLE 25# BOX NO BID No Bid JOSCO CHENILLE CHENILLE 25# BOX  $        49.00 

6554
RECEPTACLE, 55 GAL, GRAY, 26-1/2"DIA X 33"H, 
CRUSH RESISTANT, NO LID, RUBBERMAID RUBBERMAID RCP 2655G EA RUBBERMAID

FG265500GRA
Y 

RFG265500GR
AY EACH  $             57.20 RCP 2655G 2655 EACH  $        51.06 Continental 5500GY CO5500GY-3 Each $42.54/each RUBBERMAID RCP2655G RCP2655G EACH  $        60.00 

9310
RECEPTACLE, 55 GAL, RED, 26-1/2"DIA X 33"H, 
CRUSH RESISTANT, NO LID, RUBBERMAID RUBBERMAID RCP 2655R EA NO BID RCP 2655R RCP2655R 3/CARTON  $      257.78 No Bid RUBBERMAID RCP2655R RCP2655R EACH  $        60.00 

9311
RECEPTACLE, 55 GAL, WHITE, 26-1/2"DIA X 33"H, 
CRUSH RESISTANT, NO LID, RUBBERMAID RUBBERMAID RCP 2655W EA NO BID RCO 2655W

RCP2655W0
0000 3/CARTON  $      257.78 No Bid RUBBERMAID RCP2655W RCP2655W EACH  $        60.00 

6556
RECEPTACLE, LID, FLAT, FOR 55 GAL CONTAINER, 
GRAY, RUBBERMAID RUBBERMAID RCP 2640B EA RUBBERMAID

RFG265400GR
AY

RFG265400GR
AY EACH  $             24.06 RCP 2654G 2654 EACH  $        18.60 Continental 5501GY CO5501GY-3 Each $12.51/each RUBBERMAID RCP2604B RCP2604B EACH  $        21.00 

6553
RECEPTACLE, SOFT RECTANGULAR, 28-1/8 QT., 
BLACK, RUBBERMAID, RUBBERMAID 2956 EA RUBBERMAID FG295600BLA

RFG295600BL
A EACH  $               5.15 RCP 2656BK 2654BK EACH  $          4.33 Continental 2818BK CO2818BK-3 Each $3.51/each RUBBERMAID RCP2956 RCP2956 EACH  $          5.99 

6605 REPELLANT, MOSQUITO, 25% DEET (#01842) 
DEEP WOODS 

OFF DRK 94903 12X8 OZ NO BID JWAX CB018425 DWOFF 12/6oz/CASE  $        56.49 No Bid CONCORD BUG OFF BUG OFF 12X8oz  $        59.00 
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6514
SANITIZER, HAND, INSTANT, HYPOALLERGENIC, 8 
0Z PUMP BOTTLE GOJO 9652-12 12/CS GOJO 965212 G965212 EACH  $             39.16 GOJO 9652-12 GOJ9652-12 12/8oz/CASE  $        42.42 KENTRON KHS448 KHS448 48/CS $57.12 Buckeye B.90050050 B.90050050 12x550ml/cs $107.40/case PURELL 9652-12 9652-12 12X8oz  $        42.75 

6516

SANITIZER, HAND, WIPES, ANTI MICROBIAL, LOW 
ALCOHOL, MOISTURIZES (BRAND  OR 
EQUIVALENT) PURELL YGL-9010-06 6/175/CS GOJO 903106 G903106 6/CA  $             40.61 PURELL 9010-06

GOJ901006
CT 6/175/CASE  $        47.42 No Bid PURELL GOJ9113-06 9113-06

6X1 CAN 
270CT  $        79.80 

6512
SANITIZER, HAND,INSTANT, HYPOALLERGENIC, 
FLIPTOP, 4.25 OZ BOTTLE GOJO 9651-24 24/CS GOJO 965124 G965124 EACH  $             40.36 PURELL 9651-24 GOJ9651-24 24/4.25oz/CASE  $        40.03 KENTRON KHS444 KHS444 96/CASE $56.64 Buckeye B.90050150 B.90050150 24x50ml/cs $60.60/case PURELL GOJ9651 GOJ9561 24X4OZ  $        43.75 

7580
SEALER/FINISH, CAREFREE JOHNSON WAX, 4X 1 
GAL/CS JOHNSON WAX 5432 4X 1 GAL DIVERSEY 5104731 D5104731 5G BOX/EACH  $             83.97 JWAX 5104731 CARE5 5GAL BIB  $        75.15 Buckeye B.CLAR25GL B.CLAR25GL 4x1 Gallon $51.00/case CONCORD PREMIERE PREMIERE 5 GAL PAIL  $        65.00 

9291
SOAP, DETERGENT, DISH, POT & PAN, 
PALMOLIVE, 9/828 PER CASE, PALMOLIVE CPC46303CT 9X828 ML/CS PALMOLIVE 46303 CPC46303CT

9X28OZ / 
CASE  $             21.16 PALMOLIVE

CPC46303C
T PAL828 8/828ML/CASE  $        23.65 Palmolive L.CPC320181 L.CPC320181 12/800 ml $39.95/case PALMOLIVE CPC4630CT CPC4630CT

9X828MIL/C
ASE  $        35.75 

6442
SOAP, DISH, ORIGINAL, 28 OZ, PALMOLIVE 
ORIGINAL 

COLGATE 
PALMOLIVE CPC46128 12X28 OZ PALMOLIVE 46303 CPC46303CT

9X28OZ / 
CASE  $             21.16 PALMOLIVE 46112

CPC46112C
T 12/25oz/CASE  $        41.77 Palmolive L.CPC46112 L.CPC46112 12x25 oz $43.67/case PALMOLIVE CPC46128 CPC46128 12X28OZ  $        34.50 

6444 SOAP, DISH, POT & PAN, 1GAL, PALMOLIVE 
COLGATE 

PALMOLIVE CPC04910 4X1 GAL PALMOLIVE 4915 CPC04915 4X1GAL/CASE  $             55.41 PALMOLIVE 4915 CPC04915 4/1GAL/CASE  $        51.42 Palmolive L.CPC04915 L.CPC04915 4x1 Gallon $60.04/case PALMOLIVE CPC4915 CPC4915 4X1 GL  $        52.70 

6443 SOAP, DISH, POT & PAN, PALMOLIVE, 5 GAL
COLGATE 

PALMOLIVE CPC04913 5 GAL PALMOLIVE 4917 CPC04917
5GAL 

PAIL/EACH  $             71.20 PALMOLIVE 4917 CPC04917 5GAL PAIL  $        61.36 Palmolive L.CPC04917 L.CPC04917 5 Gallon $72.01/case PALMOLIVE CPC4913 CPC4913 5 GAL PAIL  $        56.60 

SOAP, HAND ANTIBACTERIAL, FOAM, 1 LITER DEB ANT1L 6/CS DEB ANT1L DANT1L 6/CA  $             41.58 DEB ANT1L ABFW 6/1LTR/CASE  $        42.00 

Buckeye
Requires 
Dispenser B.90091120 B.90091120 6/1250ml/case $42.37/case

BOARDWALK
(FREE 

DISPENSER) BWK8400 BWK8400 6X1250MIL  $        69.80 

6504
SOAP, HAND LIQUID, ANTIBACTERIAL, WITH 
PUMP, 7.5 OZ DIAL DIA-84014

12X7.5 
OZ/CS DIAL 84014 DIA84014 12/CASE  $             27.34 DIA; 84014 761 12/7.5oz/CASE  $        26.14 KENTRON ABS888 ABS888 48/CASE  $        57.12 No Bid DIAL DIA84014 DIA84014 12X7.5 MIL   $        29.95 

6502
SOAP, HAND, ANTISEPTIC, BACTERIOSTATIC, 
FUNGISTATIC, 1GAL GOJO GJ-184504 4X1 GAL GOJO 154504 G184504

EACH (MUST 
BUY CASE /4)  $             34.98 GOJO 1845 GOJ1845 4/1GAL/CASE  $        43.39 Boardwalk BWK430 L.BWK430 4x1 gallon $34.44/case GOJO 184504 184504 4X1 GAL  $        59.00 

6506

SOAP, HAND, LOTION, NATURAL ORANGE W/ 
PUMICE, PUMP DISPENSER, USE WITH OR 
WITHOUT WATER, 1GAL GOJO 0955-04 4X1 GAL GOJO 95504 G095504 EACH  $             14.77 GOJO 0955-04

GOJ095504
CT 4/1GAL/CASE  $        63.96 No Bid GOJO GOJ0955-04 GOJ055-04 4X1 GAL  $        63.00 

6546 SOAP, PRESSURE WASHER, CARS, 55 GAL SPARTAN SP-3002-55
55 GAL 
DRUM NO BID SPARTAN 3002-55

CCUSTOM5
5 55GAL DRUM  $      289.48 Buckeye B.AUTWAS55 B.AUTWAS55 55 Gal Drum $487.55/drum CONCORD CW/1000 CW/1000 55 GAL  $      299.00 

6548

SPRAYERS, TRIGGER, W/TUBE FILTER, 9-1/4"DIP 
TUBE, RED/WHITE, FOR QUART BOTTLES (BRAND 
OR EQIVALENT) CONTICO TRIG QT EA

IMPACT 
PRODUCTS 5906 I5906 EACH  $               1.12 TOLCO 902RW9 TRIGQT EACH  $          0.44 Continental 902RW9 CO902RW9 Each $.37/each UNISAN UNS922-9 UNS922-9 EACH  $          0.69 

6468

SWEEP, FLOOR, COMPOUND MFG W/SCREENED 
SAWDUST, MAX DUST ABSORPTION & 
COVERAGE, FOR WOOD OR CEMENT,50LBS SORB-ALL 50OILBS 50 LB SORB-ALL 50OILBS 50OILBS 50# BAG  $        14.47 No Bid SORB ALL SORB ALL

SORB 
ALL/50 EACH  $        14.50 

6552
TABLE COVER, POLY, 40" X 300',  WHITE,  CUT TO 
FIT ROLL 

KIMBERLY 
CLARK FJ810 ROLL NO BID 13728 G13728 8/CA  $             17.95 TIDY 503 503 ROLL  $        16.00 No Bid

KIMBERLY 
CLARK FJ810 FJ810 EACH  $        24.90 

7605 TAMPONS, TAMPAX HOSPECO MT500 500/CS HOSPECO T500 HT500 500/CA  $             53.37 HOSPECO MT500/T500 TAMPAX 500 CASE  $        56.18 Hospeco T500 HOST500 500/Case $54.00/case HOSPECO MT500 MT500 500/CASE  $        54.00 

6575
TISSUE, FACIAL, 2PLY, WHITE, 8-1/4" X 8-3/4", 
KLEENEX 

KIMBERLY 
CLARK KC 2140 36/100

KIMBERLY 
CLARK 21400 K21400

100 
SHEET/BOX  $               1.18 KC 21400 K21400 36/100/CASE  $        31.18 GP 48560 FJ48560 30/125 $34.17/case

KIMBERLY 
CLARK KC2140 KC2140 36/100  $        58.00 

6578 TISSUE, TOILET, 2 PLY COMPACT CORELESS GP GP19378 18/1500
GEORGIA 
PACIFIC 19378 GEO19378 18/CA  $             32.59 GP 19378 GP19378 18/1500/CASE  $        32.19 GP 19378 FJ19378 18/1500 $32.70/case GP 19378 19378 18X1500  $        31.00 

6577 TISSUE, TOILET, 2 PLY JUMBO ROLL GP GP12798 8/1000
GEORGIA 
PACIFIC 12798 G12798 8/CA  $             17.95 Atlas A700 A700 12/cs  $        29.99 GP 12798 GP12798 8/1000/CASE  $        17.75 GP 12798 FJ12798 8/1000' $18.00/case

CLEAR 
CHOICE 9200 9200 8/1000  $        22.99 

6580
TISSUE, TOILET, 2 PLY, JRT JR JUMBO ROLL, 
SCOTT SURPASS 

KIMBERLY 
CLARK K7805 12/1000

KIMBERLY 
CLARK 7805 K07805 12/CA  $             27.84 Atlas A700 A700 12/cs  $        29.99 KC 7805 K7805 12/1000/CASE  $        27.53 

Commercial 
Tissue JRT3810 L.CTJRT3810 12/1000' $20.07/case

KIMBERLY 
CLARK KC7805 KC7805 12/1000  $        27.50 

6579 TISSUE, TOILET, 2PLY, 100% BIODEGRADABLE ACCLAIM ABII 96/500
GEORGIA 
PACIFIC vonDrehle B50096 B50096 96/cs  $        45.66 NPS 12325 N12325 96/500/CASE  $        28.75 

Commercial 
Tissue 42352 WI42352 96/500 $31.17/case

SUPPLY 
WORKS H596 H596 96/500  $        28.43 

7666
TOWEL, CENTERPULL, WHITE PREMIUM, 4 ROLLS 
@ 560 SHEETS, 7.8" X 15' GP GP28143 4/560

GEORGIA 
PACIFIC 28143 GEO28143 4/CA  $             36.53 GP 28143 GP28143 4/560/CASE  $        36.12 GP 28143 FJ28143 4/560 $36.70/case GP GPC281-43 GPC281-43 4/560  $        64.40 

6588 TOWEL, MULTIFOLD, 1 PLY, NATURAL GP GP23304 4000
GEORGIA 
PACIFIC 23304 G23304 16/CA  $             15.23 Putney P200N P200N 4000/cs  $        19.77 NPS 21500 N21500 4000/CASE  $        13.92 GP 23304 FJ23304 4000 $15.29/case MARCAL MAC P-200--2 MAC-200-2 4000CT  $        17.95 

7594
TOWEL, ROLL, 1 PLY, BROWN, 1 1/8" CORE, 7 7/8" 
X 800', 12/CS GP GP26301 12/CS

GEORGIA 
PACIFIC 26301 G26301 6/CA  $             20.85 Putney P728N P728N 12/cs  $        54.66 GP 26301 GP26301 6/800/CASE  $        20.62 GP 26301 FJ26301 12/CS $20.94/case GP 26301 26301 12/800  $        20.00 

7593
TOWEL, ROLL, 1 PLY, BROWN, 2" CORE, 7 7/8" X 
350', 12/CS GP GP26008 12/CS

GEORGIA 
PACIFIC 26008 GEO26008 12/CA  $             19.09 Putney P720N P720N 12/cs  $        31.17 GP 26008 GP26008 12/350/CASE  $        18.88 GP 26008 FJ26008 12/CS $19.17/case GP 26008 GJPC26008 12/350  $        18.00 

6590
TOWEL, ROLL, 1 PLY, NATURAL, 1-5/8" CORE, 7-
7/8" X 350' GP GP26401 12/350

GEORGIA 
PACIFIC 26401  G26401  12/CA  $             18.75 Putney P720N P720N 12/cs  $        31.17 GP 26401 GP26401  12/350/CASE  $        18.54 GP 26401 FJ26401 12/CS $18.82/case GP GP26401 PG26401 12-350  $        18.00 

6584
TOWEL, ROLL, 2 PLY, KITCHEN, WHITE, 10-7/10" X 
11" 

KIMBERLY 
CLARK K41482 20/128

KIMBERLY 
CLARK 41482 K41482  EACH  $               1.22 KC 41482 K41428  20/128/CASE  $        26.21 GP 27385 FJ27385 30/85 $19.41/case

CLEAR 
CHOICE 52231 52231 20-128  $        24.80 

6586
TOWEL, ROLL, 2 PLY,KITCHEN, PERFORATED, 
11x8.8, WHITE, ROLL DIAMETER, 5.2", 100 SHT GP GP27300 30/CS

GEORGIA 
PACIFIC 27300 G27300 30/CA  $             21.93 Marcal 6350 6350

30/cs
85 shts/roll  $        29.66 GP 23700 GP23700 30/100/CASE  $        21.69 GP 27300 FJ27300 30/CS $22.01/case GP GP27300 GP27300 30X100  $        21.00 

6591
TOWEL, ROLL, 2PLY, PREFERENCE ULTRA, 
WHITE, 7-7/8"X350', 1-5/8"CORE GP FJ28000 12/350/CS

GEORGIA 
PACIFIC 28000 G28000 12/CA  $             37.73 GP 28000 GP28000 12/350/CASE  $        37.30 GP 28000 FJ28000 12/350/CS $37.88/case GP GP28000 GP28000 12  $        36.50 

6592
TOWEL, ROLL, CENTER PULL, 1 PLY, WHITE, 
PREMIUM, 1-5/8" CORE (FITS DISPENSER S8201) GP GP28124 6/320

GEORGIA 
PACIFIC 28124 G28124 6/CA  $             32.90 GP 28124 GP28124 6/320/CASE  $        32.53 GP 28124 FJ28124 6/320 $33.05/case GP GP28124 GP28124 6/320  $        31.75 

6595
TOWEL, SINGLE FOLD, 1PLY, NATURAL, 
ECONOMY, 10-5/8" X 9-1/2" GP GP23504 4000

GEORGIA 
PACIFIC 23504 G23504 16/CA  $             16.65 Putney P600N P600N 4008/cs  $        21.78 GP 23504 GP23504 4000/CASE  $        16.46 GP 23504 FJ23504 4000 $16.70/case GP GP23504 GP23504 4000  $        16.80 

6589
TOWEL, ULTRA MULTIFOLD, WHITE, 2 PLY 
PREMIUM, 9-1/2" X 9-1/4" GP GP21000 2000

GEORGIA 
PACIFIC 21000 G21000 16/CA  $             18.07 GP 21000 GP21000 2000/CASE  $        17.87 GP 21000 FJ21000 2000 $18.11/case GP GP21000 PG21000 2000  $        17.25 

8146
WIPE, DISINFECTING, LYSOL, LEMON/LIME 
BLOSSOM LYSOL REC77182 6X80 CT/CS LYSOL 77812 RAC77182CT 6/CA  $             30.95 LYSOL 77182 RAC77182 6/80/CASE  $        30.17 Lysol RAC77182 L.RAC77182 6x80ct/cs $32.08/case LYSOL REC77182 REC77182 6X80  $        33.50 

7197
WIPERS, 1 PLY, POP-UP BOX, WYPALL X 70 
WORKHORSE, 10/100 / CS, 

KIMBERLY 
CLARK K4145550 10/100/CS

KIMBERLY 
CLARK 41455 K41455 10/CA  $             46.39 KC 4145550 K4145550 10/100/CASE  $        52.08 Hospeco N-P070IDW HOSN-P070IDW 10/100/CS $49.41/case

KIMBERLY 
CLARK KC41455 KC41455

10X100 
CASE  $      115.00 

6599
WIPERS, TERI, 2PLY, WHITE, 9-3/4"X16-7/8", 10/126 
POP UP BOX KC 434790 10/CS

KIMBERLY 
CLARK 34790 K34790 10/CA  $             49.32 KC 434790 K434790 10/CASE  $        53.70 Hospeco N-P060IDW HOSN-P060IDW 10/125/CS $50.58/case KC 434790 434790 10X126  $        75.00 



Page 4 of  7

MFG NAME MFR PART #
VENDOR PART 

#
 VENDOR UOM 
PKG (SOLD AS) 

VENDOR PKG 
PRICE MFG NAME MFR PART # VENDOR PART #

 VENDOR 
UOM PKG 
(SOLD AS) 

VENDOR 
PKG PRICE MFG NAME 

MFR PART 
# VENDOR PART #

 VENDOR 
UOM PKG 
(SOLD AS) 

VENDOR 
PKG PRICE MFG NAME MFR PART # VENDOR PART #

 VENDOR 
UOM PKG 
(SOLD AS) 

VENDOR 
PKG PRICE MFG NAME MFR PART # VENDOR PART #

 VENDOR 
UOM PKG 
(SOLD AS) 

VENDOR 
PKG PRICE MFG NAME 

MFR PART 
#

VENDOR 
PART #

 VENDOR 
UOM PKG 
(SOLD AS) 

VENDOR 
PKG PRICE MFG NAME MFR PART #

VENDOR PART 
#

 VENDOR UOM 
PKG (SOLD AS) 

VENDOR 
PKG PRICE

Duro 13200056 400/bail  $        49.85 
General Supply/ 

DURO  80076 (1657)

BAGSK1675

400/BD  $        56.99  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

All American 
Poly 2333H-AAP 2333H-AAP 500/case  $         26.12 Interplast ibss243306k 1000/cs  $        32.70 PItt Plastics B73310DK

P32BL 1000/CS

 $        44.72 UPC 33R 33R 1,000.00  $        18.48 Aluf/IBS INT-2433-Reg
As per sample 

#7598A 1,000/Case  $        24.48 

All American 
Poly 2433H-AAP 2433H-AAP 500/case  $         26.12 Interplast ibsvalh2433n8 1000/cs  $        29.40 MPC SV2433N8 MP-SV2433N8 1000/cs.  $        17.00 Berry Plastics HR243308N

24,338.00 1000/CS

 $        48.19 UPC 243308N 243308N 20/50  $        17.47 Aluf/IBS INT-2433-Reg
As per sample 

#7597A 1,000/Case  $        24.48 

All American 
Poly 3340XH-AAP 3340XH-AAP 100/case  $           9.13 Lwell 9759746 100/cs  $        18.16 Inteplast SL3339 IP-SL333915K 100/cs.  $        12.10 Pitt Plastics TI3340S

P40STL 100/CS

 $        31.39 UPC 3340C15 3340C15 100/4  $        13.45 Glopack
INT-3340-Super 

Exh
As per sample 

#7906A 100/Case  $        15.32 

All American 
Poly 4048XH-AAP 4048XH-AAP 125/case  $         20.93 Interplast ibsvalh4048n16 250/cs  $        33.43 MPC VL404816N MP-VL404816N 250/cs.  $        18.00 Berry Plastics HR404816N

404,816.00 250/CS

 $        53.17 UPC 404816N 404816N 10/25  $        19.50 Aluf/IBS INT-4048-XH
As per sample 

#7596A 250/Case  $        28.24 

B&G  BHBP1-6TY 1000/cs  $        23.95 DURO 2645 1/6HID 1000/CS  $        31.18 UPC 1/6 1/6 1,000.00  $        21.50  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

All American 
Poly 3957XXH-AAP 3957XXH-AAP 50/case  $           8.87 Maint pro MPL385820B 100/cs  $        26.10 Inteplast SL-3957200S IP-SL3957200S 50/cs.  $        16.50 Pitt Plastics TI3957S

P56STL

50/CS  $        29.26 UPC 3957S17 3957S17 50/CS  $        17.50 Aluf/IBS
INT-3957-Super 

XH
As per sample 

#7595A 50/Case  $        18.32 

 $              -   KIK Kik International 10BLEACH
KIKBLEACH4

4X1 GAL  $        12.45  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Purebright 24060205 6/cs  $          9.50 KIK KIKBLEACH6 BZ-KIKBLEACH6 6 gal/cs.  $          9.85 Kik International 6BLEACH
KIKBLEACH6

6X1 GAL  $        14.16  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

GARLAND 
NORRIS 9400C/9480G

Z9400C/Z9480G
CHERRY/GREEN 

APPLE C12 19.78$         Lwell KRY PBS 12/cs  $        12.22 Hospeco 1991 HS-01991 Dz.  $        17.83 Fresh Products 12USPB

FRS12USPB

DZ  $        34.80  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Lwell KRY-U03 12/cs  $          8.93 Hospeco 6411 HS-06411 Dz.  $          7.00 Fresh Products 123

URINALBLOCK

DZ  $        11.52  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Lwell UNS-32 1-ea  $          1.54 Contico 120125

BOTTLEQT

EA (100/CS)  $          1.31  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Well WEl42023 1-ea  $          9.45 Boardwalk 20424

BWK20124

EA  $        14.21  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Brute BRU 20136 1-ea  $        10.55 Boardwalk BWK20136

BWK20136

EA  $        28.93  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Bwalk BWK932A-ct 12/cs  $      107.52 Boardwalk UNS932A

BWK932AEA

EA  $        11.74  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Bwalk Bwk932Y 1-ea  $        10.86 ABCO 34BROOM AB-34BROOM Ea.  $          4.90 Boardwalk BWK932YEA

BWK932YEA

EA  $        14.13  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Bwalk Bwk 951WC 12/cs  $      103.81 Boardwalk BWK951WC
BWK951WC

EA (12/BD)  $          9.54  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Lwell 22224PB 1-ea  $        17.95 Malish 24424

24,424.00

EA (12/CS)  $        25.76  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Rmaid RCP 758088YW 35 qt  $        79.36 Contintental 226YW CN-226YW Ea.  $        46.95 Rubbermaid RCP748000YEL

RCP748000YEL

EA  $      108.53  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Rmaid RCP 3351GRA 1-ea  $        17.03 Rubbermaid RCP3351GRA

RCP3351GRA

EA  $        23.41  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Regal/SPC T3

T3

25LB PAIL  $      174.18  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Spartan SPA 7496-04 4/1-gal  $        47.14 Spartan 7116 SP-7116 12 qts/cs.  $        18.50 Spartan 711603 NABC 12QT/CS  $        51.36  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Carroll 76323 12/cs  $        34.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Carroll 76328 4/1-gal  $        35.91 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Betco AMR R92512CT 12/cs  $        29.98 Spartan 7120 SP-7120 12 qts/cs.  $        17.20 Spartan 712003 GERMICIDAL
12X32OZ/C

S  $        48.90  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Spartan SPA 2040-12 12/cs  $        32.26 Spartan 2040 SP-2040 12 qts/cs.  $        24.00 Spartan 204003 TOUGHRTU
12X32OZ/C

S  $        66.88  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Arcot AR07750CS 1-55 gal  $      431.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Spartan SPA 3297-04 4/1-gal  $        59.60 Spartan 3297 SP-3297-4 Gal.  $        10.86 Spartan 329704 ECO1 4X1 GAL/CS  $      123.55  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Diversify DVO903904 4/1-gal  $        30.53 MPC 21870
MP-

MA0218570AA 4gal/cs.  $        18.19 Diversey 4689 STRIDE14 4X1 GAL/CS  $        71.36  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Acme LMN-4 4/1gal  $        32.53 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

P&G PGC02621ct 3/1-gal  $        49.40 P&G 2621 PG-02621 3ga;/cs.  $        40.00 Proctor & Gamble PG02621 PGC02621CT 3X1 GAL/CS  $        66.53  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

P&G PGC41774 4/1-gal  $        73.50 P&G #19 PG-41774 4 gal/cs.  $        58.13 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Spartan SPA 6343 12/cs  $        39.02 Spartan 6343 SP-6343 12/18oz/cs.  $        29.00 Spartan 634300 TNT
12X18OZ/C

S  $        80.90  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Bwalk Bwk 37112A 12/cs  $        31.61 Spartan 3261 SP-3261 12/qts/cs.  $        22.00 Spartan 326103 GLASSRTU
12X32OZ/C

S  $        58.82  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Spartan SPA 6217 12/cs  $        35.79 Spartan 6217 SP-6217 12/18oz/cs.  $        26.50 Spartan 6217 GLASSCLNAERO
12X18OZ/C

S  $        74.18  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

BWalk BWK 3714A 4/1-gal  $        20.10 Spartan 3030 SP-3030-4 Gal.  $          5.22 Spartan 303004 GLASSCLN1 4X1 GAL/CS  $        59.42  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

3M MMM15238 12/cs  $        30.35 3mcommercial MMM15238 MMM15238 12/CS  $        39.49  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Spartan SPA 4840 4/1-gal  $        43.92 Spartan 1013 SP-1013-4 4/1gal/cs.  $        36.12 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Spartan NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Spartan SPA3194-12-C 12/cs  $        35.90 Spartan 3194 SP-3194 12 qts/cs.  $        26.16 Spartan 3194 OVENRTU
12X32OZ/C

S  $        74.43  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Spartan SPA7118-12-C 12/cs  $        27.33 Spartan 7118 SP-7118 12qts/cs.  $        22.00 Spartan 711803 SPARCLING
12X32OZ/C

S  $        56.67  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

713-980-1500 800-440-6050 845-782-6800718-677-1065

713-694-9366 772-334-7979 845-781-2450718-677-9371

HOUSTON, TX 77043 STUART, FL 34957 MONTGOMERY, NY 12549BROOKLYN, NY 11234

NANCY HOLLEY STEVE COOK LEAH ROSENTHALBRIAN MARCUS

MATERA PAPER MORNING STAR INDUSTRIES, INC. INTERBORO PACKAGING CORP.UNIPAK CORP.

1809 BRITTMOORE RD. 819 S. FEDERAL HWY, SUITE 205 114 BRACKEN RD.2766 E. 63RD ST.

ROBIN FINN

800-334-9880

ALL AMERICAN POLY

40 TURNER PLACE

PISCATAWAY, NJ 08854

4111 RICE DRIER ROAD, SUITE 1-F

PEARLAND, TX 77588

CHRIS ORSAK

281-485-0871

281-485-7638

GUQUAY-VARINA, NC 27526

NIKKI KLEIN

732-752-3200 X1124

732-752-2305 800-322-7537

BOB BARKER COMPANY, INC.

134 N. MAIN ST.

AMERICAN PAPER
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P&G PGC58773CT 3/cs  $        39.85 P&G 58773 PG-58773 3 1gal/cs.  $        37.52 Proctor & Gamble 32538 PAG31241 3X1 GAL/CS  $        62.06  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Spartan SPA3200-12 12/cs  $        38.93 Spartan 3200 SP-3200 12 qts/cs.  $        29.00 Spartan 3200 FOAMYRTU
12X32OZ/C

S  $        80.70  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Spartan SPA2216-12 12/cs  $        45.97 Spartan 2216 SP-2216 12qts/cs.  $        34.36 Spartan 221603 OT15QT
12X32OZ/C

S  $        95.30  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Spartan SPA5801-12` 12/cs  $        83.00 Spartan 580100 FENABC
12X32OZ/C

S  $      172.06  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Crown CCH 25601 100-Drum  $        89.07 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Lysol Rec 74828 12/cs  $        77.29 Clorox 38504 CL-38504 12/19oz/cs.  $        51.45 Reckitt Benckiser 74276 RAC74276CT
12X19OZ/C

S  $      114.59  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Spartan SPA 6081 12/cs  $        39.96 Spartan 6081 SP-6081CF 12/15oz/cs.  $        34.27 Spartan 608100 STERIPHENE
12X15OZ/C

S  $        97.50  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Clorox CLO 30651 4/1-gal  $        61.88 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Rmaid RCP 265400GY 1-ea  $        77.30 Rubbermaid 2654GRY RM-2654GRY Ea.  $        17.45 Rubbermaid 2640 RCP264000BK EA  $        78.45  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Lwell LW 5136F 1-ea  $          5.15 ABCO 24536 AB-BH24536 Ea.  $          2.50 Genuine Joe GJO02309EA GJO02309EA EA  $          7.15  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Tmist TMS 2960 12/cs  $        47.25 Hospeco 7917 HS-07917 12/7oz/cs.  $        30.62 Time Mist TMS2960 TMS332960TMCT
12X6.6 
OZ/CS  $        73.73  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Bwalk BWK 355LBX 100/bx  $          5.81 ANSELL 69210L ANS69210L 10/100/CS  $      132.32 
Med 

Pride/Elara
Med Pride/Elara-

Lrg-LG
As per sample 

#6479

100/Box, 10 
Boxes/Case 

(1,000)
 $38.00 all 

sizes 

Bwalk BWK 355XLBX 100/bx  $          5.81 ANSELL 69210XL ANS69210XL 10/100/CS  $      132.64 
Med 

Pride/Elara
Med Pride/Elara-

XL-LG
As per sampe 

#6480

100/Box, 10 
Boxes/Case 

(1,000)
 $38.00 all 

sizes 

Bwalk BWK 183L 12/pk  $        19.80 Boardwalk 242L BWK242L 12/DZ  $        15.06  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Bwalk HOSGL-N1050rfl 100/bx  $        14.70 ANSELL 92675L ANS92675L 100/BOX  $        13.81 
Med 

Pride/Elara
Med Pride/Elara-

Lrg-NPFG
As per sample 

#7584 100/Box
 $3.90 all 

sizes 

Bwalk HOSGL-N1050RFX 100/bx  $        14.70 ANSELL 92675XL ANS92675XL 100/BOX  $        13.81 
Med 

Pride/Elara
Med Pride/Elara-

XL-NPFG
As per sample 

#7585 100/Box
 $3.90 all 

sizes 

Ambitex TRALL 05201 100/bx  $          8.35 ANSELL 69318L ANS69318L 10/100/CS  $      110.40 
Med 

Pride/Elara
Med Pride/Elara-

Lrg-LPFG-E
As per sample 

#7235

100/Box, 10 
Boxes/Case 

(1,000)
 $42.00 all 

sizes 

Ambitex TRALYL 5201 100/bx  $          8.35 Boardwalk 310LBX BWK310LBX 100/BX  $          6.30 
Med 

Pride/Elara
Med Pride/Elara-

Lrg-VPFG
As per sample 

#7586 100/Box
 $2.70 all 

sizes 

Bwalk BRU 136 1-ea  $          3.62 ABCO 1123 AB-01123 Ea.  $          2.65 Boardwalk 136 BWK136 EA  $          4.72  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Rmaid RCPH146 1-ea  $        20.51 Wilen 60CL 60CL EA  $        23.90  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Bwalk BWK 620 1-ea  $          8.47 Boardwalk 620 BWK620 EA  $        11.02  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Renown Ren02604 1-ea  $        11.48 ABCO 1208 AB-01208NB Ea.  $          7.25 Wilen 60J 60J EA  $        21.25  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Unisan uns 1490 1-ea  $        10.54 ABCO 01406NB AB-01406NB Ea.  $          7.24 Wilen DMH DMH EA  $        16.06  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Spartan SPA6820 12/cs  $        56.98 Spartan WASP SBWASP
12X20OZ/C

S  $      118.21  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Premier AB50 11-ea  $        16.35 Premier 9571 AR-9571 50lb Box  $        43.90 Premier 4377050P CPI5016 50LB BOX  $        44.62  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

BWK BWK 542 CT 12/cs  $      105.81 Golden Star 306W GD-AST30BWM Ea.  $          4.10 Continental A03512 MFM EA  $        15.74  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

BWK BWK 124C 6/cs  $        51.84 ABCO 5012 AB-A605012 Ea.  $          2.50 Unisan UNS124C 24MOS EA  $        22.40  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Rmaid RCP 1255 12/cs  $      121.27 ABCO 11536W AB-DDTL11536W Ea.  $          4.40 Continental C057036 536DMH EA  $        23.14  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Bwk BWK 7160CT 12/cs  $        75.30 Unisan UNS116R 716R EA  $        14.19  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

RMaid RCV119 12/cs  $        63.36 
Continental - 

Wilen A401132 32CCL DZ  $        13.28  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

BOB 
BARKER 250IN-C 250IM-C C250  $        20.40 Hospeco HOS250iM 250/cs  $        18.80 HOSPECO? MT4 147GARD 250/CS  $      103.39  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

BWK BWK 196 20/cs  $          5.64 Americo 510161 69GP 3X20/CS  $        29.44  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

BWK BWK4017HIP 5/cs  $        22.50 Americo 400117 17MSTRP 5/CS  $        28.38  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

RMaid RCP2005CHA 1-ea  $          5.62 Rubbermaid 2005 RCP2005CHA EA  $          7.44  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Spartan SPA3025-12 12/cs  $      122.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Josco 6165C 25WR 25/BX  $        42.40  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Boardwalk BWK16BLUCLOTH BWK16BLUCLOTH 24/PK  $        17.76  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

RMaid RCP2655GR 3/cs  $      257.33 Rubbermaid 265500 RM-265500GRY Ea.  $        56.00 Rubbermaid 2655GRAY RCP265500GY EA  $      119.07  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

RMaid RCP2655Red 3/cs  $      257.33 Rubbermaid 2655RED RCP2655REDCT 3/CT  $      366.21  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

RMaid RCP2655WH1ct 3/cs  $      257.33 Rubbermaid 2655WHITE RCP2655WHICT 3/CT  $      366.21  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

RMaid RCP265400GY 1-ea  $          6.94 Rubbermaid 2654GRY RM-2654GRY Ea.  $        18.11 Rubbermaid 2654GRAY RCP265400GY EA  $        40.18  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

RMaid RCP295600BK 1-ea  $          6.94 Rubbermaid 2956 RM-2956BLK Ea.  $          4.18 Rubbermaid 2956BLA RCP295600BK EA  $          8.78  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Off DVOCB018425CT 12/cs  $        68.92 Drackett 18425
LG-

DVOCB018425 12/6oz/cs.  $        72.00 Diversey CB018425 DVOCB018425CT 12X6OZ/CA  $        83.68  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 
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GOJ GOJ 9651-24 24/cs  $        49.04 GOJO 9652-12 GJ-9652-12 12/6oz/cs.  $        43.00 GOJO 9652-12 GOJ9652-12 12X8OZ/CA  $        55.14  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Purell GOJ911306CT 6/cs  $        69.90 GOJO 9031-06 GOJ9031-06
175/CN 
6CN/CA  $        57.18  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Purell GOJ2965124 24/cs  $        48.87 GOJO 9651-24 GJ-9651-24 24/4oz./cs.  $        44.40 GOJO 9651-24 GOJ9651-24
24X4.25OZ/

CA  $        56.83  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Johnson JWP05432 4/1-gal  $      153.84 Johnson 5432 JW-5432 4gal/cs.  $        93.44 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID  NO BID  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Colgate CPC46303ct 9/cs  $        23.89 Colgate Palmolive 46303 CPC46303CT 9X28OZ  $        30.51  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Colgate CPC46112ct 12/cs  $        46.14 P&G Dawn 45112 PG-45112 8/38oz/cs.  $        33.10 Colgate Palmolive 46112 CPC46112CT 12X25OZ  $        60.30  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Colgate CPC04915 4/gal  $        59.58 P&G Dawn 57445 PG-57445 4 gal/cs.  $        48.45 Colgate Palmolive 4910 CPC04910CT 4X1 GAL/CS  $        22.98  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Colgate CPC04917 5-Gal  $        71.45 P&G Dawn 2611 PG-02611 5 gal.  $        61.50 Colgate Palmolive 4911 PAL5 5 GAL  $              -    NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Deb SBSAZU1G 6/cs  $        64.20 DEB ANT1L ABFW 6X1L/CS  $      114.43  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Dial DIA84014CT 12/cs  $        30.81 Kutol 5019 KU-5019
12/8oz 

pumps/cs  $        28.40 Dial 84014 DIA84014CT
12X7.5OZ/C

S  $        43.44  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

GOJ GOJ 1845 4/cs  $        42.34 GOJO 1845 J-1845-04 Gal.  $          9.17 GOJO 1845-04 GOJ1845-04 4X1 GAL/CS  $        48.13  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

GOJ GOJ095504CT 4/cs  $        70.15 GOJO 0955-04 GJ-0955-04 4gal/cs.  $        15.88 GOJO 0955-04 GOJ0955-04 4X1 GAL/CS  $        81.18  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Stinger #701 1-55 gal  $      258.88 Spartan 3002 SP-3002-55 55 gal.  $      345.17 Spartan 300255 CUSTOM55
55 GAL 
DRUM  $      905.73  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Jpak IMP5900 1-ea  $          1.25 Contico 110246 TRIGQT EA  $          0.99  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Sorball SW 3000 1-ea  $        16.75 SORB-ALL OIL50 SOR50RED 50 LB  $        26.69  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

TBL TBL B101403WH 1-roll  $        19.63 Tidi Products 503 503 RL  $        20.38  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

BOB 
BARKER TAM500 TAM500 C500  $        59.50 P&G PGC025001 500/cs  $        66.62 Hospeco T500 HS-T500 500/cs.  $        62.50 Proctor & Gamble T500 PGC025001 500/CT  $        84.42  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

KCC KCC 21400 36/100  $        46.64 Solaris 11513 SI-11513 30/100/cs.  $        17.87 Kimberly Clark 21400 KCC21400
100/BX 

36BX/CT  $        78.70  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

GP GPT19378 18/1500  $        60.13 GP 19378 GP-19378 18/1500/cs.  $        32.70 Georgia Pacific 19378 GP19378
1500FT/RL 
18RL/CS  $        90.74  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

GP GPT12798 8/1000  $        40.53 MPC 1000 MP-MPC1000 12/1000  $        23.00 Georgia Pacific 12798 GPC12798
1000FT/RL 

8RL/CT  $        57.07  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

KCC KCC07805 12/cs  $        76.97 MPC 1000 MP-MPC1000 12/1000  $        23.00 Kimberly Clark 7805 KCC07805
1000FT/RL 
12RL/CT  $      107.44  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Empress BT 4535500 96/cs  $        44.96 MPC 42375 MP-MPC42375 96/500  $        31.00 Boardwalk 6180 BWK6180
/RL  

96RL/CT  $        57.34  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

GP GPT28143 4/cs  $        66.37 GP 28143 GP-28143 4/560/cs.  $        37.00 Georgia Pacific 28143 GPC28143
560/RL 
4RL/CT  $        91.97  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

GP GPT23304 16/cs  $        34.57 GP 23304 GP-23304 4000/cs.  $        15.30 Georgia Pacific 23304 GP23304

 
16PK/CS = 

4000  $        41.42  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

GP GPT26301 6/cs  $        39.06 GP 26301 GP-26301 6/800'/cs.  $        20.94 Georgia Pacific 26301 GP26301
800FT.RL 
6RL/CS  $        53.15  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

GP GPT26008 12/cs  $        40.18 GP 26401 GP-26401 12/350  $        18.82 Georgia Pacific 26008 GP26008
350FT/RL 
12RL/CS  $        58.19  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

GP GPT26401  12/cs  $        35.06 GP 26401 GP-26401  12/350/cs.  $        18.82 Georgia Pacific 26401 GPC26401
350FT/RL 
12RL/CT  $        53.54  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

KCC KCC 41482  20/cs  $        33.84 KC 41482 KC-41482  20/128/cs.  $        22.50 Kimberly Clark 41482 KCC41482
 128/RL 
20RL/CT  $        48.66  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

GP GPT27300 30/cs  $        37.04 GP 27300 GP-27300 30/100/cs.  $        22.00 Georgia Pacific 27300 GP27300 30/CS  $        57.42  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

GP GPT28000 12/cs  $        75.17 GP Georgia Pacific 28000 GPC28000
350FT/RL 
12RL/CT  $      113.15  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

GP GPT28124 6/cs  $        57.80 GP 28124 GP-28124 6/320/cs.  $        33.10 Georgia Pacific 28124 GP28124
320FT/RL 
6RL/CS  $        86.35  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

GP GPT23504 16/pk  $        27.36 Bay West 47000 BW-47000 4020/cs.  $        16.90 Georgia Pacific 23504 GP23504

250/PK 
16PK/CS = 

4000  $        42.08  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

GP GPT21000 16/cs  $        31.65 GP193 21000 GP-21000 2000/cs.  $        18.11 Georgia Pacific 21000 GPC21000

125/PK 
16PK/CT = 

2000  $        45.22  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Reckitt RAC77182CT 6/cs  $        32.70 Lysol 77182 LG-REC77182 6/80/cs.  $        32.90 Reckitt Benckiser 77182 RAC77182CT
80/CN 

6CN/CT  $        44.38  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

KCC KCC 41455 10/100cs  $      115.34 Kimberly Clark 41455 KCC41455
100/BX 

10BX/CT  $      166.85  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

KCC KCC 34790 10/cs  $        86.61 Kimberly Clark 34790 KCC34790CT
126/BX 

10BX/CT  $      122.05  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 
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 BID "B" BID "C" BID "D" BID "E"

Aluf/IBS INT-2433-L
As per sample 

#7598B 1,000/Case  $        16.24 Aluf/IBS INT-2433-L
As per sample 

#7598B 1,000/Case  $        16.24 Aluf/IBS INT-2433-L
As per sample 

#7598B 1,000/Case  $        16.24 Aluf/IBS INT-2433-L
As per sample 

#7598B 1,000/Case  $        16.24 

Aluf/IBS INT-2433-L
As per sample 

#7597B 1,000/Case  $        16.24 Aluf/IBS INT-2433-L
As per sample 

#7597B 1,000/Case  $        16.24 Aluf/IBS INT-2433-L
As per sample 

#7597B 1,000/Case  $        16.24 Aluf/IBS INT-2433-L
As per sample 

#7597B 1,000/Case  $        16.24 

Glopack
INT-3340-

Exh
As per sample 

#7906B 100/Case  $        12.48 Aluf/IBS INT-3340-X-Hvy
As per sample 

#7906C 100/Case  $          9.82 Aluf/IBS INT-3340-Hvy
As per sample 

#7906D 100/Case  $          7.98 Aluf/IBS INT-3340-Med
As per sample 

#7906E 100/Case  $          6.82 

Aluf/IBS
INT-4048-X-

Hvy
As per sample 

#7596B 250/Case  $        24.74 Aluf/IBS INT-4048-H
As per sample 

#7596C 250/Case  $        21.34 Aluf/IBS INT-4048-Med
As per sample 

#7596D 250/Case  $        19.82 Aluf/IBS INT-4048-Med
As per sample 

#7596D 250/Case  $        19.82 

 NB  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB  NB 

Aluf/IBS
INT-3957-
Super Exh

As per sample 
#7595B 50/Case  $        16.84 Glopak INT-3957-Exh

As per sample 
#7595C 50/Case  $        12.48 Aluf/IBS INT-3957-XH

As per sample 
#7595D 50/Case  $        11.24 Aluf/IBS INT-3957-X-Hvy

As per sample 
#7595E 50/Case  $          9.34 

INTERBORO PACKAGING CORP. ADDITIONAL ITEMS
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