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1.1 HERBICIDE, 48% ISOPROPYLAMINE – (ROUND UP PRO) –PRIMARY AWARD 

  

ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

1.1   ROUNDUP PRO (48% Isopropylamine Salt 

of Glyphosate) ITEM ID UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price 

Loaded onto 

Co. Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

1.67 GALLON JUGS 824 GAL $23.35 $23.35 $38.99 $38.99

List any additional sizes: 826 30 GAL $22.00 $22.00 $660.00 $660.00

Surfactant - NAME

 Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567

 State Mixing Rate 

DELIVERY: ____________DAYS ARO

HOUSTON, TX 77039

A.J. THIBODEAUX

CROP PRODUCTION SERVICE

13622 E.HARDY RD.

PRIMARY AWARD

SPREADER 90

281-590-5043

A.J. THIBODEAUX

713-705-9800

5 WORKING DAYS

$16.00

1 TO 2 QTS P/100

 
 

1.1  HERBICIDE, 48% ISOPROPYLAMINE – (ROUND UP PRO) – SECONDARY AWARD 

 

ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

1.1   ROUNDUP PRO (48% Isopropylamine Salt 

of Glyphosate) ITEM ID UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price 

Loaded onto 

Co. Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

1.67 GALLON JUGS 824 GAL $25.20 $25.20 $42.08 $42.08

List any additional sizes: 826 30 GAL $23.85 $23.85 $715.50 $715.50

Surfactant - NAME

 Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567

 State Mixing Rate 

DELIVERY: ____________DAYS ARO 5 - 7 DAYS

318-425-5944

318-227-3032

TIFFANY MEGUESS

409-296-4097

FAX: 409-296-3273

RRSI NIS

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC.

1324 NORTH HEARN AVE., SUITE 120

SHREVEPORT, LA 71107

JESSE CULBERTSON

JESSE CULBERTSON

$8.50

1 QUART / 100 GALLONS

SECONDARY AWARD
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1.1  ALTERNATE, HERBICIDE, 48% ISOPROPYLAMIN – (MAD DOG PLUS) 

 

ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

 ALTERNATE FOR ROUNDUP PRO:  ITEM ID UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price 

Loaded onto 

Co. Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

List Name

1 gallon size NO BID - - - -

2-1/2 gallon size UPON REQUEST GAL $11.10 $11.10 $27.75 $27.75

30 gallon drum UPON REQUEST GAL $10.80 $10.80 $324.00 $324.00

Surfactant appropriate for use 

with_____________

Surfactant - NAME

Surfactant Price Per Gallon UPON REQUEST

State Mixing Rate

$16.00

1 TO 2 QTS P/100

281-590-5043

PRIMARY AWARD

MAD DOG PLUS

MAD DOG PLUS

SPREADER 90

CROP PRODUCTION SERVICE

13622 E.HARDY RD.

HOUSTON, TX 77039

A.J. THIBODEAUX

A.J. THIBODEAUX

713-705-9800

 
 

 

1.1  ALTERNATE, HERBICIDE, 48% ISOPROPYLAMIN – (RANGER PRO) 

ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

 ALTERNATE FOR ROUNDUP PRO:  ITEM ID UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price 

Loaded onto 

Co. Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

List Name

1 gallon size NO BID - - - -

2-1/2 gallon size UPON REQUEST GAL $11.25 $11.25 $28.13 $28.13

30 gallon drum UPON REQUEST GAL $10.85 $10.85 $325.50 $325.50

Surfactant appropriate for use 

with_____________

Surfactant - NAME

Surfactant Price Per Gallon UPON REQUEST

State Mixing Rate

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

10841 LATIGO CT.

RICK BENNETT

COLLEGE STATION, TX 77845

979-268-5206

936-372-1509

1 QUART / 100 GALLONS

INLET 90

RICK BENNETT

$13.25

SECONDARY AWARD

RANGER PRO

RANGER PRO
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1.2 HERBICIDE,CONCENTRATE, 50.2% ISOPROPYLAMINE – (ROUND UP PRO CONCENTRATE)  

PRIMARY AWARD 

ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

1.2   ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE (50.2% 

Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate) ITEM ID UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price 

Loaded onto 

Co. Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

1 gallon size NO BID - - - -

2-1/2 gallon size 2682 GAL $14.84 $14.84 $37.10 $37.10

30 gallon drum 2661 GAL. $14.24 $14.24 $427.20 $427.20

Surfactant - NAME

 Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567

 State Mixing Rate 

DELIVERY: ____________DAYS ARO

713-705-9800

281-590-5043

PRIMARY AWARD

SPREADER 90

$16.00

1 TO 2 QTS P/100

5 WORKING DAYS

CROP PRODUCTION SERVICE

13622 E.HARDY RD.

HOUSTON, TX 77039

A.J. THIBODEAUX

A.J. THIBODEAUX

 
 

1.2 HERBICIDE,CONCENTRATE, 50.2% ISOPROPYLAMINE – (ROUND UP PRO CONCENTRATE)  

 SECONDARY AWARD 

 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

1.2   ROUNDUP PRO CONCENTRATE (50.2% 

Isopropylamine Salt of Glyphosate) UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price 

Loaded onto 

Co. Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

1 gallon size NO BID - - - -

2-1/2 gallon size 2682 GAL $16.25 $16.25 $40.63 $40.63

30 gallon drum 2661 GAL $16.00 $16.00 $480.00 $480.00

Surfactant - NAME

 Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567

 State Mixing Rate 

DELIVERY: ____________DAYS ARO 3 DAYS

SECONDARY AWARD

$13.25

1 QUART / 100 GALLONS

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

COLLEGE STATION, TX 77845

10841 LATIGO CT.

RICK BENNETT

RICK BENNETT

INLET 90

979-268-5206

936-372-1509
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1.3 HERBICIDE, AQUATIC,(53.5% ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE) – (RODEO) –  

 PRIMARY AWARD 

 

ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

1.3  RODEO   (53.5% Isopropylamine Salt of 

Glyphosate). ITEM ID UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price Loaded 

onto Co. 

Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

1 gallon size NO BID - - - -

2-1/2 gallon size 828 GAL $18.50 $18.50 $46.25 $46.25

30 gallon drum 829 GAL $18.25 $18.25 $547.50 $547.50

Surfactant - NAME

Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567

State Mixing Rate

DELIVERY: ____________DAYS ARO

INLET 90

$13.25

1 QUART / 100 GALLONS

3 DAYS

936-372-1509

PRIMARY AWARD

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

10841 LATIGO CT.

COLLEGE STATION, TX 77845

RICK BENNETT

RICK BENNETT

979-268-5206

 
 

1.3 HERBICIDE, AQUATIC,(53.5% ISOPROPYLAMINE SALT OF GLYPHOSATE) – (RODEO) –  

 SECONDARY AWARD 

 

ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

1.3  RODEO   (53.5% Isopropylamine Salt of 

Glyphosate). ITEM ID UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price Loaded 

onto Co. 

Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

1 gallon size NO BID - - - -

2-1/2 gallon size 828 GAL $19.50 $19.50 $48.75 $48.75

30 gallon drum 829 GAL $19.25 $19.25 $577.50 $577.50

Surfactant - NAME

Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567

State Mixing Rate

DELIVERY: ____________DAYS ARO

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC.

1324 NORTH HEARN AVE., SUITE 120

RRSI NIS

$8.50

SHREVEPORT, LA 71107

JESSE CULBERTSON

JESSE CULBERTSON

1 QUART / 100 GALLONS

5 - 7 DAYS

318-425-5944

318-227-3032

TIFFANY MEGUESS

409-296-4097

FAX: 409-296-3273

SECONDARY AWARD
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1.3  ALTERNATE, HERBICIDE, AQUATIC, 53.5% ISOPROPYLAMINE – (AQUA NEAT) 

 

ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

  ALTERNATE  FOR RODEO: ITEM ID UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price 

Loaded onto 

Co. Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

Name

1 gallon size NO BID - - - -

2-1/2 gallon size UPON REQUEST GAL $15.15 $15.15 $37.88 $37.88

30 gallon drum UPON REQUEST GAL $14.95 $14.95 $448.50 $448.50

Surfactant appropriate for use with 

____________ having TNRCC approval for 

aquatic use. UPON REQUEST

Surfactant - NAME

Surfactant Price Per Gallon

State Mixing Rate

DELIVERY: ____________DAYS ARO

AQUANEAT

AQUANEAT

SPREADER 90

$16.00

1 TO 2 QTS P/100

281-590-5043

PRIMARY AWARD

5 WORKING DAYS

CROP PRODUCTION SERVICE

13622 E.HARDY RD.

HOUSTON, TX 77039

A.J. THIBODEAUX

A.J. THIBODEAUX

713-705-9800

 
 

1.4 ALTERNATE, HERBICIDE, AQUATIC, 53.5% ISOPROPYLAMINE – (ROUND UP CUSTOM ATU) 

 

ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

  ALTERNATE  FOR RODEO: ITEM ID UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price 

Loaded onto 

Co. Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

Name

1 gallon size NO BID - - - -

2-1/2 gallon size UPON REQUEST GAL $16.59 $16.59 $41.48 $41.48

30 gallon drum UPON REQUEST GAL $15.99 $15.99 $479.70 $479.70

Surfactant appropriate for use with 

____________ having TNRCC approval for 

aquatic use. UPON REQUEST

Surfactant - NAME

Surfactant Price Per Gallon

State Mixing Rate

DELIVERY: ____________DAYS ARO

TARGET SPECIALITY PRODUCTS

1225 N. POST OAK RD.

713-682-4374

SECONDARY AWARD

ROUNDUP CUSTOM ATU

TARGET PRO SPREADER ACTIVATOR

ROUNDUP CUSTOM ATU

$14.56

16-32 OZ. PER 100 GALLONS OF MIX

1 - 7 DAYS

HOUSTON, TX 77055

MIKE NICHOLS

MIKE NICHOLS

713-682-4411
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1.4  HERBICIDE, 31.8% TRICLOPYR ACID – (GARLON 3A) – PRIMARY AWARD 

 

ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

 1.4  GARLON 3A (31.8% Triclopyr Acid, 3 

lb./gal.)  ITEM ID UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price 

Loaded onto 

Co. Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

1 gallon size 830 NO BID - - - -

2-1/2 gallon size 831 GAL $57.95 $57.95 $144.88 $144.88

30 gallon drum 832 GAL $57.95 $57.95 $1,738.50 $1,738.50

Surfactant - NAME

Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567

State Mixing Rate

DELIVERY: ____________DAYS ARO

SPREADER 90

$16.00

1 TO 2 QTS P/100

5 WORKING DAYS

281-590-5043

PRIMARY AWARD

CROP PRODUCTION SERVICE

13622 E.HARDY RD.

HOUSTON, TX 77039

A.J. THIBODEAUX

A.J. THIBODEAUX

713-705-9800

 
 

1.4  HERBICIDE, 31.8% TRICLOPYR ACID – (GARLON 3A) – SECONDARY AWARD 

ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

 1.4  GARLON 3A (31.8% Triclopyr Acid, 3 

lb./gal.)  ITEM ID UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price 

Loaded onto 

Co. Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

1 gallon size 830 NO BID - - - -

2-1/2 gallon size 831 GAL $62.50 $62.50 $156.25 $156.25

30 gallon drum 832 GAL $62.50 $62.50 $1,875.00 $1,875.00

Surfactant - NAME

Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567

State Mixing Rate

DELIVERY: ____________DAYS ARO

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

10841 LATIGO CT.

INLET 90

$13.25

COLLEGE STATION, TX 77845

RICK BENNETT

RICK BENNETT

1 QUART / 100 GALLONS

3 DAYS

979-268-5206

936-372-1509

SECONDARY AWARD
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1.5 HERBICIDE, 27.76% PYRIDINE CARBOXYLIC – (ARSENAL) - PRIMARY AWARD 

 

ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

1.5   ARSENAL (Pyridine carboxylic acid with 

propanamine salt - 27.76%, Inert ingredients - 

72.4%) - Low Usage Item ITEM ID

POLARIS OR 

ARSENAL

UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price Loaded 

onto Co. 

Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

1 gallon size NO BID - - - -

2-1/2 gallon size 833 GAL $51.50 $51.50 $128.75 $128.75

15 gallon drum 2159 GAL $51.00 $51.00 $765.00 $765.00

30 gallon drum 834 GAL $51.00 $51.00 $1,530.00 $1,530.00

Surfactant - NAME

Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567

State Mixing Rate

DELIVERY: ____________DAYS ARO

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

10841 LATIGO CT.

COLLEGE STATION, TX 77845

RICK BENNETT

RICK BENNETT

979-268-5206

936-372-1509

PRIMARY AWARD

INLET 90

$13.25

1 QUART / 100 GALLONS

3 DAYS  
1.5 HERBICIDE, 27.76% PYRIDINE CARBOXYLIC – (ARSENAL) – SECONDARY AWARD 

ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

1.5   ARSENAL (Pyridine carboxylic acid with 

propanamine salt - 27.76%, Inert ingredients - 

72.4%) - Low Usage Item ITEM ID UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price Loaded 

onto Co. 

Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

1 gallon size NO BID - - - -

2-1/2 gallon size 833 GAL $52.90 $52.90 $132.25 $132.25

15 gallon drum 2159 GAL $52.50 $52.50 $787.50 $787.50

30 gallon drum 834 GAL $52.00 $52.00 $1,560.00 $1,560.00

Surfactant - NAME

Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567

State Mixing Rate

DELIVERY: ____________DAYS ARO

$8.50

1 QUART / 100 GALLONS

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC.

1324 NORTH HEARN AVE., SUITE 120

SECONDARY AWARD

5 - 7 DAYS

RRSI NIS

JESSE CULBERTSON

318-425-5944

318-227-3032

SHREVEPORT, LA 71107

JESSE CULBERTSON

TIFFANY MEGUESS

409-296-4097

FAX: 409-296-3273
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1.6 HERBICIDE, 22% AMMONIUM SALT OF IMAZAPIC – (PLATEAU) – PRIMARY AWARD 

 
ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

 1.6   PLATEAU { (+)-2- [4,5-dihydro-4-methyl-4-

(1-methylethy)-5-oxo-1H-imidazol-2-yl]1-5-

methyl-3pyridine carboxylic acid} - not less 

than 22%. Inert ingredients - 76.4% - Low 

Usage Item ITEM ID UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price 

Loaded onto 

Co. Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price Loaded 

onto Co. 

Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

1 gallon size 1460 GAL $117.85 $117.85 $117.85 $117.85 - - - - -

2-1/2 gallon size 2162 NO BID - - - - NO BID - - - -

15 gallon size 2163 GAL $117.85 $117.85 $1,767.75 $1,767.75 NO BID - - - -

30 gallon drum AS NEEDED NO BID - - - - GAL $120.00 $120.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00

Surfactant - NAME

Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567

State Mixing Rate

DELIVERY: ____________DAYS ARO

P R I M A R Y  A W A R D

318-425-5944

5 WORKING DAYS

SPREADER 90

$16.00

SHREVEPORT, LA 71107

A.J. THIBODEAUX JESSE CULBERTSON

RRSI NIS

1 QUART / 100 GALLONS

$8.50

281-590-5043 318-227-3032

TIFFANY MEGUESS

409-296-4097

FAX: 409-296-3273

5 - 7 DAYS

1 TO 2 QTS P/100

CROP PRODUCTION SERVICE RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC.

13622 E.HARDY RD. 1324 NORTH HEARN AVE., SUITE 120

A.J. THIBODEAUX JESSE CULBERTSON

713-705-9800

HOUSTON, TX 77039

 
 

1.6  HERBICIDE, 22% AMMONIUM SALT OF IMAZAPIC – (PLATEAU) – SECONDARY AWARD 

 

ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

 1.6   PLATEAU { (+)-2- [4,5-dihydro-4-methyl-4-

(1-methylethy)-5-oxo-1H-imidazol-2-yl]1-5-

methyl-3pyridine carboxylic acid} - not less 

than 22%. Inert ingredients - 76.4% - Low 

Usage Item ITEM ID UOM

 Price/gal. 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price/gal. 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price 

Loaded onto 

Co. Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

1 gallon size 1460 GAL $122.00 $122.00 $122.00 $122.00

2-1/2 gallon size 2162 NO BID - - - -

15 gallon size 2163 GAL $120.00 $120.00 $1,800.00 $1,800.00

30 gallon drum 2164 NO BID - - - -

Surfactant - NAME

Surfactant Price Per Gallon 7567

State Mixing Rate

DELIVERY: ____________DAYS ARO 3 DAYS

$13.25

1 QUART / 100 GALLONS

SECONDARY AWARD

INLET 90

936-372-1509

RICK BENNETT

979-268-5206

COLLEGE STATION, TX 77845

RICK BENNETT

HELENA CHEMICAL COMPANY

10841 LATIGO CT.
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1.7 SPREADER, STICKER, DISPOSITION AID, DRIFT RETARDANT  

 

ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

1.7  DRIF-TROL 2 Deposition Aid – Drift 

Retardant (Polyvinyl Polymer (Polyacrylamide) 

36%; Constituents. Ineffective as Spray 

Adjuvant 64%).  ITEM ID

BIDDING 

ELITE 

SECURE 

ULTRA

UOM

 Price 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price 

Loaded onto 

Co. Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

1 quart 2172 QT $9.50 $9.50 $9.50 $9.50

1 gallon size 1020 GAL $27.50 $27.50 $27.50 $27.50

2-1/2 gallon size NO BID

30 gallon drum NO BID - - - -

RED RIVER SPECIALTIES, INC.

1324 NORTH HEARN AVE., SUITE 120

BIDDING ELITE SECURE ULTRA

PRIMARY AWARD

318-227-3032

TIFFANY MEGUESS

409-296-4097

FAX: 409-296-3273

JESSE CULBERTSON

318-425-5944

SHREVEPORT, LA 71107

JESSE CULBERTSON

 
 

1.8 DYE, HERBICIDE  

 

ITB #15-70 HERBICIDES 

BIDDERS  NAME

CONTACT

QUOTED BY

TELEPHONE 

NUMBER

FAX NUMBER

Person to contact

for placing orders

I.0  SUPPLY OF HERBICIDE MATERIALS

1.8  DYE, HERBICIDE, TURF MARK, LOCATE 

BLUE OR EQUIVALENT. ITEM ID UOM

 Price 

Loaded Onto 

Co. Trucks 

 Price 

Delivered 

Extended 

Price 

Loaded onto 

Co. Trucks

Extended 

Price 

Delivered

1 quart 1495 QT $13.95 $13.95 $13.95 $13.95

1 gallon size - - - - -

2-1/2 gallon size 2173 GAL $24.35 $24.35 $60.88 $60.88

30 gallon drum - - - - -

DELIVERY: ____________DAYS ARO 5 WORKING DAYS

281-590-5043

PRIMARY AWARD

CROP PRODUCTION SERVICE

13622 E.HARDY RD.

HOUSTON, TX 77039

A.J. THIBODEAUX

A.J. THIBODEAUX

713-705-9800
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