

BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION
ITB # 17-05 VEHICLES

OPEN DATE:	RESPONDENT'S NAME	GRAPEVINE DCJ, LLC	SAM PACKS FIVE STAR FORD	CALDWELL COUNTRY CHEVROLET	CALDWELL COUNTRY FORD	
FRIDAY, OCTOBER 28, 2016	ADDRESS	2601 WILLIAM D. TATE AVE	1635 I35E	P.O. BOX 27	P.O. BOX 27	
2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME		GRAPEVINE, TX 76051	CARROLLTON, TX 75006	CALDWELL, TX 77836	CALDWELL, TX 77836	
	QUOTED BY:	DENNIS THOMAS	KEVIN MOORE	AVERYT KNAPP	AVERYT KNAPP	
	TELEPHONE NUMBER:	817-410-7541	972-242-6415	979-567-6116	979-567-6116	
	FAX NUMBER:	817-410-7502	972-245-5278	979-567-0853	979-567-0853	
1.0 QTY TWO (2), 2017 FORD EXPLORER XLT, LEATHER SEATS, V6 ENGINE, EXTERIOR COLOR WHITE (FOR COUNTY JUDGE OFFICE)						
TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE		\$31,172.00	\$32,306.00	NO BID	\$31,540.00	
EXTERIOR COLOR WHITE MFR. NAME		PW7 WHITE KNUCKLE	YZ-OXFORD WHITE	NO BID	WHITE	
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES		BLACK OR LIGHT FROST BEIGE	LT CAMEL OR EBONY BLACK	NO BID	EBONY BLACK, MEDIUM LIGHT CAMEL	
MAKE AND MDEL QUOTED		2017 DODGE DURANGO GT WDDH75	2017 XLT 202A PKG TO GET LEATHER REG	NO BID	FORD EXPLORER XLT K7D	
VENDOR TO LIST ALL INCLUDED STANDARD EQUIPMENT AND STANDARD FEATURES		ATTACHED ITEM #1 & #2	SEE ATTACHED	NO BID	SEE ATTACHED "WINDOW STICKER" EVERYTHING LISTED IS INCLUDED IN BID PRICE.	
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE	TOW PACKAGE	\$995.00	99H 2.3 L ECOBOOST	\$495.00	NO BID	NO BID
	PREMIUM GROUP	\$2,395.00	CLASS III TRAILER TOW	\$570.00	NO BID	NO BID
	CONVENIENCE	\$1,195.00	TECHNOLOGY PKG	\$1,095.00	NO BID	NO BID
	SINGLE CD	\$495.00	COLDWEATHER PKG	N/A	NO BID	NO BID
	BLACK TOP PACKAGE	\$595.00	20" POLISHED WHEELS	\$1,295.00	NO BID	NO BID
	GATE	\$1,495.00	TWIN PANEL MOON ROOF	\$1,695.00	NO BID	NO BID
	REAR DVD	\$1,995.00	FLOOR LINERS	\$120.00	NO BID	NO BID
	BRASS MONKEY PACKAGE	\$595.00	ROOF CROSS BARS	\$140.00	NO BID	NO BID
	2ND ROW CAPTAINS CHAIRS	\$995.00	SPLASH GUARDS	\$205.00	NO BID	NO BID
	2ND ROW CONSOLE	\$300.00	WHEEL LOCK KIT	\$75.00	NO BID	NO BID
	SUNROOF	\$1,395.00	SECOND ROW BUCKET	\$695.00	NO BID	NO BID
	BLOCK HEATER	\$95.00	2ND ROW INFLATABLE SEAT BELTS	\$195.00	NO BID	NO BID
			REAR BUMPER PROTECTION	\$75.00	NO BID	NO BID
Delivery can be made in _____ days	60-90	90-120			90-120 DAYS	
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / _____ miles	3 / 36,000 LIMITED POWERTRAIN 5 YR / 100,000	5 / 60,000 POWERTRAIN 3 / 36,000 BUMPER TO BUMPER		NO BID	3 YEARS; 36,000 MILES / 5 YEAR; 60,000 MILES POWERTRAIN	
2.0 QTY ONE (1), 2017 FORD EXPLORER XLT, LEATHER SEATS, V6 ENGINE, EXTERIOR COLOR WHITE (FOR PRECINCT ONE)						
TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE		\$31,172.00	\$32,306.00	NO BID	\$31,540.00	
EXTERIOR COLOR WHITE MFR. NAME		PW7 WHITE KNUCKLE	YZ-OXFORD WHITE	NO BID	WHITE	
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES		BLACK OR LIGHT FROST BEIGE	LT CAMEL OR EBONY BLACK	NO BID	EBONY BLACK; MEDIUM LIGHT CAMEL	
MAKE AND MDEL QUOTED		2017 DODGE DURANGO GT WDDH75	2017 XLT 202A PKG TO GET LEATHER REG	NO BID	FORD EXPLORER XLT K7D	
VENDOR TO LIST ALL INCLUDED STANDARD EQUIPMENT AND STANDARD FEATURES		ATTACHED	SEE ATTACHED	NO BID	SEE ATTACHED "WINDOW STICKER" EVERYTHING LISTED IS INCLUDED IN BID PRICE.	
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE	TOW PACKAGE	\$995.00	99H 2.3 L ECOBOOST	\$495.00	NO BID	NO BID
	PREMIUM GROUP	\$2,395.00	CLASS III TRAILER TOW	\$570.00	NO BID	NO BID
	SAFETY / SECURITY & CONVENIENCE	\$1,195.00	TECHNOLOGY PKG	\$1,095.00	NO BID	NO BID
	SINGLE CD	\$495.00	COLDWEATHER PKG	N/A	NO BID	NO BID
	BLACK TOP PACKAGE	\$595.00	20" POLISHED WHEELS	\$1,295.00	NO BID	NO BID
	NAVIGATION & POWER LIFT GATE	\$1,495.00	TWIN PANEL MOON ROOF	\$1,695.00	NO BID	NO BID
	REAR DVD	\$1,995.00	FLOOR LINERS	\$120.00	NO BID	NO BID
	BRASS MONKEY PACKAGE	\$595.00	ROOF CROSS BARS	\$140.00	NO BID	NO BID
	2ND ROW CAPTAINS CHAIRS	\$995.00	SPLASH GUARDS	\$205.00	NO BID	NO BID
	2ND ROW CONSOLE	\$300.00	WHEEL LOCK KIT	\$75.00	NO BID	NO BID
	SUNROOF	\$1,395.00	SECOND ROW BUCKET	\$695.00	NO BID	NO BID
			2ND ROW INFLATABLE SEAT BELTS	\$195.00	NO BID	NO BID

ITB # 17-05 VEHICLES

OPEN DATE:	RESPONDENT'S NAME	GRAPEVINE DCJ, LLC	SAM PACKS FIVE STAR FORD	CALDWELL COUNTRY CHEVROLET	CALDWELL COUNTRY FORD
FRIDAY, OCTOBER 28, 2016	ADDRESS	2601 WILLIAM D. TATE AVE	1635 I35E	P.O. BOX 27	P.O. BOX 27
2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME		GRAPEVINE, TX 76051	CARROLLTON, TX 75006	CALDWELL, TX 77836	CALDWELL, TX 77836
	QUOTED BY:	DENNIS THOMAS	KEVIN MOORE	AVERYT KNAPP	AVERYT KNAPP
	TELEPHONE NUMBER:	817-410-7541	972-242-6415	979-567-6116	979-567-6116
	FAX NUMBER:	817-410-7502	972-245-5278	979-567-0853	979-567-0853
		BLOCK HEATER \$95.00	REAR BUMPER PROTECTION \$75.00	NO BID	NO BID
				NO BID	NO BID
Delivery can be made in _____ days		60-90	90-120	NO BID	90-120 DAYS
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / miles		3 / 36,000 LIMITED POWERTRAIN 5 YR / 100,000	5 / 60,000 POWERTRAIN 3 / 36,000 BUMPER TO BUMPER	NO BID	3 YEARS; 36,000 MILES
3.0 QTY TWO (2) OF FORD TAURUS, 4-DOOR, 3.5L V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, POWER LOCKS AND WINDOWS, CRUISE CONTROL, TILT STEERING, STANDARD RADIO WITH BLUE TOOTH, FLOOR MATS, TINTED WINDOWS, EXTERIOR COLOR WHITE WITH TAN INTERIOR. (JUVENILE)		NO BID			
TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE		NO BID	\$20,926.00	\$20,720.00	\$21,275.00
EXTERIOR COLOR WHITE MFR. NAME		NO BID	YZ-OXFORD WHITE	CHEVROLET IMPALA LS 1GX69 (NEW BODY STYLE)	WHITE
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES		NO BID	7D-DUNE	JET BLACK, DARK TITANIUM	DUNE
MAKE AND MDEL QUOTED		NO BID	2017 TAURUS SE P2D	CHEVROLET IMPALA LS 1GX69 (V6)	2017 FORD TAURUS SE P2D
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE		NO BID	62S SIRUS SATELITE RADIO \$190.00	SEE ATTACHED "WINDOW STICKER" EVERYTHING LISTED IS INCLUDED IN BID PRICE.	SEE ATTACHED "WINDOW STICKER" EVERYTHING LISTED IS INCLUDED IN BID PRICE.
			41H ENGINE BLOCK HEATER \$90.00		
			97M ALLWEATHER FLOOR MATS \$90.00		
			97C CARGO ORGANIZER \$200.00		
			942 DAYTIME RUNNING LIGHTS INCLUDED		
			97P SMOKER PACKAGE \$90.00		
			999 2.0L ECOBOOST \$995.00		
Delivery can be made in _____ days after receipt of order.		NO BID	90-120 DAYS	60-90 DAYS	90-120 DAYS
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / miles		NO BID	5 YEARS, 60,000 MILES POWERTRAIN; 3 YEARS, 36,000 BUMPER TO BUMPER	3 YEARS; 36,000 MILES	3 YEARS; 36,000 MILES/ 5 YEAR; 60,000 MILES POWERTRAIN
4.0 QTY ONE (1) OF FORD F150 CAB 4X4 LONGWHEEL BASE WITH TOW PACKAGE AND POWER AUXILLARY, EXTERIOR COLOR WHITE (FOR MOSQUITO CONTROL)					
TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE		\$23,034.00	\$22,737.00	\$22,940.00	\$22,720.00
EXTERIOR COLOR WHITE MFR. NAME		PW7 BRIGHT WHITE	OXFORD WHITE YZ	WHITE	WHITE
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES		DIESEL GRAY	MED EARTH GRAY	DARK ASH WITH BLACK ACCENT	MEDIUM EARTH GRAY
MAKE AND MDEL QUOTED		RAM 1500 TRADESMEN	2017 XIC EXTEND CAB LWB 5.0L V8 TRAILER TON	CHEVROLET 1500 SILVERADO 4X4 CAB CK15903	FORD F150 4X4 REGULAR CAB LWB RIE
		ATTACHED; BID WITH SPRAY BEDLINER DELETE	85A POWER GROUP (WINDOWS/LOCKS) \$1,170.00	NONE LISTED	SPRAY-IN BEDLINER \$495.00
			50S CRUISE \$225.00		TRAILER TOW INCLUDED
			52B SYNC (BLUETOOTH) \$420.00		POWER WINDOWS INCLUDED

ITB # 17-05 VEHICLES

OPEN DATE:	RESPONDENT'S NAME	GRAPEVINE DCJ, LLC	SAM PACKS FIVE STAR FORD	CALDWELL COUNTRY CHEVROLET	CALDWELL COUNTRY FORD
FRIDAY, OCTOBER 28, 2016	ADDRESS	2601 WILLIAM D. TATE AVE	1635 I35E	P.O. BOX 27	P.O. BOX 27
2:00 P.M. LOCAL TIME		GRAPEVINE, TX 76051	CARROLLTON, TX 75006	CALDWELL, TX 77836	CALDWELL, TX 77836
	QUOTED BY:	DENNIS THOMAS	KEVIN MOORE	AVERYT KNAPP	AVERYT KNAPP
	TELEPHONE NUMBER:	817-410-7541	972-242-6415	979-567-6116	979-567-6116
	FAX NUMBER:	817-410-7502	972-245-5278	979-567-0853	979-567-0853
<p>VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE</p>		85H BACKUP ALARM	\$125.00		DAYTIME LIGHTS \$45.00
		18B RUNNING BOARDS	\$250.00		BLACK RUNNING BOARDS \$250.00
		63T TAILGATE STEP	\$375.00		CRUISE \$225.00
		67T TRAILER BRAKE COUTOOLER	\$275.00		
		76R REVERSE SENSING SYSTEM	\$275.00		
		942 DAY TIME RUNNING LIGHT	INLCUDED		
		SPRAYIN LINER	\$490.00		
		TINT	\$175.00		
		EXTRA KEY WITH FOB	\$225.00		
Delivery can be made in _____ days after receipt of order.		75-100	90-120 DAYS	90 DAYS	90-120 DAYS
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / miles		3 / 36,000 LIMITED POWERTRAIN 5 YR / 100,000	5 YEARS, 60,000 MILES POWERTRAIN; 3 YEARS, 36,000 MILES BUMPER TO BUMPER	3 YEARS; 36,000 MILES	3 YEARS; 36,000 MILES