

BRAZORIA COUNTY BID TABULATION
ITB # 18-05 VEHICLES

RESPONDENT'S NAME	ADDRESS	ROCKDALE COUNTRY FORD	CALDWELL COUNTRY CHEVROLET	SILSBEE FORD	MOORE CDJR	GULF COAST FORD	FRED HAAS NISSAN LP
GRAPEVINE DCJ, LLC	2601 WILLIAM D. TATE AVE GRAPEVINE, TX 76051	P.O. BOX 72 CALDWELL, TX 77836	P.O. BOX 72 CALDWELL, TX 77836	1211 U.S. HWY 96N SILSBEE, TX 77656	1305 HWY 96 BYPASS SILSBEE, TX 77656	3100 N. 288 FREEWAY ANGLETON, TX 77515	24202 S.H. 249 TOMBALL, TX 77375
QUOTED BY:	DENNIS THOMAS	AVERYT KNAPP	AVERYT KNAPP	JARROD RUNNELS	JARROD RUNNELS	DON THOMPSON	CHRISTOPHER KINGHAM
TELEPHONE NUMBER:	817-410-7541	979-567-6116	979-567-6116	409-895-3858	409-895-3858	979-849-2351	832-220-5852
FAX NUMBER:	817-410-7502	979-567-0853	979-567-0853	409-895-3884	409-895-3884	713-422-7260	281-516-5001
EMAIL:	DTTHOMAS@GRAPEVINEDCJ.COM	AKNAPP@CALDWELLCOUNTRY.COM	AKNAPP@CALDWELLCOUNTRY.COM	FLEETSALES@OUTLOOK.COM	FLEETSALES@OUTLOOK.COM	DONTHOMPSON@GULFCOAST.NET	CKINGHAM@FREDHAASNISSAN.COM

1.0 QTY TWO (2) OF 2018 FORD TAURUS SE P2D, 4-DOOR, 3.5L V6, AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION, POWER LOCKS AND WINDOWS, CRUISE CONTROL, TILT STEERING, STANDARD RADIO WITH BLUE TOOTH, FLOOR MATS, TINTED WINDOWS, EXTERIOR COLOR WHITE WITH TAN INTERIOR. (FOR JUVENILE PROBATION DEPT)

TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE	NO BID	\$21,575.00	\$21,175.00	\$20,990.00	NO BID	\$23,500.00	NO BID
EXTERIOR COLOR SHALL BE WHITE. PROVIDE THE MFR. COLOR NAME		OXFORD WHITE	SUMMIT WHITE	OXFORD WHITE		TAN	
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES				DUNE			
MAKE AND MODEL QUOTED		2018 FORD TAURUS SE P2D	2018 CHEVROLET IMPALA LS 16X89	FORD TAURUS SE		2018 FORD TAURUS	
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE							
Delivery can be made in _____ days after receipt of order.		120	90-120	120		120	
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / _____ miles		3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES	3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES	3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES			
EPA emission level of the engine		FEDERAL	FEDERAL	ULEV			

2.0 QTY ONE (1) OF 2018 DODGE GRAND CARAVAN SE, SE EQUIPMENT PACKAGE TO INCLUDE STOW AND GO SEATS, BLUETOOTH, BACKUP CAMERA, SPARE TIRE, REAR AIR CONDITIONING, CODE RTKH53 (FOR TAX OFFICE)

TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE	\$23,479.00	NO BID	\$26,815.00	NO BID	\$22,800.00	NO BID
EXTERIOR COLOR SHALL BE WHITE. PROVIDE THE MFR. COLOR NAME	WHITE KNUCKLE		SUMMIT WHITE		WHITE KNUCKLE	
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES	BLACK OR LIGHT GRAY				BLACK LT GREYSTONE	
MAKE AND MODEL QUOTED	DODGE GRAND CARAVAN SERTK53		2018 CHEVROLET TRAVERSE LT INC56		DODGE GRAND CARAVAN SE	
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE	POWER CONVERGE GROUP \$775.00 POWER SEAT \$195.00 ALUMINUM WHEELS \$625.00 NAVIGATOR \$980.00 REAR PARK SENSORS \$285.00 DVD \$980.00 ALARM \$190.00 BODY COLOR RUNNING BOARDS \$980.00 BLACK ROOF RAILS \$390.00 LEAD LEVELING \$280.00 BLOCK HEATER \$90.00					
Delivery can be made in _____ days after receipt of order.	75-90		90		120	
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / _____ miles	3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES		3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES		3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES	
EPA emission level of the engine	ULEV II+		FEDERAL		ULEV	

3.0 QTY ONE (1) OF 2018 CHEVROLET 1500 SILVERADO, SHORT BOX, 2WD, 4x2 CREW CAB, 5.3 L, V8, 6-SPD AUTOMATIC, AIR CONDITIONING, AM/FM STEREO MYLINK WITH BLUETOOTH, 40-20-40 CLOTH SEATS, FULL RUBBER FLOOR, TILT, CRUISE, POWER WINDOWS, POWER LOCKS, KEYLESS ENTRY, OEM HD TRAILER TOW PACKAGE, REAR STEP BUMPER, REAR VISION CAMERA, BAKFLIP MX4 ALUMINUM TONNEAU COVER (FOR PCT 4 COMMISSIONER)

TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE	\$26,676.00	NO BID	\$25,945.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$30,550.00
EXTERIOR COLOR SHALL BE WHITE. PROVIDE THE MFR. COLOR NAME	BRIGHT WHITE		SUMMIT WHITE			GLACIER WHITE
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES	DIESEL GRAY					CHARCOAL
MAKE AND MODEL QUOTED	PAM 1500 CREW CAB TRADESMAN		2018 CHEVROLET 1500 SILVERADO 4X2 CREW CAB SWB CC15543			NISSAN TITAN
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE	SEE THUMB DRIVE					REAR BUMPER STEP ASSIST \$245.00 SPRAY IN BED LINER INCLUDED IN PRICE BAKFLIP MX4 TONNEAU COVER INCLUDED IN PRICE
Delivery can be made in _____ days after receipt of order.	75-90		120			30
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / _____ miles	3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES		3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES			5 YEARS / 100,000 MILES
EPA emission level of the engine	ULEV II+		FEDERAL			LEV-II TIER 3 BIN125

4.0 QTY ONE (1) OF 2018 CHEVROLET 1500 SILVERADO, SHORT BOX, 2WD, 4x2 CREW CAB, CC15543, 5.3 L, V8, 6-SPD AUTOMATIC, AIR CONDITIONING, AM/FM STEREO MYLINK WITH BLUETOOTH, 40-20-40 CLOTH SEATS, FULL RUBBER FLOOR, TILT, CRUISE, POWER WINDOWS, POWER LOCKS, KEYLESS ENTRY, OEM HD TRAILER TOW PACKAGE, REAR STEP BUMPER, REAR VISION CAMERA, BAKFLIP MX4 ALUMINUM TONNEAU COVER (FOR INFO SYSTEMS)

TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE	\$26,676.00	NO BID	\$25,945.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$30,550.00
EXTERIOR COLOR SHALL BE WHITE. PROVIDE THE MFR. COLOR NAME	BRIGHT WHITE					GLACIER WHITE
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES	DIESEL GRAY					CHARCOAL
MAKE AND MODEL QUOTED	RAM 1500 CREW CAB TRADESMAN		2018 CHEVROLET 1500 SILVERADO 4X2 CREW CAB SWB CC15543			NISSAN TITAN
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE	Polished aluminum 20 x 9 OE Chevrolet truck wheels N/A SEE THUMB DRIVE	Polished aluminum 20 x 9 OE Chevrolet truck wheels	Polished aluminum 20 x 9 OE Chevrolet truck wheels	Polished aluminum 20 x 9 OE Chevrolet truck wheels	Polished aluminum 20 x 9 OE Chevrolet truck wheels	Polished aluminum 20 x 9 OE Chevrolet truck wheels NOT AVAILABLE REAR BUMPER STEP ASSIST \$245.00 SPRAY IN BED LINER INCLUDED IN PRICE BAKFLIP MX4 TONNEAU COVER INCLUDED IN PRICE
Delivery can be made in _____ days after receipt of order.	75-90		90			30
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / _____ miles	3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES		3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES			5 YEARS / 100,000 MILES
EPA emission level of the engine	ULEV II+		FEDERAL			LEV-II TIER 3 BIN125

ITB # 19-05 VEHICLES									
OPEN DATE	RESPONDENT'S NAME	GRAPEVINE DCJ, LLC	ROCKDALE COUNTRY FORD	CALDWELL COUNTRY CHEVROLET	SILSBEE FORD	MOORE CDJR	GULF COAST FORD	FRED HAAS NISSAN LP	
11:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME	ADDRESS	2601 WILLIAM D. TATE AVE GRAPEVINE, TX 76051	P.O. BOX 72 CALDWELL, TX 77836	P.O. BOX 72 CALDWELL, TX 77836	1211 U.S. HWY 96N SILSBEE, TX 77856	1305 HWY 96 BYPASS SILSBEE, TX 77856	3100 N. 288 FREEWAY ANGLETON, TX 77515	24202 S.H. 249 TOMBALL, TX 77375	
QUOTED BY:	TELEPHONE NUMBER:	DENNIS THOMAS 817-410-7541	AVERYT KNAPP 979-567-6116	AVERYT KNAPP 979-567-6116	JARROD RUNNELS 409-895-3858	JARROD RUNNELS 409-895-3858	DON THOMPSON 979-849-2351	CHRISTOPHER KINGHAM 832-220-5852	
FAX NUMBER:	EMAIL:	817-410-7502 DTHOMAS@GRAPEVINEDCJ.COM	979-567-0853 AKNAPP@CALDWELLCOUNTRY.COM	979-567-0853 AKNAPP@CALDWELLCOUNTRY.COM	409-895-3884 FLEETSALES@OUTLOOK.COM	409-895-3884 FLEETSALES@OUTLOOK.COM	713-422-7260 DONTHOMPSON@GULFCOAST.NET	281-516-5001 CKINGHAM@FREDHASNISSAN.COM	

5.0 QTY ONE (1) OF 2018 CHEVROLET EQUINOX, LS PACKAGE, V6 ENGINE, 4X2 DRIVE, CARPETED FLOOR, CLOTH SEATS, 2ND ROW BENCH, POWER WINDOWS/LOCKS, AUTOMATIC, CRUISE CONTROL, BLUETOOTH, HEAVY DUTY FLOOR MATS, POWER MIRRORS, CAMERA, KEYLESS ENTRY (FOR LIB ADMIN)

TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE	NO BID	NO BID	\$20,720.00	NO BID	NO BID	\$20,991.00
EXTERIOR COLOR SHALL BE WHITE. PROVIDE THE MFR. COLOR NAME			SUMMIT WHITE			GLACIER WHITE
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES						ALMOND, CHARCOAL
MAKE AND MODEL QUOTED			2018 CHEVROLET EQUINOX LS 1XP26 1.5L TURBO			NISSAN ROGUE S
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE						BLIND ZONE MIRRORS \$125.00 CARGO AREA PROTECTOR \$75.00 5 YEAR 100K MILE WARRANTY \$0 DEDUCTIBLE \$1,995.00
Delivery can be made in _____ days after receipt of order.			90-120			30
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / _____ miles			3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES			3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES
EPA emission level of the engine			FEDERAL			LEV-II TIER 3 BIN 70

6.0 QTY ONE (1) OF 2018 DODGE RAM 1500 TRUCK, 1/2 TON, EXTENDED CAB, LONG BED, GASOLINE, V8, AUTOMATIC ENGINE, SINGLE REAR WHEEL 4X2, TRAILER TOW, RUBBER FLOOR, VINYL SEATS, 1ST ROW BENCH, POWER WINDOWS/LOCKS, CRUISE CONTROL, AFTERMARKET TINT, SIDE STEPS, BED LINER, RECEIVER HITCH, GRILL GUARD, HEAVY DUTY FLOOR MATS, LARGEST ENGINE AVAILABLE FROM FACTORY (FOR PARKS DEPT.)

TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE	\$26,416.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$21,988.00	\$31,840.00
EXTERIOR COLOR SHALL BE WHITE. PROVIDE THE MFR. COLOR NAME	BRIGHT WHITE				BRIGHT WHITE CLEARCOAT	GLACIER WHITE
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES	DIESEL GRAY				DIESEL GRAY	GREY
MAKE AND MODEL QUOTED	RAM 1500 QUAD CAB TRADESMAN LONG BED IS 6FT 4IN				2018 1500 QUAD CAB SHORT BED ***LONG BED N/A ON 1500 QUAD 5.7L V8 ENGINE LARGEST IN TRADESMAN	NISSAN TITAN
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE	SEE THUMB DRIVE				TRAILER BRAKE CONTROLLER \$295.00 PARK SENSOR REAR PARK SENSING \$250.00 LCONNECT 3.0 \$198.00 TUBULAR SIDE STEPS \$595.00 REMOTE KEYLESS ENTRY \$190.00	REAR BUMPER STEP ASSIST \$245.00 REAR SEAT DELETE \$443.00
Delivery can be made in _____ days after receipt of order.			75-90			45
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / _____ miles			3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES			5 YEARS / 100,000 MILES
EPA emission level of the engine			ULEV II+			LEV-II TIER 3 BIN 125

7.0 QTY ONE (1) OF 2018 DODGE RAM 2500 TRUCK, 3/4 TON, CREW CAB, LONG BED, GASOLINE, V8, AUTOMATIC ENGINE, SINGLE REAR WHEEL, 4X4, TRAILER TOW, RUBBER FLOOR, VINYL SEATS, 1ST ROW BENCH, POWER WINDOWS/LOCKS, CRUISE CONTROL, AFTERMARKET TINT, SIDE STEPS, BED LINER, RECEIVER HITCH, GRILL GUARD, HEAVY DUTY FLOOR MATS, LARGEST ENGINE AVAILABLE FROM FACTORY. GOOSENECK HITCH INSTALLED (FOR PARKS DEPT.)

TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE	\$30,790.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$28,950.00	NO BID
EXTERIOR COLOR SHALL BE WHITE. PROVIDE THE MFR. COLOR NAME	BRIGHT WHITE				BRIGHT WHITE	
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES	DIESEL GRAY				DIESEL GRAY	
MAKE AND MODEL QUOTED	RAM 2500 CREW CAB				2018 RAM 2500 CREW CAB LONG BED	
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE	SEE THUMB DRIVE				ELEC SHIFTS ON THE FLY \$295.00 POWER TRAILER TOW MIRRORS \$195.00 TCP ON/OFF ROAD TIRES \$390.00 18" STEEL WHEELS INC W/TIRES 180 AMP ALT \$95.00 PROTECTION GROUP \$145.00	
Delivery can be made in _____ days after receipt of order.			90-140		120	
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / _____ miles			3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES		3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES	
EPA emission level of the engine			ULEV II+		N/A	

8.0 QTY ONE (1) OF 2018 DODGE RAM 2500 TRUCK, 3/4 TON, CREW CAB, LONG BED, GASOLINE, V8, AUTOMATIC ENGINE, SINGLE REAR WHEEL, 4X4, TRAILER TOW, RUBBER FLOOR, VINYL SEATS, 1ST ROW BUCKET SEATS, POWER WINDOWS/LOCKS, CRUISE CONTROL, AFTERMARKET TINT, SIDE STEPS, BED LINER, RECEIVER HITCH, GRILL GUARD, HEAVY DUTY FLOOR MATS, LARGEST ENGINE AVAILABLE FROM FACTORY. GOOSENECK HITCH INSTALLED (FOR PARKS DEPT.)

TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE	\$30,790.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	\$28,950.00 *** 40/20/40 IS THE ONLY SEAT AVAILABLE IN THE TRADESMAN TRIM. 40/20/40 SINGLE SEAT QUOTED	NO BID
EXTERIOR COLOR SHALL BE WHITE. PROVIDE THE MFR. COLOR NAME	BRIGHT WHITE				BRIGHT WHITE	
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES	DIESEL GRAY				DIESEL GRAY	
MAKE AND MODEL QUOTED	RAM 2500 CREW CAB TRADESMAN				2018 RAM 2500 CREW CAB LONG BED	
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE	SEE THUMB DRIVE				ELEC SHIFTS ON THE FLY \$295.00 POWER TRAILER TOW MIRRORS \$195.00 TCP ON/OFF ROAD TIRES \$390.00 18" STEEL WHEELS INC W/TIRES 180 AMP ALT \$95.00 PROTECTION GROUP \$145.00	
Delivery can be made in _____ days after receipt of order.			90-140		120	
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / _____ miles			3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES		3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES	
EPA emission level of the engine			ULEV II+		N/A	

ITB # 19-05 VEHICLES									
OPEN DATE	RESPONDENT'S NAME	GRAPEVINE DCJ, LLC	ROCKDALE COUNTRY FORD	CALDWELL COUNTRY CHEVROLET	SILSBEE FORD	MOORE CDJR	GULF COAST FORD	FRED HAAS NISSAN LP	
TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 14, 2017	ADDRESS	2601 WILLIAM D. TATE AVE GRAPEVINE, TX 76051	P.O. BOX 72 CALDWELL, TX 77836	P.O. BOX 72 CALDWELL, TX 77836	1211 U.S. HWY 96N SILSBEE, TX 77856	1305 HWY 96 BYPASS SILSBEE, TX 77856	3100 N. 288 FREEWAY ANGLETON, TX 77515	24202 S.H. 249 TOMBALL, TX 77375	
11:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME	QUOTED BY:	DENNIS THOMAS	AVERYT KNAPP	AVERYT KNAPP	JARROD BUNNELS	JARROD BUNNELS	DON THOMPSON	CHRISTOPHER KINGHAM	
TELEPHONE NUMBER:	817-410-7541	879-567-6116	879-567-6116	409-895-3858	409-895-3858	409-895-3858	879-849-2351	832-220-5852	
FAX NUMBER:	817-410-7502	879-567-0853	879-567-0853	409-895-3884	409-895-3884	409-895-3884	713-422-7260	281-516-5001	
EMAIL:	DTHOMAS@GRAPEVINEDCJ.COM	AKNAPP@CALDWELLCOUNTRY.COM	AKNAPP@CALDWELLCOUNTRY.COM	FLEETSALES@OUTLOOK.COM	FLEETSALES@OUTLOOK.COM	FLEETSALES@OUTLOOK.COM	DONTHOMPSON@GULFCOAST.NET	CKINGHAM@FREDHAASNISSAN.COM	
9.0 QTY ONE (1) OF 2018 FORD F550 "ONE-MAN BUCKET" (TWO-MAN F ONE-MAN NOT AVAILABLE) TRUCK, REG CAB CHASSIS, 60CA, 4X4, UP FITTER SWITCHES, DAYTIME RUNNING LIGHTS, VINYL FLOORING, 6.7L, V8 DIESEL, SPARE TIRE AND WHEEL, VINYL INTERIOR, TRAILER BRAKE CONTROLLER, POWER GROUP, POWER WINDOWS AND LOCKS, CRUISE CONTROL, 4 CORNER AMBER LED STROBES, PAYLOAD PLUS PACKAGE UPGRADE, 4.88 RATIO LIMITED SLIP AXLE, HEAVY DUTY SERVICE SUSPENSION (FOR FACILITIES MAINTENANCE DEPT.)									
TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE	NO BID	\$96,775.00	NO BID	KNAPHEIDE: \$53,940.00 VERSALIFT: \$95,441.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	
EXTERIOR COLOR SHALL BE WHITE. PROVIDE THE MFR. COLOR NAME		OXFORD WHITE		OXFORD WHITE					
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES				GREY					
MAKE AND MODEL QUOTED OF TRUCK		FORD F550 REG CAB 4X4 F5H		FORD F550 REGULAR CAB					
MAKE AND MODEL QUOTED OF AERIAL DEVICE		VERSALIFT VSW-16679 (SST-40-EIH)		VERSALIFT SST-40-EIH					
MAKE AND MODEL QUOTED OF SERVICE BODY		DAKOTA ATTACHED		DAKOTA					
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE	JIB CRANE	JIB CRANE \$5,775.00		LIFT MOORE L-21W \$5,710.00					
Delivery can be made in _____ days after receipt of order.		240-280		300-330					
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / _____ miles		3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES		3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES					
EPA emission level of the engine		FEDERAL		N/A					
Provide warranty information on Aerial Device on separate sheet.									
Provide warranty information of Service Body on separate sheet									
10.0 QTY ONE (1) OF 2018 FORD F150, 1/2 TON, 4 X 2, LONG BED, REGULAR CAB, XL PACKAGE, GASOLINE ENGINE, V6, AUTOMATIC ENGINE, SINGLE REAR WHEEL, NO TRAILER TOW, RUBBER FLOOR, VINYL SEATS, 1ST ROW BENCH SEAT, POWER WINDOWS AND LOCKS, CRUISE CONTROL, BED LINER (FOR MOSQUITO CONTROL)									
TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE	\$18,851.00	\$21,820.00	\$20,855.00	\$21,350.00	NO BID	\$22,435.00	\$25,087.00		
EXTERIOR COLOR SHALL BE WHITE. PROVIDE THE MFR. COLOR NAME	BRIGHT WHITE	OXFORD WHITE	SUMMIT WHITE	OXFORD WHITE			GLACIER WHITE		
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES	DIESEL GRAY			MEDIUM EARTH GRAY			GREY		
MAKE AND MODEL QUOTED	RAM 1500 REGULAR CAB TRADESMAN	FORD F150 4X2 REGULAR CAB LWB F1C	2018 CHEVROLET 1500 SILVERADO 4X2 REG CAB 4VBCC15903	FORD F150			NISSAN TITAN		
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE	SEE THUMB DRIVE			ELEC LOCK AXLE \$420.00			REAR BUMPER STEP ASSIST \$245.00		
				BLACK PLATFORM RUNNING BOARDS \$250.00			TOW PACKAGE \$800.00		
				SYNC \$420.00					
				TRAILER BRAKE CONTROLLER \$275.00					
				REVERSE SENSING \$275.00					
				BACK UP ALARM \$125.00					
Delivery can be made in _____ days after receipt of order.	75-90		90-120	120		120	45		
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / _____ miles	3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES		3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES	3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES		3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES	5 YEARS / 100,000 MILES		
EPA emission level of the engine	ULEV II+		FEDERAL	ULEV			LEV-II TIER 3 BIN 125		
11.0 QTY ONE (1) OF 2018 FORD F-150, 1/2 TON, CREW CAB, SHORT BED, GASOLINE FUEL, V6, AUTOMATIC, SINGLE REAR WHEEL, TRAILER TOW, RUBBER FLOOR, VINYL SEATS, 1ST ROW BUCKET SEATS, POWER WINDOW AND LOCKS, CRUISE CONTROL, AFTERMARKET TINT, SIDE STEPS, BED LINER, RECEIVER HITCH, BLUETOOTH, HEAVY DUTY FLOOR MATS, POWER MIRRORS, CAMERA, KEYLESS ENTRY (FOR FIRE MARSHAL)									
TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE	\$24,410.00	\$24,520.00	\$24,335.00	\$23,990.00	NO BID	\$28,172.00	\$32,750.00		
EXTERIOR COLOR SHALL BE WHITE. PROVIDE THE MFR. COLOR NAME	BRIGHT WHITE	OXFORD WHITE	SUMMIT WHITE	OXFORD WHITE		WHITE	GLACIER WHITE		
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES	DIESEL GRAY			MEDIUM EARTH GRAY			GREY		
MAKE AND MODEL QUOTED	SEE THUMB DRIVE	2018 FORD F150 4X2 CREW CAB SWB W1C	2018 CHEVROLET 1500 SILVERADO 4X2 CREW CAB SWB CC15543	2018 FORD F150 CREW CAB			NISSAN TITAN		
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE				ELEC LOCK AXLE \$420.00			REAR BUMPER STEP ASSIST \$245.00		
				BLACK PLATFORM RUNNING BOARDS \$250.00					
				SYNC \$420.00					
				TRAILER BRAKE CONTROLLER \$275.00					
				REVERSE SENSING \$275.00					
				BACK UP ALARM \$125.00					
Delivery can be made in _____ days after receipt of order.	75-100	120	90-120	120		120	45		
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / _____ miles	3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES	3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES	3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES	3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES		3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES	5 YEARS / 100,000 MILES		
EPA emission level of the engine	ULEV II+	FEDERAL	FEDERAL	ULEV			LEV-II TIER3		
12.0 QTY ONE (1) OF 2018 CHEVY SUBURBAN, BASIC PACKAGE, GASOLINE FUEL, V8 ENGINE, AUTOMATIC, 4X2, TRAILER TOW, RUBBER FLOOR, CLOTH SEATS, 2ND AND 3RD ROW BENCH, POWER WINDOWS AND LOCKS, CRUISE CONTROL, RECEIVER HITCH, HEAVY DUTY FLOOR MATS, POWER MIRRORS (FOR AG EXTENSION)									
TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE	NO BID	NO BID	\$38,775.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		
EXTERIOR COLOR SHALL BE WHITE. PROVIDE THE MFR. COLOR NAME			SUMMIT WHITE						
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES									
MAKE AND MODEL QUOTED			2018 CHEVROLET SUBURBAN CC15906						
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE									
Delivery can be made in _____ days after receipt of order.			90						
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / _____ miles			3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES						
EPA emission level of the engine			FEDERAL						

ITB # 19-05 VEHICLES										
OPEN DATE	RESPONDENT'S NAME	ROCKDALE COUNTRY FORD	CALDWELL COUNTRY CHEVROLET	SILSBEE FORD	MOORE CDJR	GULF COAST FORD	FRED HAAS NISSAN LP			
TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 14, 2017	ADDRESS	2601 WILLIAM D. TATE AVE	P.O. BOX 72	P.O. BOX 72	1211 U.S. HWY 96N	1305 HWY 96 BYPASS	3100 N. 288 FREEWAY	24202 S.H. 249		
11:00 A.M. LOCAL TIME		GRAPEVINE, TX 76051	CALDWELL, TX 77836	CALDWELL, TX 77836	SILSBEE, TX 77656	SILSBEE, TX 77656	ANGLETON, TX 77515	TOMBALL, TX 77375		
	QUOTED BY:	DENNIS THOMAS	AVERYT KNAPP	AVERYT KNAPP	JARROD BUNNELS	JARROD BUNNELS	DON THOMPSON	CHRISTOPHER KINGHAM		
	TELEPHONE NUMBER:	817-410-7541	979-567-6116	979-567-6116	409-895-3858	409-895-3858	979-849-2351	832-220-5852		
	FAX NUMBER:	817-410-7502	979-567-0853	979-567-0853	409-895-3884	409-895-3884	713-422-7260	281-516-5001		
	EMAIL:	dthomas@grapevinecdj.com	aknapp@caldwelldwcountry.com	aknapp@caldwelldwcountry.com	fleetsales@outlook.com	fleetsales@outlook.com	donthompson@gulfcoast.net	ckingham@fredhasnissan.com		
13.0 QTY ONE (1) OF 2018 NISSAN NV VAN, GASOLINE FUEL, V8 ENGINE, AUTOMATIC, 4X2, TRAILER TOW, RUBBER FLOOR, CLOTH SEATS, 2ND ROW BUCKET SEATS, 3RD ROW BENCH SEATS, POWER WINDOW AND LOCKS, CRUISE CONTROL, SLIDING SIDE DOOR, RECEIVER HITCH, HEAVY DUTY FLOOR MATS, POWER MIRRORS (FOR AG EXTENSION)										
TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$32,080.00		
EXTERIOR COLOR SHALL BE WHITE. PROVIDE THE MFR. COLOR NAME								GLACIER WHITE		
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES								GREY		
MAKE AND MODEL QUOTED								2017 NISSAN NVP S V8		
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE										
Delivery can be made in _____ days after receipt of order.								45		
Length of vehicle warranty: _____ years / _____ miles								5 YEARS / 100,000 MILES		
EPA emission level of the engine								LEV-II TIER3 BIN 125		
14.0 QTY ONE (1) OF 2017 or 2018 FORD F250, CODE F25H, 4X4 CREW CAB PICKUP160, PREFERRED EQUIPMENT PACKAGE 603A, XLT TRIM, TRAILER TOW PACKAGE, AM/FM STEREO CD/CLK, 6.2 L EFI V-8 ENGINE, 6 SPEED AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION G, LT275/70R18E BSW ALL TERRAIN, 3.73 ELECTRONIC LOCKING AXLE, FX4 OFF-ROAD PACKAGE SKID PLATES, 5" CHROME TUBULAR STEP BAR, 10000# GVWR PACKAGE, NAVIGATION SYSTEM, ELECTRONIC SHIFT ON THE FLY, HD SATELLITE DIGITAL BROADCAST, 50 STATE EMISSIONS, 110V/400W OUTLET, CAMPER PACKAGE, SPARE TIRE AND WHEEL JACK, UPFITTER SWITCHES, EXTRA HEAVY DUTY ALTERNATOR, SYNC 3 VOICE ACTIVATED SYSTEMS (FOR PCT 2 CONSTABLE)										
TOTAL EACH VEHICLE WITH STANDARD EQUIPMENT, AS WELL AS FEATURES LISTED ABOVE		\$37,335.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID		\$36,385.00		
EXTERIOR COLOR SHALL BE SHADOW BLACK		SHADOW BLACK								
INTERIOR COLOR CHOICES								GRAY		
MAKE AND MODEL QUOTED		2018 FORD F250 4X4 CREW CAB SWB XLT W2B						2017 FORD F250		
VENDOR TO ITEMIZE OTHER AVAILABLE OPTIONS, WITH ASSOCIATED PRICING, THAT BRAZORIA COUNTY MAY CHOOSE FROM TO ADD TO THE ABOVE PRICE										
Delivery can be made in _____ days after receipt of order.								1		
Length of vehicle warranty for bumper to bumper _____ years / _____ miles		3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES						3 YEARS / 36,000 MILES		
Length of vehicle warranty for power train _____ years / _____ miles		5 YEARS / 60,000 MILES								
EPA emission level of the engine		FEDERAL								
Is an extended warranty available? Provide information and pricing		NO						YES		