

DATE OF BID OPENING THURSDAY, MARCH 31, 2016 AT 11:00 A.M. CONTRACT TERM	BIDDERS NAME WALLER COUNTY ASPHALT, INC				
	ADDRESS 22010 FAIRGROUND ROAD				
	CONTACT HEMPSTEAD, TX 77445				
	TELEPHONE NUMBER JENNIFER WITTE				
	FAX NUMBER 979-826-7075				
	PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS TERI UBER - 979-826-7075				
PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES JENNIFER WITTE-979-826-7075					
DESCRIPTION	COMM CODE	COUNTY ID #			
PATCHING MATERIAL					
1.0. Hot Mix-Cold Laid Asphaltic Concrete Pavement			Price per Ton	Plant Location	
1.1. Price per ton-bidder's plant / siding loaded onto County trucks	745-14	6777	\$0.00	NO BID	
1.2 Price per ton as delivered to County Facility at:	745-14	6777	County Facility	Price/ton Delivered	
			Airport	\$0.00	
			Alvin Svc Ctr	\$0.00	
			Angleton Svc Ctr	\$0.00	
			Camp Mohawk	\$0.00	
			Clute Svc Ctr	\$0.00	
			Hanson Park	\$0.00	
			Manvel Svc Ctr	\$0.00	
			Mosquito Control	\$0.00	
			Quintana Cty Park	\$0.00	
			Resoft Park	\$0.00	
			San Luis Cty Park	\$0.00	
			W. Columbia Svc	\$0.00	
			MATERIAL COST	HAULING 1ST MILE	HAUL EA ADDTL
1.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite	745-14	6777	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
1.4 State Minimum if required			NO BID		
1.2 POLYMER MODIFIED COLD ASPHALT (Brand or Equivalent)			Price per Ton	Plant Location	
1.2 Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto County trucks	745-14	6778	\$90.00	22010 FAIRGROUND RD HEMPSTEAD, TX 77445	
1.3 Price per ton as delivered to County Facility at:	745-14	6778	County Facility	Price/ton Delivered	
			Airport	\$112.50	
			Alvin Svc Ctr	\$109.00	
			Angleton Svc Ctr	\$112.25	
			Camp Mohawk	\$110.70	
			Clute Svc Ctr	\$113.92	
			Hanson Park	\$110.70	
			Manvel Svc Ctr	\$107.25	
			Mosquito Control	\$111.85	
			Quintana Cty Park	\$117.37	
			Resoft Park	\$108.17	
			San Luis Cty Park	\$118.52	
			W. Columbia Svc	\$110.93	
			MATERIAL COST	HAULING 1ST MILE	HAUL EA ADDTL
1.4 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite	745-14	6778	\$90.00	\$0.23	\$0.23
1.5 State Minimum if required			25 TONS		
1.6 Price per 35# bag	745-14	6778	\$0.00		
1.7 Price per 50# bag	745-14	6778	\$11.00 FOR 60 LB BAG		
			County Facility	MILEAGE	
			Airport	98	
			Alvin Svc Ctr	83	
			Angleton Svc Ctr	97	
			Camp Mohawk	90	
			Clute Svc Ctr	104	
			Hanson Park	90	
			Manvel Svc Ctr	75	
			Mosquito Control	95	
			Quintana Cty Park	119	
			Resoft Park	79	
			San Luis Cty Park	124	
			W. Columbia Svc	91	
BID DOCUMENTS INLCUDED			INCLUDED		
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS			NONE		

DATE OF BID OPENING THURSDAY, MARCH 31, 2016 AT 11:00 A.M. CONTRACT TERM	BIDDERS NAME CENTURY ASPHALT, LTD				
	ADDRESS 5303 NAVIGATION BLVD				
	CONTACT HOUSTON, TX 77011				
	TELEPHONE NUMBER PHILLIP KING				
	FAX NUMBER 713-292-2868				
	713-292-2885				
PERSON TO CONTACT FOR PLACING ORDERS			DARRYL VANEK-713-923-1988		
PERSON TO CONTACT FOR BILLING ISSUES			KIM BYFORD-713-292-2868		
DESCRIPTION	COMM CODE	COUNTY ID #			
PATCHING MATERIAL					
1.0. Hot Mix-Cold Laid Asphaltic Concrete Pavement			Price per Ton	Plant Location	
1.1. Price per ton-bidder's plant / siding loaded onto County trucks	745-14	6777	\$88.00	5303 NAVIGATION BLVD HOUSTON, TX 77011	
1.2 Price per ton as delivered to County Facility at:	745-14	6777	County Facility	Price/ton Delivered	
			Airport	\$96.00	
			Alvin Svc Ctr	\$96.00	
			Angleton Svc Ctr	\$96.00	
			Camp Mohawk	\$96.00	
			Clute Svc Ctr	\$97.75	
			Hanson Park	\$97.25	
			Manvel Svc Ctr	\$96.00	
			Mosquito Control	\$96.00	
			Quintana Cty Park	\$99.25	
			Resoft Park	\$96.00	
			San Luis Cty Park	\$99.25	
			W. Columbia Svc	\$97.25	
			MATERIAL COST	HAULING 1ST MILE	HAUL EA ADDTL
1.3 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite	745-14	6777	\$88.00	\$2.75	\$0.15
1.4 State Minimum if required			17 TONS		
1.2 POLYMER MODIFIED COLD ASPHALT (Brand or Equivalent)			Price per Ton	Plant Location	
1.2 Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto County trucks	745-14	6778	\$0.00	NO BID	
1.3 Price per ton as delivered to County Facility at:	745-14	6778	County Facility	Price/ton Delivered	
			Airport	\$0.00	
			Alvin Svc Ctr	\$0.00	
			Angleton Svc Ctr	\$0.00	
			Camp Mohawk	\$0.00	
			Clute Svc Ctr	\$0.00	
			Hanson Park	\$0.00	
			Manvel Svc Ctr	\$0.00	
			Mosquito Control	\$0.00	
			Quintana Cty Park	\$0.00	
			Resoft Park	\$0.00	
			San Luis Cty Park	\$0.00	
			W. Columbia Svc	\$0.00	
			Material cost	Hauling first mile	Hauling ea add'l mile
1.4 Price per ton as delivered to jobsite	745-14	6778	\$0.00	\$0.00	\$0.00
1.5 State Minimum if required			NO BID		
1.6 Price per 35# bag	745-14	6778	\$0.00		
1.7 Price per 50# bag	745-14	6778	\$0.00		
			County Facility	MILEAGE	
			Airport	50	
			Alvin Svc Ctr	28	
			Angleton Svc Ctr	56	
			Camp Mohawk	33	
			Clute Svc Ctr	44	
			Hanson Park	59	
			Manvel Svc Ctr	25	
			Mosquito Control	49	
			Quintana Cty Park	70	
			Resoft Park	26	
			San Luis Cty Park	71	
			W. Columbia Svc	57	
BID DOCUMENTS INLCUDED			INCLUDED		
EXCEPTIONS TO TERMS & CONDITIONS			NONE		