

Item No.	Description	American Quality Fire & Safety Price (flat fee) per location	Price (flat fee) per location	Advantage Interests	Cintas Fire Protection Price (flat fee) per location	Fire & Life Safety America Price (flat fee) per location	Liberty	Sky Wonder Price (flat fee) per location
1.0	Fire Sprinklers				N/A		Multiple sheets with different pricing	
	Inspection & Testing		\$250		N/A	\$250.00		NO BID
	Trip Charge (if applicable)				N/A			NO BID
	One Way				N/A			NO BID
	Round Trip				N/A			NO BID
2.0	Fire Alarms	Price (flat fee) per system	Price (flat fee) per system	2.0 Fire Alarms ****Service Rates were provided in this section because accurate device counts per building were not provided...A/V's, Strobes/Horns/Pull Stations/Maglocks and Etc. were not included in Addendum 3 Exhibits...per code all Peripheral Fire Alarm devices must be inspected annually. Battery Cost Itemized: 12V 7AH SLA BATTERY \$35.00 12V 12 AH SLA BATTERY \$38.00	Price (flat fee) per system	Price (flat fee) per system		Price (flat fee) per system
	Inspection & Testing		95.00 per hr each		\$238.99	\$500.00		NO BID
	Trip Charge (if applicable)				45.76			NO BID
	One Way				\$45.76			NO BID
	Round Trip				\$91.52			NO BID
	Battery Replacement (include price list breakdown of battery sizes)		see attached		58.00 ea			NO BID
3.0	Portable Fire Extinguishers	Price (flat fee) per extinguisher	Price (flat fee) per extinguisher	2.5# ABC Recharge/6-Yr Maint \$17.00 2.5# ABC Hydrotest and Recharge \$33.00 5# ABC Recharge/6-Yr Maint \$22.00 5# ABC Hydrotest and Recharge \$38.00 10# ABC Recharge/6-Yr Maint \$32.00 10# ABC Hydrotest and Recharge \$48.00 20# ABC Recharge/6-Yr Maint \$45.00 20# ABC Hydrotest and Recharge \$61.00	Price (flat fee) per extinguisher	Price (flat fee) per extinguisher		Price (flat fee) per extinguisher
	Inspection	\$4.50	\$5.50		5.33 ea	\$5.00		\$4.00
	Maintenance / Recharge (6 years)	\$14.50	see attached		5lb ABC-31.52	\$85.00		\$10.50
	Hydrostatic Test (12 years)	\$14.00	see attached		5lb ABC-33.56	\$85.00		\$13.50
	Trip Charge (if applicable)				45.76			\$17.50
	One Way				\$45.76			\$25.50
	Round Trip	\$25.00			\$91.52			\$14.00
4.0	Kitchen Suppression System			10# ABC Recharge/6-Yr Maint \$32.00 10# ABC Hydrotest and Recharge \$48.00 20# ABC Recharge/6-Yr Maint \$45.00 20# ABC Hydrotest and Recharge \$61.00 Fusible Links \$8.00 each Link Test \$3.00 each				\$12.50 \$25.00
	Inspection	\$70.00	\$149.00		\$106.78	\$300.00		
	Maintenance / Recharge (6 years)	N/A	see attached		\$184.40			
	Hydrostatic Test (12 years)		see attached		\$129.99			
	Trip Charge (if applicable)				45.76		\$65 per control head	
	One Way				\$45.76		N/A	
	Round Trip	\$25.00			\$91.52		\$25 per bottle	
5.0	Stand Pipe System with Fire Pump	Price					\$12.50 \$25.00	
	Inspection	\$2.00	\$568.00		N/A	\$500.00		
	Maintenance	\$1.00	95.00 per hour		N/A			
		\$1.50						
		\$8.00					NO BID	
6.0	FM 200 Systems (Inert Gas Systems)	\$5.00					NO BID	
	Inspection	\$5.00	\$350.00		350	\$300.00		
	Maintenance	\$3.00	95.00 per hour		238.99			
7.0	List any additional fees:		Price	7.0 List of Any Additional Fees: Extinguisher Disposable Fee \$10.00 each Additional Risers for buildings with multiple systems \$150.00 each Trip charges 55.00 each on service calls Service calls minimum Fire Alarm/Sprinkler 3 hours @ \$95.00 each	Fire Alarm Devices-Smoke Detectors,Strobes,Horns,& Pull Stations 8.64 ea Kitchen Inspection (Remote Tank) 51.00 ea Kitchen Inspection (Fusible Links) 9.96 ea Kitchen Inspection-Rubber Caps 7.78 ea Portable Fire Extinguishers- Additional Sizes	Price	NO BID NO BID High pressure seal & pull pin \$3.00 Service collars \$1.00 Fusible links \$7.50 Nozzle caps \$4.50	