21-32 ATTACHMENT A BID TABLE- ROAD MATERIALS - SURFACE

COURSES AMERICAN MATERIALS CENTURY ASPHALT
DESCRIPTION
COMM
SURFACE COURSES CODE COUNTY ID #

5.1 RECYCLED ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT RACP)

TxDot Item 340, Type D, mixed
with AC-20 Price per ton Price per ton
Price per ton bidder's plant /
siding loaded onto County trucks | 745-68 6780 $56.00 NO BID
Price per ton as delivered to Hauling first Hauling first
jobsite 745-68 6780 Material cost mile Hauling ea add'l mile Material cost mile Hauling ea add'l mile
$56.00 $3.25 $0.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hauling first Hauling first
Price per ton in place 745-68 6780 Material cost mile Hauling ea add'l mile Material cost mile Hauling ea add'l mile
NO BID NO BID NO BID
State mininum truckload if
required 14.00 tons NO BID

5.2 RECYCLED ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT (RACP)
TxDot Item 340, Tpe B, mixed with AC-20 Asphalt

Price per ton

Price per ton

Price per ton bidder's plant/siding
loaded onto County trucks 745-68 6781 $56.00 NO BID
Price per ton as delivered to Hauling first Hauling first
jobsite: 745-68 6781 Material cost mile Hauling ea add'l mile Material cost mile Hauling ea add'l mile
$56.00 $3.25 $0.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID
Hauling first Hauling first
Price per ton in place 745-68 6781 Material cost mile Hauling ea add'l mile Material cost mile Hauling ea add'l mile
NO BID NO BID NO BID
State Minimum truckload if
required 14.00 tons NO BID
5.3 HOT MIX APAHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT
ASPHALT MIXTYPE D
Price per ton bidder's plant /
siding loaded onto County trucks 745-21 6782 Price per ton Price per ton
$56.00 $54.00
Price per ton as delivered to Hauling first Hauling first
jobsite 745-21 6782 Material cost mile Hauling ea add'l mile Material cost mile Hauling ea add'l mile
$56.00 $3.25 $0.20 $54.00 $2.75 $0.25
State Minimum truckload if
required 14.00 tons

Plant Location Plant Location #1

County Facility Mileage Mileage

Airport 6 9519 Galveston Rd., Houston TX 77034 -46
Alvin Svc Ctr 23 9519 Galveston Rd., Houston TX 77034 -20
Angleton Svc Ctr 3 9519 Galveston Rd., Houston TX 77034-38
Camp Mohawk 23 9519 Galveston Rd., Houston TX 77034-25
Clute Svc Ctr 10 9519 Galveston Rd., Houston TX 77034-43
Hanson Park 14 9519 Galveston Rd., Houston TX 77034-57
Manvel Svc Ctr 24 9519 Galveston Rd., Houston TX 77034-28
Mosquito Control 3 9519 Galveston Rd., Houston TX 77034-40
Quintana Cty Park 22 9519 Galveston Rd., Houston TX 77034-61
Resoft Park 23 9519 Galveston Rd., Houston TX 77034-13
San Luis Cty Park 30 9519 Galveston Rd., Houston TX 77034-60
W. Columbia Svc 14 9519 Galveston Rd., Houston TX 77034-53

Plant Location #2

Mileage

5303 Navigation Blvd, Houston, TX 77011-50

5303 Navigation Blvd, Houston, TX 77011-28

5303 Navigation Blvd, Houston, TX 77011-56

5303 Navigation Blvd, Houston, TX 77011-33

5303 Navigation Blvd, Houston, TX 77011-44

5303 Navigation Blvd, Houston, TX 77011-59

5303 Navigation Blvd, Houston, TX 77011-25

5303 Navigation Blvd, Houston, TX 77011-49

705303 Navigation Blvd, Houston, TX 77011-70

5303 Navigation Blvd, Houston, TX 77011-26

5303 Navigation Blvd, Houston, TX 77011-71

5303 Navigation Blvd, Houston, TX 77011-57




21-32 ATTACHMENT A BID TABLE- ROAD MATERIALS - SURFACE

COURSES VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIAL
DESCRIPTION
COMM
SURFACE COURSES CODE COUNTY ID #

5.1 RECYCLED ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT RACP)

TxDot Item 340, Type D, mixed
with AC-20 Price per ton

Price per ton bidder's plant /

siding loaded onto County trucks | 745-68 6780 $56.00
Price per ton as delivered to Hauling first
jobsite 745-68 6780 Material cost mile Hauling ea add'l mile
$56.00 $4.95 $0.25
Hauling first
Price per ton in place 745-68 6780 Material cost mile Hauling ea add'l mile
$56.00 $4.95 $0.25

State mininum truckload if

required 22 TONS

5.2 RECYCLED ASPHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT (RACP)
TxDot Item 340, Tpe B, mixed with AC-20 Asphalt Price per ton

Price per ton bidder's plant/siding

loaded onto County trucks 745-68 6781 $56.00
Price per ton as delivered to Hauling first
jobsite: 745-68 6781 Material cost mile Hauling ea add'l mile
$56.00 $4.95 $0.25
Hauling first
Price per ton in place 745-68 6781 Material cost mile Hauling ea add'l mile
$56.00 $4.95 $0.25

State Minimum truckload if

required 22 TONS

5.3 HOT MIX APAHALTIC CONCRETE PAVEMENT

ASPHALT MIXTYPE D

Price per ton bidder's plant /

siding loaded onto County trucks | 745-21 6782 Price per ton
$56.00
Price per ton as delivered to Hauling first
jobsite 745-21 6782 Material cost mile Hauling ea add'l mile
$56.00 $4.95 $0.25

State Minimum truckload if
required

Plant Location

County Facility Mileage

Airport Lockwood / 50 Mi / $11.20 (Haul Rate)
Alvin Svc Ctr Lockwood / 28 Mi / $8.35
Angleton Svc Ctr Lockwood / 49 Mi / $11.20
Camp Mohawk Lockwood / 43 Mi/ $10.40
Clute Svc Ctr Lockwood / 59 Mi / $12.50
Hanson Park Lockwood / 61 Mi / $12.75
Manvel Svc Ctr Lockwood / 25 Mi / $8.05
Mosquito Control Lockwood / 50 Mi / $11.20
Quintana Cty Park Lockwood / 70 Mi / $13.80
Resoft Park Lockwood / 26 Mi / $8.05
San Luis Cty Park Lockwood / 80 Mi / $18.58

W. Columbia Svc Lockwood / 58 Mi / $12.25




	Bid Tabulation

