
AMERICAN MATERIALS
CHERRY CRUSHED 

CONCRETE

VERNOR 
MATERIAL & 
EQUIPMENT

STABILIZING MATERIALS COMM CODE COUNTY ID # PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION

5.1 LIME NO BID NO BID NO BID 

5.1.1 Hydrated Lime

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-95 9204 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Hauling First Mile 750-95 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-95 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Price per ton for Spreader Bar NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 State Minimum truckload if required 750-95 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

5.1.2 Lime Slurry 6750 Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-95 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Hauling First Mile 750-95 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-95 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Price per ton for Spreader Bar NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 State Minimum truckload if required NO BID NO BID NO BID 

5.2.1  6% cement by weight Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-77 6752 NO BID $15.00 $17.50

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-77 6752 NO BID $15.00 $17.50

 Hauling First Mile 750-77 7104 NO BID $2.60 $2.75

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7105 NO BID $0.12 $0.27

 State Minimum truckload if required 750-77 NO BID 15.00 14 Tons

5.2.2   8% cement by weight Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-77 6753 NO BID $18.00 $19.50

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-77 6753 NO BID $18.00 $19.50

 Hauling First Mile 750-77 7106 NO BID $2.60 $2.75

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7107 NO BID $0.12 $0.27

 State Minimum truckload if required NO BID 15.00 14 Tons

5.2.3.  12% cement by weight Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-77 6754 NO BID $24.00 $24.50

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-77 6754 NO BID $24.00 $24.50

 Hauling First Mile 750-77 7108 NO BID $2.60 $2.75

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7109 NO BID $0.12 $0.27

 State Minimum truckload if required NO BID 15.00 14 Tons

5.3.1  3-1/2% cement by weight Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON

ITB#21-33 ROAD MATERIALS - STABILIZING 
BID TABULATION

5.2 CEMENT STABILIZED SAND 
*Shall consist of sand, free of foreign matter and having a plasticity index not exceeding 
10, stabilized with cement in proportions bid as follows:

5.3  CEMENT STABILIZED BASE-LIMESTONE
*Shall consist of a Portland cement treated base material, composed of new crushed 
limestone, cement, and water, mixed at a central mixing plant.



STABILIZING MATERIALS COMM CODE COUNTY ID # PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-91 6757 NO BID $36.25 $39.50

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-91 6757 NO BID $36.25 $39.50

 Hauling First Mile 750-77 7114 NO BID $2.60 $2.75

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7115 NO BID $0.12 $0.27

 State Minimum truckload if required NO BID 15.00 14 Tons

5.3.2   6% cement by weight Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-91 6758 NO BID $39.50 $43.00

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-91 6758 NO BID $39.50 $43.00

 Hauling First Mile 750-77 7116 NO BID $2.60 $2.75

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7117 NO BID $0.12 $0.27

 State Minimum truckload if required NO BID 15.00 14 Tons

5.4.1 6% cement by weight Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-91 6750 NO BID $31.00 $26.75

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-91 6760 NO BID $31.00 $26.75

 Hauling First Mile 750-77 7120 NO BID $2.60 $2.75

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7121 NO BID $0.12 $0.27

 State Minimum truckload if required NO BID 15.00 14 Tons

5.4.2  12% cement by weight Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-91 9205 NO BID $39.00 $39.00

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-91 9205 NO BID $39.00 $39.00

 Hauling First Mile 750-77 9206 NO BID $2.60 $2.75

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 9207 NO BID $0.12 $0.27

 State Minimum truckload if required NO BID 15.00 14 Tons

Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-04 6761 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-04 6761 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Hauling First Mile 750-77 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Price per ton for Spreader Bar 750-04 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 State Minimum truckload if required NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-04 6762 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-04 6762 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Hauling First Mile 750-77 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

5.6  LIME-FLY ASH PLANT MIX
*Shall consist of a homogeneous blend of not less than 30 percent lime by weight which 
meets the specification for Hydrated Lime in Item II.1.A of these specifications.  The 
balance of the mix shall consist of fly ash meeting the specification for Fly Ash in Item 
2.1.6. of these specifications or in TxDOT Item 265.

5.5 FLY ASH
*Shall consist of Class "C" fly ash meeting ASTM Specification C-593, Section 3.2, when 
sampled and tested in accordance with Sections 4, 6 and 8.

5.4 CEMENT STABILIZED RECLAIMED BASE-CRUSHED 
CONCRETE
*Shall consist of a Portland cement treated reclaimed base material, cement, and 
water, mixed at a central mixing plant.



STABILIZING MATERIALS COMM CODE COUNTY ID # PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION

Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Price per ton for Spreader Bar NO BID NO BID NO BID 

State Minimum truckload if required 750-04 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-21 6765 NO BID NO BID $190.00

Hauling First Mile 750-77 8199 NO BID NO BID $3.00

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 8200 NO BID NO BID $0.30

 Price per ton for Spreader Bar 750-21 6766 NO BID NO BID $10.00

 State minimum truckload if required NO BID NO BID 24 Tons

Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON

 Price per ton bidder's plant loaded onto County 
Trucks 750-21 6779 $54.00 NO BID NO BID 

  Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-21 6779 54.00 Plus Hauling NO BID NO BID 

. Hauling First Mile 750-77 7084 $3.25 NO BID NO BID 

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7085 $0.20 NO BID NO BID 

 Price per ton in place 750-21 7086 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Hauling First Mile NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 Hauling Each Additional Mile NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 State minimum truckload if required 14 tons NO BID NO BID 

Price per TON Price per TON Price per TON

  Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-21 6767 NO BID NO BID $110.00

 Hauling First Mile 750-77 8201 NO BID NO BID $3.00

Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 8202 NO BID NO BID $0.30

Price per ton for Spreader Bar 750-21 6768 NO BID NO BID $10.00

MILEAGE MILEAGE MILEAGE

6 26 14

23 14 40

3 25 15

23 19 28

10 33 1

14 40 25

24 5 38

5.9 RECLAIMED CEMENT FOR STABILIZATION OF MATERIALS 
(ROAD MIXED)
*Shall consist of reclaimed portland cement, Class A or Class H, containing no toxic or 
hazardous components other than crystalline silica, delivered in tanker-type trucks to 
jobsite anywher

County Facility

5.8 ASPHALT STABILIZED BASE -BLACK BASE
Per TxDOT Item 292.4(A), Grade 1

5.7 CEMENT FOR STABILIZATION OF MATERIALS (ROAD MIXED)
*Shall consist of portland cement, Type I, IP, or II in accordance with TxDOT Item 524.2., 
delivered in tanker-type trucks to jobsite anywhere in Brazoria County.  Price bid shall 
include distributor 

Hanson Park

Camp Mohawk

Angleton Svc Ctr

Alvin Svc Ctr

Airport

Clute Svc Ctr

Manvel Svc Ctr



STABILIZING MATERIALS COMM CODE COUNTY ID # PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION PLANT LOCATION

3 24 14

22 46 11

23 14 36

30 56 20

14 32 25W. Columbia Svc

San Luis Cty Park

Resoft Park

Quintana Cty Park

Mosquito Control



STABILIZING MATERIALS COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

5.1 LIME

5.1.1 Hydrated Lime

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-95 9204

 Hauling First Mile 750-95

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-95

 Price per ton for Spreader Bar

 State Minimum truckload if required 750-95

5.1.2 Lime Slurry 6750

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-95

 Hauling First Mile 750-95

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-95

 Price per ton for Spreader Bar

 State Minimum truckload if required

5.2.1  6% cement by weight

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-77 6752

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-77 6752

 Hauling First Mile 750-77 7104

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7105

 State Minimum truckload if required 750-77

5.2.2   8% cement by weight

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-77 6753

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-77 6753

 Hauling First Mile 750-77 7106

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7107

 State Minimum truckload if required

5.2.3.  12% cement by weight

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-77 6754

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-77 6754

 Hauling First Mile 750-77 7108

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7109

 State Minimum truckload if required

5.3.1  3-1/2% cement by weight

ITB#21-33 ROAD MATERIALS - STABILIZING 
BID TABULATION

5.2 CEMENT STABILIZED SAND 
*Shall consist of sand, free of foreign matter and having a plasticity index not exceeding 
10, stabilized with cement in proportions bid as follows:

5.3  CEMENT STABILIZED BASE-LIMESTONE
*Shall consist of a Portland cement treated base material, composed of new crushed 
limestone, cement, and water, mixed at a central mixing plant.

VULCAN CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS 
LLC

PLANT LOCATION

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Price per TON

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Price per TON

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Price per TON

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Price per TON

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Price per TON



STABILIZING MATERIALS COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

 

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-91 6757

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-91 6757

 Hauling First Mile 750-77 7114

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7115

 State Minimum truckload if required

5.3.2   6% cement by weight

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-91 6758

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-91 6758

 Hauling First Mile 750-77 7116

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7117

 State Minimum truckload if required

5.4.1 6% cement by weight

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-91 6750

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-91 6760

 Hauling First Mile 750-77 7120

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7121

 State Minimum truckload if required

5.4.2  12% cement by weight

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-91 9205

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite: 750-91 9205

 Hauling First Mile 750-77 9206

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 9207

 State Minimum truckload if required

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-04 6761

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-04 6761

Hauling First Mile 750-77

Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77

Price per ton for Spreader Bar 750-04

 State Minimum truckload if required

Price per ton bidder's plant / siding loaded onto 
County trucks 750-04 6762

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-04 6762

Hauling First Mile 750-77

5.6  LIME-FLY ASH PLANT MIX
*Shall consist of a homogeneous blend of not less than 30 percent lime by weight which 
meets the specification for Hydrated Lime in Item II.1.A of these specifications.  The 
balance of the mix shall consist of fly ash meeting the specification for Fly Ash in Item 
2.1.6. of these specifications or in TxDOT Item 265.

5.5 FLY ASH
*Shall consist of Class "C" fly ash meeting ASTM Specification C-593, Section 3.2, when 
sampled and tested in accordance with Sections 4, 6 and 8.

5.4 CEMENT STABILIZED RECLAIMED BASE-CRUSHED 
CONCRETE
*Shall consist of a Portland cement treated reclaimed base material, cement, and 
water, mixed at a central mixing plant.

PLANT LOCATION

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Price per TON

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Price per TON

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Price per TON

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Price per TON

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Price per TON

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 



STABILIZING MATERIALS COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

 

Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77

Price per ton for Spreader Bar

State Minimum truckload if required 750-04

Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-21 6765

Hauling First Mile 750-77 8199

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 8200

 Price per ton for Spreader Bar 750-21 6766

 State minimum truckload if required

 Price per ton bidder's plant loaded onto County 
Trucks 750-21 6779

  Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-21 6779

. Hauling First Mile 750-77 7084

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 7085

 Price per ton in place 750-21 7086

 Hauling First Mile

 Hauling Each Additional Mile

 State minimum truckload if required

  Price per ton as delivered to jobsite 750-21 6767

 Hauling First Mile 750-77 8201

Hauling Each Additional Mile 750-77 8202

Price per ton for Spreader Bar 750-21 6768

5.9 RECLAIMED CEMENT FOR STABILIZATION OF MATERIALS 
(ROAD MIXED)
*Shall consist of reclaimed portland cement, Class A or Class H, containing no toxic or 
hazardous components other than crystalline silica, delivered in tanker-type trucks to 
jobsite anywher

County Facility

5.8 ASPHALT STABILIZED BASE -BLACK BASE
Per TxDOT Item 292.4(A), Grade 1

5.7 CEMENT FOR STABILIZATION OF MATERIALS (ROAD MIXED)
*Shall consist of portland cement, Type I, IP, or II in accordance with TxDOT Item 524.2., 
delivered in tanker-type trucks to jobsite anywhere in Brazoria County.  Price bid shall 
include distributor 

Hanson Park

Camp Mohawk

Angleton Svc Ctr

Alvin Svc Ctr

Airport

Clute Svc Ctr

Manvel Svc Ctr

PLANT LOCATION

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Price per TON

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Price per TON

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

Price per TON

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

NO BID 

MILEAGE

64 / $28.12

69 / 29.32

65 / $28.12

62 / $28.12

73 / 29.70

50 / $25.65

60 / 27.06



STABILIZING MATERIALS COMM CODE COUNTY ID #

 

W. Columbia Svc

San Luis Cty Park

Resoft Park

Quintana Cty Park

Mosquito Control

PLANT LOCATION

63 / $28.12

77 / $30.58

66 / $29.32

94 / $32.78

49 / $25.65

ALTERNATE PRODUCT

 Price per ton bidder's plant loaded onto County 
Trucks 13

  Price per ton as delivered to jobsite SEE MILAGE

. Hauling First Mile $4.70

 Hauling Each Additional Mile 0.21

 State minimum truckload if required 22 Tons

Plant Locations Simonton

SAND-MFG CONCRETE SAND (C33)


	Bid Tabulation

