ITB #21-51 CR 723 RECONSTRUCTION

BIDDERS NAME

ANGEL BROTHERS

WADECON, LLC

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT COMPANY, INC.

TLC CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT SERVICES, INC.

BID SUMMARY ADDRESS 1525 LAKEVILLE DR. SUITE 115 545 WILSON ROAD 11714 CHARLES ROAD

BID OPEN DATE: KINGWOOD, TX 77339 FREEPORT, TX 77541 HOUSTON, TX 77041

WEDNESDAY, JUNE 16, 2021 AT 11:00 AM LOCAL TIME CONTACT PERSON JERRY WADE DALTON GARDNER CHRIS GWYN

LOCATION: TELEPHONE NO. 281-348-0853 979-233-3366 281-357-4069

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM FAX NUMBER 979-233-6167 713-849-2734

451 N. VELASCO ST., SUITE 100, ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL DSCHOMER@WADECON.COM DALTON@VERNOR.COM CGWYN@TLCCCS.COM

TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE

BASE BID SECTION 1 NO BID BASE BID SECTION 1 NO BID BASE BID SECTION 1 S 2,340,531.55 |BASE BID SECTION 1 S 2,665,028.20
BASE BID SECTION 2 NO BID BASE BID SECTION 2 NO BID BASE BID SECTION 2 S 1,080,247.00 |BASE BID SECTION 2 S 1,160,144.54
BASE BID TOTAL NO BID BASE BID TOTAL NO BID BASE BID TOTAL S 3,420,778.55 |BASE BID TOTAL $ 3,825,172.74
ALTERNATIVE BID SECTION1 | $ 2,229,474.30 |ALTERNATIVE BID SECTION1 | $ 1,741,455.83 |ALTERNATIVE BID SECTION1 | $ 2,099,982.50 |ALTERNATIVE BID SECTION1 | $ 2,331,162.17
ALTERNATIVE BID SECTION 2 | $ 1,039,950.89 |ALTERNATIVE BID SECTION2 | $ 728,623.60 |ALTERNATIVE BID SECTION2 | $ 921,588.50 |ALTERNATIVE BID SECTION2 | $ 1,039,156.95

ITEM | SPEC CODE DESCRIPTION UNIT ‘ QTY. |ALTERNATIVE BID TOTAL S 3,269,425.19 |ALTERNATIVE BID TOTAL $ 2,470,079.43 |ALTERNATIVE BID TOTAL S 3,021,571.00 |ALTERNATIVE BID TOTAL $ 3,370,319.12
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