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ALCOHOL, ISOPROPYL, 70%, 16 OZ 7291 1028806 16 OZ BT CUMBERLAND $2.02 Bottle  112-7067 HENRY SCHEIN 1.57$                                                           $1.52 

EFA-4101 
Alcohol 
Isopropyl 
16Oz Btl 
ea

ALCOHOL WIPES, INDIVIDUALLY 
WRAPPED 7292 1126131 200/BX COVIDIEN $1.61 Box 1126131 HENRY SCHEIN 1.81$                                                           $1.55 

EFA-4150 
Alcohol 
Prep 
Sterile,Me
dium, 
200/Bx 
(1113) bx

APPLICATORS, WOOD,  COTTON TIP, 6" 
STERILE,  7294 2670051 100/BX DYNAREX $2.75 Box 4304 DYNAREX 4.08$                                                           $2.43 

EFA-4411 
S Cotton 
Tip 
Applic, 6" 
100/Bx 
(4304) bx

BANDAGE JR, SHEER, 3/8 X 1 1/2 7295 6780359 100/BX MEDLINE $1.25 Box 6780359 MEDLINE 0.75$                                                           $1.01 

EFA-1107 
Kids Band-
Aid  
3/8"X1.5" 
100/Bx 
(NON255
09/3608) 
bx

BANDAGE, PLASTIC, 3/4 X 3 7296 1668684 12BX/CS ASO $17.24 Case 1275033 DUKAL 22.98$                                                         1,500/Case $1.65 

EFA-1103 
Plstc Adh 
Band, 3/4 
X 3, 
100Bx bx

BANDAGE, SHEER, 7/8 SPOT 7297 1555713 100/BX DERMA $0.99 Box 1126143 HENRY SCHEIN 1.23$                                                           

BANDAGE, FLEXIBLE FABRIC, 7/8 SPOT 7298 1271247 100/BX DERMA $1.49 Box 1271247 DUKAL 2.05$                                                           $1.43 

EFA-1112 
7/8" Spot 
Band, 
Plastic 
100/Bx 
(3607) bx

CONTAINER, SHARP, 4 QT, RED, 
MEDIUM, STACKABLE (BRAND OR 
EQUIVALENT) 7299 1532682 EA MEDICAL ACTION $3.52 Each 676236 CARDINAL $3.81 

EIC-3536 
Sharps 
Cont. 1 
Gallon 
#8703 ea

CONTAINER SHARP 8.2 QT RED LARGE 7300 9876359 EA BECTOR-DICKINSON $8.05 Each 9876359
BECTON-

DICKINSON 6.34$                                                           $7.12 

EIC-
352305 B-
D Sharps 
Cont 8.2 
Qt 
#305490 
ea

CONTAINER SHARP 6.9 QT RED 7692 9875824 EA BECTOR-DICKINSON $7.25 Each 9875824
BECTON-

DICKINSON 7.60$                                                           $6.95 

EIC-
352304 
BD 
Sharps 
Collector, 
6.9 Qt, 
Medium, 
Red 
(305489) 
ea

COTTON BALLS MEDIUM NON-STERILE 7664 1000468 4000/CA RICHMOND DENTAL $13.02 1000468 HENRY SCHEIN 14.09$                                                         500/Bag $6.87 

EFA-4415 
Cotton 
Balls 
2000/Bag 
(3170) bg

CUP, PLASTIC, 1 OZ, GRADUATED IN 
CC'S AND OZ, 7420 1000580 100/PK DYNAREX $0.52 $0.90 Pack 1125555 HENRY SCHEIN 0.84$                                                           100/Sleeve $0.64 

EFA-4599 
Medicine 
Cups 1Oz  
100/Pk 
(4258) pk

DRAPE SHEET 2 PLY 40 X 48 BLUE 7302 1099605 100/CA GRAHAM $17.25 Case 73715 HENRY SCHEIN 17.60$                                                         $20.61 

EIC-
188503 
Drape 
Sheets 
Tissue 
Poly 
40x48 Tidi 
brand cs

FILM DRESSING, TEGADERM, 3M, 
FRAME STYLE 1622W, 1 3/4" X 1 3/4" 7303 7778721 100/CA 3M MEDICAL $55.47 Case 1622W 3M MEDICAL $20.83 

EFA-3524 
Tegaderm 
2-3/8" X 2-
3/4 
100/Bx bx

GLOVE, EXAM, LATEX, TEXTURED, 
POWDER FREE, NOVAPLUS, SIZE 
MEDIUM 7305 1530141 150/BX CARDINAL

$19.85/150    JobGuard-Medium-LPFG-E. Mfr: 
Spring-fill. Item #7305

Case of 10 
Boxes 1530141 CARDINAL $11.50 

GLOVE EXAM VINYL SMALL POWDER-
FREE 7307 1026721 100/BX PINNACLE $7.50 $6.54 

$9.84/100  Med Pride-Small-VPFG-E. Mfr: Med 
Pride. Item #7307 $9.98 

Case of 10 
Boxes 20211 SHAMROCK 13.95$                                                         $8.50 

GLOVES, VINYL, POWDER-FREE, 
LATEX-FREE, CRITERION, MEDIUM,   7696 1025338 100/BX SEMPERMED $5.50 $6.54 

$9.84/100  Med Mride-Medium-VPFG-V. Mfr: 
Med Mride. Item #7696 $9.98 

Case of 10 
Boxes 20212 SHAMROCK $8.50 
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GLOVE, NITRILE, LATEX-FREE, 
POWDER-FREE, TEXTURED, SUPRENO 
EC, SIZE LARGE
THICKNESS: 5.9 mils palm, cuf 4.7mils, 7.9 
mils finger 7768 5657125 50/BX MICROFLEX $15.00 Box 5657125 MICROFLEX $24.99 BOX $16.50 
GLOVE, NITRILE, LATEX-FREE, 
POWDER-FREE, TEXTURED, SUPRENO 
EC, SIZE MEDIUM
THICKNESS: 5.9 mils palm, cuf 4.7mils, 7.9 
mils finger 7769 5652065 50/BX MICROFLEX $15.00 Box 5652065 MICROFLEX $24.99 BOX $16.50 
GLOVE, NITRILE, LATEX-FREE, 
POWDER-FREE, TEXTURED, SUPRENO 
EC, SIZE SMALL
THICKNESS: 5.9 mils palm, cuf 4.7mils, 7.9 
mils finger 7770 5654791 50/BX MICROFLEX $15.00 Box 5654791 MICROFLEX $24.99 BOX $16.50 
GLOVE, DIAMOND GRIP, POWDER-
FREE, LATEX, SMALL
THICKNESS: 7.2mils palm, cuff 63.0 mils, 
finger 10.3 mils 8126 5655860 100/BX MICROFLEX no bid 5655860 MICROFLEX $19.99 BOX
GLOVE, DIAMOND GRIP, POWDER-
FREE, LATEX, MEDIUM
THICKNESS: 7.2mils palm, cuff 63.0 mils, 
finger 10.3 mils 7888 5650694 100/BX MICROFLEX no bid 5650694 MICROFLEX $19.99 BOX
GLOVE, DIAMOND GRIP, POWDER-
FREE, LATEX, EXTRA-LARGE
THICKNESS: 7.2mils palm, cuff 63.0 mils, 
finger 10.3 mils 7889 5651329 100/BX MICROFLEX no bid 5651329 MICROFLEX $19.99 BOX
GLOVE, DIAMOND GRIP, POWDER-
FREE, LATEX, LARGE
THICKNESS: 7.2mils palm, cuff 63.0 mils, 
finger 10.3 mils 7918 5651061 100/BX MICROFLEX no bid 5651061 MICROFLEX 14.50$                                                         $19.99 BOX

LUER HOLDER, MULTI-SAMPLE, 5ML, 
DISPOSABLE, NON-STERILE 9013 3377113 100/BX EXEL INTER $8.30 Box 3377113 EXEL INTER $13.11 

EDI-3096 
Monoject 
Regular 
Blood 
Tube 
Holder, 
13mm 
Diameter, 
100/bx 
(8881610
102) bx

NEEDLE BLOOD 22 X 1 1/4 ECLIPSE 7309 9872645 48/BX BECTOR-DICKINSON $22.31 Box 9872645
BECTON-

DICKINSON $12.32 

EDI-
339210 
Safety 
Needles 
22G x 1-
1/2 50/bx 
(8881850
215) bx

NEEDLE ECLIPSE 23 X 1 7310 9874963 100/BX BECTOR-DICKINSON $11.34 Box SN2310 HENRY SCHEIN $12.94 

EDI-
339212 
Safety 
Needles 
23G x 1 
50/bx 
(8881850
310) bx

SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3ML 23 X 1 
RETRACTING 7311 9876244 100/BX BECTOR-DICKINSON $23.92 Box 100077IM SOL-MILLENIUM $14.76 

EDI-
341011 
Magellan 
Safety 
3ML 23G 
x 1" 50/bx 
(8881833
310) bx

SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 25 X 5/8 
RETRACTING 7312 9875659 100/BX BECTOR-DICKINSON $24.92 Box 100078IM SOL-MILLENIUM $14.76 

EDI-
341012 
Magellan 
Safety 
3ML 25G 
x 1" 50/bx 
(8881833
510) bx

SYRINGE / NEEDLE 3 ML 22 X 1 1/2 
RETRACTING 7313 9875497 100/BX BECTOR-DICKINSON $25.72 

Case of 8 
Boxes 100076IM SOL-MILLENIUM $15.82 

EDI-
341010 
Magellan 
Safety 
3ML 22G 
x 1-1/2" 
50/bx 
(8881833
215) bx

NEEDLE, PRECISION GLIDE, 25G X 1 1/2 8127 9870092 100/BX BECTOR-DICKINSON $3.29 Box 112515 SOL-MILLENIUM $12.85 

EDI-
339215 
Safety 
Needles 
25G x 1-
1/2 50/bx 
(8881850
515) bx

VACUTAINER SAFETY-LOK BLOOD 
COLLECTION SET, 23 X .75 NEEDLE 
WITH 12" TUBING 7315 9878940 25/BX BECTOR-DICKINSON $39.05 Box 9878940

BECTON-
DICKINSON $49.70 

EDI-3083 
23G x 3/4 
12" Tube 
with Luer 
Adapter 
50/bx bx

STETHOSCOPE, DUAL-HEAD, RED 7320 4996136 EA MEDSOURCE $2.95 Each 4996136 MEDSOURCE $2.38 

EDI-7350-
BL 
Dualhead 
Stethosco
pe, Blue 
(MS-
70032) ea

TOWEL, 4 PLY, 13.5" X 18",  WHITE 8125 8955218 50/BX TIDI $4.25 Box 8955218 TIDI

TOURNIQUET, LATEX-FREE, 1" X 18" 7322 4673571 100/BX PDI $9.30 Box NLT4100 DUKAL 32.11$                                                         EACH $8.30 

EFA-
350100 
Tournique
ts, Latex 
Free 
100/Pk 
(10921) 
pk

TOWELETTE, OBSTETRICAL 7323 1135633 100/BX PDI $3.27 Box 1135633 MEDLINE 1.77$                                                           100/PACK $1.83 

EFA-
410900 
Obstetrica
l 
Towelette
s, 100/Bx 
(1302) bx



SYRINGE WITH NEEDLE, LL, DISP, 3CC, 
25G X 5/8, 100/BOX, 7663 9872220 100/BX BECTON $9.93 Box 26100 EXEL INTER $12.67 

EDI-
340530 
3ML 
Syringe 
25G X 
5/8" 
100/bx 
(1180325
058) bx

NEEDLE SYRINGE, PRECISION GLIDE, 
3CC, 23 x 1LL, 100/BOX 7388 9877076 100/BX BECTON $9.63 Box 26101 EXEL INTER $12.67 

EDI-
340528 
3ML 
Syringe 
23G X 1" 
100/bx 
(1180323
100) bx

NEEDLE, 23 X 1, PRECISION GLIDE, 
100/BOX 7389 9875590 100/BX BECTON $9.85 Box  305194

BECTON-
DICKINSON $12.63 

EDI-
339212 
Safety 
Needles 
23G x 1 
50/bx 
(8881850
310) bx

NEEDLE, HYPODERMIC, 23 X 1, 
100/BOX 7390 9870934 100/BX BECTON $3.50 Box 112310 SOL-MILLENIUM $2.98 

EDI-
339130 
Hypo 
Needle 
23G X 1" 
100/bx 
(6970) bx

GAUZE SPONGES, COTTON WOVEN, 
STERILE, 2" X 2", 12 PLY, 2 PER PACKL, 
50 PKS/BX, 7416 9336780 100/BX DUKAL $3.75 

Case of 24 
Boxes 1212 DUKAL 1.03$                                                           200/Bag $0.83 

EFA-1030 
S 2X2, 8-
Ply 2'S, 
50 Pk/Bx 
(8500) bx

GAUZE, 2X2, 8 PLY, N/C WHITE, 7695 1562063 5000/CS DUKAL $25.00 Case 2085 DUKAL 1.03$                                                           200/Bag $0.81 

EFA-1017 
NS 2X2, 
8-Ply 
200/Pk 
(3222) pk

GAUZE BANDAGE ROLLS, 4.5" X 3.1 
YDS, 8 PLY, STERILE,  7417 8908610 EA COVIDIEN $2.00 Each 6716 CARDINAL $0.86 

EFA-1008 
S 
Conform 
Bandage 
4.5" 6 -Ply 
(645) ea

BANDAGE, GAUZE, 2" X 3.5 YDS, 
STERILE, 12/BX, 7418 8900060 96/CA COVIDIEN $49.98 Case 441250 CARDINAL $1.32 

EFA-1004 
S 
Conform 
Gauze 2", 
12 Rls/Bx 
(8513) bx

TAPE, SURGICAL, TRANSPARENT, 
WATER RESISTANT, PERFORATED 
PLASTIC, 1" X 10 YDS, 7419 7777305 12/BX 3M MEDICAL $7.90 Box HP8111 DUKAL 12.36$                                                         12/PACK $9.64 

EFA-
115601 
3M 
Transpore 
Surgical 
Tape, 1" x 
10 Yds, 
12/bx bx

HYDROGEN PEROXIDE, 8 OZ,  7421 4718454 EA CUMBERLAND $99.00 Each 1127012 HENRY SCHEIN 0.59$                                                           $0.80 

EFA-
410008 
Hydrogen 
Peroxide 
Topical 
Antiseptic 
Solution, 
8oz Bottle 
ea

SPECIMEN CUPS, WITH SCREW-ON LID 
AND LABEL, STERILE, 4 OZ, 7661 6066028 100/CA GLOBE $11.50 Case 9007433 HENRY SCHEIN 27.87$                                                         100/BOX $0.10 

EIC-5455 
Specimen 
Cup 
W/Lid, 4 
Oz. 
(AS343) 
ea

LANCETS, FINGERSTIX,  9508 9007980 100/BX HENRY SCHEIN $6.50 Box 9007980 HENRY SCHEIN $12.50 

EDI-
327703-
oR 
Microdot 
Pro 
Lancet 
23G x 
2.2mm 
200/bx 
(523-23) 
bx

SCALE LINERS, INFANT, 131/2X18, 2 
PLY, 7694 1106952 250/CA TIDI 18..25 Case 981222 TIDI

SYRINGES, VANISH PT, 1CC 
W/NEEDLE,27x1/2" 9029 7011396 100/BX RETRACTABLE $45.75 Box 7011396 RETRACTABLE $12.63 

EDI-
339214 
Safety 
Needles 
25G x 1 
50/bx 
(8973) bx

GLOVES,NITRILE, PURPLE,SIZE SMALL
THICKNESS: 6ML 9030 1070501 100/BX KIMBERLY

$28.75/100     Aurelia/Procure-Small-NPFG. Mfr: 
Supermax/Procure. Item #9030 $35.00 Box 1070501 HALYARD $29.26 

EGL-
529001-s 
PURPLE 
NITRILE, 
Small 
100/Bx 
(55081) 
bx

GLOVES,EXAM,LATEX,POWDER FREE, 
SIZE LARGE,(DASH MEDICAL GLOVES)
THICKNESS: 3.4 ml palm, 4 ml finger 9031 1522450 100/BX DASH $13.50 Generic

$12.75/100 JobGuard-Large-LPFG-E. Mfr: 
Spring-fill. Item #9031 $16.75 Box 1522450 DASH $11.07 

EGL-
522003-s 
Comfort 
Grip Lg 
Latex 
100/Box 
bx



JELLY,LUBRICATING,STERILE,WATER 
SOLUBLE,FLIP TOP TUBE 4oz 9032 1181350 12/BX HR PHARMACEUTICAL $20.00 Box 1181350

HR 
PHARMACEUTICA

L $1.26 

EFA-
417210 
Lube Jelly  
4 Oz  
Tube 
(880) ea

PROBE COVER,DISPOSABLE,SURE 
TEMP PLUS MODEL 690 & 
692,ELECTRONIC THERMOMETER 9033 1152618 250/PK WELCH ALLYN $10.00 Pack 05031-750 WELCH ALLYN 9.91$                                                           250/BOX $8.42 

EDI-7456 
SureTem
p 
Disposabl
e 
Thermom
eter Probe 
Covers, 
250/bx bx

 MASK, SURGICAL, WITH EAR LOOPS, 
BLUE 9034 1043809 50/BX AR MEDICON $5.83 $5.00 

Case of 6 
Boxes 1541 DUKAL 12.87$                                                         $27.44 

EIC-
515413 
Surgical 
Mask, 
Splashgu
ard Visor, 
Level 3, 
25/box 
(47147) 
bx

WIPE,LARGE SURFACE,GERMICIDAL 
DISPOSABLE,SANI-CLOTH AF3, 6x6.75 9036 2670039 160/PK PDI $10.00 

Case of 12 
Canisters N1325-CC WEXFORD

PAPER, EXAM TABLE, WHITE, SMOOTH, 
21" x 225' ROLL 9364 3953252 12/CA GRAHAM $28.16 Case 74071 HENRY SCHEIN 36.24$                                                         $32.99 

EMI-
805010 
Examtabl
e Paper 
Smooth 
18X225 
12rl/cs cs

HAND SANITIZER, INSTANT, ALOE, 8 OZ 
PUMP 9366 5900011 12/BT/CA GOJO $75.00 

Case of 24 
Bottles 17371 SAFE-TEC 3.90$                                                           EACH $1.20 

EIC-
630303 
Dawnmist 
Hand 
Sanitizer 
8 Oz 
(HS3794) 
ea

WRAP, TAN, SELF-ADHERENT, LATEX 
FREE, ECONOMY, 1" x 5 YD ROLL 9367 6819862 30/CA ANDOVER $15.67 Box of 30 1127363 HENRY SCHEIN 35.36$                                                         $7.24 

EFA-
107801 
Cohesive 
Bdg, Tan 
1X5 Yd 
30/Bx 
(8015T) 
bx

APPLICATOR STICKS, PLAIN, 6" 9368 1009485 1000/BX GOODCARD $6.25 Box 95-8701-10 C&A SCIENTIFIC 4.15$                                                           $2.40 

EFA-4408 
Cotton Tip 
Applicator
s, 3", Ns 
10pk/bx 
(4301) bx

BANDAGE, SHUR-BAND, ELASTIC, 
LATEX FREE, SURE-BAND, 2" x 5 YD 
ROLL 9369 8299953 10/BX HARTMAN $8.90 Box 59520000 HARTMAN 12.04$                                                         $13.90 

EFA-
107802 
Cohesive 
Bdg, Tan 
2X5 Yd 
36/Bx 
(8025T) 
bx

BANDAGE, SHUR-BAND, ELASTIC, 
LATEX FREE, SURE-BAND, 3" x 5 YD 
ROLL 9370 8295759 10/BX HARTMAN $9.77 Box 59530000 HARTMAN 14.52$                                                         $26.96 

EFA-
107803 
Cohesive 
Bdg, Tan 
3X5 Yd 
24/Bx 
(8035T) 
bx

BANDAGE, SHUR-BAND, ELASTIC, 
LATEX FREE, SURE-BAND, 4" x 5 YD 
ROLL 9371 8292743 10/BX HARTMAN $10.68 Box 59540000 HARTMAN 18.00$                                                         $12.63 

EFA-
107804 
Cohesive 
Bdg, Tan 
4X5 Yd 
18/Bx 
(8045T) 
bx

TOWEL, C-FOLD, WHITE, 10-1/8" X 12-
3/4" 9372 1204781 2400/CA GEORGIA PACIFIC $19.88 Case 06362-01 HENRY SCHEIN 26.41$                                                         

TAPE, PAPER, SURGICAL, WHITE, 1" X 
10 YD ROLL 9373 1019673 12/BX DUKAL $5.15 Box 1019673 DUKAL 3.89$                                                           $3.21 

EFA-
115801 
Paper 
Tape 1" X 
10 Yds 
12/Bx 
(P110) bx

CUP, PAPER, POLY COAT, 5 OZ 9374 9491478 1000/CA MEDICOM $27.90 Case
115-

CHARC HENRY SCHEIN 4.90$                                                           

PAPER, CREPE, EXAM TABLE, WHITE, 
18" x 125' ROLL 9375 1161643 12RL/CA ANALON $17.32 Case 73743 HENRY SCHEIN 22.28$                                                         $32.99 

EMI-
805010 
Examtabl
e Paper 
Smooth 
18X225 
12rl/cs cs

GLOVE, STRECH, VINYL, LATEX FREE, 
POWDER FREE, MEDIUM 9376 9870355 150/BX MEDLINE

$23.85/150 FoodHandler-Medium-VNB.Mfr: 
FoodHandler. Item #9376 $9.98 

Case of 10 
Boxes 20212 SHAMROCK 13.95$                                                         100/Box $9.00 

GLOVE, STRECH, VINYL, LATEX FREE, 
POWDER FREE, LARGE 9377 9870356 150/BX MEDLINE

$23.85/150 FoodHandler-Large-VNB. Mfr: 
Foodhandler. Item #9377 $9.98 

Case of 10 
Boxes 20213 SHAMROCK 13.95$                                                         100/Box $9.00 

GLOVE, STRECH, VINYL, LATEX FREE, 
POWDER FREE, EXTRA-LARGE 9378 9870357 130/BX MEDLINE

$21.50/130 FoodHandler-XL-VNB. Mfr: 
Foodhandler. Item #9378 $9.98 

Case of 10 
Boxes 20214 SHAMROCK 13.95$                                                         100/Box $9.00 

SOAP, VIONEX ANTIMICROBIAL, PUMP 
BOTTLE, 18 OZ 9379 1763829 18 OZ/BT VIRO $11.02 Each 1763829 METREX $11.95 

EIC-6420 
Vionex 
Antimicro
bial Liquid 
Hand 
Soap, 
18oz 
Pump 
Bottle (10-
1518) ea



NEEDLE,25gx5/8" PRECISIONGLIDE 
REG BEVEL STRL BLUE, 9517 9870029

100/BX
10 BX/CS PRECISIONGLIDE $54.50 Case 6972 DYNAREX $12.77 

EDI-
339213 
Safety 
Needles 
25G x 5/8 
50/bx 
(8881850
558) bx
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