ES OPCO USA INC. dba CLARKE MOSQUITO CONTROL
BIDDERS NAME VESERIS
ITB #21-48 MOSQUITO CONTROL CHEMICALS ADDRESS 10800 PECAN PARK BLVD
Iw TABULATION AUSTIN, TX 78750 SANFORD, FL 32771
OPEN DATE: THURSDAY, JUNE 25, 2021 AT 11:00 A.M. CONTACT PERSON KEITH HAAS KATHY RUSSELL
LOCATION: PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM TELEPHONE NO. 713-203-0436 407-328-6519
451 N. VELASCO ST., SUITE 100 FAX NO. 866-330-9888
ANGLETON, TEXAS 77515 EMAIL KEITH.HAAS@VESERIS.COM CUSTOMERCARE @ CLARKE.COM |BIDS@MYADAPCO.COM
PROVIDE | VENDOR | DAYS TO PROVIDE[ VENDOR | DAYSTO
DESCRIPTION QrY uom UN'LZFL‘E:OENPER Ex;sl"(‘:[;ED PROVIDEMIX | VENDOR PRODUCT DET:V:RTER o | UNIT PRICE PER GALLON Ex:gl"::':éED MIX | PRODUCT | DELIVER UNILZTE:chPER Ex;sl"(‘:[;ED MIX | PRODUCT | DELIVER
RATIO RATIO NAME ARO RATIO | NAME ARO
2.0 PERMETHRIN 30-30 CONCENTRATE - 30 GALLON CONTAINER 30 DRUM $55.34 range from neet, to $65.00 $69.13/g! PermaSease 30-
annual for 2020 were: $34,000.00) $1,660.00 [1:1,to 1:14 MasterLine Kontrol 30-30 1 $1,950.00 per label [Biomist 30+30 7 [52,073.90/drum _|Mix 1-4 2-5 Days ARO
3.0 PERMETHRIN 31-67 CONCENTRATE - 30 GALLON CONTAINER 30 DRUM $93.20 range from neet to No Bid $91.76/g! Permasease 31-
Estimated annual for 2020 were: $0.00) $2,796.00 |1:8 Masterline Kontrol 31-67 1 $2,752.80/drum _|Mix 1-4 67 2-5 Days ARO.
We do have
o BULK $55.80 No 8id No Bid Fyfanon ULV
4.0 MALATHION - BULK PRICE (Estimated available in 260
annual for 2020 were: $141,000.00) $55.80 |neet, 1:1 Fyfanon ULV 5 el totes
5.0 NALED - 30 GALLON DRUM (Estimated Dibrom
DRUM NA No Bi 254.11,
annual expenditures for 2020 were: $500,000.00) ® v obid S5l $7,623.30/drum_|Neat Concentrate _[2-5 Days ARO
5.0 NALED ( Does vendor retrieve containers after use? YES OR NO (reply in box A
named days to deliver ARO) ves
6.0 B.T.I. BACILLUS THURINGIENSIS, SEROTYPE H-14 25
GALLON CONTAINER Vectobac 12AS
Estimated annual expenditures for 2020 were: $300.00) 25 CAN $40.00 $100.00 |.25-2 pints per acre |Aqua Bac XT 1 No Bid $32.74/gl [81.85/2.5 gl jug 160z/acre 2x2.5gl ¢s 2-5 Days ARO
7.0 BONIDE - 2.5 GALLON CONTAINER (Estimated
annual expenditures for 2020 were $300.00) 25 cAN na No gid No gid
BVA 2 Larvicide
5 GALLON 5 CAN No Bid $12.94/gl $64.70/can-pail Neat oil 2-5 Days ARO
BVA 2 Larvicide
55 GALLON CONTAINER 55 DRUM No Bid $9.98/gl $548.90/drum Neat oil 2-5 Days ARO
8.0 METHOPRENE EXTENDED RESIDUAL BRIQUET - "INGOT DESIGN"
ALTOSID XR EXTENDED RESIDUAL BRIQUET "INGOT DESIGN" - CASE 1 per 100-200 Altosid XR Metalarv XRP
Estimated annual for 2020 were $75,000.00) CASE $759.00 $759.00 |square feet Altosid XR Briguet 2 $3.45/briquet $759.00 Ingots 7 No Bid $1,760.00/cs None (800wsp/cs) 2-5 Days ARO
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