ITB #21-51 CR 723 RECONSTRUCTION

BIDDERS NAME|

ANGEL BROTHERS ENTERPRISES, LTD.

WADECON,

LLC

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT COMPANY, INC.

TLC CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT SERVICES, INC.

BID TABULATION ADDRESS 3003 KILGORE PARKWAY 1525 LAKEVILLE DR. SUITE 115 545 WILSON ROAD 11714 CHARLES ROAD
BID OPEN DATE: BAYTOWN, TX 77523 KINGWOOD, TX 77339 FREEPORT, TX 77541 HOUSTON, TX 77041
WEDNESDAY, JUNE 16, 2021 AT 11:00 AM LOCAL TIME CONTACT PERSON GARY ENDLER JERRY WADE DALTON GARDNER CHRIS GWYN

LOCATION:

TELEPHONE NO.

281-421-5721

281-348-0853

979-233-3366

281-357-4069

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM FAX NUMBER| 281-421-5796 979-233-6167 713-849-2734
451 N. VELASCO ST., SUITE 100, ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL] GARY.ENDLER@ANGELBROTHERS.COM DSCHOMER@WADECON.COM DALTON@VERNOR.COM CGWYN@TLCCCS.COM
TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE TOTAL PRICE
BASE BID SECTION 1 NO BID BASE BID SECTION 1 NO BID BASE BID SECTION 1 S 2,340,531.55 |BASE BID SECTION 1 S 2,665,028.20
BASE BID SECTION 2 NO BID BASE BID SECTION 2 NO BID BASE BID SECTION 2 S 1,080,247.00 |BASE BID SECTION 2 S 1,160,144.54
BASE BID TOTAL NO BID BASE BID TOTAL NO BID BASE BID TOTAL $ 3,420,778.55 |BASE BID TOTAL $ 3,825,172.74
ALTERNATIVE BID SECTION 1 S 2,229,474.30 |ALTERNATIVE BID SECTION 1 S 1,741,455.83 | ALTERNATIVE BID SECTION 1 S 2,099,982.50 |ALTERNATIVE BID SECTION 1 S 2,331,162.17
ALTERNATIVE BID SECTION 2 S 1,039,950.89 |ALTERNATIVE BID SECTION 2 S 728,623.60 | ALTERNATIVE BID SECTION 2 S 921,588.50 | ALTERNATIVE BID SECTION 2 S 1,039,156.95
ITEM | SPEC CODE DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY. |ALTERNATIVE BID TOTAL $ 3,269,425.19 |ALTERNATIVE BID TOTAL $ 2,470,079.43 |ALTERNATIVE BID TOTAL $ 3,021,571.00 |ALTERNATIVE BID TOTAL $ 3,370,319.12
BASE BID ITEMS
SECTION 1 UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE UNIT PRICE
1 0100 6002 [PREPARING ROW STA 86 S - S - S 250.00 | $ 21,500.00 | $ 796.00 | $ 68,456.00
2 0104 6017 [REMOVE CONC (DRIVEWAYS) SY 175 S - S - S 28.00 | $ 4,900.00 | $ 32.00 | $ 5,600.00
3 0105 6037 [REMOVE STAB BASE AND ASPH PAV (0"-16") SY 21,424 S - S - S 10.00 | $ 214,240.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 128,544.00
4 0110 6001 [EXCAVATION (ROADWAY) CY 3,439 S - S - S 20.00 | $ 68,780.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 96,292.00
5 0162 6002 [BLOCK SODDING SY 2,549 S - S - S 5.50 [ $ 14,019.50 | $ 5.00 | $ 12,745.00
6 0164 6009 [BROADCAST SEEDING (TEMP) (WARM) SY 41,226 S - S - S 050 | $ 20,613.00 | $ 0.18 | $ 7,420.68
7 0166 6001 |[FERTILIZER AC 10 S - S - S 750.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 1,312.00 | $ 13,120.00
8 0168 6001 |VEGETATIVE WATERING MG 12 S - S - S 45.00 | $ 540.00 | $ 1,457.00 | $ 17,484.00
9 0247 6053 |[FL BS (CMP IN PLC)(TYD GR1-2)(FNAL POS) CY 32 S - S - S 95.00 | $ 3,040.00 | $ 82.00 | $ 2,624.00
10 02756001 [CEMENT TON 48 S - S - S 185.00 | $ 8,880.00 | $ 488.00 | $ 23,424.00
11 0275 6006 [CEMENT TREAT (EXIST MATL) (10") SY 7,645 S - S - S 16.00 | $ 122,320.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 168,190.00
12 0340 6106 |D-GR HMA(SQ) (TYPE D) (PG64-22) TON 58 S - S - S 165.00 | $ 9,625.55] $ 231.00 | $ 13,475.77
13 0464 6003 [RC PIPE (CLIII) (18 IN) LF 1,110 S - S - S 90.00 | $ 99,900.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 94,350.00
14 0464 6005 [RC PIPE (CL I1I) (24 IN) LF 203 S - S - S 105.00 | $ 21,315.00| $ 107.00 | $ 21,721.00
15 0464 6008 [RC PIPE (CL11I) (36 IN) LF 97 S - S - S 175.00 | $ 16,975.00 | $ 167.00 | $ 16,199.00
16 0465 6168 |[INLET (COMPL) (TY A) EA 2 S - S - S 2,500.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 3,470.00 | $ 6,940.00
17 0496 6002 [REMOV STR (INLET) EA 2 S - S - S 1,100.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 369.00 | $ 738.00
18 0496 6007 [REMOV STR (PIPE) LF 1,350 S - S - S 30.00 | $ 40,500.00 | $ 23.00 | $ 31,050.00
19 0502 6001 [BARRICADES, SIGN AND TRAFFIC HANDLING MO 6 S - S - S 4,500.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 25,735.00 | $ 154,410.00
20 0506 6047 [TEMP SDMT CONT FENCE (INLET PROTECTION) LF 656 S - S - S 8.00 | $ 5,248.00 | $ 3.00 | $ 1,968.00
21 0512 6009 [PORT CTB (FUR & INST)(LOW PROF)(TY 1) LF 760 S - S - S 60.00 | $ 45,600.00 | $ 47.00 | $ 35,720.00
22 0512 6010 [PORT CTB (FUR & INST)(LOW PROF)(TY 2) LF 40 S - S - S 60.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 41.00 | $ 1,640.00
23 0512 6033 [PORT CTB (MOVE)(LOW PROF)(TY 1) LF 7,450 S - S - S 10.00 | $ 74,500.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 52,150.00
24 0512 6034 [PORT CTB (MOVE)(LOW PROF)(TY 2) LF 400 S - S - S 10.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 4,000.00
25 0512 6057 [PORT CTB (REMOVE)(LOW PROF)(TY 1) LF 760 S - S - S 15.00 | $ 11,400.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 11,400.00
26 0512 6058 [PORT CTB (REMOVE)(LOW PROF)(TY 2) LF 40 S - S - S 15.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 640.00
27 0530 6004 [DRIVEWAYS (CONC) SY 175 S - S - S 26.00 | $ 4,550.00 | $ 99.00 | $ 17,325.00
28 0530 6005 [DRIVEWAYS (ASPH) SY 1,485 S - S - S 22.00 | $ 32,670.00| $ 37.00 | $ 54,945.00
29 0644 6078 |RELOCATE SM RD SN SUP&AM TY10BWG EA 39 S - S - S 750.00 | $ 29,250.00 | $ 394.00 | $ 15,366.00
30 0666 6048 |REFL PAV MRK TY | (W) (24") (SLD) (100 MIL) LF 148 S - S - S 10.00 | $ 1,480.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 888.00
31 0666 6003 [REFL PAV MRK TY-I (Y) (4") (BRK) (100 MIL) LF 1,620 S - S - S 1.50 [ $ 2,430.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 1,620.00
32 0666 6011 [REFL PAV MRK TY-I (W) (4") (SLD) (090 MIL) LF 17,243 S - S - S 1.50 [ $ 25,864.50 | $ 1.00 | $ 17,243.00
33 0666 6207 [REFL PAV MRKR TY-II (Y) 4" (SLD) LF 3,913 S - S - S 1.50 [ $ 5,869.50 | $ 1.00 | $ 3,913.00
34 0666 6224 [PAVEMENT SEALER 4" LF 18,863 S - S - S 050 | $ 9,431.50] $ 0.25]|$ 4,715.75
35 0672 6009 [REFL PAV MRKRTY Il A-A EA 185 S - S - S 6.00 | $ 1,110.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 1,110.00
36 0760 6001 [DITCH CLEANING AND RESHAPING (FOOT) LF 4,896 S - S - S 8.50 | $ 41,616.00] $ 6.00 | $ 29,376.00
37 3016 6001 |ROLLER COMPACTED CONCRETE (7") SY 25,438 S - S - S 48.00 | $ 1,221,024.00| $ 57.00 | $ 1,449,966.00
38 3019 6001 |TACKLESS TACK COAT GAL 22 S - S - S 15.00 | $ 330.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 264.00
39 7199 6087 [TEMP PAVING (HOT MIX OR HIGH PERFORM) TON 211 S - S - S 210.00 | $ 44,310.00| $ 117.00 | $ 24,687.00
40 0500 6001 [MOBILIZATION (NOT TO EXCEED 3% OF BID) LS 1 S - S - S 68,000.00 | $ 68,000.00 | $ 53,308.00 | $ 53,308.00
SECTION 2
1 0100 6002 [PREPARING ROW STA 41 S - S - S 250.00 | $ 10,250.00 | $ 778.00 | $ 31,898.00
2 0104 6017 [REMOVE CONC (DRIVEWAYS) SY 103 S - S - S 28.00 | $ 2,884.00 | $ 32.00 | $ 3,296.00
3 0105 6037 [REMOVE STAB BASE AND ASPH PAV (0"-16") SY 9067 S - S - S 10.00 | $ 90,670.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 63,469.00
4 0110 6001 [EXCAVATION (ROADWAY) CY 1075 S - S - S 20.00 | $ 21,500.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 30,100.00
5 0162 6002 [BLOCK SODDING SY 1785 S - S - S 5.50 [ $ 9,817.50) $ 5.00 | $ 8,925.00
6 0164 6009 [BROADCAST SEEDING (TEMP) (WARM) SY 13416 S - S - S 0.50 | $ 6,708.00 | $ 029|$ 3,890.64
7 0166 6001 |[FERTILIZER AC 4 S - S - S 750.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 1,176.00 | $ 4,704.00
8 0168 6001 [VEGETATIVE WATERING MG 6 S - S - S 45.00 | $ 270.00 | $ 1,460.00 | $ 8,760.00
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ITB #21-51 CR 723 RECONSTRUCTION

BIDDERS NAME|

ANGEL BROTHERS ENTERPRISES, LTD.

WADECON, LLC

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT COMPANY, INC.

TLC CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT SERVICES, INC.

BID TABULATION ADDRESS 3003 KILGORE PARKWAY 1525 LAKEVILLE DR. SUITE 115 545 WILSON ROAD 11714 CHARLES ROAD
BID OPEN DATE: BAYTOWN, TX 77523 KINGWOOD, TX 77339 FREEPORT, TX 77541 HOUSTON, TX 77041
WEDNESDAY, JUNE 16, 2021 AT 11:00 AM LOCAL TIME CONTACT PERSON GARY ENDLER JERRY WADE DALTON GARDNER CHRIS GWYN

LOCATION: TELEPHONE NO. 281-421-5721 281-348-0853 979-233-3366 281-357-4069

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM FAX NUMBER 281-421-5796 979-233-6167 713-849-2734
451 N. VELASCO ST., SUITE 100, ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL GARY.ENDLER@ANGELBROTHERS.COM DSCHOMER@WADECON.COM DALTON@VERNOR.COM CGWYN@TLCCCS.COM

9 | 02476053 |FLBS (CMP IN PLC)(TYD GR1-2)(FNAL POS) cy 25 $ - $ B 95.00 | $ 2,375.00| $ 78.00 | $ 1,950.00
10 | 02756001 |CEMENT TON 12) s - s B 185.00 | $ 2,220.00| $ 488.00 | $ 5,856.00
11 | 02756006 |CEMENT TREAT (EXIST MATL) (10") Sy 1790 $ - s B 16.00 | $ 28,640.00 | $ 0.96 | $ 1,718.40
12 | 03406106 |D-GR HMA(SQ) (TYPE D) (PG64-22) TON 19 s - s B 165.00 | $ 3,135.00 | $ 301.00 | $ 5,719.00
13 | 04646003 |RC PIPE (CLIII) (18 IN) LF 486 s - s B 90.00 | $ 43,740.00 | $ 85.00 | $ 41,310.00
14 | 04646005 |RC PIPE (CLIII) (24 IN) LF 60 s - s B 105.00 | $ 6,300.00 | $ 107.00 [ $ 6,420.00
15 | 04656168 |INLET (COMPL) (TY A) EA 1] s - s B 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 3,005.00 | $ 3,005.00
16 | 04966007 |REMOV STR (PIPE) LF 546 s - $ B 30.00 | $ 16,380.00| $ 23.00 | $ 12,558.00
17 | 05026001 |BARRICADES, SIGN AND TRAFFIC HANDLING MO 4 s - s B 3,500.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 14,122.00 | $ 56,488.00
18 | 05066047 |TEMP SDMT CONT FENCE (INLET PROTECTION) LF 440 s - s B 8.00 | $ 3,520.00 | $ 3.00$ 1,320.00
19 | 05126009 |PORT CTB (FUR & INST)(LOW PROF)(TY 1) LF 750 s - $ B 60.00 | $ 45,000.00 | $ 74.00 | $ 55,500.00
20 | 05126010 |PORT CTB (FUR & INST)(LOW PROF)(TY 2) LF 40 s - $ B 60.00 | $ 2,400.00 | $ 72.00 | $ 2,880.00
21 | 05126033 |PORT CTB (MOVE)(LOW PROF)(TY 1) LF 3000 s - s B 10.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 21,000.00
22 | 05126034 |PORT CTB (MOVE)(LOW PROF)(TY 2) LF 400 $ - s B 10.00 | $ 4,000.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 2,800.00
23 | 05126057 |PORT CTB (REMOVE)(LOW PROF)(TY 1) LF 750 s - s B 15.00 | $ 11,250.00| $ 31.00 | $ 23,250.00
24 | 05126058 |PORT CTB (REMOVE)(LOW PROF)(TY 2) LF 40 s - $ B 15.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 29.00 | $ 1,160.00
25 | 05306004 |DRIVEWAYS (CONC) SY 100 s - s B 26.00 | $ 2,600.00 | $ 99.00 | $ 9,900.00
26 | 05306005 |DRIVEWAYS (ASPH) Sy 240 s - s B 22.00 | $ 5,280.00 | $ 37.00 | $ 8,880.00
27 | 06446078 |RELOCATE SM RD SN SUP&AM TY10BWG EA 17 s - s B 750.00 | $ 12,750.00| $ 394.00 | $ 6,698.00
28 | 06666048 |REFL PAV MRKTY | (W) (24") (SLD) (100 MIL) LF 70 s - $ B 10.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 6.00 S 420.00
29 | 0666 6003 |REFL PAV MRK TY-I (Y) (4") (BRK) (100 MIL) LF 3120 $ - s B 150 $ 4,680.00 | $ 1.00$ 3,120.00
30 | 06666011 |REFL PAV MRK TY-I (W) (4") (SLD) (090 MIL) LF 8165 s - s B 150 $ 12,247.50| $ 0.50 | $ 4,082.50
31 | 06666207 |REFL PAV MRKR TY-II (Y) 4" (SLD) LF 4755 s - s B 150 $ 7,132.50 | $ 1.00$ 4,755.00
32 | 06666224 |PAVEMENT SEALER 4" LF 16040 s - s B 0.50 | $ 8,020.00 | $ 0.25]$ 4,010.00
33 | 06726009 |REFLPAV MRKRTY Il A-A EA 95 s - s B 6.00 S 570.00 | $ 6.00 S 570.00
34 | 07606001 |DITCH CLEANING AND RESHAPING (FOOT) LF 4100 $ - $ B 8.50 | $ 34,850.00 | $ 500 $ 20,500.00
35 | 30166001 |ROLLER COMPACTED CONCRETE (7") Sy 12065 $ - s B 48.50 | $ 585,152.50 | $ 54.00 | $ 651,510.00
36 | 30196001 |TACKLESS TACK COAT GAL 13 s - $ B 15.00 | $ 195.00 [ $ 1200 $ 156.00
37 | 7199 6087 |TEMP PAVING (HOT MIX OR HIGH PERFORM) TON 71 s - $ B 210.00 | $ 14,910.00| $ 188.00 | $ 13,348.00
38 | 05006001 |MOBILIZATION (NOT TO EXCEED 3% OF BID) Ls 1 S - s N 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 34,218.00 | $ 34,218.00
ALTERNATIVE BID ITEMS
SECTION 1

1 | 01006002 |PREPARING ROW STA 86| $ 1,500.00 | $ 129,000.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 258,000.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 21,500.00 | $ 966.00 | $ 83,076.00
2 | 01046017 |REMOVE CONC (DRIVEWAYS) sy 175] $ 18.50 | $ 3,237.50 | $ 10.00 | $ 1,750.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 4,900.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 6,300.00
3 | 01056037 |REMOVE STAB BASE AND ASPH PAV (0"-16") sy 21,424| $ 6.10 | $ 130,686.40 | $ 5.00 | $ 107,120.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 257,088.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 171,392.00
4 | 01106001 |EXCAVATION (ROADWAY) cY 6,442| $ 30.00 | $ 193,260.00 | $ 15.00 | $ 96,630.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 128,840.00 | $ 34.00 | $ 219,028.00
5 | 01646009 |BROADCAST SEEDING (TEMP) (WARM) sy 41,226] $ 0.15 | $ 6,183.90 | $ 0.20 | $ 8,245.20 | $ 0.50 | $ 20,613.00 | $ 0.25 | $ 10,306.50
6 | 01666001 |FERTILIZER AC 10| $ 865.00 | $ 8,650.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 7,500.00 | $ 1,593.00 | $ 15,930.00
7 | 01686001 |VEGETATIVE WATERING MG 12] 3 185.00 | $ 2,220.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 1,200.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 540.00 | $ 1,769.00 | $ 21,228.00
8 | 02476053 |FLBS (CMP IN PLC)(TYD GR1-2)(FNAL POS) cY 5,653| $ 90.00 | $ 508,770.00 | $ 82.00 | $ 463,546.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 452,240.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 537,035.00
9 | 02756001 |CEMENT TON 48] $ 150.00 | $ 7,200.00 | $ 220.00 | $ 10,560.00 | $ 185.00 | $ 8,880.00 | $ 593.00 | $ 28,464.00
10 | 02756006 |CEMENT TREAT (EXIST MATL) (10") sy 7,645| $ 12.00 | $ 91,740.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 76,450.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 122,320.00 | $ 4008 30,580.00
11 | 03406106 |D-GR HMA(SQ) (TYPE D) (PG64-22) TON 4,198] $ 116.00 | $ 486,968.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 377,820.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 587,720.00 | $ 155.00 | $ 650,690.00
12 | 04646003 |RC PIPE (CL IIl) (18 IN) LF 1,110] $ 108.00 | $ 119,880.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 88,800.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 99,900.00 | $ 104.00 | $ 115,440.00
13 | 0464 6005 |RC PIPE (CL IIl) (24 IN) LF 203 $ 130.00 | $ 26,390.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 20,300.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 21,315.00 | $ 128.00 | $ 25,984.00
14 | 04646008 |RC PIPE (CL IIl) (36 IN) LF Y B 185.00 | $ 17,945.00 | $ 200.00 | $ 19,400.00 | $ 175.00 | $ 16,975.00 | $ 201.00 | $ 19,497.00
15 | 04656168 |INLET (COMPL) (TY A) EA 2|s 4,200.00 | $ 8,400.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 7,000.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 5,000.00 | $ 4,213.00 | $ 8,426.00
16 | 04966002 |REMOV STR (INLET) EA 2|5 710.00 | $ 1,420.00 | $ 500.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 1,100.00 | $ 2,200.00 | $ 448.00 | $ 896.00
17 | 04966007 |REMOV STR (PIPE) LF 1,350| $ 17.00 | $ 22,950.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 27,000.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 40,500.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 37,800.00
18 | 05026001 |BARRICADES, SIGN AND TRAFFIC HANDLING MO 6l $ 24,000.00 | $ 144,000.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 15,000.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 21,000.00 | $ 16,950.00 | $ 101,700.00
19 | 0506 6047 |TEMP SDMT CONT FENCE (INLET PROTECTION) LF 656| $ 520 | $ 3411.20 | $ 2.00 | $ 1,312.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 19,680.00 | $ 3.00 | $ 1,968.00
20 | 05306005 |DRIVEWAYS (ASPH) sy 1,660| $ 74.00 | $ 122,840.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 33,200.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 36,520.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 74,700.00
21 | 06446078 |RELOCATE SM RD SN SUP&AM TY10BWG EA 39 $ 230.00 | $ 8,970.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 3,900.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 29,250.00 | $ 479.00 | $ 18,681.00
22 | 06666048 |REFL PAV MRK TY | (W) (24") (SLD) (100 MIL) LF 148 $ 7.00 | $ 1,036.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 1,480.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 1,480.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 1,184.00
23 | 0666 6003 |REFL PAV MRK TY-I (Y) (4") (BRK) (100 MIL) LF 1,620] $ 060 | $ 972.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 1,620.00 | $ 150 | $ 2,430.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 1,620.00
24 | 0666 6011 |REFL PAV MRK TY-I (W) (4") (SLD) (090 MIL) LF 17,243 $ 055 | $ 9,483.65 | $ 1.00 | $ 17,243.00 | $ 150 | § 25,864.50 | $ 1.00 | $ 17,243.00
25 | 0666 6207 |REFL PAV MRKR TY-Il (Y) 4" (SLD) LF 3,913| § 060 | $ 2,347.80 | $ 1.00 | $ 3,913.00 | $ 150 | $ 5,869.50 | $ 1.00 | $ 3,913.00
26 | 0666 6224 |PAVEMENT SEALER 4" LF 18,863| $ 0.15 | $ 2,829.45 | $ 0.01]$ 188.63 | $ 0.50 | $ 9,43150 | $ 0.09 | $ 1,697.67
27 | 06726009 |REFL PAV MRKR TY Il A-A EA 185] $ 500 | $ 925.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 1,850.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 1,110.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 1,295.00
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ITB #21-51 CR 723 RECONSTRUCTION

BIDDERS NAME|

ANGEL BROTHERS ENTERPRISES, LTD.

WADECON, LLC

VERNOR MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT COMPANY, INC.

TLC CONSTRUCTION CONTRACT SERVICES, INC.

BID TABULATION ADDRESS, 3003 KILGORE PARKWAY 1525 LAKEVILLE DR. SUITE 115 545 WILSON ROAD 11714 CHARLES ROAD
BID OPEN DATE: BAYTOWN, TX 77523 KINGWOOD, TX 77339 FREEPORT, TX 77541 HOUSTON, TX 77041
WEDNESDAY, JUNE 16, 2021 AT 11:00 AM LOCAL TIME CONTACT PERSON GARY ENDLER JERRY WADE DALTON GARDNER CHRIS GWYN

LOCATION: TELEPHONE NO. 281-421-5721 281-348-0853 979-233-3366 281-357-4069

PURCHASING CONFERENCE ROOM FAX NUMBER| 281-421-5796 979-233-6167 713-849-2734
451 N. VELASCO ST., SUITE 100, ANGLETON, TX 77515 EMAIL GARY.ENDLER@ANGELBROTHERS.COM DSCHOMER@WADECON.COM DALTON@VERNOR.COM CGWYN@TLCCCS.COM

28 | 07606001 [DITCH CLEANING AND RESHAPING (FOOT) LF 4,896| $ 16.00 | $ 78,336.00 | $ 500 $ 24,480.00 | $ 850 | $ 41,616.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 29,376.00
29 | 30196001 |[TACKLESS TACK COAT GAL 3,816] $ 6.40 | $ 24,422.40 | $ 3.00($ 11,448.00 | $ 1250 | $ 47,700.00 | $ 7.00|$% 26,712.00
30 | 05006001 |MOBILIZATION (NOT TO EXCEED 3% OF BID) LS 1|$ 65,000.00 | $ 65,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 60,000.00 | $ 69,000.00 | $ 69,000.00
SECTION 2

1 0100 6002 |PREPARING ROW STA 41| $ 1,500.00 | $ 61,500.00 | $ 1,000.00 | $ 41,000.00 | $ 250.00 | $ 10,250.00 | $ 990.00 | $ 40,590.00
2 | 01046017 |[REMOVE CONC (DRIVEWAYS) SY 103| $ 18.50 | $ 1,905.50 | $ 10.00 | $ 1,030.00 | $ 28.00 | $ 2,884.00 | $ 36.00 | $ 3,708.00
3 | 01056037 |REMOVE STAB BASE AND ASPH PAV (0"-16") sy 9067| $ 12.00 | $ 108,804.00 | $ 500 |$ 45,335.00 | $ 12.00 | $ 108,804.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 72,536.00
4 | 01106001 |[EXCAVATION (ROADWAY) cY 2288| $ 30.00 | $ 68,640.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 45,760.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 45,760.00 | $ 34.00 | $ 77,792.00
5 | 01646009 |BROADCAST SEEDING (TEMP) (WARM) sy 15201| $ 0.14 | $ 2,128.14 | $ 020 (% 3,040.20 | $ 050 | $ 7,600.50 | $ 0.35|% 5,320.35
6 | 01666001 |FERTILIZER AC 4ls 865.00 | $ 3,460.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 400.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 3,000.00 | $ 1,429.00 | $ 5,716.00
7 | 01686001 |VEGETATIVE WATERING MG 6| $ 185.00 | $ 1,110.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 600.00 | $ 45.00 | $ 270.00 | $ 1,769.00 | $ 10,614.00
8 | 02476053 |FL BS (CMP IN PLC)(TYD GR1-2)(FNAL POS) (632 2682] $ 90.00 | $ 241,380.00 | $ 84.00 | $ 225,288.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 214,560.00 | $ 95.00 | $ 254,790.00
9 | 02756001 |CEMENT TON 12| $ 150.00 | $ 1,800.00 | $ 220.00 | $ 2,640.00 | $ 185.00 | $ 2,220.00 | $ 307.00 | $ 3,684.00
10 | 02756006 |CEMENT TREAT (EXIST MATL) (10") SY 1790] $ 12.00 | $ 21,480.00 | $ 20.00 | $ 35,800.00 | $ 16.00 | $ 28,640.00 | $ 4.00 [ $ 7,160.00
11 | 03406106 |D-GRHMA(SQ) (TYPE D) (PG64-22) TON 1995| $ 116.00 | $ 231,420.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 199,500.00 | $ 140.00 | $ 279,300.00 | $ 155.00 | $ 309,225.00
12 | 0464 6003 |RC PIPE (CL IIl) (18 IN) LF 486| $ 85.00 | $ 41,310.00 | $ 80.00 | $ 38,880.00 | $ 90.00 | $ 43,740.00 | $ 104.00 | $ 50,544.00
13 | 0464 6005 |RC PIPE (CL IIl) (24 IN) LF 60| $ 127.70 | $ 7,662.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 6,000.00 | $ 105.00 | $ 6,300.00 | $ 131.00 | $ 7,860.00
14 | 04656168 |INLET (COMPL)(TY A) EA 1'$ 420512 | $ 420512 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 3,648.00 | $ 3,648.00
15 | 0496 6007 |REMOV STR (PIPE) LF 546| $ 16.81 | $ 9,178.26 | $ 20.00 | $ 10,920.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 16,380.00 | $ 27.00 | $ 14,742.00
16 | 0502 6001 [BARRICADES, SIGN AND TRAFFIC HANDLING MO 4's 22,734.03 | $ 90,936.12 | $ 2,500.00 | $ 10,000.00 | $ 3,500.00 | $ 14,000.00 | $ 17,149.00 | $ 68,596.00
17 | 0506 6047 [TEMP SDMT CONT FENCE (INLET PROTECTION) LF 440| $ 520 (% 2,288.00 | $ 200 (% 880.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 13,200.00 | $ 3.00|$% 1,320.00
18 | 05306005 |DRIVEWAYS (ASPH) SY 340] $ 74.00 | $ 25,160.00 | $ 30.00 | $ 10,200.00 | $ 22.00 | $ 7,480.00 | $ 4400 | $ 14,960.00
19 | 0644 6078 |RELOCATE SM RD SN SUP&AM TY10BWG EA 17] $ 230.00 | $ 3,910.00 | $ 100.00 | $ 1,700.00 | $ 750.00 | $ 12,750.00 | $ 479.00 | $ 8,143.00
20 | 06666048 [REFL PAV MRK TY I (W) (24") (SLD) (100 MIL) LF 70| $ 7.00 [ $ 490.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 700.00 | $ 8.00 | $ 560.00
21 | 0666 6003 [REFL PAV MRK TY-I (Y) (4") (BRK) (100 MIL) LF 3120| $ 0.60 | $ 1,872.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 3,120.00 | $ 150 | $ 4,680.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 3,120.00
22 | 0666 6011 |REFL PAV MRK TY-I (W) (4") (SLD) (090 MIL) LF 8165| $ 0.55 | $ 4,490.75 | $ 1.00 | $ 8,165.00 | $ 150 | $ 12,24750 | $ 1.00 | $ 8,165.00
23 | 0666 6207 |REFL PAV MRKR TY-II (Y) 4" (SLD) LF 4755| $ 0.60 | $ 2,853.00 | $ 1.00 | $ 4,755.00 | $ 150 | $ 713250 | $ 1.00 [ $ 4,755.00
24 | 0666 6224 |[PAVEMENT SEALER 4" LF 16040| $ 015 $ 2,406.00 | $ 0.01[$ 160.40 | $ 0.50 | $ 8,020.00 | $ 0.09 | $ 1,443.60
25 | 06726009 [REFL PAV MRKRTY Il A-A EA 95| $ 5.00 | $ 475.00 | $ 10.00 | $ 950.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 570.00 | $ 7.00 | $ 665.00
26 | 07606001 [DITCH CLEANING AND RESHAPING (FOOT) LF 4100| $ 16.00 | $ 65,600.00 | $ 500 |$ 20,500.00 | $ 850 | $ 34,850.00 | $ 6.00 | $ 24,600.00
27 | 30196001 [TACKLESS TACK COAT GAL 700| $ 6.41|$ 4,487.00 | $ 3.00($ 2,100.00 | $ 1250 | $ 8,750.00 | $ 7.00 (% 4,900.00
28 | 05006001 |MOBILIZATION (NOT TO EXCEED 3% OF BID) LS 1 $ 29,000.00 | $ 29,000.00 | $ 5,700.00 | $ 5,700.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 25,000.00 | $ 30,000.00 | $ 30,000.00
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